

Opening Date:02.11.2014
RFP 2014-88
3 month Contract for Meats

Webb County
Purchasing Dept.
Bid Tabulation

Ben E. Keith
c/o Mario Jimenez
5505 Kaepa
San Antonio, TX 78218
210-661-7997
mellmenez@benekelth.com

Labatt Food Service
c/o Enrique Alvarado
902 N. Expressway 77
Harlingen, TX 78550
956-266-4934
ealvarado@labattfood.com

RFP 2014-88 3 month contract for Meats (Fixed Price Required)

							Secondary			Primary			
Category	Item#	Description	Brand	Pkg Size	Quantity	Catch/Weight	Case Price	Price p/LB	Ext. Price	Pkg size if Different	Case Price	Price Per LB	Ext. Price
5 - FRESH MEAT	500245	BRISKET BNLS NR #120	JBP	6 / CATCH	61			\$ 2.69				\$2.30	
5 - FRESH MEAT	500245	BRISKET BNLS NR #120	JBP	6 / CATCH	33			\$ 2.69				\$2.30	
5 - FRESH MEAT	500255	BRISKET BNLS H/R #120	JBP	5 / 11-14#	20			\$ 2.69				\$2.30	
5 - FRESH MEAT	500255	BRISKET BNLS H/R #120	JBP	5 / 11-14#	19			\$ 2.69				\$2.30	
5 - FRESH MEAT	502001	BEEF MEKUDO COOKED	SUPREME MEAT	2 / 5 LB	11	10	\$ 18.75		\$ 206.25	10	\$19.03		\$209.33
5 - FRESH MEAT	506079	BEEF GROUND FINE #1/10	CREEKSTONE F FARMS	8 / 5 LB	1			\$ 3.58				\$2.47	
5 - FRESH MEAT	506080	BEEF GROUND FINE 73/22	PACKER	8 / 10#CW	17			\$ 2.24				\$2.04	
5 - FRESH MEAT	506083	BEEF GROUND FINE #0/20	JBP	8 / 10#CW	45			\$ 3.51				\$2.47	
5 - FRESH MEAT	506083	BEEF GROUND FINE #0/20	JBP	8 / 10#CW	19			\$ 3.51				\$2.47	
5 - FRESH MEAT	506086	BEEF GROUND FINE 73/22	JBP	8 / 10 LB.CW	50			\$ 2.24				\$2.04	
5 - FRESH MEAT	506105	BEEF GROUND FINE #0/20	JBP	6 / 10 LB	1			\$ 3.51				\$2.47	
5 - FRESH MEAT	506114	BEEF GROUND FINE #0/20	PACKER	2 / 5 LB	397	10	\$ 29.43	\$ 2.94				\$2.32	
5 - FRESH MEAT	506205	BEEF GROUND FINE #1/19	CARGILL MEATS	6 / 10#CW	1			\$ 3.66				\$2.47	
5 - FRESH MEAT	506275	BEEF GROUND FINE #1/19	JBP	8 / 5 LB.	32			\$ 3.58				\$2.47	
5 - FRESH MEAT	506275	BEEF GROUND FINE #1/19	JBP	8 / 5 LB.	33			\$ 3.58				\$2.47	
5 - FRESH MEAT	506475	BEEF GROUND FINE 73/22	JBS SWIFT	8 / 10 LB	47			\$ 3.20				\$2.04	
5 - FRESH MEAT	506475	BEEF GROUND FINE 73/22	JBS SWIFT	8 / 10 LB	21			\$ 3.20				\$2.04	
5 - FRESH MEAT	506511	BEEF GROUND FINE #1/19	JBS SWIFT	6 / 10 LB	2			\$ 3.19				\$2.47	
5 - FRESH MEAT	506545	BEEF GROUND #0/20	WINN MEAT	1 / 10 LB	1	10	\$ 91.98	\$ 3.20				\$2.75	
5 - FRESH MEAT	506550	BEEF STEW MEAT DICED	SUPREME MEAT	7 / 1.5 LB	4			\$ 4.42				\$4.02	
5 - FRESH MEAT	506602	BEEF GROUND #0/20	WOLVERINE PACKING	2 / 5 LB	13	11	\$ 29.09	\$ 2.91				\$2.79	
5 - FRESH MEAT	506773	BEEF PATTIES #0/20 W #02	WINN MEAT	20 / 8 OZ	4	10	\$ 37.30		\$ 149.20	Box	\$26.76		\$107.04
5 - FRESH MEAT	550108	CHICKEN BREAST BANDO.M.BLS	KOCH FOODS	4 / 10 LB	1	40	\$ 56.82		\$ 56.82	10	\$72.94		\$72.94
5 - FRESH MEAT	506991	BEEF PATTIES 2/1 75/25 ANG	WINN MEAT	20 / 8 OZ	2	10	\$ 28.64		\$ 57.28	8 oz	\$25.07		\$50.14
3 - FROZEN MEAT	501069	PRIME RIB CH FC TO BARE	TYSON	2 / 9-11#CW	1			\$ 10.55				\$10.46	
3 - FROZEN MEAT	501110	ROAST BEEF SLICED .50 OZ EA	TYSON	6 / 32 OZ	13	12	\$ 69.82		\$ 907.66	2	\$56.26		\$731.38
3 - FROZEN MEAT	506003	BARBACOA COOKED VALUE PACK	SUPREME MEAT	2 / 5 LB	2	10	\$ 42.61		\$ 85.22	5	\$74.41		\$148.82
3 - FROZEN MEAT	506015	BARBACOA COOKED	GARCIA FOODS	8 / 2.5 LB	1	20	\$ 111.14		\$ 111.14	5	\$74.41		\$74.41
3 - FROZEN MEAT	506019	BARBACOA COOKED	SUPREME MEAT	2 / 5 LB.	2	10	\$ 55.11		\$ 110.22	5	\$74.41		\$148.82
3 - FROZEN MEAT	506031	BEEF STEW MEAT 1 III CUBE	SUPREME MEAT	1 / 10 LB	37			\$ 41.93	\$ 4.19			\$4.02	
3 - FROZEN MEAT	506040	BEEF STEW MEAT 1/2 III CUBE	SUPREME MEAT	1 / 10 LB.	274			\$ 44.20	\$ 4.42			\$4.01	
3 - FROZEN MEAT	506064	BEEF CHILI MEAT 90/10	SUPREME MEAT	2 / 5 LB	1			\$ 33.98	\$ 3.40			\$3.20	
3 - FROZEN MEAT	506075	CHILI MEAT BEEF #0/20	WINN MEAT	1 / 10 LB	1			\$ 33.98	\$ 3.40			\$2.75	
3 - FROZEN MEAT	506345	BEEF PATTIES 3/1 CHUCK	HOLTEN MEAT	45 / 5.33 OZ	58	15	\$ 55.51		\$ 3,219.58	5.33	\$52.15		\$3,024.70
3 - FROZEN MEAT	506829	BEEF STEW MEAT 1X1	WINN MEAT	2 / 5 LB	8			\$ 39.59	\$ 3.96			\$4.02	
3 - FROZEN MEAT	506840	BEEF STEW MEAT 1/2	WINN MEAT	2 / 5 LB	29			\$ 36.80	\$ 3.68			\$4.01	
3 - FROZEN MEAT	506961	BEEF PATTIES 3/1 CTF 75/25	HOLTEN MEAT	30 / 5.33 OZ	4	10	\$ 28.05		\$ 112.20	5.3	\$25.07		\$100.28
3 - FROZEN MEAT	507587	BEEF PHILLY MEAT PRECOOKED	ADVANCE PIERRE FOODS	4 / 2.5 LB	1	10	\$ 54.50		\$ 54.50	2.5	\$58.86		\$58.86
3 - FROZEN MEAT	508013	BEEF STEAK FRITTER 4/1 RAW	KINGS COMMAND	40 / 4 OZ	126	10	\$ 27.10		\$ 3,414.60	4 oz	\$23.02		\$2,900.52
3 - FROZEN MEAT	508101	BEEF STEAK FINGER 1 OZ CHOP	ADVANCE PIERRE FOODS	160 / 1 OZ	12	10	\$ 28.03		\$ 336.36	.97 oz	\$22.45		\$269.40
3 - FROZEN MEAT	508121	BEEF STEAK FRITTER NAT 4/1	ADVANCE PIERRE FOODS	40 / 4 OZ	134	10	\$ 25.27		\$ 3,520.18	4 oz	\$23.02		\$3,084.68
3 - FROZEN MEAT	509004	BEEF PATTIE STRIPS	ADVANCE PIERRE FOODS	2 / 5 LB	3	10	\$ 51.99		\$ 155.97	5	\$43.10		\$129.30
3 - FROZEN MEAT	509009	BEEF FAJITA MEAT PRE CKD	KINGS COMMAND	2 / 5 LB	2	10	\$ 58.86		\$ 117.72	5	\$43.10		\$86.20
3 - FROZEN MEAT	509144	BEEF PATTIES CHARBROILED	ADVANCE PIERRE FOODS	102 / 2.66 OZ	8	17	\$ 54.40		\$ 435.20	2.5 oz	\$34.45		\$275.60
3 - FROZEN MEAT	509155	BEEF PATTIES CHARBROILED	ADVANCE PIERRE FOODS	102 / 2.5 OZ	10	16	\$ 51.13		\$ 511.30	2.5 OZ	\$34.45		\$344.50
3 - FROZEN MEAT	509305	BEEF PATTIES CHARBROILED	ADVANCE PIERRE FOODS	120 / 2 OZ	177	15	\$ 47.95		\$ 8,487.15	1.95oz	\$50.08		\$8,864.16
3 - FROZEN MEAT	509306	BEEF PATTIE CHARBROILED	ADVANCE PIERRE FOODS	102 / 2.5 OZ	9	16	\$ 48.85		\$ 439.65	2.5 oz	\$34.45		\$310.05
3 - FROZEN MEAT	509341	BEEF PATTIES CHARBROILED	ADVANCE PIERRE FOODS	90 / 2.5 OZ	246	14	\$ 42.60		\$ 10,479.60	2.5 OZ	\$34.45		\$8,474.70
3 - FROZEN MEAT	509345	BEEF PATTIES CHARBROILED	ADVANCE PIERRE FOODS	90 / 3 OZ	8	17	\$ 50.19		\$ 401.52	2.5 OZ	\$34.45		\$275.60

53	3 - FROZEN MEAT	509353	BEEF PATTIES CHARBROILED	ADVANCE PIERRE FOODS	40 / 4 OZ	45	10	\$ 52.74	\$ 2,373.30	4 OZ	\$34.68	\$1,560.60
56	3 - FROZEN MEAT	509414	BEEF SALISBURY FLAMBROIL	ADVANCE PIERRE FOODS	114 / 3 OZ	246	21	\$ 68.24	\$ 16,787.04	3 OZ	\$49.90	\$12,275.40
57	3 - FROZEN MEAT	509610	MEATLOAF PORTIONED PC	ADVANCE PIERRE FOODS	75 / 3.20 OZ	23	35	\$ 52.65	\$ 1,210.95	3.15 OZ	\$49.70	\$1,143.10
58	3 - FROZEN MEAT	509618	MEATLOAF PATTIE DELUXE	ADVANCE PIERRE FOODS	76 / 3.15 OZ	89	15	\$ 51.74	\$ 4,604.86	3.15 OZ	\$49.70	\$4,423.30
59	3 - FROZEN MEAT	510225	BEEF STEAK FINGER 1OZ CKD	KINGS COMMAND	160 / 1 OZ	60	10	\$ 27.09	\$ 1,625.40	.97 OZ	\$22.45	\$1,347.00
60	3 - FROZEN MEAT	510409	BEEF STEAK FINGER BRD PC	ADVANCE PIERRE FOODS	160 / 1 OZ	31	10	\$ 26.27	\$ 814.37	.97 OZ	\$22.45	\$695.95
61	3 - FROZEN MEAT	510413	BEEF STEAK FINGER PC	ADVANCE PIERRE FOODS	160 / 0.97 OZ	15	10	\$ 24.63	\$ 369.45	.97 OZ	\$22.45	\$336.75
62	3 - FROZEN MEAT	510496	BEEF STEAK FRITTER 4/1	ADVANCE PIERRE FOODS	40 / 3.88 OZ	225	10	\$ 24.23	\$ 5,451.75	4 OZ	\$23.02	\$5,179.50
63	3 - FROZEN MEAT	522383	MEATBALL ITALIAN PRECKD .5OZ	SYRACUSE SAUSAGE COMPANY	1 / 10 LB	19	10	\$ 28.69	\$ 545.11	.5 OZ	\$22.96	\$436.24
64	3 - FROZEN MEAT	522410	MEATBALL CHARBROILED CN	ADVANCE PIERRE FOODS	320 / .5 OZ	162	10	\$ 30.95	\$ 5,013.90	.5 OZ	\$22.96	\$3,719.52
65	3 - FROZEN MEAT	522439	MEATBALL CHARBROILED .5 OZ	ARMOUR ECKRICH	320 / .5 OZ	12	10	\$ 30.95	\$ 371.40	.5 OZ	\$22.96	\$275.52
66	3 - FROZEN MEAT	522505	MEATBALL CHARBROILED	ADVANCE PIERRE FOODS	320 / .5 OZ	12	10	\$ 30.52	\$ 366.24	.5 OZ	\$22.96	\$275.52
67	3 - FROZEN MEAT	530098	BACON PRECKD REG 300 SL	TYSON	3 / 100 CT	1	5	\$ 50.34	\$ 50.34	300 CT	\$49.98	\$49.98
68	3 - FROZEN MEAT	530813	BACON ENDS & PIECES	FARMLAND	1 / 15 LB	63		\$ 37.67	\$ 2,373.21		\$1.90	
69	3 - FROZEN MEAT	530832	BACON PRECKD 300 SL	HORNEL	1 / 300 CT	1	4	\$ 33.85	\$ 33.85	300 CT	\$49.98	\$49.98
70	3 - FROZEN MEAT	530834	BACON BITS O BACON CAN EC	TYSON	6 / 1 LB	1	6	\$ 39.41	\$ 39.41	10 LB	\$15.72	\$15.72
			GRAND TOTAL						\$ 75,399.90			\$61,525.51

24	5 - FRESH MEAT	550305	CHICKEN BREAST BAHCOM RLSL	PACKER	1 / 40 LB	64	40	\$ 46.82	\$ 2,996.48		\$82.50	no bid
33	3 - FROZEN MEAT	506063	BEEF PATTIES 3 OZ PRE CKD	KINGS COMMAND	54 / 3 OZ	26	10	\$ 51.08	\$ 1,328.08	0	\$36.62	no bid
40	3 - FROZEN MEAT	507239	BEEF STEAK 5OZ SIRLOIN	NATIONAL STEAK & POULTRY	36 / 5 OZ	1	11	\$ 79.90	\$ 898.88	0		no bid
54	3 - FROZEN MEAT	509399	BEEF SALISBURY CHARBROILED	ADVANCE PIERRE FOODS	50 / 3 OZ	81	9	\$ 31.77	\$ 2,573.37		\$52.25	no bid
55	3 - FROZEN MEAT	509403	BEEF SALISBURY STK 3OZ CKD	KINGS COMMAND	54 / 3 OZ	6	10	\$ 34.94	\$ 279.52		\$52.25	no bid