Professional Turf Products, L.P.
Houston, Texas 77041
5520 Brittmoore
Dodd Drabing
{888) 776-8873 exl. 5469
drabingd@@proturf.com

FRFESIONM.

Ship Ta Casa Blanca Muni. Golf Course - Laredo Date 3/12/2014
Quotation Tax Rate
Centact Joln Junker - Southern Golf Properties PKG Discount
Address 3900 Casa Blanca Lake Rd.
City Lareda, TX Finance
State TX Account Type STD
Postal Code 78041 ecial Prici :
Phone [956) 791 7262
Fax (9563 724-6460
I Proposal |
] Gy THodel# Description Unit Extended |
50 102-2709 ASSY, SOLENCID, 24VDC, LATCHING 523.48 $1,174.00
50 102-4831 Selecior Valve Stems Red 50.81 540.50
6 985-15 Selector Toal (Flag Key) 52.12 512.72
10 102-5975 Adjustable Pilot Valve Ass. w/o Salznoid $25,35 5253.50
50 DEC-ISP-1GB Decoder. ISP, 1 Station, Golf $47.00 $2,350.00
[Toro Sorinkler Acc $3,830.72 |
16 DT54-5558 ASSY.CONVERSION,DTS4, 55-58 NOZZLE 556.00 $896.00
[Toro DT50 Series $896.00 |
SubTotai 3 4,7268.72
Paclage Discount 5 -
Tax {Estimated) $ -
TOTAL $ 4,726.72
Comments:

Terms & Conditions:
1. Pricing, including finance options, valid for 30 days from time of quotation.
2. After 30 days all prices are subject to change without notice.

Returns Policy:

1. All returns are subject to restocldng, refurbishing, usage, and shipping fees,

2. All returns must be able to be sold as new.

3. Items missing parts are non returnable,

4. Professional Turf Products will have sole discretion as to the resalable condition of the product.

5. This policy does not apply te ftems that are defective, or shipped incorrectly by PTP or one of its vendors.

Payment:
1. Terms are net 10 unless prior arrangements have been made.
2, Quoted prices are subject to creditapproval.
A. PTP will work with third party financial institutions to secure leases when requested to do so.
B. When using third party finapciers, documentation fees & advance payments may be required.
C. For convenience, monthly payments are estimated based on third party rate factors in effect at time of the quotation,
D. PTP assumes ne lability in the event credit becomes unavailable or rates change during the approval process.
E. New equipment dellvery time i5 estimated at six weeks from the time creditis approved & decuments are executed.
3. There will be a service charge equal to 1,5% per month (18% per annum]) on ail past due inveices.
4. By Law we are required to file a "Notce to Owner” of our intent to file lien in the event of payment default
This notice must be sent within 60 days of the date the original invoice and will happen automatically regardiess
of any special payment arrangements that may have been made,
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Front: Rodolfo Gonzalez <rgonzalez@southerngolfproperiies.com>

Sent: Friday, March 14, 2014 10:24 AM
To: Leticia Gutierrez
Subject: RE: Casa_BIanca_GC_—_(Revised)_—Preferred_Quote_for_ﬂRepair_supplies;

_DR_expansion_Project,_3-12-2014 pdf

Lety,

The account number it is coming out of capital outlay. The account number is
746-6001-8601

From: Leticia Gutierrez [mailto:lgutierrez@webbcountytx.gov]

Sent: Friday, March 14, 2014 8:39 AM

To: Rudy Gonzalez

Subject: RE:
Casa_Blanca_GC_-_(Revised)_-Preferred_Quote_for_Repair_supplies; DR_expansio
n_Project,_3-12-2014.pdf

What is the funding source please identify

-—-QOriginal Message--—-

From: Rudy Gonzalez [mailto:rgonzalez@southerngolfproperties.com]

Sent: Friday, March 14, 2014 8:32 AM

To: Ari Gutierrez; Leticia Gutierrez; john junker

Subject:
Casa_Blanca_GC_-_{Revised)_-Preferred_Quote_for_Repair_supplies;_DR_expansio
n_Project,_3-12-2014.pdf

Leticia:
Thank you for all your help in preparing agenda items for our ongoing irrigation upgrade & expansion project.

We are now at the point where we need the court to approve the parts, components, and materials needed to complete
the project.

Attached is a quote from an approved vendor that we have done business with in the past. There will not be three
quotes on these items because this vendor is the authorized dealer of Toro. These are specialized or specific products

for our system only available through this vendor.

We would appreciate your assistance in helping us create an item for the court to continue our project with Stahlman
England.

Example for agenda item:

Discussion and possible action to approve the purchase of parts, components, and materials, for the upgrade and
expansion of the irrigation system project from professional turf products not to exceed the amount of 510000



