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"Webb County
} Bid Tabulation
.. Purchasing Department
Date opened: 4.14.14

Bid: 2015-05 Annual Contract for Auto Parts

Comract Ixpiration; 930,13

Gonzalez Auto Parts
cfoloe Gage - T
4220 5an Bernardo
Laredo, TX 78041
956-726-9766 .
gzp@aapauto.net

Prim'a'

|o'Rellly Auto Parts

¢/o Chris George

‘|233 5. patterson

Springfield, MO 65802
417-825-5879
installeshids@oreillyauto.com

ITEM A: SEALBEAMS P A R
Sylvania Halogen HE054 20 56.99 .+ 5139,80 56.59 5131.80
Sylvania Halogen H465% 20 55,47 :5109.40 - 56.29 $125.80
Sylvania Halogen H4656 20 ‘%547 | 510840 ¢ 56,29 §135.80
Sylvanla Hatogen HG024 1 $7.49 489,88 $7.19 86,28
G.E. Halogen 9004 a0 5489 | 5149,70 55,99 $179.70
G.E. Halogen 9007 a0 54,99 £ 5259.40 55.99 5350.40
Halogen 5006 &0 53,99 523940 f  $5.99 $355,40
Halogen a0as an £083,90 . 8239.40 55,99 $359.40
Halogen 5008 60 $7.99 5479,40 . $7.19 $431.40
ITEM B: BATTERY ACCESSORIES: e s
Battery Cable 15' Long, 24 53,99 585,76 . 55,99 5143.76
No. 4 Ga. : oo

24 5575 | :5138.00 $7.99 $191.76
Battery Cable 28' Long, EE
No. 4 Ga.
Battery Holddown 2 4285 ] 3570 .|  $5.80 $11.78
Battery Bolts 9-3/4" Long 4 S150 - i $E.DCI . 54.49 $17.56
Battery Terminals Bronze 300 '52.49 - -5747.00 48.99 $2,697.00
Batttery Terminal Protector 24 ©.:83.49 - .| . 883,76 54.49 $107.76
Spray {12/case) PR DR
ITEM C: SHOP SUPPLIES B C
12 oz, WD-40 120 ..53.89 .| 5478.80 $6.02 $722.40
Carburetor Choke Cleaner 80 $2.49 - 5159.20 52,29 5183.20
Silicone Blue &0 -$2.,50 $150.00 .|  $3.00 $180.00
11 oz. Starting Fluid 48 $2.75 |- 5132.00 . 52.39 5114.72
Throttle Bottle Cleaner 100 5299 | 529900 - $1.88 $159.00
Silicon {Red) 50 $2.99 [ $179.40. $3.95 $239.40
Brake Cleaner {140z} 120 - $3.35 $402.00 $2,69 $322,80
\Weather-strip Adhesive (Black & Yellow) 50 $3.75 $187.50 %5.65 282,50




. ‘Webb County
‘Bid Tabulation
N - Purchasing Department
Date ppened: 4.14.14

Bid: 2015-05 Annual Contract for Auto Parts

Cuoutract Expiration: 9.30,13

I Granted an Extension Contract Expirves: 9.30.16

Gonzalez Auto Parts . - -

c/o loe Gage

4220 San Bernardo
Laredo, TX 78041
956-726-9766 -
gag@gag'auin.net

O'Reilly Auto Parts

. |c/o Chris George

233 S, Patterson
Springfield, MO 65862

© {417-825-5879
instatlerbids@oreitlyaute.com

{Secondary

Primary
i

Deéseription : Lxt. Pric
Air Conditloning Coll Cleaner{for automative} gal 40 $18.00 572000 - 514,99 $595,60
Elactricat Tape 50 40,89 | %4950 53.75 $187.50
Di-electrical grease (3.30z) 50 $8.99 . $448.50 58,00 540450
Battery Cleaner {110z) 40 $2.55 5102.00 54,22 $168.80
Duct Tape 29 “81.75 542,00 §1.99 547.76
Power Strip fluid {320z) 80 53,48 - 5279.20 - $3.39 $271,20
Brake Fluld {gallon size) 40 51E.99 $759.60 |  $16.7% $671.60
Grease Tube{for manual grease gun) 80 (5275 $22000 53,49 $279.20

FUSES
ATM-10amps,15amps,20amps,25amps,30amps BO 50.40 153200 $3.89 $311.20
ATC- 10amps, 15amps, 20amps, 25amps, 30amps 100 $0.20 $20.00 $3.14 5314.00
FMX-20amps,3Camps,40amps, 40amps, 50amps 100 50,40 - 540.00 54.09 5409.00
LIGHT BULBS
Light Bulb 1156 150 50.50 "875.00 - $0.35 $S8.50
Light Bulb 1157 150 so050 | o g7s00 50.19 $28.50
Light Butb 3158-3156A 250 4075 518750 50,50 $125.00
. : R 51.19
Light Buib 3157-3157A 250 51.1t| ) $275.00 50.55 $137.50
o : S 50.78

Light Bulb 194 Amber 40 50,30 S 512,00 S0.51 $20.40
Light Bulb 194 A0 50.45 518.00 50.19 57.60
Light Bulb 67 40 s030 | C-512.00 - 50.27 $10.80
Light Bulb 922 40 50,75 $30.00 40.56 $22.40
Light Bulb 37 40 53.30 ©$132.00 50.27 $10.80
Light Bulb 3056 200 50,89 $158.00 50.50 $100.00
Light Bulb 3057 . 200 ..50.88.....|.:..8188.00 ...[.......50.53 . 5106.00 ..
GM 4060935 1 $17.55 517.85 $22.06 522.06
GM 4060620 1 0 §11.55 + 411,85 517.85 $17.85
GM 4060952 1 $17.95 517.85 §27.23 527.23




Webb County Gonzalez Auto Parts O'Reilly Auto Parts
- . Bid Tabulation c/o Joe Gage - |efo Chris George
- Purchasing Department 4220 San Bernardo - 233 5, Patterson

Date opened: 4.14.14 Laredo, TX 78041 - |Springfield, Mo 65802
Bid: 2015-05 Annual Contract for Auto Parts 956-726-9766 - - |a17-829-5879

gap@capauta.net X " ||nstallerbids@arelllvauto.com
Contract Expiration: 9.30.15 o ISR
If Gramed an Extension Contracs Expires: 9.30.16 - ._ .

Primary Secondary
ITEM E: AIR FILTERS:
The C_ﬂntyIWebh willonlyaccept | ool
the following brands WIX, FRAM,
AC, PURLATOR and HASTINGS. | ] o)
Filters must be first-line
quality filters only.
Light Buty Trucks and Cars Alr Fllter
INTL - 3551814C1 1 84350 |- %4350 %52.07 552,07
INTL - 3551815C1 ] . 529,61 529,61 $29.04 529.04
WIX 42020 6 %325 | 41950 53.85 523.10
WwiIX 42073 [ -83.00 .- |- - 818,00 53,64 $21.84
WIX 42077 6 So53.00 | %1800 L7 53.75 522.50
WIX 42088 6 5350 - 52100 53.63 521,78
WIX 42098 24 *.53.92 885,76 54.29 $102.96
WiIX 42113 10 153,10 - 531.00 5452 545.20
WIX 42116 20 53.25 - $65.00 4335 567.00
WiX 42119 10 524,99 §248.80 - 528,72 5$287.20
WX 42126 6 512,75 87650 ¢ $13.75 $82.50
WIX 42133 6 %3.85 ©%2310 54.45 526.70
WIX 42153 6 $3.25 © 1950 - 54.33 $25.98
WIX 42194 [3 S 85.27 0| 83182 56.96 54176
WIX 42222 6 513,25 . $79.50 - $13.79 582.74
WIX 42233 6 282075 C| . 412450 $22.32 $133.92
Wix 42234 B 12 42075 [ 8249.00 $23.58 $282.96
WIX 42254 6 519,85 '$118.70 $21.97 5131.82
WIX 42253 12 520.50 - $354.00 $32.14 5385.68
WIX 42276 4] 510,85 SAR5.70 - $13.86 583.16
WX 42295 6 E VI RETT Y IE 58.31 549.86
WIX 42321 12 522,50 :5270.00 525.73 $308,76
WIX 42334 6 524,35 . §145.50 527.12 $162.72
WX 42335 6 - $18.78 $118.68 |  $28.53 517118
WIX 42373 6 53,49 © 520,94 $4.66 $27.06
wix4zass 10 55.25 §5250 | 4538 553.80
WIX 42336 6 ~'328.50 $171.00 : 430.74 $184.44
WIX 42373 3] ©53,49 |t 62004 54,66 527.96
WIX 42434 3] ri 812,00 - $3.53 521.18
WIX 42472 6 57.85 54710 $8.67 558.02
WIX 42487 200 $10,00 -1 -52,000.00 510.90 $2,180.00
WIX 42491 200 542.92 $8,584.00 $43.66 $8,732.00
WIX 42504 & $13.,61 881,66 517.38 $304.28
WIX 42631 6 521.95 5131.70 525.24 $151.44
WIX 42632 20 514,35 - $287.00 516.24 $324.80
WIX 42648 18 5$16.75......|.-..5301.50...;}... . 519,24 ..$346,32.
WIX 42651 18 $23,75 ... 842750 425,43 $457.74
WIX 42672 [3 447,07 | 5282.42 558.94 $353.64
WIX 42673 3] o 520,67 512402 - 525,37 518222 -
WIX 42674 6 $27.15 $162.00 | $37.33 $223.98
WIX 42675 B $18.25 $115.50 522,28 $133.68
WIX 42676 5] $27.50 5165.00 528.11 $168.66




. Webh County : | Gonzalez Auto Parts - O'Reilly Auto Parts
"+ -Bid Tabulation R ' * |efoloe Gage -2 " |efochris George
o o * Purchasing Department . o _ {4220 5an Bernardo - . (233 5. Patterson

Date opened: 4,14,14 Laredo, TX 78041 . - . :|Springfield, MO 65802
Bid: 2015-05 Annual Contract for Auto Parts 956-726-9766 . .. |417-829-5879

gap@gapautonst . - . installerbids@orelllyauto.com
Contract Expiration; 9,30.13 R VR
If Granted an Exiension Conract Expires: 9.30.16 L o

Primary |Secondary
WIX 42714 & ]
WIX 42723 3 .- 849,74 $10.06 360.36
WIX 42725 & S72.00 $12.52 $75.12
WIX 42759 5 5172.50 $30.71 $184,26
WIX 42817 & .-’5352,50 585,75 $514.50
WiX 42918 6 . %125.34°| 528.96 $173.76
WIX 42920 6 88262 | G1B56 $111.36
WIX 42924 12 $222,00 819,13 $220.56
WiX 42926 12 518300 | 51544 $185.28
WIX 42980 12 ‘535940 | 531.89 $382.68
WiX42981 12 $287.40 $25.75 $309.00
WiX 42992 . 10 513,10 .. 51,72 517.20
WIX 46036 10 83250 ¢ $4.08 $40.80
WEX 46040 12 545,00 $4.66 $55.92
WIX 46046 10 $33.00 $4.60 546,00
WIX 46048 10 $28.30 33,73 537.30
WX 46077 12 $66.00 $5.73 $68.76
WX 46084 12 C 851,00 $4.60 $55.20
WX 46088 12 - 569.00 46.08 $72.956
WIX 46116 15 497,50 $7.15 $107.25
WEX 46117 15 §78.75 $7.43 5111.45
WiIX 46120 12 /542,00 - 44,60 455,20
WIX 46126 ] 15 56750 54,60 569.00
WIX 46128 12 $63.00 - $5.32 $63.84
WIX 46133 12 : $57.00 - $4.59 $59.88
WiX 46134 250 51,8750 - 54.596 $1,240.00
WiX 46138 N 10 845,00 - $5.00 $50.00
WIX 46144 30 . 5193.50 $7.60 $228,00
WiX 46153 55 528875 $5.63 $300.65
WIX 46174 75 - 8383.75 35.48 $411.00
WIX 46180 10 84100 - $5.11 551.10
WIX 46204 10 -5121.00 © $12.98 $125.80
WIX 46220 10 54750 56.13 561.30
WIX 46246 12 186120 $5.11 $61.32
WX 46272 10 512400 - §15,69 $156,90
WIX 46255 8 57400 511,33 390.64
WX 46301 6 - 540,80 57.00 542.00
WIX 46302 [ .7.536.80 .. 56.41 538.46
WiX46313 i0 $170.50 518.28 $182.80
WX 46316 12 “$16B.00- | 51614 415368
WX 46375 10 $152.50 516.63 $166.30
WIX 46406 16 $148.00 58,65 $154,40
WIX 46416 16 $137.60 - 58.97 $143.52
WIX 46417 10 $165.00 - $17.86 5178.60
WIX 46418 300 $3,225.00 §11.25 $3,375,00
WIX 46428 12 457.00 $4.99 $59.88
WIX 46433 10 $235.00 - $24.25 $242.50
WIX 46438 15 823250 $14.99 5224.85
WIX 46440 10 TUR1I5.00 7| 81273 | 812730
WIX 46472 10 86500 G- 57,60 $76,00
WIX 46496 12 8279,84 427.22 5326.64
WIX 46489 ] 12 '$264.00 $21.59 $259.08
WIX 46500 10 5325.40 $36.65 $366.50
WIX 46522 12 5183,00 516.18 $194.16
WIX 46530 10 $267.50 $28.51 $285.10




Webh County

Bid Tahulation
NI - Purchasing Department
Date opened: 4.14.14

{4220 San Bernardo

Bid: 2015-05 Annual Contract for Auto Parts

Contract Expiration; 9.30.13

I Gramed an Exrension Contract Expives; 9.30.16

Gonzalez Auto Parts = -
¢/oJoe Gage - :

Laredo, TX 78041 -
856-726-9766
gap@aapauto.net

O'Reilly Auto Parts

- |e/o Chris Gearge

233 S, Patterson

Springfield, MO 65802

417-829-5872

installerbids@orelllyauto.com

* |Secondary

Ext.Prive it Pr Ext: Price
WIX 46531 10 520540 s22.01 $220.10
WIX 46562 25 %618.75 | 52517 $629.25
WIX 46565 20 '5270.00 - 514,14 $282.80
WIX 46573 8 58400 ] 51125 $90.00
WIX 46648 16 ©.5158,20 - $10.98 $175.68
WIX 46671 10 519250 522.35 $223.50
WIX 46711 3 §150.24 §29,39 $176.34
WIX 46722 i0 845340 | S4BB2 $486.20
WiIX 46723 a0 8209750 | 83187 $319.70
WIX 46734 12 $513.00 ! %4625 $555.00
WX 46744 12 "5330.00 529.51 5354,12
WIX 46759 12 -5456,00 546,03 §552.36
WIX 46804 150 -52,062.50 514,57 $2,185.50
WX 46870 14 -§553,00 -] 54259 $596,26
WIX 46871 14 . 545840 - . 338.09 $533.26
wix4e976 24 CISA7.52 ] 5211 $50.64
WIX 46977 12 521,48 52.1%1 525,32
IGERSALL RAND 59144188 12 $150,12 §15.71 $188.52
3551814C1 INTL 12 852200 $52.07 $624.84
3E51815CIINTL 12 535532 $29.04 5348.48
356424 BRIGGS 12 52808 42,99 435,88
WIX 42011 10 : §26,50 - 43,50 535,00
WIX 48115 10 599,50 -, 510,22 $102.20
WEX 48136 16 "$165.76 $12.51 $200.16
WIX 42272 10 584,30 $12.07 512070
WIX42824 10 $290.00 533.04 $330.40
WIX 46922 12 '$426.00 $38.00 $456.00
WIX 46923 10 1623500 | 427.86 $278.60
WIX 46563 3p 874,10 - $28.87 $866.10

ALTERNATE:

Crwn Vict Ford 33-2272 {1987-06 4.6 [iter V-8) 40-50% jobber
Ford F-150, F-250 E0945 40-50% jobber
Chevrolet 5.3 liter v-B Tahoe, Silverado, 33-2129 40-50% jobber
Percent of discount 10% list, Johber, etc. please
specify
ITEM F: OIL FILTERS
LghtDug Trucks and Cars I DR
WIX 51036 10 (8275 |t $27.50 53.45 534,50
WIX 51040 45 $2.75 5123.75 53,45 $155,25
WIX 51060 24 52,75 |- 566,00 §3.45 582.80
WIX 51061 24 52.75 ©E66.00 $3.90 $53,60
WIX 51065 20 5430 486,00 . 53.77 $75.40
WIX 51068 24 S %295 [ 86600 $3.29 $78.96
WIX 51069 12 2,82 . 0| %33.84 - $3.35 $40.68
WIX 51085 18 <5285 853,10 53.73 567.14
WIX 51113 10 TU53E7 TR3R70 | 52041 7820410
WX 51147 10 $4.12 ©U841.20 $5.92 $59,20
WIX 51163 10 10 %530 ¢ |- :553.00 $7.23 572,30
WEX 51194 12 38.97 5107.64 512.97 $155.64
WIX 51197 16 $15.49 '5247.84 $7.90 5126.40
WIX 51204 12 512,69 $152.28 $16.49 $197.88
WIX 51243 12 $3.57 542.84 84.15 549,80




;. Webb County Gonzalez Auto Parts O'Rellly Auto Parts
: -Bid Tabulation cfo Joe Gage ' _ /o Chris George

=¥ - . purchasing Department 4220 San Bernardo - - |233 5. Patterson
Date apened: 4.14.14 Laredo, TX 78041 . - - |Springfield, MO 65802
Bid: 2015-05 Annual Contract for Auto Parts 956-726-9766 - |417-829-5879

gap@gapauto.net ) g -|Installerbids{@oreitlyauta.com
Cantract Expiration: 9.30.13 _. R o :
If Granted an Extension Comract Expiees: 9.30.16 S

Primary Secondary
WIX 51268 10 . 532,30 $4.04 540.40
WIX 51290 10 518,25 . 518250 §23.17 $231.70
WIX 51334 18 5315 | 45670 - 44,15 $74.70
WX 51348 400 82,75 1 51,100,00 $3.45 51,380.00
WIX 51361 12 -$2,95 535,40 $3.65 $43.80
WiIX 51372 800 43,00 .$2,400.00 53.73 $2,984.00
WX 51394 10 53.11 53110 53,73 $37.30
WIX 51381 10 53,15 53150 53,61 536,10
WX 51452 10 52,84 52840 - 85.71 $57.10
WIX 51456 10 $24.68 $246.80 530.01 $300.10
WIX 51515 10 §2.75 §27.50 $3.45 $34.50
WIX 51516 36 '82.75 499,00 - 53.45 $124.20
WIX 51551 24 54,22 1510128 55,20 $124.80
WIX 51602 10 $3.65 -253650 o 0 84.42 $44.20
WIX 51607 24 54,40 .| 510560 55.34 §128.16
WIX 51616 10 '534.93 U 534930 . $46.38 $463.80
WIX 51630 10 -82.67 826,70 $2.96 529.60
WIX 51648 8 %4813 [ 338504 $44.81 $358.48
WIX 51645 8 $11.16 589,28 515.04 $120.32
WIX 51663 12 $5.25 | ~%63.00 56,71 580.52
WIX 51722 36 57,25 | 5261.00 - 58,61 $309.95
WIX 51731 15 54650 | 5687.50 552.93 $753.95
WIX 51734 16 80.25 ~5148,00 510,79 $172.64
WIX 51742 [ - 56,25 83750 $8.30 $49.80
WIX 51748 10 523.80 5238.00 $27.53 $275.30
‘WIX 51750 10 57.44 " 574.40 59.64 __596.40
WEX 51784 16 85,20 ~583.20 $6.33 $101,28
WIX 51791 16 '56.10 897.60 47.19 $115,04
WIX 51794 16 56.05 506,80 . 57.44 5119.04
WIX 51787 30 ‘54,69 814070 . -56.52 - $195.60
WIX 51799 10 516,36 15163.60 £19.19 $191.50
WIX 51806 10 55,75 85750 ¢ 57.82 $78.20
WIX 57606 10 53135 §313.50 534.57 5345,70
WIX 51570 10 §11.25 §112.50 $13.79 $137.50
(HYD) 51149 34 4$6.86 524696 57.63 $274.68
(HYD) 51203 10 58.40 584,00 $0.35 $93.50
WIX 51042 10 53.45 53450 $3.89 $38.80
WIX 51064 10 '$3.15 $31.50 $5,99 558,80
WIX 51071 10 42.87 S EIRI0 $3.80 $38.00
WIX 51088 12 143,25 .$30,00 $4.67 $56.04
WIX 51215 - 12 ‘53,56 54272 54,32 549.44
WIX 51261 12 53,43 541,16 $4.78 557.36
WI¥X 51307 B 12 53,70 $45.48 54,04 548,48
WIX 51356 12 53,75 54500 © 53.95 $47.40
WIX 51372 10 -53.00 530,00 . $3.73 $37.30
[HYD) WIX 51485 10 $23.20 $232.00 532.28 §322.80
(HYD) WIX 51485 10 525,65 $256.50 428,55 $285.50
{HYD) WIX51486 10 $32.29 532280 .| .. 538.87 .. ...$398.70 -
WIX 51487 10 54,70 847,00 55,74 $57.40
WIX 51522 36 53.50 -$126.00 - 53,96 $142.56
WIX 51545 i0 56,42 - 564,20 | $11.56 ) §115.60 -
WIX 51618 10 §6.11 86110 - - 57.75 $77.50
WIX 51746 10 §6.12 461,20 50,02 590,20
WIX 51759 24 68,25 5222.00 511.30 $271.20




- Webb County - Gonzalez Auto Parts . . . |O'Reilly Auto Parts
" Bid Tabulation ' ; ' " |c/o Joe Gage -+ |efo Chris George
" . | Purchasing Department =~ : 4220 5an Bernarda -+ - - |233 S. Patterson

Date opened: 4.14.14 LarEd_D,,_TX?BD_Iﬂl e : - |Springfield, MO 65802
Bid: 2015-05 Annual Contract for Auto Parts 956-726-9766 o [#17-829-5879

gep@oapeuto.nst - -+ |insiatlerbids@oreillyauto.com
Contract Expiration; 9,306,135 L Sl
If Graned an Extension Contract Expives: 9.30.16 o _

Primary - Secondary
WIX 51772 24 -'46.30 | s1s1.20 $7.67 $184.08
WIX 51782 40 %1200 | °$4B0.00 513.79 S551.60
WIX 51796 16 5555 .| : SBE80 . $6.11 %97.76
WIX 51817 12 625,20 $302.40 ] %3351 5402.12
WI¥ 51863 12 '545,00 7| : $588.00 $52.65 §631.80
{Tran) 57060 80 %350 | 528000 $3.45 §2756.00
WIX 57028 12 -~ 5611 §73.32 §12.08 $144,96
WIX 57089 10 54,00 840,00 ¢ 54,74 547.40
[Trans) 57701 10 %942 $94.20 ¢ 511.84 $11B.40
WIX 57243 12 5810 $97.20 ¢ 510,14 §121,68
WIX 57740 16 549,16 | ‘57B6.56 . $54.04 $B64.64
WIX 57746XD 24 527,75 | S666.00 ¢ 530.92 5742.08
Trans WIX 58608 12 '511.55 $143.40 512,92 $155.04
Trans WIX 58613 12 ~§7,50 - 880,00 | - -57.81 593.72
Trans WIX 5B705 12 85,48 ) L8656 $7.26 587.12
Trans WIX 58707 12 8375 7 54500 - 54,09 549,08
Trans WIX 58815 26 511,25 529250 - $11.59 530134
Trans WIX 58840 16 059,25 - 5148.00 . 55,94 $159.04
Trans WIX 58877 12 51055 ©8131.40 7| $11.68 $140.16
Trans WIX 58881 12 53.99 $47.88 . $5.30 563,60
Trans WIX 5BR90 12 T 5818 | 588,16 - 511.75 $135.00
Trans WIX 58892 123 - 52130 | 52,619.80 527.71 $3,408,33
Trans WIX 58896 12 56,60 5$78.20 - 58,47 $101.64
Trans WIX 58897 ] 12 - 8B58 | 578,96 58.79 $105.48
Trans WIX 58504 12 8825 | 588.00 58.47 $101.64
Trans WIX 58917 12 5952 |- 5114,24 ¢ 512,64 415168
Trans WIX 58018 12 86,73 |4 $R0T6 $9.05 510860
Trans WIX 58920 12 52,88 534,56 = 53.44 $41.28
Trans WIX 58929 12 8350 0|t 84200 0 s457 554,84
Trans WIX 58534 12 5488 [ $58.56 °. $6.49 $77.88
Trans WIX 58535 12 53,80 - [ 084560 - $5.00 560.00
Trans WIX 58552 12 ©85.44 7| 8E5.28 7 57.22 $86.64
Trans WIX 58955 200 511.25 52,250.00 ° $11.64 52,328.00
Trans WIX 58557 24 $14.95 | .- $358.76 . $15.56 5373.44
Trans WIX 58590 12 56,25 $75.00 513,97 $167.64
Trans WIX 58593 12 54,87 558.44 - $5.94 §71.28
WIX 57035 12 15430 cA51.60 56.14 $73.68
WIX 51215 12 8356 54272 54.12 $49.44
WIX 57060 12 §3.50 .| /54200 ... $3.45 541,40
WIX 57744 ’ 3 '$27.95 | 483B.50 ¢ 530,59 5917.70
WIX 57203 20 53,25 | %6500 53.77 $75.40
WIX 51758 18 +87.30 [ 513140 - $7.99 $143.82
WIK 57137 i2 $15.00 5180.00 516.94 $203,28
WIX 57076 12 54,17 850,04 - 45,71 568,52
ITEM &; FUEL FILTERS
Light Buty Trucks and Cars e CeE it
WIX 33002 12 So5165. 7.0 819,80 5207 | . %2484
WIX 33023 12 5450 558.80 - 58.51 102,12
WIX 33032 10 © 8170 - $17.00 - 52,22 522,20
WIX 33059 N 10 522000 008222005 5280 ~-539.00
WIX 33083 10 S0.58 ‘88,80 41,35 $13,50
WIX 33057 20 $4.75 595,00 56.34 $126.80
WIX 33109 20 $4.50 550.00 $5.49 $109.80




- . -\Webh County
Bid Tabulation
g .+ Purchasing Department
Date apened: 3.14.14

Bid: 2025-05 Annual Contract for Auto Parts

Contract Expiration: 9.30.15

If Granted an Extension Contract Expires: 9.30.16

c/o toe Gage

:|4220 Sarni Bgrnardi_:_ .

Lare_du,‘lfx 78041
956-726-9766 . .
gap@oapauto.net’ | -

Pl"ii'r'iary. )

Gonzalez Auto Parts . ...

O'Rellly Auto Parts
cfo Chris George

233 5. Patterson
Springfield, MO 65802

" |a17-820-5879
. |installerbids@orelllyauio.com

] e
WIX 33166 10 54,00 ‘340,00
WIX 33370 12 5850 -} -.:5103,08
WIX 33377 10 CSB.50 --0f 7 885,00 -
WIX 33390 16 G444 10 5104 .
_Wix 33392 12 $18.00 [ 821600 $19.61 $235.32
WIX 33403 12 8785 | 500,60 ; 58,35 3100.20
WK 33405 12 8973 [ 811676 510.65 $127.80
WIX 33439 12 ©.811.94 $143.28 512.55 $150.60
WIX 33472 12 SBO5 | $86.E0 1. 58,57 $102.84
WIX 33481 16 $6.00 - $06.00 - - $7.85 5125.50
WIX 33438 10 781104 .| 811840 $12.55 313550
WIX 33483 10 54,65 - $46.50 §7.12 571.20
WX 33484 24 5645 .| 5154.80 $8.45 $202.80
WIX 33517 24 . $17.95 - [ 543080 | 519.83 $475.92
WIX 33518 12 %1895 /| 822740 | $2056 4246,72
WIX 33532 i0 412,25 .|/ 612250 $15.18 $151.90
WIX 33533 12 $12.25 | $147.00 $15.33 $183.96
WiX 33811 0 '57.30 $73.00 © - 57.55 579,50
WIX 1822627C1 8 5806 .|\ 56448 58,00 564,00
Case 254686A1 8 $20.75 -~ 5166.00 526.64 $213.12
3267 NAPA 8 $4.75 . $38.00 $5.40 543,20
3321 NAPA 8 5800 | --$64.00 - 510.02 580,16
NAPA 3439 8 $11.94 |- 088552 5$12.55 $100.40
Wix 33031 8 : 51,55 C512.40 §2.11 516.88
Wix 33144 10 $14.36 -5143,60 - $15.39 $153,90
Wix 33179 10 96,85 | ;%6990 ;" $14.78 4147.80
Wix 33183 i0 56,15 - | 86150 48,03 380.30
Wix 33217 12 81576 | 5189,12 520,89 $250.68
Wix 33243 100 S57.00 00| 5700,00 57.97 $797.00
Wix 33248 24 U8R00° 007812000 07| sa31 $151.44
Wix 33267 12 5475 | g57.00 0 85.40 $64.80
Wix 33270 12 $5.25 . .9 -.563.00 45.69 568.28
Wix 33295 24 55.75 $138.00 55.53 $142,32
Wix 33318 10 $6.50 565,00 © - 58.84 $88.40
Wix 33321 10 58,00 880007 %1002 $100,20
Wix 33324 12 87,70 . $92.40 . $10.15 $121.80
Wix 33334 12 5825 ¢ 559.00 $B.59 5103.08
Wix 33350 12 .- 5444 .4 553,28 ¢ 6533 $63.96
Wix 33349 10 $14.75 ] - 514750 .- 514.63 $146,30
WIX 33359 10 SR.00 - ‘38000 - $10.85 $108.50
Wix 33361 10 36,00 - 560.00 $7.31 $73.10
Wix 33393 8 5353 ° 531.44 $6.83 854,64
Wix 33403 10 §7.55 475,50 $8.35 $83.50
Wix 33405 10 $9,73 ©.897.30 . -| 41065 5106.50
Wix 33406 10 41175 $117.50 511.78 5117.80
Wix 33539 10 51194 . +5§119,40 $12.55 $125,50
Wix 33472 43 5805 436225 58.57 5385.65
Wix 33481 36 %600 | . %$216,00 - §7.85 $282,60
Wix 33483 10 254,65 | 846,50 1 $7.12 571.20
Wix 33484 10 864500 25645000 . SB.45 . . 684,50 ...
Wix 33430 10 54,98 - 548,80 56.65 $66.50
Wix 33509 12 511.09 - $143,88 $75.37 5304.44
Wix 33517 12 51785 " 821540 519.83 5237.56
WIX 33518 12 518.95 $227.40 520,56 $246.72




‘Webhb County
) - Bid Tabulation
S . .. Purchasing Departmant
Date opened: 4.14.14

Gonzalez Auto Parts
¢/oloe Gage -

4220 San Bernards |

O'Reilly Auto Parts
¢/o Chris George

- |233 5. Patterson

Bid: 2015-05 Annual Contract for Auto Parts

Contract Expiration: 5.30.13

If Giranted an Extension Contract Expires: 9.30.16

Laredo, TX 78041
956-726-9765
gap@aapautanet -

~|Springfield, MO 65802
.+ |417-820-5879
. |installerbidsFareillyauto.com

WIX 33521 10 55,1 $84.20
WIX 33531 10 $13.00 .- |."-5130.00 - 3156,40
Wix 33532 10 512,25 .|/ §122.50° $151.90
Wix 33533 10 §12,25 i |0 §123,50 - 415330
Wiy 33548 £l $13.25 . 5387.50 54B6.60
Wix 3357% 10 $6.01 860,10 - $79.60
Wix 33585 10 510.13 $101.30 $108.50
Wix 33595 ) 56,00 ' '$360.00 - $376.20
Wix 33626 10 §8.50 S85.00 551,90
Wix 33674 12 510.07 - $120.84 5131.28
WiX 33811 12 57.30 CUBBT.E0 $55.40
WIX 33424 24 $5.50 - 322800 - 5237.36
WIX 33243 10 $7.00 T 570.00 - $79.70
WIX 33719 10 58,22 582207 5112.50
WX 33749 10 58,31 58310 - 5110.80
WIX 33752 10 59.41 SOi59410 0/ $172.30
WIX 98037481 10 513.43 -%134,30 5161.80
Price:

gﬂtlwﬂﬁﬂwggﬁulgment Water Filter

WIX 24206 10 81104 $110.40 - $14.80 5148,00
WIX 24071 10 48.06 - $80,60 ° $8.00 $80.00
WX 33217 Fuel filters 10 - 518,91 ©| 15188,10 $20.89 420850
WiX 33248 10 L8500 | 85000 $6.31 $63.10
WiX 33267 10 5475 547.50 0 $5.40 554,00
WIX33295 10 85,75 | T857.60 55.93 $59.30
WiX 33311 it " 87.00 -] 57000 . $8.47 584,70
WiX 33321 10 (058,00 ofooosen00 o] 810,02 5100.20
WiX 33324 10 S7.97 ] S0 $10.15 5101.50
WiX 33336 10 58,25 " SE250 ¢ $8.59 585.90
WIX 33341 12 85,78 -] 186936 $6.46 §77.52
WIX 33352 36 85,00 -+ (-$180.00 - $5.96 421456
WiX 33357 24 $6.50 $156.00 - $7.22 5173.28
WIX 33358 24 $5.50 $132,00 - $5.73 $137.52
WiX 33365 14 81250 ) sarso0-c ] %1400 5196.00
WEX 58705 Transmissian 12 (85,48 565,76 57.26 58712
WIX 58707 12 83,75 4] 84500 .- $4.05 $49.08
WIX 58840 ) 0 59.25 | 58250 ¢ 5$0.94 $99.40
WIX 58877 45 410.95 $432,75 | 51168 3525.60
WEX 58881 10 6399 | 33g.80 - 35.30 553,00
WIX 58892 10 $21.30 | -$213.00 f 52771 $277.10
WIX 58856 10 . 56.60 - 86600 - $8.47 $B4.70
WIX 58897 10 56.58 - | . .565.80 $B.79 $87,50
WIX 58904 10 - 58.25 $82.50 58.47 584,70
WIX 58917 10 50,52 ©-:$95.20.., 512,64 $126.40
WIX 58918 10 $6.73 -567.30 - 59,05 590.50
WIX 58920 B 11 ‘5350 -] 53830 54.57 550,27
WIX 58934 10 <o S4.BRUE84R.B0 56.49 564.50
WIX 58838 10 5380 0} 1 83800 0| $5.00 $50.00 ..
WIX 58952 10 $5.44 854,40 .. §7.22 $72.20
WIX 58067 ) 36 "514.99 - -$535.64. $15.55 $560.16
WIX 52118 10 $3.05 - 530,50 538.93 $380,30




. Wehb County
_ .Bid Tabulation
S - 1 Purchasing Department
Date opened: 4.14.14

Bid: 2015-05 Annual Contract for Auto Parts

Coutract Expiration: 8,30, 15

If Granted an Extensivn Contract Expires: 9.30.16

Gonzalez Auto Parts

“|e/oloe Gage
8220 San Bernardo ..

Laredo, TX78041 .\
956-7269766 . -
gap@gapauto.net . C.

-|Seconda

- |O'Rellly Auto Parts
‘[c/o Chris George

- |233 5. Patterson

.- |Springfield, MO 65802

417-829-5873

Instalterbids@oreillyauio.com

ry

ITEM H: HYDRAULIC FILTERS
WIX 51719 10 . $39.08 ' 5300.80 651,38 $513,80
WIX 574404 0 . %29,47. 7] 15284.70 ¢ 52295 $229.50
ITEM I: TRANSMISSION FILTERS Lo

WiX 58845 15 515.9% ~.$239.85 516,00 $240.00
ITEM J; SPARK PLUGS R S

ASF-52 10 5120 | 51200 - $1.51 $15.10
R-46TS 10 51,20 1$12.00 $2.06 520,60
RASTS o &35 ] 82250 $206 |- 52060
ITEM K: DISTRIBUTOR CAP I R

FD-168 12 810,25 7 - 5323.00 $6.42 $77.04
FD-169 14 5850 T 9$119,00 $9.21 $128.94
CHA03 10 - §3.00 - [ $30.00 54.71 $47,10
CH-400 10 gz on i 4a0.00 ¢ 59.32 $93,20
DR-450 10 8750 | 57500 57.11 571,10
TEML; ROTOR CAP

FD-117 15 S182.00 | -530.00 $2.50 437,50
FD-118 12 5200 °$24.00 - 43,26 539,12
FD-167 10 §2.00 | -.$20,00. $2.76 $27.60
FD-303 10 82,35 [ 42350 $2.14 521.40
CH-303 10 5300 7| 830,00 - 5136 513.60
IR-94 10 5200 ©2|0820.00 $8.81 588.10
FD-117 10 - 8200 |00 520000 T 52.50 $25.00
DR-318 10 $200 | --420.00 - $3.16 $31.60
FD-307 10 87,85 ¢ 187950 52,12 $21.20
ITEM M: WIRE SET

6879 10 413,19 | . %5131.80 52248 $224.80
9635 10 {'§13,19 | + 513190 421,65 $216.50
9406 10 813,50 ‘-] +4135.00 518,58 $185.80
9822 10 %1350 | . $135.00. 54055 $405.50
6873 10 §13.75 7| :°§137.50 - $17.60 $176.00
6880 10 532,00 2| 532000 | $21.65 $216.50
Y57 i0 $16.00 © "5160.00 - §21.51 $215.10
7837 10 516,00 | 616000 521.51 $215.10
ITEM O: WATER FILTERS

24071 H20 WIX 10 8B.06 i | - '5BOED 58.00 S80.00
24206 H20 WIX 10 51104 - [ 8$110.40 $14.80 $148.00
24804 H20 Wix 10 - 52048 | 5204.80 $30.48 $304.80
24316 Cabin Filter Wix 60 415,50 [+ :°55830.00. 515.65 $935,00
24773 Cahin Filter Wix 10 875700 [0 87590 0] $1063 . | $206.30
24780 Cabin Filter Wix 10 $8.07 | s8o70 - 48,63 586.30
24876 Cabin Fllter Wix 10 $11.50 | 5115.00 511,36 $113.60
24807 Cahia Filter Wix 10 $6.62 - 566.20 56.34 $63.40
24868 Cabln Filtar Wix 10 $11.50 5115.00 $17.89 517880




Date opened: 4.14.14

. Webb County
. Bid Tabulation

© . Purchasing Department

- |Gonzalet Auto Parts
" |efo doe Gage -
. [42205an Bernardo -

Bid: 2015-05 Annual Contract for Auto Parts

Cantract Expiration: 9.30.15

If Granted an Exiension Contract Expires: 9.30.16

24316 Cabln Filter

piti

Laredo, TX 78041
956-726-9766 -
gap(@capauto.net

*|O'Reilly Auto Parts
¢/a Chris George

. |233 5, Patterson
|springfietd, MO 65802

417-829-5879

. |Insfallerbids@aoreillyauto.com

o Secondary

Wix

§156.50

3318157/24071 CUMMINS

$80.00

24316 Cabin Filer WIX

5156.50

ITEM M: NON.CAPTIVE AUTO &

TRUCK PARTS

ACCESSORIES

Discount off price list

40%-50%

for Items not on this price schedule

Jobber

41% ar better

GRAND TOTAL {Must be included)

$87,346.36

$101,592.63




- Webb County
Purchasing Department
Bid Tabulation

Opened: 4.14.14 Schaley Industrial Parts, LLC
Bid 2015-07 "Annual Contract for Heavy Equipment Parts" c/a Matthew Leyendecker
832 Hallmark Dr.
Contract Expires: 9.30.13 Laredo, TX 78045
If Granted an Extension Contract Expires- 9.30.16 956-831-6441

mati@schaley.com

Primary

Bid 2015-07 "Annual Contract for Heavy Equipment Parts"

ITEM A: TIPES & BLADES
1 Tip Caterpillar 13252 15 $18.00 5270.00
2 Tip Caterpillar 103302 15 $26.00 $390.00
3 Tip Caterpillar Y039 15 $38.00 5570.00
4 Blade Caterpillar T74863 10 §150.00 $1,500.00
1/2xBx7, 314 Hole

5 Retainer 1U2405 10 57.00 $70.00
6 Pin 8E6259 20 56.00 $120.00
7 Retainer BE6259 20 $6.00 $120.00
8 Pin 107-3308 10 $3.50 $35.00
9 Bolt 544773 10 52.75 527.50
10 Nut 243506 20 51.00 $20.00
11 Tip L100896 15 5160.00 $2,400.00
12 Blade BD2786 20 $60.00 $1,200.00
13 Blade T74B42 25 5110.00 52,750.00
14 Blade 7D-1158 10 $138.00|  51,380.00
15 Balde-Motor grader 8d-2757 15 $60.00 5500.00
i6 Blade-Case backhoes 112948A1 10 $255,00 §2,550.00
17 Balde-Brush hog 67743 20 $65.00 51,300.00
18 Balde-Brush hog 67744 10 $65.00 $650.00
19 Bolt-Brush hog 7919 10 $9.00 590.00




_ Webb County
Purchasing Department
Bid Tabulation

Dpeed:4.14.14 Schaley industrial Parts, LLC
Bid 2015-07 "Annual Contract for Heavy Equipment Parts" ¢/o Matthew Leyendecker
832 Hallmark Dr.
Contract Expires: 9.30.13 Laredo, TX 78045
If Granted an Extension Contract Expires- 9.30.16 956-831-6441
matt@schaley.com
Primary
Bid 2015-07 "Annual Contract for Heavy Equipment Parts"
20 Jam nut-Brush hog 252 10 $300]  $30.00
21 Lock washer-Brush hog 20322 10 $3.00 530.00
22 Cutting edge-Bull dozer 9W-1878 15 $145.00 52,175.00
23 End bits-Bull dozer 9W-8874 12 $70.00 $840.00
24 End bits-Bull dozer SW-8875 9 570.00 5630.00
25 Cutting edge-Earth scraper 47-6613 10 $105.00 $1,050.00
26 Cutting edge-Earth scraper 4T-6611 10 $190.00 $1,800.00
27 Tooth-Motor grader 9937 10 570.00 $700.00
28 Pin-Motor grader 9938 15 520.00 5300.00
29 Shank-Motor grader 8110 15 §75.00 $1,125,00
30 Ripper tooth-Motor grader 195-7234 5 $25.00 $125.00
31 Tooth-Earth scraper 3252HX 15 565,00 5975.00
32 Tooth Deere front loader 1U-3252 20 518.00 5360.00
33 Pin-John Deere front loader 132-4763 25 53.00 $75.00
34 Washer-John Deere front loader 148-5733 20 $6.00 5120.00
35 Tooth-963 Track Loader 1U-3302 10 526.00 $260.00
36 Pin-963 Track Loader 107-3308 15 $3.50 §52.50
37 Retainer-Track Loader 8E-6259 15 56.00 590.00
38 Tooth-863 Track Loader 6Y-0309 10 $38.00 $380.00
(rear ripper}
39 Pin-963 Track Loader 114-0358 10 $10.00 5100.00




Webb County
Purchasing Department
- N " Bid Tabulation .
Opened: 4.14.14 Schaley Industrial Parts, LLC

Bid 2015-07 "Annual Contract for Heavy Equipment Parts" ¢/o Matthew Leyendecker
832 Hallmark Dr.
Contract Expires: 9.30.15 Laredo, TX 78045
If Granted an Extension Contract Expires- 9.30,16 956-831-6441
matt@schaley.com
Primary
Bid 2015-07 "Annual Contract for Hea ipment Parts"
T e S -
40 Retainer-963 Track Loader 10 $8.00 580.00
114-0358 (rear ripper)
41 Tooth-Case Motor grader 75251673 15 5100.00 51,500.00
42 Roll pin-Case Motor grader 10 $20.00 $200.00
75251674
43 Shank-Case Motor grader 10 $100.00 51,000.00
73162856
44 Tooth-Bull dozer (ripper} 15 560.00 5900.00
6Y-0352
45 Pin-Bull dozer {ripper) 9W-2678P 15 56.00 590.00
46 Retainer-Bull dozer (ripper) 10 55.00 550,00
TBEB359
a7 Tooth-Backhoe TF-23D 15 58.00 $120.00
48 Pin-Backhoes TF-23P 10 $3.50 535.00
49 Blade bolt-Motor grader 3F-5108 10 §1.10 511.00
50 Blade nut-Motor grader 4K-0367 15 50.75 $11.25
51 Balde washear-Motor grader 38-4510 10 $0.25 $2.50
52 tooth # 6Y0359 15 560.00 $900.00
53 Vail Pin # 79309300 10 58.50 $85.00
54 Pin {79309300) 10 _ S8.50 585.00
55 Tip (AT 166866) 15 58.00 $120.00
56 Cutting Edge (T187987) 10 5155.00 $1,550.00




g Webb County
. Purchasing Department
" - 'Bid Tabulation .

Opened: 4.14.14 Schaley Industrial Parts, LLC
i Bid 2015-07 "Annual Contract for Heavy Equipment Parts" c/o Matthew Leyendecker
832 Hallmark Dr.
Contract Expires: 9.30.15 Laredo, TX 78045
If Granited an Extension Contract Expires- 9.30.16 956-831-6441

matt@schaley.com

Primary

5100.00 $1,200.00

58 End Bit { T187244) 10 $125.00 $1,250.00
59 Edge T32742 Bobcat 12 512500 51,500.00
GRAND TOTAL $38,349.75

(Must be included)

ITEM B: Non Captive/Eguipment Parts
ACCESSOCRIES Discounts

1. Schedule None Stated
List None Stated
Dealer None Stated
Jobber None Stated

2.FIXED Discount OFf Price List for items not listed None Stated




Bid Opened: Webb County Consolidated Electrical Dist. |3G Electrical Supply Inc.
m4/14/2014 Purchasing Dept. c/o Alan K. Rudder 811 East Calton Rd.
Bid Tabulation 1010 E. Calton Rd. Laredo, TX 78041
Bid 2015-16 Annual Contract for Electrical Supplies Laredo, TX 78041 956-724-2151
956-722-4951 david@3gelectric.com
arudder@cedlaredo.com
- | :
Secondary Primary
Bid 2013-16 Annual Contract for Electrical Supplies- Price Schedule Form
Wiring
A. Solid
1 15 |1.#10 $ 0.16 $2.33| % 0.1560 $2.34
2 15 |2.#12 $ 0.096 $1.44 [ & 0.0987 $1.48
31 15 |3.#14 $ 0.06 50.97 | $ 0.0653 $0.98
B. Stranded
41 10 |1. #0 $ 1.68 $16.81| § 1.6230 $16.23
5 12 |2.#2/0 $ 2.03 $24.38| $ 2.0350 $24.42
6 10 3. #3/0 % 2.65 $26.50{ $§ 2.5530 $25.53
71 15 |4, #2 5 1.11 $16.65| § 1.0413 $15.62
B8] 10 |5. #4 $ 0.71 $7.09| $ 0.6640 $6.64
9 15 |[6. #6 $ 0.46 $6.89| 3 0.4293 $6.44
101 12 (7. #8 $ 0.30 $3.58| % 0.2792 $3.35
11 10 8. #10 $ 0.19 $1.85| % 0.2250 $2.25
12| 15 |9. #12 $ 0.12 $1.73{ § 0.1453 $2.18
13| 15 [10.#14 $ 0.08 $1.19{ % 0.0947 $1.42
Conduits
A. EMT 10" Joints
14 15 1. 1/2" $ 0.25 $3.75| $ 2.22800 $33.42
15 15 2, 3/4" $ 0.40 $6.00; $ 4.27000 $64.05
16| 20 |[3.1" 5 0.78 $15.60{ $ 7.00000 $140.00
17| 20 [4.1-14" $ 1.14 $22.80| $11.57300 $231.46
18 20 [5.1-1/2" 5 1.38 $27.60| $14.00000 $280.00
19| 25 6.2 $ 1.60 $40.00| $16.57800 $414.45
B. PVC 10" Joint
200 20 |1.12" 5 017 $3.40| % 1.753 $35.06
21 16 2. 34" 3 0.21 $3.15| & 2133 $32.00
22 10 a1 $ 0.32 $3.20| 3.098 $30.98
231 12 4114 5 0.45 $5.40( % 4.464 $53.57
24 20 5. 1-1/2" $ 0.52 $10.40( % 5.154 $103.08
251 10 |6.2" 5 0.68 $6.60| § 6.533 $65.33
C. Greenfield (Flexible Metallic
Conduit
26 15 1.3/8" $ 0.36 $5.40| & 0.345 $5.17
27 20 2. 12 $ 0.42 $8.40{ % 0.403 $8.05




Bid Opened: Webb County Consolidated Electrical Dist. |3G Electrical Supply Inc.
4/14/2014 Purchasing Dept. c/o Alan K. Rudder 811 East Calton Rd.
Bid Tabulation 1010 E. Calton Rd. Laredo, TX 78041 )
Bid 2015-16 Annual Contract for Electrical Supplies Laredo, TX 78041 956-724-2151
956-722-4951 david@3gelectric.com
- arudder@cedlaredo.com
Secondary Primary
28 10 3.1 $ 1.00 $10.00| $ 1.000 $10.00
29] 15 |4.1-1M4" % 1.33 $19.95( % 1.359 $20.39
30 20 5. 1-1/2" $ 2.1 $42.20( $ 2.203 $44.05
31 25 6, 2" % 2.57 $64.25( % 2.719 $67.98
32| 12 47, 34 $ 0.55 $6.60{ $ 0.539 $6.47
D. Greenfield (Liguid Tight Flex)
34| 10 2. 1/2" % 0.52 $5.20($ 0.483 $4.83
35| 15 3. 1" $ 0.99 $14.85| $  1.295 $19.43
36 12 |4, 1-1/4° $ 1.28 $15.36| % 2.092 $25.10
37 10 5. 1-1/2" $ 2.36 $23.60| § .31 $33.71
3B 20 6.2" 3 2.77 $55.40| § 3.242 $64.83
gy 10 [7.34" $ 0.67 $6.70| § 0.978 $9.78
Fittinas
A. EMT
1. Set Screw Connector
401 10 a. 1/2" % 0.14 $140 |5 0.147 $1.47
41 12 b. 3/4" $ 0.24 $2.82 | % 0.248 $2.98
a4z 10 c. 1" $ 0.39 $3.90 | % 0.464 $4.64
43 15 d. 1-1/4" $ 0.75 $11.25 | & 0.831 $12.486
44] 12 e. 1-1/2" $ 1.09 $3.081% 1111 $13.33
45 10 2" $ 1.55 $1550 | § 1.497 $14.97
2. Raintight Connectors
46 10 a. 12" $ 0.27 $270 | % 0.240 $2.40
47 12 b. 3/4" E: 0.37 5444 | § 0.433 $5.19
48 10 c. 1" $ 0.59 $5.90 |$ 0.719 $7.19
49 15 d. 1-1/4" $ 1.14 $1710 1% 1193 $17.90
50| 12 e, 1-1/2" $ 1.67 $20.04 | $ 1.538 $18.46
51| 10 f. 2" $ 2.42 $24.20 | §  2.456 $24.56
3. Set Screw Couplings
52 12 a. 1/2" $ 0.17 $2.08 | § 0.161 $1.93
53 i0 b. 3/4" 5 0.28 $2.80 (5 0.257 $2.57
54 10 c. 1" $ 0.45 $4501% 0.427 $4.27
551 10 d. 1-1/4" 3 0.87 $8.70 { % 0854 $8.54
56| 10 e. 1-1/2" $ 1.23 $12.30 | % 1.319 $13.19




Bid Opened: Webb County Consolidated Electrical Dist. |3G Electrical Supply Inc.
4/14/2014 Purchasing Dept. ¢/o Alan K. Rudder 811 East Calton Rd.
Bid Tahulation 1010 E. Calton Rd. Laredo, TX 78041
Bid 2015-16| Annual Contract for Electrical Supplies Laredo, TX 78041 956-724-2151
» 956-722-4953 david@3gelectric.com
arudder@cedlaredo.com
|
Secondary Primary
s- Price Schedule Form
S
57] 10 | f.2° § 169 $16.90 | §  1.556 $15.56
4. Raintight Couplings
58 15 a. 1/2" $ 0.34 $5.03 | % 0.380 $5.70
52| 10 ib. 34" $ 0.46 $4.57 (3 0.491 $4.91
60 10 e 1" $ 69.00 $690.00 {3 0.819 $8.19
61 12 |d. 11/4" $ 1.25 $15.00 | §  1.427 $17.12
62 5 e. 1-1/2" $ 1.81 $9.05 | § 2122 $10.61
63 10 f. 2" $ 247 $24.70 ( % 2.749 $27.49
B. PVC
1. Terminal (Connectors) Adapters
(male)
64| 12 a. 1/2" $ 0.12 $1.441% 0113 $1.35
65 10 b. 3/4" 5 0.22 $2201% 0.200 $2.00
66 10 c. 1" $ 0.29 $290 |$ 0.250 $2.50
67 10 d.11/4" $ 0.34 $3.40 | $ 0.313 $3.13
68 10 e. 112" $ 0.41 $410 | $ 0.375 $3.75
69 10 f. 2" $ 0.59 $5.90 | $ 0.538 $5.38
|12. 90 degree Elbows
700 12 a. 1/2" $ 0.347 $4.16 | $  0.325 $3.90
71 10 b. 3/4" s 0.389 $3.89 | § 0.350 $3.50
72 10 c. 1" $ 0.60 $5.98 | % 0.550 $5.50
73 10 d. 11/4" 5 0.885 $B8.85 | § 0.875 $8.75
74 10 e 112" $ 1.160 $1160 | $ 1.063 $10.63
75 10 £ 2" $ 1.5%0 $1590 | § 1.438 $14.38
3. Couplings
76 12 a. 12" % 0.089 $1.07 | $ 0.080 $0.96
77| 10 b. 3/4" $ 0.110 51.101% 0100 $1.00
78 10 c 1" 3 0.169 $169(% 0163 $1.63
79| 10 d. 11/4" 5 0.225 $2.25 [§ 0.213 $2.13
80| 10 e 112" 1% 0365 $365|% _ 0.288 $2.88
81 10 2" $ 0.418 $4.18 | $ 0.350 $3.50
C. Greenfield
1. Straight Squeeze type flex




Bid Opened: Webb County Consolidated Electrical Dist. |3G Electrical Supply Inc.
4/14/2014 Purchasing Dept. c/o Alan K. Rudder 811 East Calton Rd.
Bid Tabulation 1010 E. Calton Rd. Laredo, TX 78041
Bid 2015-16 Annual Contract for Electrical Supplies Laredo, TX 78041 956-724-2151 B
956-722-4951 david@3gelectric.com
arudder@cedlaredo.com
E
Secondary Primary
Bid 2013-16 Annual Contract for Electrical Supplies- Price Schedule Form
Rl .
cannectors
82 15 a. 12" $ 0.415 $6.23 | $ 0.337 $5.08
83 10 b. 3/4" s 0.895 $8.95}| % 0.681 $6.81
84 10 c. 1" $ 1.055 $1055 | § 1.169 $11.69
85| 12 d.11/4" 3 2.770 $33.24 (& 2628 $31.53
86 5 e. 11/2" L3 3.270 $16.35 | & 3.554 $17.77
87 10 f 2" L 4.080 $40.80 | 4.710 $47.10
2. liguid tight squeeze type.
fiex connectors
88 15 airR" $ 1.570 $23.55 | § 0.959 $14.38
89 10 b. 3/4" $ 2.070 $20.70 1 $ 1.674 $16.74
oo 10 c 1" $ 4.400 $44.00 | $ 2.594 $25.94
91 12 d. 1 1/4" $ 7.010 $84.12 1% 4115 $49.38
92 5 e.11/2" $ 10.200 $51.00 | $ 5.980 $29.90
93] 10 f. 2" $ 12500 $12500 | § 9.229 $92.29
3. 80 degree angle flex connectors
94 15 a. 172" $ 0.710 $10.65 | $ 0.532 $7.98
85 10 b. 3/4" % 0.645 $6.45 | 1.273 $12.73
961 10 c. 1" $ 1.250 $1250(§  3.287 $32.87
97| 12 d.11/4" % 4.140 $49.68 | $  4.686 $56.23
98 5 e 11/2" $ 8.350 $41,75 |$ 9.388 $46.94
85 10 f. 2" $ 9.490 $94.90 | $ 11.520 $115.20
4. Liguid tight 80 degree angle
flex connectors
100 5 a 1/2" 5 2.510 $12.55 | § 1.940 $9.70
101 5 b. 3/4" 5 4.290 $2145|% 2.998 $14.99
102 5 c. 1" $ 7.690 $38.45|% 5.818 $29.09
103 5 d. 11/4" $ 12.410 $62.05 | % 9.168 $45.84
104 5 e.11/2" $ 19.980 $99.90 [ § 13.222 $66.11
105 5 f. 2" $ 24.980 $12490 | $§ 18.510 $92.55
106 Utility Boxes and Covers
A. Octagon Boxes
107 5 1. 4" QOctagon boxes with $ 1.264 $6.32 | % 1.022 $5.11
1/2" and 3/14" K.Q.'s




Bid Opened:

Webb County

Consolidated Electrical Dist.

3G Electrical Supply Inc.

4/14/2014 Purchasing Dept. c/o Alan K. Rudder 811 East Calton Rd.
Bid Tabulation 1010 E. Calton Rd. Laredo, TX 78041
Bid 2015-16 Annual Contract for Electrical Supplies Laredo, TX 78041 956-724-2151

056-722-4951

david@3gelectric.com

arudder@cedlaredo.com

scue

Secondary

Primary

Bid 2013-16 Annual Contract for Electrical Supplies- Price Schedule Form

EMD

08 5 2. 4" octagon box extension $ 2.656 $13.28 | & 1.022 $5.11
rings with 1/2" and 3/4" K.Q.'s
109 10 3. 4" octagon boxes flat blank $ 0.435 5435 | § 0.259 $2.59
covers
B. Square (Junction) Boxes
110 10 1. 4" square 1 1/2" deep with $ 0.5710 $5.71|$ 0.6180 $6.18
112" and 3/4" K.QO.'s
111 10 2. 4" square extension rings $ 1.3630 $13.63 | $ 1.8400 $18.40
with 1/2" and 3/4" K.Q.'s
112| 10 3. 4" square flat blank covers $ 0.257 $2.57 ($  0.247 $2.47
113 10 4. 4" square surface covers for $ 0.977 $9.77 | & 0.618 $6.18
toggle switch
114 5 5. 4" square surface covers for $ 1.064 $6.32 | § 0.742 $3.71
single receptacle
115 10 6. 4" square surface covers for 3 1.064 $1064 | 0.742 $7.42
duplex receptable
116 15 7. 4" square surface covers for $ 1.190 $17.85 [ & 1.432 $21.48
toggle and duplex
117 15 8. 4" square surface covers for $ 0.977 $1466 [ $  0.845 $12.67
two duplex receptable
C. Handy Boxes
118 10 1. 4" x 2 1/8" Standard size $ 1.202 $12.02 { % 0.742 §7.42
12" K.0,
119 10 2. 11/2" deep extensions $ 1.437 $14.37 | $ 1.966 $19.66
1/2" K.O.
120 10 3. 4" % 2 1/8" blank covers $ 0.335 $3.35|% 0.337 $3.37
(metal)




Bid Opened: Webb County Consolidated Electrical Dist. |3G Electrical Supply Inc.
4/14/2014 Purchasing Dept. ¢fo Alan K. Rudder 811 East CaltonRd. )
Bid Tabulation 1010 E. Calton Rd. Laredo, TX 78041
Bid 2015-16 Annual Contract for Electrical Supplies Laredo, TX 78041 956-724-2151
956-722-4951 david@3gelectric.com
arudder@ced}_ﬁredo.com
I
Secondary Primary
Bid 2013-16 Annual Contract for Electrical Supplies- Price Schedule Form
. — -
- a NI
12| 10 4. 4" x 2 1/8" single receptable 5 0.358 $3.58 1 % 0.024 $0.24
covers (metal)
122] 10 5. 4" x 2 1/8" 20 amp receptable $ 0.437 $4.37 ($ 0.371 $3.7
cavers (metal)
123 10 6. 4" x 2 1/B8" duplex receptable $ 0.358 $3.58 | % 0.270 $2.70
covers {metal)
124 5 7. 4"%x2-1/8" switch covers $ 0.318 $1.59 | $ 0.394 $1.97
(metal)
D. Switch Boxes (standard depth)
125 10 1. 3" long-2" wide with 1/2" 5 1.608 $16.08 | 0.888 $8.88
K.O.'s with ears
126 10 2. 3" long-2" wide with 1/2" $ 1.827 31827 [ % 0.888 $8.88
K.O.'s without ears
Conduit Bodies with Covers
A. LB Type - Aluminum
127 5 1. 12" $ 2.656 $13.28 {$ 2.580 $12.90
128 5 2. 314" % 4,090 $2045|% 3.200 $16.00
129 5 3.1 $ 4.900 $2450 1 % 4,170 $20.8B5
130 5 4,1 1/4" $ 7.690 $3845 |§  7.550 $37.75
131 5 5112 $ 8.700 $43.50 [ $  8.300 $41.50
132 5 6. 2" $ 17.520 $8760 | $ 13.610 $68.05
133 5 7.21/2" $ 39.110 $195.55 | § 33.510 $167.55
134 5 83" $ 45.650 $228.25 | § 37.480 $187.40
135 5 8.31/2" $ 520.564 $2,602.82 | § 55490 $277.45
136 5 10. 4" $ 82580 $41280 | $ 59.110 $295.55
Duplex Receptacles and Covers
137] 10 |A. 3-Wire Duplex QOulet $ 1.110 $11.10 | $  0.250 $2.50
138 10 1. Wire duplex outlet cover (ivory)
139 5 B. 3-Wire 1-Gang_ 30 or 50 amp 24lc $240|% 2452 $12.26




Bid Opened: Webb County Consolidated Electrical Dist. |3G Electrical Supply Inc.
4/14/2014 Purchasing Dept. c/o Alan K. Rudder 811 East Calton Rd.
Bid Tabulation 1010 E. Calton Rd. Laredo, TX 78041
Bid 2015-16 Annual Contract for Electrical Supplies Laredo, TX 78041 956-724-2151
956-722-4951 david@3gelectric.com
arudder@cedlaredo.com
|
Secondary Primary

Bid 2013-1

6 Annual Contract for Electrical

e

ES

140 10 OQutlet (ivony) 125/250 Volts
141 15 1. 4" x 4" covers (metal) for $ 2.980 $14.90 | 5 1.449 $21.74
amp outlet
142 10 (€. 3-Wire Ground Caps 15 Amp. 37.28ic $4.86 | % 1.804 $18.04
125 Volt (Male)
143 10 1D, 3-Wire Ground Connector | 14%8/c $22.351 % 3.054 $30.54
15 Amp 125 Volt {(Female)
Switches and Wall Plates (ivory)
144] 10 |1. AC quiet switches, 15 amp {ivory) 5 3.78 $37.80($ 0.654 $6.54
10 |2. 1 Toggie wall plate $ 6.59 $65.90 | $ 0.24 $2.40
FPipe Straps
A, 2-Hole
145 5 1. 12" % 0.070 $0.35| % 0.038 $0.19
146 5 2. 3/4" $ 0.082 $0.41 | § 0.048 $0.24
147 5 31" % 0.156 $0.78 | $ 0.088 $0.44
148 5 4.1 1/4" 5 0.246 $1.23 (% 0.144 $0.72
149 5 5. 112" $ 0.334 $1.67 | % 0.158 $0.78
150 5 6, 2" & 0.356 $1.78 | & 0.230 $1.15
B. 1-Hole
151 5 1. 12" % 0.070 $0.35 (% 0.042 $0.21
152 5 2. 34" s 0.072 $0.36 | $ 0.064 50.32
163 5 3 $ 0.082 $0.41 [ % 0.114 $0.57
154 5 4.11/4" $ 0.266 $1.33 | § 0.168 $0.84
185 5 5.11/2° $ 0.340 $1.70 | $ 0.288 $1.44
156 5 6. 2" % 0.482 $2.41 1| 5% 0.364 $1.82
Locknuts
157 5 1. 1/2" % 0.062 $0.31 | % 0.056 $0.28
158 5 2. 34" $ 0.070 $0.35|% 0.074 $0.37
159 5 31" $ 0.138 $0.69 | § 0.124 $0.62
160 5 4.11/4" $ 0.160 $0.80 | § 0.170 $0.85




R

N

Bid Opened: Webb County Consolidated Electrical Dist. [3G Electrical Supply Inc.
47142014 Purchasing Dept. c/o Alan K. Rudder _|811 East Calton Rd.
Bid Tabulation 1010 E. Calton Rd. Laredo, TX 78041
Bid 2015-16 Annual Contract for Electrical Supplies Laredo, TX 78041 956-724-2151
- 956-722-4951 david @3gelectric.com
arudder@cedlaredo.com

5 Secondary Primary

Bid 2013-16 Annual Contract for Electrical Supplies- Price Schedule Form
P = e

161 5 5.1 1/2" $ 0.250 $1.251 % 0.270 $1.35
162 5 6.2" L3 0.360 $1.80 0.344 $1.72
Wire Nuts
1631 10 1. Orange 5 0.056 $0.56 | §  0.041 $0.41
164! 10 2. Yellow S 0.063 $0.63 | §  0.044 $0.44
165 10 3. Red $ 0.100 $1.00{% 0.052 $0.52
166 10 4, Large Gray $ 0.365 $3.65|% 0119 $1.19
167 10 5. Large Blue $ 0.365 $3.65|% 0.157 $1.57
Flourescent Ballasts
168 5 A. For 442 light fixtures $ 19.360 $96.80 [ $§ 11.270 $56.35
169 5 B. For 842 light fixtures $ 3r.810 $189.05 | $ 22.040 $110.20
Breakers
A. Single Pole
Amps Challenger Sqguare D
170 5 1.15 $ 4.520 $2260 [ $  3.500 $17.50
171 5 2.20 $ 4.520 $2260 (§  3.500 $17.50
172 5 3.30 $ 5.210 $26.05 |$ 3.500 $17.50
B. Double Pole (Amps)
Amps Challenger Square D
173 5 1.15 $ 9.450 $47.25 | $ 8.110 $40.55
174 5 2.20 $ 9.450 $47.25 1%  8.110 $40,55
175 5 3.30 $ 9.450 $47.25 | % 8.110 $40.55
176 5 4.40 % 9.450 $47.25 (%  8.110 $40.55
177 5 5.50 $ 9.450 $47.25 % 8110 $40.55
178 5 6. 60 $ 9.450 $47.25 ($  8.110 $40.55
179 5 7.70 $ 23.050 $115.25 | $ 20.000 $100.00
180 5 8.90 $ 36740 $183.70 | $ 25.000 $125.00
181 5 9.100 $  36.740 $183.70 | $ 25.000 $125.00
182 5 10. 125 $ 66.320 $331.60 | § 50.000 $250.00
C. Three Pole (Amps)
Amps  Challenger Square D
183 5 1. 18 $ 52.53 $26265|%  30.00 $150.00
184 5 2,20 $ 52.53 $262.65 |$  30.00 $150.00




Bid Opened; Webh County Consolidated Electrical Dist. |3G Electrical Supply Inc.
4/14/2014 Purchasing Dept. ¢/o Alan K. Rudder 811 East Calton Rd.
B Bid Tabulation 1010 E, Calton Rd. Laredo, TX 78041
Bid 2015-16 Annual Contract for Electrical Supplies Laredo, TX 78041 956-724-2151
956-722-4951 david@3gelectric.com
arudder@cedlaredo.com
1
Secondary Primary
Bid 2013-16 Annual Contract for Electrical Supplies- Price Schedule Form
ITEM = = = e =
185] 5 |[3.30 $ 5253 $262.65 | $  30.00 $150.00
186 5 4. 40 $ 52.53 $262.65 | % 30.00 $150.00
187 5 5. 50 L 52.53 $262.65 | $ 30.00 $150.00
188 5 6. 60 $ 52.53 $262.65 | % 30.00 $150.00
189 5 7.70 $ 52.53 $262.65 % 59.00 $295.00
190 5 8.90 $ 101.58 $507.90 [ % 65.00 $325.00
191 5 9. 100 $ 101.58 $507.90 | $ 65.00 $325.00
Breaker Boxes
A. Nema |, Indoor, Single Phase
192 5 1.2 $ 19.89 $99.45 | $ 11.40 $57.00
1983 5 2.4 $ 19.89 $99.45 | 3 18.25 $91.25
194 5 3.6 $ 25.16 $125.80 | % 21.00 $105.00
195 5 4.8 $ 33.16 $165.80 I % 27.00 $135.00
196 5 5.12 $ 30.53 $15265 (% 25.20 $1 26.00
197 5 6. 16 $ 62.11 $31055 | % 29.40 $147.00
198 5 7.24 $ 88.42 $442.10 | $ 43.60 $218.00
B. Nema 3R, Outdoor, Single Phase
199 5 1.12 $ 69.37 $346.85 | § 63.00 $315.00
200 5 2.24 $ 114.74 $573.70 | $ 105.00 $525.00
C.Nema |, Indoor, 3-Phase
201 5 1.12 $ 103.16 $515.80 | $ 46.00 $230.00
202 5 2,24 : % 107.37 $63685 | % 88.00 $440.00
D. Nema |, indoor, 3-Phase
203 5 1.12 $ 138.84 $694.20 | % 46.00 $230.00
204 5 2.24 $  367.37 $1,836.85 | § 88.00 $440.00
Weather Heads
205 10 1. 2" $ 7.72 $77.20 | & 0.579 $5.79
206 1 Ground Rod with Clamp $ 12.59 $12.59 |5 1220 $12.20
Main Disconnect Boxes Fuse Type
1 A. Indoor, 1 Phase
207 5 1. 100 Amps $ 109.00 $545.00 | $  81.20 $406.00




Bid Opened: Webb County Consolidated Electrical Dist. |3G Electrical Supply Inc.
4/14/2014 Purchasing Dept. ¢/a Alan K. Rudder 811 East Calton Rd.
Bid Tabulation 1010 E. Calton Rd. Laredo, TX 78041
Bid 2015-16 Annual Contract for Electrical Supplies Laredo, TX 78041 956-724-2151
956-722-4951 david@3gelectric.com
arudder@cedlaredo.com
|
Secondary Primary
Bid 2013-16 Annual Contract for Electrical Supplies- Price Schedule Form
208 5 2. 200 Amps $ 212.00 $1,060.00 | $ 173.00 $865.00
209 5 3. 30 Amps $ 29.00 $145.00 | § 31.00 $155.00
210 5 4, 60 Amps 3 49.00 $245.00 [ %  40.00 $200.00
B. Indoor, 1 Phase
211 tal 1. 100 Amps $ 132.63 $663.15 | % 81.20 $406.00
212 5 2. 200 Amps $ 348.32 $1,731.60 | $ 173.00 $865.00
213 5 3. 30 Amps % 121.26 $606.30 | § 31.00 $155.00
214 5 4. 60 Amps $ 92.63 $463.15 | § 40.00 $200.00
C. Indcor, 3 Phase
215 5 1. 100 Amps $ 159.00 $795.00 [ $§ 99.00 $495.00
216 5 2. 200 Amps $ 318.00 $1,695.00 | $ 229.00 $1,145.00
217 5 3. 30 Amps $ 49.00 $24500 | $  37.69 $188.45
218 5 4. 80 Amps $ £9.00 $205.00 | $ 62.00 $310.00
D. Outdoor, 3 Phase
218 5 1. 100 Amps 5 231.00 $1,155.00 | $§ 146.00 $730.00
220 5 2. 200 Amps $ 418.00 $2,090.00 ([ $ 268.00 $1,340.00
221 5 3. 30 Amps 3 71.00 $355.00 [ $ 54.00 $270.00
222 5 4. 60 Amps $ 79.00 $395.00 | § 80.00 $400.00
Dual Element Fuses 250V
223 5 1. 5-30 Amps $ 3.19 $15.95 | § 3.24 $16.20
224 5 2. 35-80 Amps $ 5.90 $29.50 | § 5.96 $29.80
225 5 3. 70-100 Amps $ 13.10 $65.50 | $ 13.31 $66.55
226 5 4. 110-200 Amps £ 28.90 $14450 [ §  29.26 $146.30
227 5 5. 225-400 Amps $ 54.90 $27450 1% 52,76 $263.80
228 5 6. 450-600 Amps $ 84.90 $424.50 | 5 86.39 $431.95
Dual Element Fuses 600V
229 5 1. 5-30 Amps $ 7.10 $3550 1% 11.38 $56.90
230 5 2. 35-60 Amps $ 12.80 $64.50 |$  12.36 $61.80
231 5 3. 70-100 Amps $ 24.90 $124.50 | $ 25.46 $127.30
232 5 4. 110-200 Amps 3 49,90 $249.50 | $  50.92 $254.60
234 5 5. 225-400 Amps $ 101.50 $507.50 | $ 101.63 $508.15
235 5 8. 450-600 Amps $ 342.79 $1,713.85 | § 148.24 $741.20
Emergency Light Fixtures
and Exit Liaht Fixiures




Bid Opened: Webb County Consolidated Electrical Dist. |3G Electrical Supply Inc.
4/14/2014 Purchasing Dept. ¢/o Alan K. Rudder 811 East Calton Rd.
Bid Tabulation 1010 E. Calton Rd. Laredo, TX 78041
Bid 2015-16 Annual Contract for Electrical Supgplies Laredo, TX 78041 956-724-2151
956-722-4951 david@3gelectric.com
arudder@cedlaredo.com
|
Secondary Primary

Bid

T

2013-16 Annual Contract for Electrical Supplies- Price Schedule Form

236 5 |A. Emergency Light fixtures $ 23.00 $115.00 | $  16.70 $83.50
Dual Life, Wall Mount. 115V
B. Exit Light Bulbs
237 5 1. 25T6-1/2 $ 5.16 $2580 | % 1.50 $7.50
238 5 2. 1576 $ 6.61 $33.05 | § 1.50 $7.50
239 5 3. 25T6-1/2 DC $ 6.61 $33.05 | % 1.50 $7.50
Porcelain Light Fixtures
240 5 1. Keyless Receptacle $ 1.02 $510 | $ 1.50 $7.50
Electrical Tape
240 5 1. #33 plus scotch vinyl tape, $ 4.49 $22.45 | & 3.69 $18.45
3/4" x 66"
241 10  |2. Rubber Tape, 3/4" x 66" $ 12.49 $124.90 | & 10.68 $106.80
Photo Cells
242 5 1. #AT15, 1500 watts 3 8.65 $43.25 | § 11.32 $56.60
243 5 2. #AT30, 3000 watts 3 8.65 $43.25 | & 25.20 $126.00
1 KB-CO Red Anchor Kits $ 12.10 $1210 | $ 3.70 $3.70
244 5 1. 240 Volt intermatic outdoor time $ 86.83 $43415 | % 77.00 $385.00
clock
245 5 2. Quart PVC Glue $ 6.71 $33.56 | $ 6.61 $33.05
Grand Total $33,870.35 $22,161.29
1. Discount off price list 20% 0%
for items not stated

[ 2 Lamp with Rechargeable

[$  21.00]

$105.00 | no bid

|no bid




Bid Opened

Webb County

Consolidated Electrical Dist,

3G Electrical Supply Inc.

4/14/2014

Purchasing Dept,

c/o Alan K. Rudder

811 East Calton Rd.

Bid Tabulation

1010 E. Calton Rd.

Laredo, TX 78041

Bid 2015-16

Annual Contract for Electrical Supplies

Laredo, TX 78041

956-724-2151

956-722-4951

david@3gelectric.com

arudder@cedlaredo.com

|

Secondary

Primary

1. 3/8"

$ 0.45 $9.00

no bid no bid
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