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Purchase Requisition
County of Webb

_ 1.T. Department

_ Rafael Pena

956 -523-4069

_ 003
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I hereby certify that there is an available balance in m

approved budget for the current year sufficient to pay for the
item{s) requested and that the items are absolutely necessary

for the discharge of my official duties.
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604-0101-8801] 07-915-970 96 $130.00 08/11/14 |Replacing existing data network at |$12,480.00
Plate Levitan Comm. Court building
07-915-370 48 Port Catb Patch Panel 568 A/B 2 $230.00 S 460.00
07-915-570 Bracket’s for Patch Panel 2 $70.00 S 140.00
07-915-570 Miscellaneous {J-Hooks, Labels etc.) 1 $150.00 S  150.00
07-915-570 Labor 1 51,200.00 S 1,200.00
1514,430.00




Webb County
Purchase Justification Form

Funding Sources Requested:
Capital Qutlay Fund #603-0101-8801:
__X___ Building Improvement Fund #604-0101-8103

Capital Outlay Series 2013 750-8000-8801

Department: LT. Department Department Head: Rafael Pena

Number of Dept. Employees__15

Install Data Drop Included and Wall Plate 96 Fair S 130.00 $12,480.00
48 Port Cat6 Patch Panel 568 A/B 2 Fair 230.00 460.00
Bracket’s for Patch Panel 2 Fair 70.00 140.00
Miscellaneous (J-hooks, Labels etc...) 1 150.00 150.00
Labor 1 $1,200.00 $ 1,200.00




Total Cost of item(s) being purchased: '$14,430.00
Do you have 3 quotes for all items listed above? Yes No_ X

What is the purpose of each item(s)requested? To replace commissioners court data network thru

out the building.

If the purchase is to replace item(s) is the item({s) being replaced currently in use?

Yes_ X No

What is the impact or risk potential if we don't purchase item(s)? _Connectivity and compatibility is
an issue in that building currently, with newer wiring will improve their network
infrustructer.

Please Circle Priority: Critical Upgrade Desirable

PRIORITY 1: CRITICAL — Required to prevent a critical reduction in service, operating efficiency, economy, and/or safety; to
protect valuable property; and/or comply with insurance or code requirements.

PRIORITY 2: UPGRADE — Required for significant upgrade in service, operating efficiency, economy and/or safety of current
operations.

PRIORITY 3: DESIRABLE —Raquired to introduce desirable, but optional new service, program, faculty or staff, or to make
small improvements in operating efficiency, economy and/or safety.

Required with this form:

e Price quotes
* Pictures of item{s} tc be replaced

epartrheht Head Slgdature

Date: B/ {tﬂal )

rwkk Plagse pote this form must be filled out in its entirety for purchase to be considered for approval ****



Cyndi Rodriguez

From: Gustavo Ornelas

Sent: Friday, August 1, 2014 8:30 AM

To: Cyndi Rodriguez

Cc: John G Ornes; Yenko Jimenez

Subject: FW!: Court House CATG

Attachments: Webb County COMMISSIONERS COURT CATé6 Bldg.doc; Webb County Courthouse Cat6 Data Quote.pdf
Cyndi,

Please see attached. John mentioned that this will be an item on the Agenda for approval. He also mentioned if you could call purchasing to see what account
this will be coming out of? It’ll be 603 or 604. We'll be going with the quote from Intercom even dough the quote is higher in price since we know the work they
do and they have an understanding of how the wiring is done for Webb County.

Gus Ornelas

Systems Administrator

Webb County L.T. Bepartment
1110 Washington Street Ste. 304
taredo, TX 78040
gornelas@webbcountytx.gov

956-523-4893

From: Yenko Jimenez
Sent: Wednesday, July 30, 2014 4:38 PM
To: John G Ornes; Rafae) Pefia



i AlleghenyShresiers

THE SHREDDING INDUSTRY ICON SINCE 1967

March 10, 2014

Ms. Imelda Diaz

Webb County Records Management
7209 E. Saunders, Highway 59

Box 12, Suite 8

Laredo, TX 78041

Dear Ms. Diaz,

Per our conversation, I'm pleased to submit the following proposal for your consideration. Pve
outlined pricing for two options.

Option 1: New 18-250C
As we discussed, I've shown a trade-in value for your existing 18-250C Shredder toward a new

18-250C 15 Hp. Shredder.

Option 2: Cross-Shredding System

Another option is to position a new 18-250C Shredder in front of your existing shredder, at a 90°
angle. The shredded material would discharge from the new shredder, and feed into the existing
shredder. This would give you a Cross-Shredding System. When utilizing a Cross-Shredding
System, there are two significant advantages: a greater volume of material can be shredded, and
it increases the level of security because of the much smaller shred size. The primary shredder’s
shred width would be 17, and the secondary shredder’s shred width would be %2”. The result
would be a final shred width of approximately 1” x %", as opposed to your current ¥2” strip cut.

Warranty: Please see Warranty Certificate.

A 50% deposit is required with your order; an additional 40% payment is due two weeks prior to
shipping, with the remaining balance of 10% due within 15 days. Please note: Taxes have not

been included in this quotation.
This quote is subject to review after 30 days.

If you have any questions or would like to explore other options, please give me a call at
(800) 245-2497. We look forward to working with you and to serving your document
destruction needs for many years to come.

Sincerely,

Evelyn 4, Jeffencon

Evelyn A. Jefferson
Sales Manager
eiefferson@alleghenyshredders.com

P.0O. Box 80, Old William Penn Hwy East, Delmont PA 15626-0080
B00-245-2497 » 724-468-4300 » Fax: 724-468-3919
solutions(@alleghenyshredders.com * www.alleghenyshredders.com



INTERCOM
Communications

WEBB COUNTY
1110 Washington St.
Laredo TX. 78040

July 25, 2014
Att’n.: Mr. Yenko Jimenez
Proposal to Install Data Networks at Webb County Commiissioners Court Bldg.

Quantity Description up Total

96 Iustall Data Drop, included Cat6 Superior Essex Cable
# Part SE-77-246-24 Blue, Cuat6 jucks # Part 61110- RLG

And Wall Plate Leviton $ I130.00 312480.00
2 48 Pori Cat6 Patch Panel 568 A/B § 230,00 3§ 460.00
2 Bracket’s for Patch Panel § 7000 3 140.00
1 Miscelluneous (J-Hooks, Labels, etc.) § 15000 3 150.00
1 Labor $1,200.06 8 1,200.00
Total § 14,430.00
o Test
o Labeling
s Certification
o Warranty by 20 Years in Materials and Labor
Sincerely,
Mpr. Raul Torres

1815 Houston St. Laredo, Texas. 78040 P - (956) 220-8453 Fax - (956) 568-4412

intercom_communications@yahoo.com




ESTIMATE

-TECH
5517 McPherson Rd, Ste. #20

OWO Laredo, TX 78041
“Delivering Real Computer Solutions” (956) 791-4837
{956) 791-3856 fax
Customer Name: Webb County Sales persan:
Dept Courthouse
Quote Date: 07/29/114
Contact Yenko Jimenez

Description of Services Price Quantity Total
Equipment Needed:
installation and termination of Cat6 plenum datadrop. | $  125.00 96| $12,000.00
Leviton Cat5e 48 Port Patch Panel with Wall Maunt $ 200.00 2% 400.00
Labor:
Disassemble and reassemble of raceways. % Bb50.00 11 $ 850.00
Remaoving old cables in raceways.

Sub Total $13,250.00

All cables will be Jabeled and certified.

Any additional work or materials not mentioned in this quote will be at extra charge,
This Quote Includes General Plenum Cable and Leviton keystones.

20 year warranty on all cables and connectors.

Please contact me if you have any guestions or comments.

Thank you,

Hassan |. Escamilla
956-791-4837
hassan@l|an-techs.net

For more information visit us online at
www.lan-techs.net




Cyndi Rodriguez

From: Yenko Jimenez

Sent: Friday, August 1, 2014 11:31 AM

To: Rafael Pefia

Cc Cyndi Rodriguez; Gustavo Ornelas

Subject: Ricoh USA - Court House Cabling

Attachments; RE: Webb County - Court House Building; RE: Webb County - Court House Building; RE: Webb County - Court House Building;

quantities; Webb County - Court House Building

Hello Rafa,

Attached you will find the information that shows communication with the third vendor for Court House project. They came in and walked inside the building.
They wanted to come back for another walk thru, with another person in charge but they never came back. They never send us the quote.

Let me know if any questions. Thanks!

Yenko D. Jimenez
Systems Administrator
Webb County

I.T. Department
Laredo, Texas.
(956)523-4883



Cyndi Rodriguez

From: Rene Gonzalez <Rene.Gonzalez@ricoh-usa.com>
Sent: Monday, December 2, 2013 8:43 AM

To: Yenko jimenez

Subject: RE: Webb County - Court House Building

sorry | have been out on vacations .. but i believe we are .. Its hard to do a bid without plans .. | will call you at noon

Rene Gonzalez
Major Account Executive

RICOH AMERICAS CORPORATION
6108 McPherson Suite. 3

Laredo Texas, Texas 78041

Phone: 956-887-9156

Fax: 956-687-2012
Rene.Gonzalez@ricoh-usa.com
www.ricoh-usa.com

RICOH

imagine, changs,
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From: Yenko Jimenez <yjimenez@webbcountytx.gov>

To: "rene.gonzalez@ricoh-usa.com™ <rene.gonzalez@ricoh-usa.cams>
Cc: "'sergio.gomez@ricoh-usa.com™ <sergio.gomez@riceh-usa.com>
Date: 11/25/2013 01:52 PM

Subject: RE: Wehb County - Court House Building

Hello Rene,
Are you going to be able to send us the quote?

Please let us know, thanks!

Yenko D. Jimenez
Network Specialist |
1.T. Department
Webb County
Laredo, Texas.
(956)523-4883

From: Yenko limenez

Sent: Wednesday, November 13, 2013 5:01 PM
To: 'rene.gonzalez@ricoh-usa.com'

Ce: 'sergio.gomez@ricoh-usa.com’

Subject: RE: Webh County - Court House Building

Hello Rene,
Any updates on the quote?
Please advise, thanks!

Yenko D. Jimenez
Network Specialist |
L.T. Department
Webb County
Laredo, Texas.
(956)523-4883



From: Yenko Jimenez

Sent: Wednesday, October 30, 2013 3:44 PM
To: 'rene.gonzalez@ricoh-usa.com’

Cc: 'sergio.gomez@ricoh-usa.com’

Subject: Webb County - Court House Building

Hello Rene,

Attached you will find the layout for each floor at Court House Building. Since | was not able to get the original blueprints requested, | used the evacuation routes. | hope this
waorks for you.

Let me know if you have any questions.

Yenko D. Jimenez
Network Specialist |
I.T. Department
Webb County
Laredo, Texas.
(956)523-4883



