
Bid 2015-80 " 6 month Contract for  Ink Cartridges Executive Office Supply Office Depot The Tree House, Inc Staples 

                       Toner & Bottled Water" c/o Juanita Fontaine c/o Chris Edler c/o David Rizzo c/o Wayne McMillan

3312 Santa Ursula Ave 6600 N. Military Trail PO Box 413 500 Staples Dr.

Laredo, TX 78040 Boca Raton, FL 33496 Norwood, MA 02062 Framingham MA 01702

956-722-6791 956-245-1878 800-595-6651 508-253-5000

executiv@netscorp.net leslie.snyder@officedepot.com djirizz@aol.com wayne.mcmilliam@staples.com 

Price Schedule for Ink Cartridges & Toners
(NO REFURBISHED CARTRIDGES, NO EXCEPTIONS ) Secondary PRIMARY Tertiary
Item Description Unit Qty Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

HP Q7553A BLACK TONER EA 8 59.09$    472.72$            72.93$    583.44$         69.05$            552.40$        67.11 536.88

HP 49A TONER EA 5 78.99$    394.95$            76.55$    382.75$         70.65$            353.25$        59.28 296.4

HP 82A YELLOW CARTRIDGE EA 4
163.75$  655.00$            170.97$  683.88$         146.00$          584.00$        122.99 491.96

HP 81A CYAN CARTRIDGE EA 2
163.75$  327.50$            170.97$  341.94$         146.00$          292.00$        122.99 245.98

HP 83A MAGENTA CARTRIDGE EA 4
163.75$  655.00$            68.99$    275.96$         146.00$          584.00$        122.99 491.96

LEXMARK X203H22G PHOTOCONDUCT EA 1
63.90$    63.90$               68.99$    68.99$           56.85$            56.85$           72.09 72.09

TONER LASER LJ 4700 BLACK EA 1 170.90$  170.90$            174.64$  174.64$         152.50$          152.50$        137.66 137.66
HP CC532A YELLOW TONER EA 3 104.99$  314.97$            113.72$  341.16$         91.00$            273.00$        112.24 336.72

HP CC533A MAGENTA TONER EA 4 104.99$  419.96$            113.72$  454.88$         91.00$            364.00$        112.24 448.96

HP CC531A CYAN TONER EA 4 104.99$  419.96$            113.72$  454.88$         91.00$            364.00$        112.24 448.96

BROTHER TN-350 BLACK TONER EA 3 53.99$    161.97$            52.22$    156.66$         50.35$            151.05$        53.8 161.4
CANON 104 BLACK TONER EA 24 72.29$    1,734.96$         75.99$    1,823.76$      67.10$            1,610.40$     76 1824

BROTHER TN360 TONER CARTRID HY EA 10 51.99$    519.90$            48.33$    483.30$         48.45$            484.50$        53.63 536.3

HP Q2613A BLACK TONER EA 10 79.00$    790.00$            77.99$    779.90$         70.65$            706.50$        57.14 571.4

DELL PK941 BLACK TONER EA 13 122.19$  1,588.47$         91.19$    1,185.47$      117.35$          1,525.55$     104.99 1364.87
HP 85A TONER EA 24 53.95$    1,294.80$         59.99$    1,439.76$      51.00$            1,224.00$     64.95 1558.8
TONER HP LJ 3500-BLACK EA 1 126.79$  126.79$            139.13$  139.13$         113.55$          113.55$        123.94 123.94
TONER HP LJ 3500-CYAN EA 1 126.79$  126.79$            138.67$  138.67$         113.15$          113.15$        122.75 122.75
HP Q2672A YELLOW TONER EA 1 126.79$  126.79$            138.67$  138.67$         113.15$          113.15$        122.67 122.67
HP Q2673A MAGENTA TONER EA 1 126.79$  126.79$            138.67$  138.67$         113.15$          113.15$        122.66 122.66

BROTHER TN350 DUAL PACK PK 4
53.99$    215.96$            93.14$    372.56$         100.70$          402.80$        96.22 384.88

DELL 3130CN BLACK TONER CART EA 2 83.49$    166.98$            141.61$  283.22$         80.65$            161.30$        130.65 261.3

DELL 3130CN YELLOW TONER CART EA 1
106.89$  106.89$            222.39$  222.39$         103.85$          103.85$        237.81 237.81

DELL 3130CN MAGENTA TONER CART EA 1
106.89$  106.89$            222.39$  222.39$         103.85$          103.85$        237.81 237.81

DELL 3130CN CYAN TONER CART EA 1
106.89$  106.89$            222.39$  222.39$         103.85$          103.85$        237.81 237.81

HP 42A TONER EA 3 142.99$  428.97$            130.82$  392.46$         127.95$          383.85$        122.4 367.2

HP Q6470A BLACK TONER CARTRIDG EA 2 126.99$  253.98$            124.27$  248.54$         113.55$          227.10$        117.89 235.78
HP CC530A BLACK TONER EA 7 79.95$    559.65$            115.37$  807.59$         87.00$            609.00$        113.87 797.09
BROTHER TN-460 BLACK TONER EA 4 72.29$    289.16$            68.38$    273.52$         67.45$            269.80$        69.25 277
HP C7115A BLACK TONER EA 2 67.90$    135.80$            62.34$    124.68$         60.25$            120.50$        54.68 109.36

C925 BLACK HIGH YIELD TONER EA 2
134.90$  269.80$            143.55$  287.10$         124.20$          248.40$        156.81 313.62

LEX IMAGING UNIT C925 BLACK EA 2
180.50$  361.00$            97.99$    195.98$         79.30$            158.60$        98.69 197.38

DELL DRYXV TONER CARTRIDGE BLK EA 9
84.50$    760.50$            113.95$  1,025.55$      81.25$            731.25$        82.99 746.91

HP C7115X BLACK TONER EA 4 74.90$    299.60$            69.99$    279.96$         65.70$            262.80$        58.16 232.64
HP 124A CYAN TONER EA 6 79.90$    479.40$            76.76$    460.56$         70.00$            420.00$        73.03 438.18
HP 124A BLACK TONER EA 6 65.99$    395.94$            70.99$    425.94$         63.00$            378.00$        67.57 405.42
HP 124A YELLOW TONER EA 5 79.90$    399.50$            76.76$    383.80$         70.00$            350.00$        73.03 365.15
HP 124A MAGENTA TONER EA 4 79.90$    319.60$            76.76$    307.04$         71.00$            284.00$        73.03 292.12
HP Q7551A BLACK TONER EA 4 123.95$  495.80$            119.29$  477.16$         111.25$          445.00$        114.78 459.12
HP CE390A BLACK TONER CARTRIDG EA 2 149.90$  299.80$            154.10$  308.20$         132.80$          265.60$        171.99 343.98

DELL HF44N TONER CARTRIDGE BLK EA 2
60.99$    121.98$            71.29$    142.58$         59.10$            118.20$        59.99 119.98

DELL 1815DN BLACK TONER 5K EA 2 106.99$  213.98$            102.99$  205.98$         104.50$          209.00$        70.79 141.58
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Price Schedule for Ink Cartridges & Toners
(NO REFURBISHED CARTRIDGES, NO EXCEPTIONS ) Secondary PRIMARY Tertiary
Item Description Unit Qty Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

HP 507A MAGENTA TONER (CE403A) EA 1 192.20$  192.20$            223.99$  223.99$         170.55$          170.55$        201.4 201.4

HP 507A YELLOW TONER (CE402A) EA 1
192.20$  192.20$            223.99$  223.99$         170.55$          170.55$        201.4 201.4

HP 507A CYAN TONER (CE401A) EA 1
192.20$  192.20$            223.99$  223.99$         170.55$          170.55$        201.4 201.4

HP 507A BLACK TONER (CE400A) EA 1 129.00$  129.00$            149.99$  149.99$         114.50$          114.50$        149.99 149.99

BROTHER TN-430 BLACK TONER EA 2
51.25$    102.50$            49.99$    99.98$           47.90$            95.80$           50.63 101.26

HP 305A YELLOW TONER EA 1 103.92$  103.92$            106.69$  106.69$         92.15$            92.15$           119.99 119.99
HP 305A CYAN TONER EA 1 103.92$  103.92$            106.69$  106.69$         92.15$            92.15$           119.99 119.99
HP 305A MAGENTA TONER EA 1 103.92$  103.92$            106.69$  106.69$         92.15$            92.15$           119.99 119.99
HP 305X BLACK LASERJET TONER EA 1 89.45$    89.45$               92.46$    92.46$           79.40$            79.40$           99.53 99.53
HP C9720A BLACK TONER EA 1 171.99$  171.99$            -$                152.80$          152.80$        148.31 148.31
HP LASERJET Q2612A CART EA 8 60.29$    482.32$            61.34$    490.72$         58.00$            464.00$        56.91 455.28

HP 49X TONER EA 2 144.90$  289.80$            143.96$  287.92$         129.30$          258.60$        99.18 198.36

HP Q6472A YELLOW TONER CART. EA 1
126.90$  126.90$            132.48$  132.48$         113.15$          113.15$        119.86 119.86

DELL 3110CN/3115CN BLACK TONER EA 1 87.99$    87.99$               129.00$  129.00$         94.00$            94.00$           78.5 78.5

LASERJET CE250A BLACK TONER EA 4
116.95$  467.80$            123.57$  494.28$         104.15$          416.60$        124.72 498.88

LASERJET CE251A CYAN TONER EA 2
229.90$  459.80$            248.08$  496.16$         204.45$          408.90$        244.87 489.74

LASERJET CE252A YELLOW TONER EA 1
229.90$  229.90$            248.08$  248.08$         204.45$          204.45$        244.87 244.87

LASERJET CE253A MAGENTA TONER EA 1
229.90$  229.90$            248.08$  248.08$         204.45$          204.45$        244.87 244.87

LEXMARK E260A11A RETURN TONER EA 6
96.59$    579.54$            100.87$  605.22$         90.90$            545.40$        94.3 565.8

LEXMARK T650A11A RETURN TONER EA 2
143.99$  287.98$            156.99$  313.98$         133.10$          266.20$        155.97 311.94

HP CE505A BLACK TONER CARTRIDG EA 27
76.50$    2,065.50$         74.65$    2,015.55$      65.00$            1,755.00$     71.16 1921.32

OKIDATA B411/B431 SERIES TONER EA 5
70.79$    353.95$            103.99$  519.95$         62.35$            311.75$        81.27 406.35

CRTDG,DELL 2330D/DN,BK,HY EA 1
122.90$  122.90$            91.19$    91.19$           117.40$          117.40$        104.99 104.99

HP COLOR LASER CB543A MAGENTA EA 1
62.59$    62.59$               64.99$    64.99$           54.00$            54.00$           66.94 66.94

HP COLOR LASER CB542A YELLOW EA 2 62.59$    125.18$            64.99$    129.98$         54.00$            108.00$        66.94 133.88

HP COLOR LASERJET CB541A CYAN EA 2
62.59$    125.18$            64.99$    129.98$         54.00$            108.00$        66.94 133.88

HP COLOR LASERJET CB540A BLAC EA 2
61.99$    123.98$            69.98$    139.96$         60.00$            120.00$        72.83 145.66

HP Q3960A BLACK TONER EA 1 79.90$    79.90$               86.81$    86.81$           70.90$            70.90$           73.76 73.76

BROTHER TN420 BLACK TONER EA 3
32.99$    98.97$               38.47$    115.41$         30.20$            90.60$           39.28 117.84

LEXMARK E360H11A RTN TONER HY EA 0
-$                   166.39$  -$                174.50$          -$               201.48 0

BROTHER TN750 BLACK TONER HY EA 2
90.69$    181.38$            101.24$  202.48$         84.65$            169.30$        93.86 187.72

12A7462 TONER CARTRIDGE HY EA 1
349.99$  349.99$            404.99$  404.99$         327.60$          327.60$        363.12 363.12

BROTHER TN-580 BLACK TONER EA 2 88.49$    176.98$            87.77$    175.54$         82.60$            165.20$        89.99 179.98

HP Q7553X BLACK TONER HY EA 2 142.90$  285.80$            134.24$  268.48$         127.45$          254.90$        123.66 247.32

BROTHER TN115BK BLACK TONER EA 1
74.50$    74.50$               73.87$    73.87$           69.50$            69.50$           69.34 69.34

BROTHER TN110Y YELLOW TONER EA 1 56.29$    56.29$               52.90$    52.90$           52.55$            52.55$           51.89 51.89
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Price Schedule for Ink Cartridges & Toners
(NO REFURBISHED CARTRIDGES, NO EXCEPTIONS ) Secondary PRIMARY Tertiary
Item Description Unit Qty Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

BROTHER TN650 BLACK TONER HY EA 2 86.99$    173.98$            82.99$    165.98$         81.15$            162.30$        106.22 212.44

HP LASERJET CE255X BLACK TONER EA 1 196.99$  196.99$            196.99$  196.99$         175.25$          175.25$        223.64 223.64

BROTHER TN315BK HY BLACK TONER EA 2 84.90$    169.80$            100.03$  200.06$         79.15$            158.30$        105.29 210.58

BROTHER TN450 HY BLACK TONER EA 8 49.50$    396.00$            59.99$    479.92$         46.10$            368.80$        59.8 478.4
HP Color Laser Jet 2605dn Q6000 A Black EA 5 65.90$    329.50$            84.99$    424.95$         63.00$            315.00$        67.57 337.85
HP Color Laser Jet 2605dn Q6002 A Yellow EA 5 79.50$    397.50$            93.99$    469.95$         70.00$            350.00$        73.03 365.15
HP Color Laser Jet 2605dn Q6001 A Cyan EA 5 79.50$    397.50$            93.99$    469.95$         70.00$            350.00$        73.03 365.15
HP Color Laser Jet 2605dn Q 6003 A Magenta EA 5 79.50$    397.50$            93.99$    469.95$         70.00$            350.00$        73.03 365.15
HP Laser Jet 1320 49X – Q5949X EA 5 144.90$  724.50$            143.96$  719.80$         129.30$          646.50$        99.18 495.9
HPQ7583A Magenta EA 5 162.00$  810.00$            170.97$  854.85$         146.00$          730.00$        151.05 755.25
HPQ7582A Yellow EA 5 162.00$  810.00$            170.97$  854.85$         146.00$          730.00$        151.05 755.25
HPQ7581A Cyan EA 5 162.00$  810.00$            170.97$  854.85$         146.00$          730.00$        151.05 755.25
HP49A (Q5949A) Laser Jet 1320 EA 10 78.90$    789.00$            76.55$    765.50$         70.65$            706.50$        59.28 592.8
HP96A (C4096A) Laser Jet 2200 EA 5 110.00$  550.00$            103.25$  516.25$         99.00$            495.00$        90.9 454.5
HP05A (CE505A) Laser Jet P2035 EA 5 76.50$    382.50$            74.65$    373.25$         65.00$            325.00$        71.16 355.8
Hp15A (C7115A) Laser Jet 1200 EA 5 67.20$    336.00$            62.34$    311.70$         60.25$            301.25$        54.68 273.4
HP CC530 A Black- Laser Jet CP2025 EA 5 79.95$    399.75$            115.37$  576.85$         87.00$            435.00$        113.87 569.35
HP CC531 A Cyan- Laser Jet CP2025 EA 5 104.99$  524.95$            113.72$  568.60$         91.00$            455.00$        112.24 561.2
HP CC532 A Yellow- Laser Jet CP2025 EA 5 104.99$  524.95$            113.72$  568.60$         91.00$            455.00$        112.24 561.2
HP CC533 A Magenta- Laser Jet CP2025 EA 5 104.99$  524.95$            113.72$  568.60$         91.00$            455.00$        112.24 561.2
HP 53A (Q7553A) Laser Jet P2015 EA 5 77.20$    386.00$            72.93$    364.65$         69.05$            345.25$        67.11 335.55
HP 98A LaserJet 92298A EA 5 120.99$  604.95$            122.31$  611.55$         108.10$          540.50$        113.59 567.95
HP C9721 A- Cyan Laser Jet 4600dn EA 5 231.99$  1,159.95$         229.99$  1,149.95$      207.00$          1,035.00$     206.72 1033.6
HP C9722 A – Yellow Laser Jet 4600dn EA 5 231.99$  1,159.95$         229.99$  1,149.95$      207.00$          1,035.00$     206.72 1033.6
HP C9723 A – Magenta Laser Jet 4600dn EA 5 231.99$  1,159.95$         228.90$  1,144.50$      207.00$          1,035.00$     206.72 1033.6
Hp Q3961 A- Cyan EA 5 99.00$    495.00$            104.72$  523.60$         85.50$            427.50$        93.34 466.7
HP Q3962 A- Yellow EA 5 99.00$    495.00$            104.72$  523.60$         85.50$            427.50$        93.6 468
HP Q3963 A – Magenta EA 5 99.00$    495.00$            104.72$  523.60$         85.50$            427.50$        93.53 467.65
HP 49A Q 5949A EA 5 78.90$    394.50$            76.55$    382.75$         70.65$            353.25$        59.28 296.4
HP13 A Q2613A EA 5 78.99$    394.95$            77.99$    389.95$         70.65$            353.25$        57.14 285.7
HP C9700A –Black EA 5 23.99$    119.95$            93.99$    469.95$         70.85$            354.25$        88.12 440.6
HP C9701A- Cyan EA 5 29.95$    149.75$            112.99$  564.95$         85.45$            427.25$        108.85 544.25
HP C9702A- Yellow EA 5 29.95$    149.75$            112.99$  564.95$         85.45$            427.25$        104.99 524.95
HP C9703A -Magenta EA 5 29.95$    149.75$            112.99$  564.95$         85.45$            427.25$        108.85 544.25
HP 419CA EA 5 no bid no bid no bid no bid
HP Q3971A- Cyan EA 5 72.96$    364.80$            73.39$    366.95$         63.10$            315.50$        87.7 438.5
HP Q3972A- Yellow EA 5 72.96$    364.80$            73.39$    366.95$         63.10$            315.50$        87.7 438.5
HP Q3973A- Magenta EA 5 72.96$    364.80$            73.39$    366.95$         63.10$            315.50$        87.7 438.5
HP42X –Mass Printing EA 5 216.99$  1,084.95$         195.20$  976.00$         196.50$          982.50$        175.04 875.2
HP 92A EA 5 69.90$    349.50$            59.19$    295.95$         61.05$            305.25$        62.97 314.85

GRAND TOTAL 45,675.18$      48,821.72$   42,612.70$  45,891.64$   

NO BIDS-Removed from TALLY
Toshiba E-Studio 12A9635 EA 5 199.95$  999.75$            no bid 178.25$          891.25$        254.69 1273.45
Toshiba E-Studio 12A9645 EA 5 199.95$  999.75$            no bid 178.25$          891.25$        254.69 1273.45
Toshiba E-Studio 12A9640 EA 5 199.95$  999.75$            no bid 178.25$          891.25$        254.69 1273.45
Toshiba E-Studio 24B2069 EA 5 131.99$  659.95$            no bid 105.80$          529.00$        135.29 676.45

Price Schedule for Bottled Water
Description
8 oz Bottled Water Case 24 20 4.99$       99.80$               3.79
16 oz Bottled Water Case 24 150 4.99$       748.50$            5.67
 *Please Note that water is included in multiple Webb County contracts, and is not an exclusive contract
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