MUPMHCATIONS

Proposal SINCE-1986
Customer
Name WEBB COUNTY Date 10/30/2014
Address  ATTN: LEROY MEDFORD Order No. CCTV
City LAREDO, State TX ZIP 78046 Rep JOSE
Fhone 206-1143 LRMEDFORD@WEBBCOUNTYTX.GOV FOB LAREDO,TX.
Qty Description Unit Price TOTAL
1 KOCOM VIDEO DOOR PHONE W/ 7" EXTRA LARGE VIEW $195.00 $195.00
1 COLOR CAMERA FOR INDOOR -OUTDOOR W/ SPEAKER $187.00 $187.00
1 INSTALLATION OF UNIT IN COMPLEX W/ ALL CABLES & $120.00 $120.00
HARDEWARE INSTALL KIT
1 EXTRA VIDEO DOOR PHONE $195.00 $195.00
1 EXTRA INSTALL OF VDP $55.00 $55.00
1 KEYPAD FOR FRONT DOOR W/ MAGNETIC L.OCK $288.00 $288.00
1 INSTALL KIT FOR MAGNETIC LOCK W/ INSTALLATION $90.00 $90.00
[ email: novacomm@sbcglobal.net / www.novastartx.com |
SUB-TOTAL $1,130.00
/ Payment Details \
O  cash TAX $0.00
® Check SHIPPING $0.00
O Payment Options TOTAL $1,130.00
Meonthly
% Down TX-DPS-PSB
Balance Due
\ Total $1,130.00 / LIC # C-13986

A 25% Restocking Fee on all returned Merchandise / Cancellations or Special Ordérs
903 San Dario Ave. Laredo TX, 78040 (956)726-1600 Fax 726-0222

o
\@;
ACCEPTED BY:

LCD TV- TWOQO WAY RADIO COMM . - CCTV CAMERAS
DIGITALD.V.R.'s - GPS TRACKERS AUDIO VIDEQ SYSTEMS




Secur-lt, Inc.

5810 Mcpherson Road (056)727-2232
Laredo, TX 78041 secur-it@hotmail.com
@
ADDRESS ESTIMATE NO. 1045
Webb county commissioners DATE 11/17/2014

court EXPIRATION DATE
Leroy R. Medford J.D.
9565234600

SR I

E%%EEESTU\EFCLI\XRA MULTIAPARTMENTS ! 629.00 629.00
EBB'&IBNAL 7IN. MONITOR, WHITE F/KCVA374K / KVRAS1F 2 239.00 478.00
hRnglt:"aé?llDOR P/4 CASAS ! °8.00 °8.00
Dé‘,?\tF?S E;:IIPROXIMITY MIFARE 19 3.00 3000
“EnféecsnTaFIzONlc DOOR STRIKE ! 79.00 7900
Installation 1 795.00 795.00

INSTALLATION AND PROGRAMMING

SUBTOTAL 2,069.00
TAX (0%) 0.00
TOTAL $2,069.00

Accepted By Accepted Date




&

Jose E. Gonzalez

From: Leray R. Medford
Sent: Thursday, November 13, 2014 2:56 PM
To: Jose E. Gonzalez _
Cc: Cecilia May Moreng; Leticia Gutierrez; Raul Salazar
Subject: Re: WEBB CO. VDP LMEDFORD 10-30-2014.xls
Mr Gonzalez;
Can you please assist me with the procurement of the other Two (2) quotes that i need for the door security
system?
Tz

Thanks in advance.

Leroy Medford —

Sent from my iPhone . w
0o
I } o GY\

On Nov 10, 2014, at 3:24 PM, Jose E. Gonzalez <jegonzalez@webbcountyix.gov> wrote: m . Lo oA

< - .
Good afternoon Mr. Medford, j:,a-w’-ﬂ - /9( /g
The following vendors can be contacted for quotes: ol ITEE
SECURE IT 727-2232 ATT:JERRY VAR
GLOBAL TECHNOLOGIES 729-8324 ATT: JOE FLORES Lotk Tl @ [0¥;

Please let me if | can assist you with the quotes for this project.
Regards,

JOSE E. GONZALEZ

WEBB COUNTY PURCHASING DEPT.
1110 WASHINGTON ST. STE.#101
LAREDQ, TEXAS 78040
TEL:956-523-4126
FAX:056-523-5010

From: Cecilia May Moreno

Sent: Monday, November 10, 2014 2:17 PM
To: Jose E. Gonzalez

Ce: Leroy R. Medford

Subject: FW: WEBB CO. VDP LMEDFORD 10-30-2014.xls

Can you direct him on who else may be able to give him 2 more quotes. Since the purchase is over 1,000
we will need the 3 quotes.

From: Leroy R. Medford
Sent: Monday, November 10, 2014 11:21 AM



© To: Leticia Gutierrez; Cecilia May Moreno
Cc: Leo Flores
Subject: Fwd: WEBB CO. VDP LMEDFORD 10-30-2014.xIs

Dr. Moreno, i need to purchase a door security entrance system for my new office at the 1st floor
of the ct house. I received a quote from Novastar that i attached.

Do i need 2 more quotes- or can i proceed to acquire this system from Novastar?

Leroy

Sent from my iPhone
Begin forwarded message:
From: "Joe Martinez" <novacomm(@sbcglobal.net>

To: "Leroy R. Medford" <lrmedford(@webbcountytx. gov>
Subject: Fw: WEBB CO. VDP LMEDFORD 10-30-2014.xls

— Ol'l |na| Message --—--

:To nnedford@webbcountyb( gov
Sent: Friday, November 07, 2014 4:10 PM
Subject: WEBB CO. VDP LMEDFORD 10-30-2014.xls

<WEBB CO. VDP LMEDFORD 10-30-2014.xls>



