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Webb County Purchasing Department Opened:  04.09.2015
Bid Tabulation 

Arguindegui Oil Co II Ltd. Oil Patch Petroleum Inc.
BID 2016-02 6551 Star Ct. 3820 Rotary Drive
Annual Contract for Lubricants & Laredo, TX 78041 Laredo, TX 78043
Anti Freeze Cleaning Solvents 956-722-5251 956-725-9940

richard.freeland@argpetro.com c/o Salvador Torres 
Term: 10.01.2015 - 9.30.2016
If extended expires: 9.30.2017 Primary

Est. Usage Item Description Price Per Extended Price Per Extended
Per Gallon or Lbs Gallon or Lb PRICE Gallon or Lb PRICE

Item 1
2035 Motor Oil, SAE 15W-40 $8.45 $17,195.75 no bid

gallons
Price per 55 Gallon Drum $491.70 567.39

Conoco Guardol ECT Synthetic Blend 15w-40 Bulk (5 gallon pail) $53.10 no bid
Conoco Guardol ECT Synthetic Blend 15w-40 Bulk PRICE  $9.05

Conoco Super STA # 2     55 gallon Drum $935.00 no bid

Item 2
550 Hydraulic Oil, Light, Non Detergent $5.22 $2,871.00 no bid 

gallons
Price per 55 Gallon Drum $287.10 441.93

Item 3
360 Extreme Pressure (Hypoid) $1.27 $457.20 no bid
lbs Gear Lubricant, SAE 85-140

Price per 120 lb drum $152.40 695.47

Item 4
240 Wheel Bearing Grease $2.0900 $501.60 no bid 
lbs

Price per 120 lb drum $250.80 326.23

Item 5
220 Automatic Transmission Fluid $6.29 $1,383.80 no bid

gallons Dexron III (Super ATF)

Price per 55 gallon drum $345.95 670.33

Item 6
220 Syncon-HP Synthetic Transmission Oil $29.25 $6,435.00 no bid 

gallons
Price per 55 gallon drum $1,608.75 1907.65

Item 7 
165 Synthetic Gear Lubricant 75W90 $3.75 $618.75 no bid
lbs

Price per 55 gallon drum $1,537.50 1998.81

Item8
110 Multi-purpose Hydraulic Transmission $6.33 $696.30 no bid

gallons Final Drive Fluid for Farm Tranctors 

Price per 55 gallon drum $348.15 786.41
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1 Grease Gun Cartridges $2.20 2.843 ea.
ea. 28.43 10 PK

Total Price Schedule Item 1-8  (Per Gallon) $30,159.40 NO BIDS 
Total for Drums $5,957.35 7,394.22$          

Price Schedule B
110 Permanent type, ethylene base no bid 7.77 854.70$          
gal anti-freeze 50/50% Green

Price per 55 gallon drums $243.44 327.25$             

Mfg/Brand Name of product PAR/KMCO Shell Zone 
as it is recognized on the AF/Coolant 
commercial market

110 Varsol or Proven Equal no bid no bid 
gal

Price per 55 gallon drums $347.88 297.28$             

Mfg/Brand Name of product 
as it is recognized on the AOC Mineral
commercial market

110 Texaco Extended Life Anti-Freeze or Equal no bid 10.61$               1,167.10$       
gal

Price per 55 gallon drums $349.49 512.82$             
50/50 drum 

Mfg/Brand Name of product 
as it is recognized on the 
commercial market

Total Price Schedule B (Per Gallon) No Bids 2,021.80$   
Total Price Schedule B ( 55 Gal Drums) $940.81 1,137.35$      
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