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                Webb County Purchasing Department Opened: 04.0
                Bid Tabulation  

Anderson Columbia Co. Martin Asphal  
BID 2016-04 c/o Richard Leyendecker Three Riverwa   
Annual Contract for Emulsions 21202 FM 1472 Houston, TX 7

Laredo, TX 78045 713-350-6849
Contract Term: 956-726-9819
10.01.2015 -09.30.2016 rmleye@att.net jnimmo@mart
If extended expires on: 09.30.2017

Primary 
Est. ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT TOTAL UNIT
Qty PRICE PRICE PRICE

4000 SS-1 Emulsion 
gallons with use of a pump truck 5.25$                                   $21,000.00 2.90$             

Minimum order required 

7000 AEP Prime 6.00$                                   $42,000.00 3.40$             
gallons with use of a pump truck Minimum order required 

4000 SS-1 Emulsion NO BID 3.40$             
gallons without  use of a pump truck Minimum order required 

7000 AEP Prime NO BID 2.90$             
gallons without  use of a pump truck Minimum order required 

1000
gallons CRS 2 NO BID NO BID 

Grand Total $63,000.00

*** NOTE **** 
Webb County, orders 
on an as needed basis. While 
Martin Asphalt was the lower 
bidder, their bid stipulated a minimum 
order of 4000 gallons of AEP, and a 
minimum order of 7000 gallons of 
AEP Prime 
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TOTAL
PRICE

11,600.00$                       

23,800.00$                       

13,600.00$                       

20,300.00$                       

57,700.00$                       
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