COUNTY OF WEBB
:Purchasing Department
4 BID TABULATION
Bid Number: 2016-12 Southern Food Group
Bid For: Annual Contract for Milk |5330 Ayers
Corpus Christi, TX 78415
Date 956-722-1718
Opened: 05.13.2015 scott_mcclarren@deanfoods.com
Contact: Tano Trevino
Primary |
Est. Qty Description Unit Price Extended Price
384,000 1/2 Pint Whole Fluid Milk $0.27 $103,104.00
26,958 1/2 Pint (Unflavored) Low Fat $0.27 $7,143.87
1,500 Gallon of Whole Milk $3.71 $5,557.50
3,300 Gallon 1% fat milk $3.47 $11,434.50
11,844 1/2 Pint Chocolate Milk $0.27 $3,180.11
1,125 3 0z. Ice Cream no bid
19,870 1 Gal. Low Fat Milk $3.57 $70,836.55
100,000 Whole Milk % pints $0.27 $26,850.00
50,000 Soy Milk 1 gt $1.99 $99,500.00
50,000 Soy Milk 1 Pint no bid
3,000 Lactate Free Milk 2 gal $3.15 $9,450.00
3,000 Dairy Ease Milk 1/2 gallon no bid
3,000 Almond Milk pints $3.85 $11,550.00
3,000 Vanilla Soy Milk 1/2 Gallon no bid
5,000 Skim Milk ¥ Pints $0.27 $1,325.00
Grand Total $349,931.53
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