
Opened:  JUNE 16, 2015 COUNTY OF WEBB 
Purchasing Department

Bid No. 2016-26 BID TABULATION
Clark Hardware LTD

BIDS FOR: c/o Vidal Cantu
Annual Contract for Plumbing Supplies 1202 Clark Blvd

Laredo, TX 78040
Contract Term: 956-723-2241
October 1, 2015 to September 30, 2016 vcantu@clarkhardwareltd.com 

Primary 
Unit of ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT Ext.

Measure PRICE Price
30 Dresser Couplings Regular 2" $6.29 $188.70

15 Dresser Couplings PVC 3" $16.98 $254.70

20 Dresser Couplings PVC 1 1/2 " $4.86 $97.20

20 Elbows 1" PVC $0.54 $10.80

20 Tee's 1 1/2 " PVC $0.74 $14.80

8 Cement Cleaner PVC (QT) $4.97 $39.76

10 Cement PVC (1 Pint) $5.40 $54.00

18 Cement PVC (QT) $6.15 $110.70

10 PVC Pipe 20' Long 1 1/2" $10.92 $109.20

10 1 1/2" x 1 Bushing $0.39 $3.90

3 3/4" Loose Brass #0576-3/4" RC $23.10 $69.30
Sillcocks

2 3/4" x 6" Nipple Galvanized $0.98 $1.96

1 3/4" Union Galvanized $3.38 $3.38

1 1/2" x 4" Nipple Galvanzied $0.63 $0.63

1 Hose Adapter  (connector) $2.64 $2.64

10 Dresser Couplings PVC $1.61 $16.10

40 PVC Pipe 20' x 1/2" Sch 40 $3.85 $154.00
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40 PVC Pipe 20' x Sch 40 (Sewer) $23.73 $949.20

40 PVC 20' x 2" Sch 40 (Potable Water) $14.45 $578.00

20 Rubber Couplings No Hub w/clamps $4.11 $82.20
4"

10 Rubber Couplings No Hub w/clamps $2.57 $25.70
2#

10 Tee 4 x 2 PVC $7.18 $71.80

4 1" x 3/4 S x T Bush PVC $0.38 $1.52

4 h-20 Hose Clamp $0.30 $1.20

4 1/2" Hose Bibb $6.69 $26.76

4 3/4" Hose Bibb $6.98 $27.92

4 1/2" Loose Key Central $23.10 $92.40

10 4" PVC Coupling $2.51 $25.10

4 4"PVC plug $1.64 $6.56

1 1/2" Tee CxC $0.64 $0.64

10 1" PVC Coupling $0.26 $2.60

4 1" 45 Elbow Coupling $0.45 $1.80

1 1"Tee PVC $0.37 $0.37

1 1"90 comb.PVC $0.38 $0.38
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Purchasing Department
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20 400A Fluid Master $7.39 $147.80

10 Coupling 4"PVC Sewer $1.75 $17.50

4 Elbow 4"  PVC $5.41 $21.64

10 Clean Out PVC 4" $3.48 $34.80

4 Comb. 4"Wye $14.94 $59.76

20 4" No Hub Couplings $4.11 $82.20

10 C.O. Plug 4" $1.64 $16.40

10 C.O. Plug 2" $0.63 $6.30

4 4 x 2 Reduce Coupling $4.58 $18.32

10 C.O. 2" PVC $0.63 $6.30

25 Korky Flapper Tank Ball 354BP $1.98 $49.50

4 Elongated Toilet Seat White $14.65 $58.60

10 Regular Toilet Seat white $9.60 $96.00

4 Trap 1 1/4 P.C. $7.95 $31.80

1 P.O. Plug 8" Lx 1 1/4 P.C. $7.38 $7.38

1 Extension 1 1/4" x 6" Length P.c. $4.05 $4.05

1 Expoxy Plumbers $5.32 $5.32

2 1 1/2" Tee PVC (Drain) $1.13 $2.26

5 Elbow 1 1/2" PVC (Drain) $0.67 $3.35

2 Trap Adapter 1 1/2" PVC (Drain) $1.19 $2.38
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4 Trap PVC 1 1/2 " P.C. (Drain) $9.29 $37.16

2 Couplings No Hub 1 1/2" $2.39 $4.78

1 Dougle Angle Stop 3664-1/2" to 3/8" $12.41 $12.41
Double

2 QT Recton Pipe Joint Sealer $27.48 $54.96

4 Elongated White commode $90.87 $363.48

4 Regular White Commode $72.90 $291.60

PLUMBING SUPPLIES
All Domestic Products

5 Multi-Purpose Saw 14" Arm-XL98D no bid

5 4 x 1 IP BR Saddle S71-403 no bid

4 6 x 1 IP BR Saddle S71-603 no bid

4 8 x 3 IP BR Saddle S71-803 no bid

3 3/4 Corp MIPXPJ(CTS) F1100-3 no bid

2 3/4 Ball curb PJXPJ no bid
B44-333

3 3/4 MIP X CS PJ CPLG no bid 
C84-33

2 2" Repair Clamp 226-023807 $58.49 $116.98
OD 2.35-2.63 (1162)

5 4" Repair Clamp 226-045007 $78.97 $394.85
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Purchasing Department
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OD 4.45-4.73 (1642)

4 6" Repair Clamp 226-066307 $93.29 $373.16
OD Range 6.56-6.96 (2202)

3 8" Repair Clamp 226-086307 $111.59 $334.77
OD Range 8.54-8.94 (2806)

10 3/4 x 500' CTS PE Tubing 200 PSI no bid

5 5-1/4 VO Clow Med 42"B 6MJS 3W no bid
(2546-5B) 3'6" Bury, 6"MJ Shoe,

3-way, O/l, NST Fire Hydrant

5 5-1/4VO Clow Med 36"B 6MJS 3W no bid
3' Bury, 6"MJ Shoe, 3-Way, O/L

NST Fire Hydrant

4 Oval Meter Box w/ Lock Lid no bid

3 STD Plas MTR Box W/PL RDR LID no bid

2 4" Megalug ACC F/IPS 2004PTC no bid

4 6" Megalug ACC F/IPS 2006PTC no bid

3 6" Repair Clamp 226-066310 $179.00 $537.00
OD Range 6.56-6.96 (2228)

2 6" Repair Clamp 226-066312 $204.00 $408.00
OD Range 6.56-6.96 (2244)

1 4" Repair Clamp 226-045010 $156.00 $156.00
OD 4.45-4.73 (1677)

4 4" Repair Clamp 226-05012 $191.00 $764.00
OD 4.45-4.73 (1683)

5 8" Repair Clamp 226-045012 $235.00 $1,175.00
OD Range 8.54-8.94 (2848)

mailto:vcantu@clarkhardwareltd.com


Opened:  JUNE 16, 2015 COUNTY OF WEBB 
Purchasing Department

Bid No. 2016-26 BID TABULATION
Clark Hardware LTD

BIDS FOR: c/o Vidal Cantu
Annual Contract for Plumbing Supplies 1202 Clark Blvd

Laredo, TX 78040
Contract Term: 956-723-2241
October 1, 2015 to September 30, 2016 vcantu@clarkhardwareltd.com 

Primary 
Unit of ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT Ext.

Measure PRICE Price
METERS

no bid
3 5/8 X 3/4 Rockwell meters w/Rubber

Gasket, tall ones

2 5/8 x 3/4 Rockwell meters w/Rubber no bid 
Gasket, short ones

4 5/8 x 3/4 Master meters w/Rubber no bid 
Gasket

BRASS METERS

4 Multi-Purpose Saw 14" $25.24 $100.96

WATER 1"

5 1" PVC Sch. 40 20 ft. joint $7.30 $36.50

4 1" Male Adapter PVC Sch 40 $0.28 $1.12

3 1" PVC Ball Joint Valve simple $8.18 $24.54

5 1" PVC Sch 40 couplings slip x slip $0.26 $1.30

2 1" PVC Sch 40 couplings slipxthread $0.27 $0.54

6 1" PVC Sch 40 90 degree slipxslip $0.30 $1.80

4 1" PVC Sch 40 90 degrees slipxthread $0.38 $1.52

6 1" PVC Sch 40 90 degrees 1"x3/4 $0.57 $3.42
slip x thread

5 1" PVC Pressure Couplings $2.89 $14.45

4 1" PVC Sch 40 x 3/4 slipxslip red $0.40 $1.60

5 1" PVC Sch 40 x 3/4 slip x thread red $0.51 $2.55

3 1" PVC Sch 40 T 1"x1"x1" glue $0.37 $1.11
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2 1" PVC Sch 40 45 degrees slipxslip $0.45 $0.90

3 1" PVC Sch 40 Raps Water 1 1/2" $0.40 $1.20

WATER 1 1/2"

2 PVC Sch 40 20 ft.Joint $10.92 $21.84
1-1/2

1 PVC Sch 40 Coupling Slip  x Slip $0.35 $0.35
1-1/2

6 PVC sch 40 Coupling slip x thread $0.42 $2.52
1-1/2

5 PVC  Sch 40 Male Adapter $0.41 $2.05
1-1/2

5 PVC Ball Jointed Valve simple $16.48 $82.40
1-1/2

4 PVC Sch 40 90 degree slip x slip $0.55 $2.20

3 PVC Sch 40 90 degree slip x thread $0.70 $2.10

4 PVC Sch 40 45 degree slip x slip $0.75 $3.00

4 PVC Dresser Couplings $4.86 $19.44

3 PVC Sch 40 T 1 1/2"x1 1/2"x1 1/2" $0.74 $2.22
slipxslipxslip

4 PVC Sch 40 Red. 1 1/2" x 1" $0.39 $1.56
slip x slip

4 PVC Sch 40 Caps $0.38 $1.52

mailto:vcantu@clarkhardwareltd.com


Opened:  JUNE 16, 2015 COUNTY OF WEBB 
Purchasing Department

Bid No. 2016-26 BID TABULATION
Clark Hardware LTD

BIDS FOR: c/o Vidal Cantu
Annual Contract for Plumbing Supplies 1202 Clark Blvd

Laredo, TX 78040
Contract Term: 956-723-2241
October 1, 2015 to September 30, 2016 vcantu@clarkhardwareltd.com 

Primary 
Unit of ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT Ext.

Measure PRICE Price

WATER 2"

2 PVC Sch 40 20 ft. Joint $14.45 $28.90

1 PVC Sch 40 Couplings slip x slip $0.53 $0.53

3 PVC Couplings slip x thread $0.54 $1.62

3 PVC Sch 40 Make Adapters $0.54 $1.62

4 PVC Ball Joint Valve (Simple) $20.89 $83.56

4 PVC Sch 4 90 degree slip x slip $0.83 $3.32

4 PVC Sch 40 90 degree slipxthread $1.78 $7.12

1 PVC Sch 40 90 degree slipxthread $1.78 $1.78

2 PVC Sch 40 45 degree slip x slip $0.98 $1.96

3 PVC Sch 40 dresser couplings $6.29 $18.87

3 PVC Sch 40 T 2"x2"x1" $1.59 $4.77
slip x slip x slip

1 PVC Sch 40 Red. 2"x1 1/2" $0.63 $0.63
slip x slip

2 PVC Sch 40 Red. 2" x 1"slipxslip $0.63 $1.26

1 PVC Sch 40 Red. 2" x1" slipxthread $0.75 $0.75

1 PVC Sch 40 Couplings $0.53 $0.53

WATER 4"

2 PVC Sch 40 20 ft. Joint $41.69 $83.38
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2 PVC Sch 40 couplings slip x slip $2.77 $5.54

3 PVC Sch 40 Couplings slip x thread $3.06 $9.18

3 PVC Sch 40 Male Adapters $2.98 $8.94

4 PVC Ball Joint Valve (Simple) $146.90 $587.60

5 PVC Sch 40 90 degree slip x slip $5.41 $27.05

4 PVC Sch 40 45 degree slip x slip $7.10 $28.40

2 PVC Sch 40 Dresser Coupling $26.98 $53.96

3 PVC Caps $3.41 $10.23

2 PVC Red. 4" x 2" slip x slip $3.33 $6.66

WATER 6"

4 PVC 90 degree gasket $94.00 $376.00

4 PVC 90 degree slip x slip $16.96 $67.84

4 PVC Dresser Couplings $59.69 $238.76

1 PVC T gasket 6"x6"x6" $118.00 $118.00

1 PVC T  6"x6"x6"slipxslipxslip $27.15 $27.15

2 PVC Cross 6"x4"x6"x4" gasket $145.00 $290.00

2 PVC Cross 6"x4"x6"x4" slipxslip $59.00 $118.00

2 PVC Cap $8.18 $16.36

WATER 6"

2 PVC Red. 6"x4" $14.49 $28.98
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1 PVC Coupling  gasket $63.00 $63.00

4 PVC Coupling slip x slip $7.73 $30.92

WATER 8"

3 PVC coupling gasket $88.00 $264.00

4 PVC coupling slip x slip $14.43 $57.72

5 PVC 90 degree $43.88 $219.40

6 PVC Red. 8"x6" slip x slip $36.47 $218.82

5 PVC gasket T 8"x8"x8" $149.00 $745.00

4 PVC glue T 8"x8"x8" $62.95 $251.80

2 PVC Dresser Couplings no bid

1 PVC 8" P.I.P. Joints no bid

WATER 10"

2 PVC Couplings gasket $152.00 $304.00

4 PVC Couplings glue $40.00 $160.00

1 PVC 90 degree $179.00 $179.00

1 PVC Red. 10" x 8" $48.00 $48.00

2 PVC gasket T 10"x10"x10" $219.00 $438.00

WATER 12"

4 PVC Coupling gasket $212.00

5 PVC 90 degree $219.00 $1,095.00

5 PVC gasket T $298.00 $1,490.00
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WATER 1" BRASS

4 1" Brass gate valve (imported) $10.19 $40.76

5 1' Brass gate valve (domestic) $14.20 $71.00

WATER 1 1/2" BRASS

2 Brass gate valve (imported) $23.34 $46.68

2 Brass gate valve (domestic) $32.85 $65.70

WATER 2" BRASS

2 Brass gate valve (imported) $34.95 $69.90

5 Brass gate valve (domestic) $46.50 $232.50

WATER 4"

2 Brass gate valve WOG (imported) $112.49 $224.98

2 Brass gate valve WOG (domestic) $715.00 $1,430.00

Grand Total $19,061.87

Sloan Repair Kits & Repair Parts ONLY 30% off

Kissler Repair Parts Only 30% off

Kohler Repair Parts 30% off

Delaney Repair Kits & Parts Only 30% off

Chicago Repair Kits & Repair Parts OnlY 30% off
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American Standard Repair Kits & Repair Parts On 30% off

Delta Reapir Kits & Repair Parts Only 30% off

Discount off Catalogue for Plumbing 
Supplies not specified in Price Schedule NONE OFFERED

(Depending on Mfg.)

Deliveries & Business Hours 8am- 5pm (M_F)
8am-12PM (Sat.)
Closed (Sun.)

Deliveries wil be made ____days after 1-5 days 
receiving a purchasing order?
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