Bid 2015-80 " 6 month Contract for Ink Cartridges
Toner & Bottled Water"

ECON Systems LTD Inc.
c/o Swaylyn Holland

420 N. Town East Bivd
Sunnyvale, TX 75182

972-226-3400 xt. 263

dwaylynh@enconsupplie]

Executive Office Supplies

c/o Jorge Gonzalez Juaristi

3312 Santa Ursula
Laredo, TX 78040

956-722-6791

sales@executiveofficesu

Patria Office Supplies

c/o Maria Rodriguez

301 E. Calton Rd.
Laredo, TX 78041

956-723-2332

patriamaria2@yahoo.com

San Antonio Lighthouse for the Blind

c/o Gaye Preston

2305 Roosevelt Avenue

San Antonio, TX 78210

210-243-3675

customersupport@salighthouse.org

The Office Pal

clo Brenda Friedman

PO Box 2
Lakewood, NJ 08701

877-486-0590 ext. 105

brenda@theofficepal.com

Price Schedule for Ink Cartridges & Toners
(NO REFURBISHED CARTRIDGES, NO EXCEPTIONS )
Item Description Unit Qty Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price| Ext. Price | Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price
CANON
0264B001AA ea 2 $153.00 | $ 306.00 | $157.90 | $ 315.80 [ $176.45 [ $ 352.90 [ $170.25 | $ 340.50 | $110.00 | $ 220.00
0386B003AA ea 2 S 41.00 (S 82.00 | $ 39.95 | S 79.90 [$ 42.25 S 84.50 | $ 41.07 | $ 82.14 | $ 20.00 | $ 40.00
Canon 120 ea 3 $153.00 | $ 459.00 | $156.90 [ $  470.70 | $169.99 | $ 509.97 | $158.66 | $ 475.98 | $120.00 | $ 360.00
Canon 128 ea 1 S 76.00 | S 76.00 [ S 84.80 [ S 84.80 | $ 91.20 | S 91.20 [ $ 87.78 [ $ 87.78 | $ 50.00 | S 50.00
$ 923.00 $ 951.20 $ 1,038.57 $ 986.40 $ 670.00
BROTHER
DR250 ea 1 $169.00 | $ 169.00 | $168.90 | S  168.90 | $194.85 | S 194.85 | $203.95 | $ 203.95 | $ 10.00 | $ 10.00
DR350 ea 8 $ 94.00 | $ 752.00 | $107.80 | S 862.40 [ $105.35 [ 842.80 | $102.66 | $ 821.28 [ $ 90.42 [ $ 723.36
DR620 ea 1 $104.00 | $ 104.00 | $106.00 | S  106.00 | $116.50 | S 116.50 | $112.33 | $ 11233 | $ 99.60 | S 99.60
LC61BK ea 9 $ 19.00 | $ 171.00 | $ 20.40 |$ 183.60 | S 20.45 | S 184.05 | $ 20.13 | $ 181.17 | $ 17.45|$ 157.05
LC61C ea 9 S 8.00(S 7200 (S 895(S 8055 |$S 875|S 7875 |$S 9.78 S 88.02|$ 733]|S 65.97
LC61M ea 9 S 8.00|(S$ 7200 [$ 8.95(S$ 80.55|$S 875|S 7875 |$ 851($ 7659 [$ 733 (S 65.97
LC61Y ea 9 S 800(S 7200 [$ 11.85([$ 10665|S 875|S 7875 |$ 851(S 7659 [$ 733 (S 65.97
LC71BK ea 2 $ 11.00 | $ 2200 (S 9.75($ 19.50 | $ 1230 | $ 2460 | $ 11.63 [$ 23.26 [ $ 10.00 | $ 20.00
LC71C ea 2 S 7.00(S 1400 | S 9.75| S 1950 | $ 820 |S 1640 | S 7.76 | S 1552 |$ 6.67|S 13.34
LC71M ea 2 S 7.00/($S 1400 |$ 9.75|$S 1950 | $ 8.20 | S 1640 | S 7.76 | $ 1552 | $ 6.67 ]S 13.34
LC71Y ea 2 S 7.00(S 1400 | S 9.75| S 1950 | $ 820 |S 1640 | S 7.76 | S 1552 | S 6.67|S 13.34
LC793PKS ea 1 S 45.00 | $ 45.00 | $ 59.80 | $ 59.80 [ $ 56.25 [ $ 56.25 [ $ 49.09 [ $ 49.09 | § 42.27 | $ 42.27
LC79BK ea 1 S 28.00 S 28.00 [$ 36.70 [ $ 36.70 [ $ 35.69 [ $ 35.69 [ $ 31.05($ 31.05[$ 26.62 S 26.62
TN221BK ea 1 $ 60.00 | $ 60.00 [ $ 64.90 [ $ 64.90 [ $ 75.85 [ $ 75.85 | $ 74.90 [ $ 74.90 [ $ 56.82 [ $ 56.82
TN221C ea 1 S 49.00 | $ 49.00 | $ 54.58 | S 54.58 [ $ 61.50 [ $ 61.50 [ $ 61.51 S 61.51 S 46.67 [ S 46.67
TN221M ea 1 S 49.00 | $ 49.00 | $ 54.50 | $ 54.50 [ $ 62.69 | $ 62.69 | $ 61.51[$ 61.51 [$ 46.67 [ $ 46.67
TN221Y ea 1 S 49.00 | $ 49.00 | $ 54.50 | S 54.50 [ S 62.69 [ $ 62.69 | $ 61.51 S 61.51 S 46.67 [ $ 46.67
TN250 ea 2 $ 31.00 (S 62.00 [ $ 34.90 [ $ 69.80 [ $ 34.55 [ S 69.10 [ $ 34.23 [ $ 68.46 [ $ 10.00 | $ 20.00
TN350 ea 4 $ 52.00 (S 208.00 | S 5490 |S$ 219.60 [$ 57.75 [ $ 231.00 [$ 56.75 S 227.00 | S 49.60 | $ 198.40
TN430 ea 2 $ 50.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 61.90 |$ 123.80 | S 54.85| S 109.70 | $ 55.60 | $ 111.20 | $§ 47.10 | $ 94.20
TN450 ea 5 S 48.00 | $ 240.00 | S 49.85|S 249.25|S$ 52.89 S 264.45 [ S 61.65 (S 308.25 | S 4533 | S 226.65
TN460 ea 2 $ 70.00 | $ 140.00 | $ 72.90 |$ 14580 | S 77.35| S 154.70 | $ 84.07 | $ 168.14 | $ 61.41 | $ 122.82
TN570 ea 2 S 81.00 (S 162.00 | $ 83.90 |S 167.80 | S 94.95| S 189.90 | $ 91.03 | $ 182.06 | S 67.22 | S 134.44
TN620 ea 1 $ 53.00 | $ 53.00 [ $ 54.99 [ $ 54.99 [ $ 64.75 | $ 64.75 | $ 58.21 [ $ 5821 [$ 49.92 [ $ 49.92
TN630 ea 20 S 32.00 (S 640.00 | S 34.70 | S 694.00 [ S 37.75 [ $ 755.00 [$ 33.99 | $ 679.80 | S 29.69 | $ 593.80
TN650 ea 5 $ 83.00 (S 415.00 | $ 86.80 [$ 434.00 | $ 93.20 | $ 466.00 | $ 93.99 | $ 469.95 [ $ 79.89 [ $ 399.45
TN750 ea 4 S 87.00 S 348.00 | S 87.50 | $ 350.00 [ $ 97.00 [ $ 388.00 | $104.13 | $ 416.52 [ $ 8334 (S 333.36
$ 4,124.00 $ 4,500.67 $ 4,695.52 $ 4,658.91 $ 3,686.70
DELL
51645A ea 4 $ 35.00 | $ 140.00 | $ 36.70 | S 146.80 | S 39.65 | $ 158.60 | $ 31.00 | $ 124.00 | § 27.00 | $ 108.00
Dell 3130 black ea 2 S 77.00 | $ 154.00 | $ 84.90 | S 169.80 | $123.69 | S 24738 | S 86.76 | $ 173.52 | $ 70.00 | S 140.00
Dell 3130 cyan ea 2 $ 98.00 | $ 196.00 | $109.00 | $  218.00 | $166.45 | $ 332.90 [ $109.63 | $ 219.26 | $ 90.00 | $ 180.00
Dell 3130 yellow |ea 2 S 98.00 | S 196.00 | $109.00 | S 218.00 | $166.45 | S 332.90 [ $109.63 | $ 219.26 | $ 90.00 | $ 180.00
$ 686.00 $  752.60 $ 1,071.78 $ 736.04 $ 608.00
LEXMARK
80C1HCO ea 1 $ 85.00 | $ 85.00 | $ 95.80 | $ 95.80 | $112.00 | $ 112.00 | $110.88 | $ 110.88 | $ 82.84 | $ 82.84
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Item Description Unit Qty Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price| Ext. Price | Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price
80C1HKO ea 1 $ 77.00 | $ 77.00 [ $ 84.70 [ $ 84.70 | $105.00 | $ 105.00 | $ 99.86 | $ 99.86 | $ 74.62 | $ 74.62
80C1HMO ea 1 S 85.00 | S 85.00 | $ 96.70 | S 96.70 | $ 106.00 | S 106.00 | $110.88 | $ 110.88 | S 83.84 | S 83.84
80C1HYO ea 1 $ 85.00 | $ 85.00 | $ 96.70 | $ 96.70 | $106.00 | $ 106.00 | $110.88 | $ 110.88 | $ 82.84 | $ 82.84
C540A1KG ea 2 S 38.00 S 76.00 [ S 42.90 [ $ 85.80 | $ 43.50 | S 87.00 [ $ 44.84 S 89.68 | $ 3553 |S 71.06
C540A1YG ea 2 S 49.00 | $ 98.00 | § 54.90 |$ 109.80 | $ 57.00 | S 114.00 | $ 53.77 | $ 107.54 | $ 46.70 | $ 93.40
C734A1YG ea 1 $199.00 | $ 199.00 | $218.90 | S 218.90 | $247.29 | $ 247.29 | $229.88 | $ 229.88 | $160.00 | $ 160.00
C925H2KG ea 6 $124.00 | $ 744.00 | $134.90 | S 809.40 | $149.25 [ $ 895.50 | $147.58 | $ 885.48 [ $121.22 | $ 727.32
C925X72G ea 6 $ 70.00 | $ 420.00 [$ 78.80 [$ 47280 |S 87.15|S 52290 [$ 76.24 | S 457.44 | S 67.82 S 406.92
C925X76G ea 6 $ 15.00 | $ 90.00 | $ 13.50 | $ 81.00 | $ 14.15 | $ 84.90 [ $ 11.86 | $ 7116 [ $ 11.63 [ $ 69.78
E260A11A ea 4 S 98.00 | S 392.00 | $105.80 | S 423.20 [ $113.10 | $ 452.40 | $105.12 | $ 420.48 [ $ 90.00 | $ 360.00
E260X22G ea 3 $ 28.00 S 84.00 | $ 27.90 | $ 83.70 | $ 37.25 | $ 11175 | $ 30.49 | $ 91.47 | $ 2572 | $ 77.16
T650A11A ea 3 $142.00 | $ 426.00 [ $153.90 [ $ 461.70 | $168.49 | S 505.47 | $160.71 | $ 482.13 [ $125.00 | $ 375.00
X203A11G ea 2 S 84.00 | $ 168.00 | $ 89.95|$ 179.90 | $118.99 | $ 23798 [ $ 9933 |$ 198.66 | $ 80.00 | $ 160.00
ea $ 3,029.00 $ 3,300.10 $ 3,688.19 $ 3,466.42 $ 2,824.78
HP
C1823D ea 2 S 44.00 | S 88.00 | $ 44.90 | S 89.80 47.69| S 95.38 [ $ 45.99 [ $ 91.98 | $ 10.00 | $ 20.00
C4900A ea 1 $ 52.00 (S 52.00 [ $ 54.80 | $ 54.80 57.99( $ 57.99 | $ 56.57 [ $ 56.57 [ $ 48.00 [ $ 48.00
C4901A ea 1 $ 52.00 S 52.00 [$ 54.80 [ $ 54.80 57.99( $ 57.99 [ $ 56.57 [ $ 56.57 [ $ 48.00 [ $ 48.00
C4902AN ea 2 $ 23.00 (S 46.00 | $ 23.80 | $ 47.60 25.29( $ 50.58 [ $ 22.67 [ $ 45.34 | $ 21.00 | $ 42.00
C4903AN ea 2 S 17.00 | $ 34.00 [$ 18.40 | S 36.80 18.59| $ 37.18 | $ 16.78 | $ 33.56 [ $ 16.00 [ $ 32.00
C4904AN ea 2 $ 17.00 | $ 34.00 [ $ 18.40 [ S 36.80 18.59| $ 37.18 [ $ 16.78 [ $ 33.56 [ $ 16.00 | $ 32.00
C4905AN ea 2 S 17.00 | $ 34.00 [$ 18.40 | S 36.80 18.59| $ 37.18 | $ 16.78 [ $ 33.56 [ $ 16.00 [ $ 32.00
C4906AN ea 6 S 34.00 | $ 204.00 | $ 35.85|$  215.10 38.29( $ 229.74 | $ 36.01 (S 216.06 | $ 32.00 | $ 192.00
C4907AN ea 2 S 23.00 (S 46.00 | $ 23.80 | S 47.60 25.49( $ 50.98 [ $ 24.00 | $ 48.00 | $ 22.00 | $ 44.00
C4908AN ea 2 $ 23.00 (S 46.00 | $ 23.80 | $ 47.60 25.49( $ 50.98 [ $ 24.00 | $ 48.00 | $ 22.00 | $ 44.00
C4909AN ea 2 S 23.00 (S 46.00 | $ 23.80 | S 47.60 25.49( $ 50.98 [ $ 24.00 | $ 48.00 | $ 22.00 | S 44.00
C6578DN ea 4 $ 36.00 | $ 144.00 | $ 3799 |$ 151.96 40.49| $ 161.96 | $ 34.26 | $ 137.04 | $ 32.00 | $ 128.00
C6615DN ea 2 S 33.00 (S 66.00 [ S 34.70 [ $ 69.40 36.69( $ 73.38 | $ 33.25 (S 66.50 [ $ 22.00 [ $ 44.00
C6656AN ea 1 S 24.00 | $ 24.00 [$ 24.90 | $ 24.90 26.89( $ 26.89 | $ 22.12 [ $ 22,12 [ $ 19.00 | $ 19.00
C7115A ea 5 S 68.00 | S 340.00 | S 73.90 [ $  369.50 80.29| S 401.45 | $ 62.21 | $ 311.05 | S 45.00 | $ 225.00
C8543X ea 2 $239.00 | $ 478.00 | $248.90 | $§  497.80 286.5[ $ 573.00 | $248.41 | $ 496.82 | $240.00 | $ 480.00
C8721WN ea 1 S 20.00 | $ 20.00 [$ 22.99 [ $ 22.99 22.29( $ 2229 |$ 2013 (S 20.13 [$ 18.16 [ $ 18.16
C8728AN ea 1 $ 25.00 | $ 25.00 [ $ 26.50 [ $ 26.50 28( $ 28.00 [ $ 25.48 [ $ 2548 [ $ 21.13 [ $ 21.13
C8730WN ea 3 $ 15.00 | $ 45.00 | $ 15.40 | S 46.20 17.2| $ 51.60 [ $ 15.53 [ $ 46.59 | $ 12.76 | S 38.28
C8731WN ea 3 $ 15.00 | $ 45.00 | $ 15.40 | $ 46.20 17.2| $ 51.60 [ $ 15.53 [ $ 46.59 | $ 12.76 | $ 38.28
C8766WN ea 2 S 28.00 S 56.00 [$ 28.99 [ $ 57.98 30.8| S 61.60 | $ 26.10 [ $ 52.20 [ $ 20.00 [ $ 40.00
C8772WN ea 2 $ 11.00 | $ 22.00 [$ 10.90 | $ 21.80 11.49| $ 22.98 [ $ 10.56 | $ 2112 [$ 943 (S 18.86
C8773WN ea 2 S 11.00 | S 22.00 [$ 10.90 | $ 21.80 11.49| $ 22.98 | $ 10.56 | $ 2112 [$ 943 (S 18.86
C8773WN ea 2 $ 11.00 | $ 22.00 [$ 10.90 | $ 21.80 11.49| $ 22.98 [ $ 10.56 | $ 2112 [$ 943 (S 18.86
C8774WN ea 6 S 11.00 | S 66.00 [$ 10.90 [ $ 65.40 11.49| $ 68.94 | $ 10.56 | $ 6336 S 9.43(S 56.58
C8775WN ea 4 $ 11.00 | $ 44.00 | $ 10.90 | $ 43.60 11.45| $ 45.80 | $ 10.56 | $ 4224 |$ 9.43|S 37.72
C9364WN ea 2 S 24.00 S 48.00 | $ 24.90 | S 49.80 26.85[ $ 53.70 | $ 22.12 | $ 44.24 | $ 17.00 | S 34.00
C9385AN ea 5 $ 23.00 (S 115.00 | $ 22.80 | $ 114.00 23.79( $ 118.95 | $ 2041 |$ 102.05 | $ 19.62 | $ 98.10
C9386AN ea 6 S 17.00 | $ 102.00 | $ 16.50 | S 99.00 17.65| $ 105.90 | S 14.96 | $ 89.76 | $ 14.55 | S 87.30
C9387AN ea 8 $ 17.00 | $ 136.00 | $ 16.50 | $  132.00 17.65| $ 14120 | $ 14.96 | $ 119.68 | § 14.55 | $ 116.40
C9388AN ea 6 S 17.00 | $ 102.00 | $ 16.50 | S 99.00 17.65| $ 105.90 | S 14.96 | $ 89.76 | $ 14.55 | S 87.30
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Item Description Unit Qty Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price| Ext. Price | Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

C9397A ea 1 $ 38.00 | $ 38.00 [$ 39.80 | $ 39.80 43.69| $ 4369 | S 42.71|$ 4271 |$ 35.28 | $ 35.28
C9398A ea 1 S 38.00 S 38.00 [$ 39.80 | $ 39.80 43.69| S 4369 | S 4271 |$ 4271 |$ 3528 | S 35.28
C9399A ea 1 $ 38.00 | $ 38.00 [$ 39.80 | $ 39.80 43.69| $ 4369 | S 4271 |$ 4271 |$ 35.28 | $ 35.28
C9400A ea 1 S 38.00 S 38.00 [$ 39.80 [ $ 39.80 46.1| S 46.10 | S 42.71|$ 4271 |$ 3528 |$S 35.28
C9401A ea 1 $ 38.00 | $ 38.00 [$ 39.80 | $ 39.80 46.1| $ 46.10 | $ 42.71|$ 4271 |$ 35.28 | $ 35.28
C9403A ea 1 $ 55.00 [ $ 55.00 [$ 49.80 [ $ 49.80 68[ $ 68.00 | $ 62.27 [ $ 62.27 [$ 35.28 [ $ 35.28
C9500FN ea 1 $ 37.00 (S 37.00 [ $ 39.60 [ $ 39.60 42.3| S 4230 | $ 39.55 | $ 39.55 [$ 3242 (S 32.42
C9514FN ea 14 S 45.00 | $ 630.00 | S 46.50 [ $ 651.00 51.15[ $ 716.10 [ S 46.97 | S 657.58 | S 32.00 | $ 448.00
C9720A ea 2 $170.00 | $ 340.00 | $184.90 | $  369.80 203.6[ $ 407.20 | $159.95 | 319.90 | $129.00 | $ 258.00
C9732A ea 2 $328.00 | $ 656.00 | $349.90 [ S  699.80 395.9( $ 791.80 | $299.77 | $ 599.54 | $260.00 | $ 520.00
CB316WN ea 6 $ 13.00 | $ 78.00 [ $ 12.90 | $ 77.40 12.95| $ 77.70 | $ 11.84 [ $ 71.04 [ $ 10.68 [ $ 64.08
CB317WN ea 6 S 11.00 | S 66.00 1045 | S 62.70 10.65| $ 63.90 [$ 9.71 (S 5826 S 876 (S 52.56
CB318WN ea 11 $ 11.00 | $ 121.00 | $ 1045 |$ 114.95 10.65| $ 11715 |6 971 |$ 106.81 | S 7.76 | S 85.36
CB319WN ea 10 S 11.00 | $ 110.00 | $ 1045 |S  104.50 10.65| $ 10650 | S 9.71|$ 97.10|$ 7.76 | S 77.60
CB320WN ea 10 $ 11.00 | $ 110.00 | $ 10.45|$  104.50 10.65| $ 10650 | $ 9.71 | $ 97.10 |$ 776 | $ 77.60
CB323WN ea 2 $ 19.00 | $ 38.00 [$ 18.90 | $ 37.80 20.25[ $ 4050 | S 19.42 | $ 38.84 [$ 15.70 [ $ 31.40
CB324WN ea 2 $ 19.00 | $ 38.00 [$ 18.90 | $ 37.80 20.25[ $ 40.50 | $ 19.42 | $ 38.84 [$ 15.70 [ $ 31.40
CB325WN ea 2 $ 19.00 | $ 38.00 [$ 18.90 | $ 37.80 20.25[ $ 4050 | S 19.42 | S 38.84 [$ 15.70 [ $ 31.40
CB336WN ea 6 $ 39.00 | $ 234.00 | S 40.90 | $  245.40 43.75| $ 262.50 [ $ 38.14 | $ 22884 | S 35.12 | S 210.72
CB540AD ea 1 $111.00 | $ 111.00 | $121.80 | $  121.80 132.25| S 132.25 | $126.61 | $ 126.61 | $110.25 | S 110.25
CB541A ea 1 $ 57.00 | $ 57.00 [ $ 63.70 [ $ 63.70 67.69| $ 67.69 | $ 62.18 [ $ 62.18 [ $ 55.84 [ $ 55.84
CB542A ea 1 $ 57.00 | $ 57.00 [$ 63.70 [ $ 63.70 67.69| $ 67.69 | S 62.18 [ $ 62.18 [$ 55.84 [ $ 55.84
CB543A ea 1 $ 57.00 | $ 57.00 [ $ 63.70 [ $ 63.70 67.69| $ 67.69 | $ 62.18 [ $ 62.18 [ $ 55.84 [ $ 55.84
CC364A ea 3 $134.00 | $ 402.00 | $145.80 | S  437.40 156.25| S 468.75 | $120.91 | $ 362.73 | $139.00 | $ 417.00
CC530A ea 7 $ 97.00 | $ 679.00 | $109.00 | $  763.00 111.85| $ 782.95 | $ 86.55 | $ 605.85 | S 88.00 | $ 616.00
CC531A ea 4 $ 95.00 | $ 380.00 | $104.80 | S  419.20 113.55| S 45420 | $ 85.31 (S 341.24 | $ 90.00 | $ 360.00
CC532A ea 2 $ 95.00 | $ 190.00 | $104.80 | $  209.60 113.55| $ 227.10 [ $ 8531 (S 170.62 | $ 90.00 | $ 180.00
CC533A ea 2 $ 95.00 | $ 190.00 | $104.80 | S  209.60 113.55| S 227.10 [ $ 8531 (S 170.62 | $ 90.00 | S 180.00
CC641WN ea 17 $ 35.00 | $ 595.00 | $ 36.90 | $ 627.30 39.89( $ 678.13 [ $ 3199 |$ 543.83 | $ 3291 |$S 559.47
CD972AN ea 4 $ 15.00 | $ 60.00 [$ 14.90 [ $ 59.60 15.5| S 62.00 [ $ 13.40 (S 53.60 [$ 12.92 [ $ 51.68
CD973AN ea 2 $ 15.00 | $ 30.00 [ $ 14.90 | $ 29.80 15.5| $ 31.00 [ $ 13.40($ 26.80 [$ 12.92 [ S 25.84
CD974AN ea 2 $ 15.00 | $ 30.00 [$ 14.90 | $ 29.80 15.5| S 31.00 [ $ 13.40 (S 26.80 [$ 12.92 [ $ 25.84
CD975AN ea 6 $ 31.00 (S 186.00 | $ 32.90 | $ 197.40 34.29( $ 205.74 [ $ 26.93 | $ 161.58 | $ 28.57 | $ 171.42
CE250A ea 2 $106.00 | $ 212.00 | $117.80 | $  235.60 126.25| S 252.50 [ $113.94 | $ 227.88 | $104.14 | $ 208.28
CE255X ea 1 $177.00 | $ 177.00 | $194.90 | $  194.90 212.35| $ 21235 [ $178.20 | $ 178.20 | $170.00 | $ 170.00
CE257A ea 1 $212.00 | $ 212.00 | $234.90 | S  234.90 254.3[ $ 254.30 | $242.77 | $ 242.77 | $180.00 | $ 180.00
CE278A ea 6 $ 63.00 S 378.00 | S 64.90 | $ 389.40 71.2| $ 427.20 | $ 57.81|$ 346.86 | $ 55.00 | $ 330.00
CE285A ea 41 $ 53.00 [$ 2,173.00 [$ 57.80 [ S 2,369.80 62.15[$ 2,548.15 [$ 49.99 | $ 2,049.59 [ $ 50.00 [$  2,050.00
CE390AR ea 11 $134.00 [ $ 1,474.00 | $148.70 [ $ 1,635.70 156.25| $ 1,718.75 | $124.99 | $ 1,374.89 | $139.00 | $  1,529.00
CE400A ea 6 $117.00 | $ 702.00 | $129.80 [ S  778.80 138.7| $ 832.20 [ $127.46 | $ 764.76 | $115.00 | $ 690.00
CE400X ea 3 $155.00 | $ 465.00 | $173.80 [ § 521.40 205.5[ $ 616.50 [ $171.48 | $ 514.44 | $155.00 | $ 465.00
CE401AR ea 3 $172.00 | $ 516.00 | $184.90 [ S 554.70 206.65| $ 619.95 [ $197.79 | $ 593.37 | $172.00 | $ 516.00
CE402A ea 5 $172.00 | $ 860.00 | $184.90 [ $§ 924.50 206.65| S 1,033.25 | $197.79 | $ 988.95 | $172.00 | $ 860.00
CE403A ea 3 $172.00 | $ 516.00 | $184.90 [ S 554.70 206.65| S 619.95 [ $197.79 | $ 593.37 | $172.00 | $ 516.00
CE410A ea 4 $ 66.00 | $ 264.00 | S 68.90 | $  275.60 783| $ 31320 [ $ 61.16 | $ 24464 | S 65.00 | $ 260.00
CE411A ea 2 S 94.00 | $ 188.00 | $103.80 | S  207.60 111.55| S 223.10 [ $ 87.12 (S 174.24 | $ 95.00 | S 190.00
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Bid 2015-80 " 6 month Contract for Ink Cartridges
Toner & Bottled Water"

ECON Systems LTD Inc.
c/o Swaylyn Holland

420 N. Town East Bivd
Sunnyvale, TX 75182

972-226-3400 xt. 263

dwaylynh@enconsupplie]

Executive Office Supplies

c/o Jorge Gonzalez Juaristi

3312 Santa Ursula
Laredo, TX 78040

956-722-6791

sales@executiveofficesu

Patria Office Supplies

c/o Maria Rodriguez

301 E. Calton Rd.
Laredo, TX 78041

956-723-2332

patriamaria2@yahoo.com

San Antonio Lighthouse for the Blind

c/o Gaye Preston

2305 Roosevelt Avenue

San Antonio, TX 78210

210-243-3675

customersupport@salighthouse.org

The Office Pal

clo Brenda Friedman

PO Box 2
Lakewood, NJ 08701

877-486-0590 ext. 105

brenda@theofficepal.com

Price Schedule for Ink Cartridges & Toners
(NO REFURBISHED CARTRIDGES, NO EXCEPTIONS )
Item Description Unit Qty Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price| Ext. Price | Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price
CE412A ea 2 $ 94.00 | $ 188.00 | $103.80 | $  207.60 111.55| $ 223.10 [ $ 87.12 S 174.24 | $ 95.00 | $ 190.00
CE413A ea 2 S 94.00 | $ 188.00 | $103.80 | S  207.60 111.55| S 223.10 [ $ 87.12 (S 174.24 | $ 95.00 | S 190.00
CE505A ea 48 $ 69.00 [$ 3,312.00 [ $ 74.99 [ $ 3,599.52 80.35| $ 3,856.80 | $ 63.44 | $ 3,045.12 [ $ 69.00 [ $  3,312.00
CE505D ea 3 $125.00 | $ 375.00 | $134.90 [ S  404.70 149.45| S 448.35 | $113.38 | $ 340.14 | $130.00 | $ 390.00
CE505X ea 5 $127.00 | $ 635.00 | $138.70 | $  693.50 147.45| $ 737.25 [ $115.24 | $ 576.20 | $130.00 | $ 650.00
CE505XD ea 1 $228.00 | $ 228.00 | $254.50 | S  254.50 2742 $ 274.20 [ $247.21 | $ 247.21 | $260.00 | $ 260.00
CF283A ea 2 $ 52.00 (S 104.00 | $ 55.90 | $ 111.80 62.15[ $ 12430 | $ 6131 |$ 122.62 | $ 60.00 | $ 120.00
CF340A ea 3 $254.00 | $ 762.00 | $265.80 | S  797.40 306| $ 918.00 | $298.96 | $ 896.88 | $260.00 | $ 780.00
CF370AM ea 1 $250.00 | $ 250.00 | $259.70 | $  259.70 328.35| $ 328.35 | $298.84 | $ 298.84 | $270.00 | $ 270.00
CH563WN ea 23 S 28.00 S 644.00 | S 28.90 | S 664.70 31.35[ $ 721.05 [ $ 29.23 | $ 67229 | S 25.86 | $ 594.78
CH564WN ea 2 $ 30.00 | $ 60.00 [ $ 29.90 | $ 59.80 32.95[ $ 65.90 [ $ 29.88 [ $ 59.76 [ $ 30.19 [ $ 60.38
CNO45AN ea 8 S 32.00 (S 256.00 | S 33.70 | S  269.60 36.25[ $ 290.00 [ $ 33.63 (S 269.04 | S 30.19 | $ 241.52
CNO49AN ea 4 $ 23.00 (S 92.00 | $ 23.90 | $ 95.60 25.1| $ 100.40 | $ 25.16 | $ 100.64 | $ 20.93 | $ 83.72
CNO57AN ea 2 S 18.00 | $ 36.00 [$ 18.90 [ $ 37.80 19.1| $ 38.20 [ $ 18.81 (S 37.62 [$ 1591 S 31.82
CNO58AN ea 5 $ 10.00 | $ 50.00 [$ 9.95 (S 49.75 9.99| $ 4995 |S 9.84|$ 49.20 | $ 825|S$ 41.25
CNO59AN ea 5 $ 10.00 | $ 50.00 [$ 9.95 (S 49.75 9.99| $ 4995 |S 984S 4920 |$ 825|S 41.25
CNO60AN ea 5 $ 10.00 | $ 50.00 [$ 9.95 (S 49.75 9.99| $ 4995 | S 9.84|$ 49.20 | $ 825|S$ 41.25
CN684WN ea 6 S 22.00 (S 132.00 | $ 2299 | S 137.94 243| S 14580 | S 22.25|$ 133.50 | $ 20.06 | S 120.36
CR314FN ea 3 S 48.00 | $ 144.00 | $ 51.50 | $  154.50 54.55[ $ 163.65 | $ 56.99 | $ 170.97 | $ 50.00 | $ 150.00
Q2612A ea 1 S 62.00 (S 62.00 [S 67.80 | $ 67.80 70.7| S 70.70 | $ 57.99 [ $ 57.99 [ $ 60.00 [ $ 60.00
Q2612AD ea 3 $109.00 | $ 327.00 | $118.90 | $  356.70 130.35| $ 391.05 | $120.48 | $ 361.44 | $105.00 | $ 315.00
Q2670A ea 1 $126.00 | $ 126.00 | $139.80 | S  139.80 151.25| S 151.25 | $126.38 | $ 126.38 | S 80.00 | S 80.00
Q2671A ea 1 $126.00 | $ 126.00 | $139.80 | $  139.80 159.85| $ 159.85 | $125.96 | $ 125.96 | $ 80.00 | $ 80.00
Q2673A ea 1 $126.00 | $ 126.00 | $139.80 | S  139.80 159.85| S 159.85 | $125.96 | $ 125.96 | S 80.00 | S 80.00
Q5942X ea 6 $214.00 [ $ 1,284.00 | $234.90 [ $ 1,409.40 257.95| S 1,547.70 | $174.44 | $ 1,046.64 | $188.00 | $  1,128.00
Q5949A ea 13 $ 79.00 [$ 1,027.00 [ $ 88.00 [ S 1,144.00 91.5|$ 1,189.50 | S 69.96 | $ 909.48 [ $ 69.00 [ $ 897.00
Q5949X ea 7 $144.00 [ $ 1,008.00 | $162.80 [ $ 1,139.60 172.25| $ 1,205.75 | $119.45 | $ 836.15 | $100.00 | $ 700.00
Q6000A ea 5 S 73.00 S 365.00 | S 80.90 [ S  404.50 86.5| $ 43250 | $ 63.71 | $ 318.55 | $ 57.00 | $ 285.00
Q6001A ea 1 $ 79.00 | $ 79.00 [ $ 88.00 | $ 88.00 94.4| $ 94.40 [ $ 69.55 [ $ 69.55 [ $ 60.00 [ $ 60.00
Q6002A ea 1 S 79.00 | $ 79.00 [ $ 88.00 [ $ 88.00 94.4| $ 94.40 [ $ 69.55 [ S 69.55 [ $ 60.00 [ $ 60.00
Q6003A ea 1 $ 79.00 | $ 79.00 [ $ 88.40 [ $ 88.40 94.4| $ 94.40 | $ 69.55 [ $ 69.55 [ $ 60.00 [ $ 60.00
Q6470A ea 14 $126.00 [$ 1,764.00 [ $141.50 [ $ 1,981.00 151.25| S 2,117.50 | $107.99 | $ 1,511.86 | $115.00 | $  1,610.00
Q6471A ea 1 $126.00 | $ 126.00 | $141.00 | $  141.00 150.75| $ 150.75 | $120.72 | $ 120.72 | $105.00 | $ 105.00
Q6472A ea 1 $126.00 | $ 126.00 | $141.00 | S  141.00 150.75| S 150.75 | $120.72 | $ 120.72 | $105.00 | $ 105.00
Q6473A ea 1 $126.00 | $ 126.00 | $141.00 | $  141.00 150.75| $ 150.75 | $120.72 | $ 120.72 | $105.00 | $ 105.00
Q7551A ea 4 $113.00 | $ 452.00 [ $127.80 | $ 511.20 134.79| S 539.16 | $114.23 | $ 456.92 | $100.00 | $ 400.00
Q7553A ea 3 $ 77.00 | $ 231.00 | S 86.90 | $ 260.70 89.3| $ 267.90 [ S 67.80 | $ 203.40 | $ 65.00 | $ 195.00
Q7581A ea 2 $162.00 | $ 324.00 | $182.00 [ S 364.00 194.6| $ 389.20 | $148.45 | $ 296.90 | $120.00 | $ 240.00
Q7582A ea 3 $162.00 | $ 486.00 | $182.00 | $  546.00 194.6| $ 583.80 | $148.45 | $ 445.35 [ $120.00 | $ 360.00
Q7583A ea 3 $162.00 | $ 486.00 | $182.00 | $ 546.00 194.6| $ 583.80 | $148.45 | $ 445.35 | $120.00 | $ 360.00
$ 32,871.00 $ 35,645.19 $ 38,529.63 $ 31,595.06 $ 30,018.68
EPSON
7079120 ea 3 $ 19.00 | $ 57.00 [ $ 20.90 | $ 62.70 22.75[ $ 68.25 [ $ 19.76 [ $ 59.28 [ $ 18.46 | $ 55.38
7079220 ea 2 S 21.00 (S 42.00 | $ 22.80 | S 45.60 23.2|$ 46.40 | S 20.99 | $ 41.98 | $ 2030 | S 40.60
7079320 ea 1 $ 21.00 (S 21.00 [$ 22.80 | $ 22.80 23.2| $ 23.20 [ $ 20.99 [ $ 20.99 [$ 20.30 [ $ 20.30
7079420 ea 1 S 21.00 (S 21.00 [$ 22.80 | $ 22.80 23.2|$ 23.20 [ $ 20.99 | $ 20.99 [$ 20.30 (S 20.30
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Bid 2015-80 " 6 month Contract for Ink Cartridges
Toner & Bottled Water"

ECON Systems LTD Inc.
c/o Swaylyn Holland

420 N. Town East Bivd
Sunnyvale, TX 75182

972-226-3400 xt. 263

dwaylynh@enconsupplie]

Executive Office Supplies

c/o Jorge Gonzalez Juaristi

3312 Santa Ursula
Laredo, TX 78040

956-722-6791

sales@executiveofficesu

Patria Office Supplies

c/o Maria Rodriguez

301 E. Calton Rd.
Laredo, TX 78041

956-723-2332

patriamaria2@yahoo.com

San Antonio Lighthouse for the Blind

c/o Gaye Preston

2305 Roosevelt Avenue

San Antonio, TX 78210

210-243-3675

customersupport@salighthouse.org

The Office Pal

clo Brenda Friedman

PO Box 2
Lakewood, NJ 08701

877-486-0590 ext. 105

brenda@theofficepal.com

Price Schedule for Ink Cartridges & Toners
(NO REFURBISHED CARTRIDGES, NO EXCEPTIONS )
Item Description Unit Qty Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price| Ext. Price | Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price
7079520 ea 1 $ 21.00 (S 21.00 [$ 22.80 | $ 22.80 23.2| $ 23.20 [ $ 20.99 [ $ 20.99 [$ 20.30 | $ 20.30
7079620 ea 3 $ 21.00 (S 63.00 [$ 22.80 | $ 68.40 23.2|$ 69.60 | $ 20.99 [ $ 62.97 [$ 2030 | $ 60.90
7127120 ea 6 $ 28.00 | $ 168.00 | $ 29.70 | $  178.20 34.65| $ 207.90 [ $ 28.77 | $ 172.62 | $ 28.96 | $ 173.76
71127220 ea 4 S 20.00 | $ 80.00 | $ 20.90 | S 83.60 23[ $ 92.00 [ $ 19.57 [ $ 7828 [$ 19.79 [ $ 79.16
7127320 ea 4 $ 20.00 | $ 80.00 | $ 20.90 | $ 83.60 23[ $ 92.00 [ $ 19.57 [ $ 7828 [ $ 19.79 | $ 79.16
71127420 ea 4 S 20.00 | $ 80.00 | $ 20.90 | S 83.60 23[ $ 92.00 [ $ 19.57 [ $ 7828 [$ 19.79 [ $ 79.16
$ 633.00 $  674.10 $ 737.75 $ 634.66 $ 629.02
"No Bids" removed from Tally
330-1194 ea 3 S 98.00 | S 294.00 | $107.00 | $  321.00 | no bid $109.63 | $ 328.89 | $ 90.00 | $ 270.00
330-1195 ea 3 $ 98.00 | $ 294.00 | $107.00 | $  321.00 | no bid $109.63 | $ 328.89 | $ 90.00 | $ 270.00
330-1196 ea 4 S 98.00 | S 392.00 | $107.00 | S  428.00 | no bid $109.63 | $ 438.52 [ $ 90.00 | $ 360.00
330-1197 ea 3 $ 77.00 | $ 231.00 | $ 84.50 | $  253.50 [ no bid S 86.76 | $ 260.28 | $ 70.00 | $ 210.00
331-7328 ea 10 S 78.00 | S 780.00 | S 85.80 | S 858.00 [ no bid S 86.25 (S 862.50 [ $ 74.00 [ $ 740.00
331-8429 ea 1 $125.00 | $ 125.00 | $136.90 | $  136.90 | no bid $137.75 | $ 137.75 | $117.00 | $ 117.00
332-0407 ea 1 S 65.00 | $ 65.00 [$ 69.95 [ $ 69.95 | no bid S 7275 (S 72.75 [ $ 62.00 [ $ 62.00
332-0408 ea 3 $ 65.00 | $ 195.00 | $ 69.95 | $  209.85 | no bid S 7275 |$ 218.25 | $ 62.00 | $ 186.00
332-0409 ea 4 S 65.00 | $ 260.00 | S 72.80 | $ 291.20 | no bid S 7275 (S 291.00 | $ 63.00 | $ 252.00
332-0410 ea 3 $ 65.00 | $ 195.00 | $ 72.80 | $  218.40 | no bid S 7275 |$ 218.25 | S 63.00 | $ 189.00
3K9XM ea 2 S 66.00 | S 132.00 | $ 72.90 | S 145.80 | no bid S 60.26 | $ 120.52 | $ 63.00 | S 126.00
4DV2W ea 2 $ 65.00 | $ 130.00 | $ 33.80 | $ 67.60 | no bid $ 60.26 | $ 120.52 | $ 63.00 | $ 126.00
76975 ea 6 $ 91.00 (S 546.00 | $104.80 | S  628.80 | no bid $102.89 | $ 617.34 | S 90.00 | $ 540.00
79K5P ea 2 $ 65.00 | $ 130.00 | $ 38.90 | $ 77.80 | no bid S 7275 |$ 145.50 | $ 63.00 | $ 126.00
8WNV5 ea 3 $ 91.00 (S 273.00 | $104.80 | S  314.40 | no bid S 4484 S 134.52 | $ 90.00 | $ 270.00
Dell 1250 black [ea 3 S 47.00 | $ 141.00 | $ 51.90 | $  155.70 | no bid S 7275 |$ 218.25 | $ 40.00 | $ 120.00
Dell 1250 cyan [ea 2 $ 53.00 | S 106.00 | $ 57.80 | S  115.60 | no bid S 7275 (S 145.50 | $ 40.00 | $ 80.00
Dell 1250 magent|ea 2 $ 53.00 | $ 106.00 | $ 57.80 | $  115.60 | no bid S 7275 |$ 145.50 | $ 40.00 | $ 80.00
Dell 1250 yellow [ea 2 $ 53.00 S 106.00 | $ 57.80 | S  115.60 | no bid S 7275 (S 145.50 | $ 40.00 | $ 80.00
Dell 1720 ea 4 $ 85.00 | $ 340.00 | $104.90 | $  419.60 | no bid $102.98 | $ 411.92 [ $ 80.00 | $ 320.00
Dell 3115cyan [ea 1 $127.00 | $ 127.00 | $138.80 | S  138.80 | no bid $139.80 | $ 139.80 | $120.00 | $ 120.00
Dell 3115 magent|ea 1 $127.00 | $ 127.00 | $138.80 | $  138.80 | no bid $139.80 | $ 139.80 | $120.00 | $ 120.00
Dell 3115 yellow [ea 1 $127.00 | $ 127.00 | $138.80 | S  138.80 | no bid $139.80 | $ 139.80 | $120.00 | $ 120.00
Dell 3130 magent |ea 3 $ 98.00 | $ 294.00 | $109.00 | $  327.00 | no bid $109.63 | $ 328.89 | $ 90.00 | $ 270.00
Dell 5330dn toner |ea 2 $154.00 | $ 308.00 | $164.90 | S  329.80 | no bid $174.89 | $ 349.78 | $140.00 | $ 280.00
Dell B126X ea 20 error $ 57.80 | $ 1,156.00 | no bid S 86.25|$ 1,725.00 | $ 56.00 | $ 1,120.00
Dell B2360dn ea 10 $159.00 [ $ 1,590.00 | $164.90 [ $ 1,649.00 | no bid S 7879 (S 787.90 | S 89.00 | $ 890.00
Dell C1660 black |ea 1 S 48.00 | $ 48.00 | $ 49.95 | $ 49.95 | no bid $ 54.80 | $ 54.80 [ $ 45.00 [ $ 45.00
Dell C1660 cyan  |ea 1 $ 53.00 S 53.00 [$ 56.90 [ $ 56.90 | no bid $ 59.79 | $ 59.79 [ $ 49.00 [ $ 49.00
Dell C1660 mage |ea 1 $ 53.00 | $ 53.00 [ $ 56.90 [ $ 56.90 | no bid $ 59.79 | $ 59.79 [ $ 49.00 | $ 49.00
Dell C1660 yellow |ea 1 $ 53.00 S 53.00 [$ 56.90 [ $ 56.90 | no bid $ 59.79 | $ 59.79 [ $ 49.00 [ $ 49.00
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Bid 2015-80 " 6 month Contract for Ink Cartridges
Toner & Bottled Water"

Price Schedule for Ink Cartridges & Toners
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ECON Systems LTD Inc.
c/o Swaylyn Holland

420 N. Town East Bivd
Sunnyvale, TX 75182

972-226-3400 xt. 263

dwaylynh@enconsupplie]

Executive Office Supplies

c/o Jorge Gonzalez Juaristi

3312 Santa Ursula
Laredo, TX 78040

956-722-6791

sales@executiveofficesu

Patria Office Supplies

c/o Maria Rodriguez

301 E. Calton Rd.
Laredo, TX 78041

956-723-2332

patriamaria2@yahoo.com

San Antonio Lighthouse for the Blind

c/o Gaye Preston

2305 Roosevelt Avenue

San Antonio, TX 78210

210-243-3675

customersupport@salighthouse.org

The Office Pal

clo Brenda Friedman

PO Box 2
Lakewood, NJ 08701

877-486-0590 ext. 105

brenda@theofficepal.com

Item Description Unit Qty Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price| Ext. Price | Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

Dell C1765 black |ea 2 S 47.00 | $ 94.00 | § 52.90 | $ 105.80 | no bid $ 54.80 | $ 109.60 | $ 45.00 | $ 90.00
Dell C1765 cyan ea 1 $ 53.00 S 53.00 [$ 56.90 [ $ 56.90 | no bid S 59.79 | $ 59.79 [ $ 49.00 [ $ 49.00
Dell C2660 cyan ea 1 $ 72.00 (S 72.00 [$ 76.80 | $ 76.80 | no bid $ 79.99 | $ 79.99 [ $ 60.00 [ $ 60.00
Dell C2660 mage |ea 1 S 72.00 (S 72.00 [$ 76.80 [ $ 76.80 | no bid S 79.99 | $ 79.99 [ $ 60.00 [ $ 60.00
Dell C2660 yellow |ea 1 $ 72.00 (S 72.00 [$ 76.80 | $ 76.80 | no bid $ 79.99 | $ 79.99 [ $ 60.00 | $ 60.00
Dell C3760 black |ea 2 S 71.00 (S 142.00 | $ 76.90 | S 153.80 | no bid $137.75 | $ 275.50 | $ 65.00 | $ 130.00
Dell C3760 cyan ea 1 $140.00 | $ 140.00 | $148.80 | $  148.80 | no bid $274.68 | $ 274.68 | $125.00 | $ 125.00
Dell C3760 yellow |ea 1 $140.00 | $ 140.00 | $148.80 | S  148.80 | no bid $274.68 | $ 274.68 | $125.00 | $ 125.00
Dell C7165 black |ea 2 S 48.00 | $ 96.00 | $ 51.90 | $ 103.80 | no bid $ 54.80 | $ 109.60 | $ 45.00 | $ 90.00
Dell C7165 mage |ea 2 $ 53.00 S 106.00 | $ 56.90 | S  113.80 | no bid $ 59.79 | $ 119.58 | $ 49.00 | S 98.00
Dell C7165 yellow |ea 2 $ 53.00 | $ 106.00 | $ 57.90 | $  115.80 | no bid $ 59.79 | $ 119.58 | § 49.00 | $ 98.00
GP3M4 ea 2 S 73.00 S 146.00 | $ 78.80 | S  157.60 | no bid S 79.99 | $ 159.98 | $ 60.00 | S 120.00
HD47M ea 1 $ 58.00 | $ 58.00 [ $ 74.90 | $ 74.90 | no bid $ 69.99 | $ 69.99 [ $ 60.00 | $ 60.00
N51XP ea 8 S 94.00 | $ 752.00 | S 98.80 | S  790.40 | no bid $102.98 | $ 823.84 [ $ 90.00 [ $ 720.00
NPDXG ea 7 $ 93.00 (S 651.00 | $ 97.99 | $ 685.93 [ no bid $102.89 | $ 720.23 | $ 90.00 | $ 630.00
PK492 ea 2 S 62.00 (S 124.00 | $ 65.90 | S 131.80 | no bid S 69.99 | S 139.98 | $ 60.00 | S 120.00
PK941 ea 1 $111.00 | $ 111.00 | $119.80 | $  119.80 | no bid $129.44 | $ 129.44 | $105.00 | $ 105.00
ROPYX ea 2 S 73.00 S 146.00 | $ 77.80 | S  155.60 | no bid S 79.99 | $ 159.98 | $ 60.00 | S 120.00
SWNV5 ea 4 error error no bid error $ 50.00 | $ 200.00
V1620 ea 2 S 72.00 (S 144.00 | $ 79.30 | S 158.60 | no bid S 79.99 | $ 159.98 | $ 60.00 | S 120.00
W8X8P ea 2 $ 66.00 | $ 132.00 | $ 73.20 | $  146.40 | no bid S 66.14 | $ 132.28 | $ 65.00 | $ 130.00
E264X11G ea 1 error $114.70 | $  114.70 | no bid $207.17 | $ 207.17 | $160.00 | $ 160.00
CD886FN ea 14 error S 46.80 | S  655.20 [no bid S 7299 S 1,021.86 | $ 37.00 | $ 518.00
RM1-2763 ea 1 $174.00 | $ 174.00 | $197.50 | S  197.50 |no bid $134.02 | $ 134.02 | $ 50.00 | S 50.00
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