Bid Number: 2016-14

Webb County Purchasing Dept.

Bid Tabulation

Annual Contract for Janitorial Supplies

Laredo Office Supplies

c/o Jorge G. Juaristi

c/o Executive Office Supplies
3312 Santa Ursula Ave.

Laredo, TX 78040

sales@executiveofficesupply.com

Gulf Coast Paper Co.

c/o Abraham Zarate

1101 Spid

Corpus Christi, TX 78416

956-645-6869

abezarate@sbcglobal.net

Patria Office Supplies

c/o Alexis Landin
301 E. Calton Rd.
Laredo, TX 78041
956-723-2332

landinalexis@yahoo.com

Approved Approved Approved

Categ| QTY Unit ITEM DESCRIPTION

Plates/Cups/Napkins/Plastic Utensils Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price | Unit Price Ext. Price

1 400 cs Amoco #31-583 3-compartment $ 2280 | $ 9,120.00 | $ 13.60 | $ 5,440.00 | $ 16.21|$  6,484.00
foam plates or approved
“equal” (200 plates/case)

2 100 cs Round triple compartment $ 46.90 | $ 4,690.00 | $ 2240 [$ 2,240.00 | $ 18.65|$  1,865.00
plastic coated plates
(500 plates/case)

3 200 cs #RCL-750 combo aluminum no bid no bid $ 69.05 [ $ 13,810.00
3-compartment plates or
approved “equal”
(200 plates w/lid/case)

4 2 cs Pint containers for hot soup no bid $ 5058 | $ 10116 | $ 166.78 | $ 333,56
#KH16A (not foam) w/lids
or approved “equal”
(250/16 oz/case)

5 300 cs Foam cups, 6 oz. $ 19.90 | $ 5,970.00 | $ 1543 [ $ 4,620.00 | $ 17.47 |$  5241.00
(1000 cups/case)

6 15 cs Plastic cover lid for no bid $ 1032 [ $ 15480 | $ 12.45 | $ 186.75
60z cup (1000/case)

7 50 cs Foam cups, 8 oz. $ 18.80 | $ 940.00 | $ 17.98 | $  899.00 | $ 21.10 |$  1,055.00
(1000 cups/case)
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Bid Number: 2016-14

Webb County Purchasing Dept.

Bid Tabulation

Annual Contract for Janitorial Supplies

Laredo Office Supplies

c/o Jorge G. Juaristi

c/o Executive Office Supplies
3312 Santa Ursula Ave.

Laredo, TX 78040
sales@executiveofficesupply.com

Gulf Coast Paper Co.

c/o Abraham Zarate

1101 Spid

Corpus Christi, TX 78416

956-645-6869

abezarate@sbcglobal.net

Patria Office Supplies
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Approved Approved Approved

Categ| QTY Unit ITEM DESCRIPTION

8 50 cs Foam cups, 10 oz. $ 2290 | $ 1,145.00 | $ 22.80 1,140.00 | $ 2685 $  1,342.50
(1000 cups/case)

9 300 cs Medium weight plastic $ 850 | $ 2,550.00 | $ 8.49 2,547.00 | $ 930 |$  2790.00
spoons (1000 spoons/case)

10 25 cs Medium weight plastic $ 850 | $ 21250 | $ 8.49 21225 | $ 9.30 | $ 232,50
forks (1000 forks/case)

11 25 cs Medium weight plastic $ 850 [ $ 212,50 | $ 8.49 212.25 | $ 9.30 | $ 232.50
knives (1000 knives/case)

12 5 cs White embossed paper napkins $ 2090 | $ 104.50 | $ 41.00 205.00 | $ 4010 | $ 200.50
13x13” or approved “equal”

13 10 cs Multi-fold white paper towel $ 18.90 | $ 189.00 | $ 18.35 183.50 | $ 17.64 | $ 176.40

14 10 box Thrifty napkins $ 13.90 | $ 139.00 | no bid $ 2895 |$  289.50

15 50 cs Sanitary napkins, regular $ 40.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 32.25 1,61250 | $ 4190|$  2,095.00
size, individually wrapped

16 5 cs Foam Cups 8 0z, 1000/pkg. (Dart) $ 18.80 [ $ 94.00 | $ 17.87 89.35 | $ 2110 ( $ 105.50
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Approved Approved Approved
Categ| QTY Unit ITEM DESCRIPTION
17 5 cs Foam Cups 12 oz (Dart) 1000/pkg $ 25.40 | $ 127.00 | $ 25.35 126.75 | $ 28.95 [ $ 144.75
18 5 cs Foam Cups 16 oz (Dart) 1000/pkg $ 2150 | $ 107.50 | $ 36.62 183.10 | $ 40.86 | $ 204.30
19 5 cs 3 ounce paper Dixie cup $ 33.80 | $ 169.00 | $ 187.50 937.50 | $ 53.80 | $ 269.00
20 15 cs Meal Kits (1000 pkg) $ 22.50 33750 | $ 21.90 | $ 328.50
Can Liners
21 200 cs Heavy weight, white 58-gal $ 2995 | $ 5,990.00 | $ 23.95 4,790.00 | $ 2160 | $  4,320.00
min. 17 micron, trash can
liners, 36x60”
22 124 cs Heavy duty, white 45-gal. $ 22.90 | $ 2,839.60 | $ 25.23 312852 | $ 1941 |$  2,406.84
min. 17 micron, trash can
liners, 40x48”
*23 124 cs Trash can liners, 35-gal. $ 3190 | $ 3,955.60 | $ 17.56 217744 | $ 17.64 | $  2,187.36
16 microns, 33x40”
*24 100 cs Trash can liners, 8-gal. $ 2250 | $ 2,250.00 | $ 16.80 1,680.00 | $ 1642 | $  1,642.00
6 microns, 24x33”
(1000/case)
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Categ| QTY Unit ITEM DESCRIPTION

Paper & Disposable Supplies

25 544 cs Toilet tissue rolls, 2-ply $ 31.90 | $ 17,353.60 | $ 29.77 | $ 16,194.88 | $ 26.90 [ $ 14,633.60
500 sheets (96 rolls/case)

26 25 cs White single fold paper $ 2490 | $ 622.50 | $ 22.50 562.50 | $ 17.64 | $ 441.00
towel

27 243 cs Brown single or multi-fold $ 19.40 | $ 4,714.20 | $ 15.12 3,674.16 | $ 1570 [ $  3,815.10
paper towels

*28 25 cs Wypall cleaning towels, $ 1450 | $ 36250 | $ 12.43 31075 | $ 3291 | $ 822.75
12x15”, white wiper, non-
abrasive or approved “equal”

*29 25 cs Handi-Wipes $ 7750 | $ 1,937.50 | $ 26.25 656.25 | $ 27.02 | $ 675.50

30 83 cs Brown hand towel rolls $ 18.90 | $ 1,568.70 | $ 18.23 1,513.09 | $ 1845 $  1,531.35
for dispenser
Size: 1 7/8” Core

31 35 cs Kitchen paper roll towels $ 16.90 | $ 591.50 | $ 19.40 679.00 | $ 1912 | $ 669.20
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Approved Approved Approved
Categ| QTY Unit ITEM DESCRIPTION
9x11”, 2-ply, white, poly-
wrapped,
32 10 cs Kleenex #21600 36/150 $ 17.90 | $ 179.00 | $ 1665 |$  166.50 | $ 34.77 | $ 347.70
33 72 cs Toilet Tissue Jumbo $ 47.90 | $ 3,448.80 | $ 2882 |$ 2,075.04 $ 1898 | $  1,366.56
2000° X 3.96 Y dia.,
2 ply. 3.3” Core
34 72 cs Toilet Tissue Jumbo $ 22.90 | $ 1,648.80 | $ 16.75 [ $ 1,206.00 | $ 1695 |$  1,220.40
1000’ X 3.96 ¥
2 ply. 3.3” Core
35 10 cs Wax Bags for Sanitary $ 2380 | $ 238.00 | $ 1260 | $  126.00 | $ 19.89 | $ 198.90
Napkin Receptacles
Rubbermaid 6141 or Equal
1 cs Scott Shop towels 660 towels $ 40.95 | $ 40.95 | no bid $ 3128 [ $ 31.28
Mop Heads /Brooms /Handles/ Dust Pans
*36 35 ea Rayon mopheads, 20 oz. $ 780 | $ 273.00 | $ 503($ 176.05($ 258 (% 90.30
*37 90 ea Cotton mopheads, 24 oz. $ 6.99 [ $ 629.10 | $ 344 |$ 30960 | $ 291 (% 261.90
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Categ| QTY Unit ITEM DESCRIPTION
*38 35 ea Cotton mopheads, 16 oz. $ 380 [ $ 133.00 | $ 245|$  8575|$ 2.00 | $ 70.00
39 25 ea Fiberglass mop handles, 64” $ 850 [ $ 212,50 | $ 812 |$  203.00 | $ 1458 | $ 364.50
40 15 dz Household brooms, 28#, $ 89.95 | $ 1,349.25 | $ 86.12 | $ 1,291.80 | $ 6437 |$ 96555
6 sewn
41 15 dz Wood Janitor Handle $ 4188 $ 628.20 | $ 39.95 [$  599.25 | $ 83.00 | $  1,245.00
42 15 dz Warehouse brooms, 36 Ib. $ 108.80 | $ 1,632.00 | $ 11435 |$ 1,71525 | $ 61.40 | $ 921.00
6 sewn
43 20 ea Push brooms, Heavy duty, $ 13.90 | $ 278.00 | $ 1340 | $  268.00 | $ 12,60 | $ 252.00
16” w/handle, street type
44 3 dz Rubbermaid dust pans or $ 3420 $ 102.60 | $ 2868 | $ 86.04 | $ 58.40 | $ 175.20
approved “equal”
45 20 ea Dust mop heads, 5x30” $ 1390 | $ 278.00 | $ 752|$ 15040 | $ 11.05 | $ 221.00
46 15 ea Feather duster ostrich $ 6.88 | $ 103.20 | $ 524|$ 7860 |$ 155 | $ 23.25
feather on plastic handle
15”
47 15 ea Plastic bucket w/caster, $ 4980 | $ 747.00 | $ 27.90 | $ 41850
26 quart capacity
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Bid Number: 2016-14

Webb County Purchasing Dept.

Bid Tabulation
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sales@executiveofficesupply.com | abezarate@sbcglobal.net [landinalexis@yahoo.com
Approved Approved Approved

Categ| QTY Unit ITEM DESCRIPTION

48 5 ea Separate plastic mop wringer $ 2390 | $ 119.50 | $ 4939|$ 24695 | $ 58.00 | $ 290.00
24 oz.

49 5 ea Floor squeegee 18” w/handle $ 29.95 | $ 14975 | $ 1483|$  7415($ 18.30 | $ 91.50
or approved “equal”

50 35 ea Dust Mop heads $ 10.30 | $ 360.50 | $ 446 |$ 15610 | $ 522 | $ 182.70
5X 24

51 35 ea Dust Mop heads $ 18.99 | $ 664.65 | $ 1217 |$ 42595 ($ 10.08 | $ 352.80
5X 48

52 20 ea Dust Mop heads Frames clip on $ 2065 | $ 413.00 | $ 2.05 | $ 41.00 | $ 317 | $ 63.40
5X24

53 20 ea Dust Mop heads Frame clip on $ 22.85 | $ 457.00 | $ 350 [$  70.00|$ 6.98 | $ 139.60
5X 48

54 50 ea Super looped end mop heads med. $ 740 $ 370.00 | $ 406 |$ 203.00|$ 582 | $ 291.00
size or approved equal

55 50 ea Super looped end mop heads large $ 9.50 | $ 475.00 | $ 500 [$ 25000 | $ 7.20 | $ 360.00
size or approved equal

56 50 ea Dust Mop Heads 36" $ 1375 | $ 687.50 | $ 752|$  376.00 | $ 8.76 | $ 438.00

Soaps
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Approved Approved Approved
Categ| QTY Unit ITEM DESCRIPTION
57 35 cs Liquid hand soap (gal.) $ 2392 | $ 837.20 | $ 16.56 579.60 | $ 17.10 | $ 598.50
Hypoallergenic Pure Natural
or Equal
58 25 cs Zest or Dial bar soap, no bid $ 58.92 1,473.00 | $ 69.00 | $  1,725.00
wrapped, 1.5 0z
NO SUBSTITUTES
59 15 cs Liquid hand soap/dispenser $ 17.80 | $ 267.00 | $ 30.60 459.00 | $ 2522 | $ 378.30
60 10 cs AntiMicrobial Liquid Dial Soap $ 56.80 | $ 568.00 | $ 23.65 23650 | $ 50.29 | $ 502.90
61 10 cs Car Wash Soap no bid $ 36.40 364.00 | $ 37.00 [ $ 370.00
Restroom Supplies
62 20 ea Toilet bowl brushes, long $ 199 | $ 39.80 | $ 1.66 3320 | $ 251|$ 50.20
63 2 dz Plungers, long handle $ 95.88 | $ 191.76 | $ 68.40 136.80 | $ 4068 | $ 81.36
64 30 ea Sparta Hercules #45-S pot & no bid $ 4.88 146.40 | $ 355 |$ 106.50
fender brush or approved
uequaln
*65 10 cs Scrubbing sponges 3M #74 $ 2240 | $ 224.00 | $ 14.98 149.80 | $ 15.68 | $ 156.80
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Categ| QTY Unit ITEM DESCRIPTION
3-1/2x6-1/4” or approved
equal

66 10 ea Square handle brushes, med. $ 299 % 29.90 | $ 2.36 | $ 2360 | $ 350 | $ 35.00
hard bristles for cleaning
counters

*67 5 bx Heavy duty scouring pads $ 58.90 | $ 29450 | $ 9.29 | $ 46.45 | $ 7.23|$ 36.15
3M #88, 3-1/2x5”

68 40 ea Toilet Bowl Mop $ 10.90 | $ 436.00 | $ 0.61|$% 2440 | $ 0.73 | $ 29.20

Chemical Resistant Gloves

69 48 ea Neoprene Flock lined Gloves $ 12.95 | $ 621.60 | $ 2435|% 1,168.80 [ $ 5.00 | $ 240.00
Chemical Resistant

Dish Washing/ Laundry Chemicals

70 100 drum Laundry detergent $ 64.90 | $ 6,490.00 | $ 2042 |$ 2,042.00 | $ 49.00 [$  4,900.00
(100#/drum)

*71 30 cs LD-33 liquid dishwashing no bid no bid $ 23.40 | $ 702.00
detergent NO SUBSTITUTES
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Categ| QTY Unit ITEM DESCRIPTION
72 60 cs Bleach 5% chlorine $ 14.99 | $ 899.40 | $ 1025|$  615.00 | $ 10.35 | $ 621.00
(6 gals/case)
*73 10 drum Pink powder dishwashing $ 34.90 | $ 349.00 | no bid $ 51.90 | $ 519.00
soap (100#/drum)
Floor-Cleaning Supplies
74 5 cs Floor spraybuff High Speed $ 71.96 | $ 359.80 | $ 2945 $ 14725 | $ 38.92 | $ 194.60
(5 gal. container/case)
75 20 cs Floor stripper rinse free $ 51.96 | $ 1,039.20 | $ 3330|$  666.00$ 38.88 | $ 777.60
(1 gal. container)
76 60 gal Johnson’s complete floor no bid $ 989 [$ 59340 |$ 1382 | $ 829.20
wax or approved “equal”
(5 gal/container)
137,17, 20” Floor pads
for high speed (5 pads/case)
77 cs 13" $ 1499 | $ 7495 | $ 7.05 | $ 3525 [ $ 10.20 | $ 51.00
78 cs 17" $ 14.99 74.95 10.35 5175 [ $ 15.60 78.00
79 cs 20" $ 14.99 74.95 13.40 67.00 [ $ 20.90 104.50
80 20 ea Floor Folding Sign $ 16.90 | $ 338.00 | $ 939|$ 187.80$ 13.84 | $ 276.80
Two sided Caution Wet Floor
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Categ| QTY Unit ITEM DESCRIPTION

81 10 gal Shine line emulsifier plus no bid $ 9.54 | $ 95.40 | $ 10.25 | $ 102.50
stripper or approved equal

82 10 gal Shine line floor prep. Neutralizer no bid $ 510 [$  51.00|$ 955 | $ 95.50
& conditioner or approved equal

83 10 gal Shine line seal thermoplastic floor no bid $ 12.65$ 12650 | $ 12.65 | $ 126.50
sealer or approved equal

84 50 gal High frontier thermoplastic floor no bid $ 13.00 | $  650.00 | $ 17.28 | $ 864.00
finish or approved equal

85 50 gal Bounce back-restorer or approved no bid $ 995($ 49750 ($ 9.40 | $ 470.00
equal

86 80 gal Damp mop disinfectant cleaner no bid $ 566 |$ 45280 | $ 715 | $ 572.00
for restrooms or approved equal

87 40 gal Shine line multi-shine cleaner or no bid $ 6.58 | $ 26320 $ 8.30 | $ 332.00
approved equal

88 20 gal Extraction 1l shampoo or approved no bid $ 6.62$ 13240 |$ 8.95 | $ 179.00
equal

89 20 gal NABC Non-acid bowl cleaner disinfectant no bid $ 700 |$  140.00 | $ 6.98 | $ 139.60
or approved equal
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Categ| QTY Unit ITEM DESCRIPTION
90 1 cs Spartan deformer or approved equal no bid $ 3968 |$  39.68|% 46.90 | $ 46.90
91 20 gal Plus 5 shampoo or approved equal no bid $ 825|% 165.00($ 18.00 | $ 360.00
92 10 gal SSE Carpet spotter or approved equal no bid $ 5.60 | $ 56.00 [ $ 923 $ 92.30
93 15 gal Bonnet & Traffic lane shampoo or no bid $ 1350 [ $ 20250 | $ 18.00 | $ 270.00
approved equal
94 5 gal Spart-guard carpet protector or approved no bid $ 2270 [$ 11350 | $ 37.00 | $ 185.00
equal
95 100 gal Festival Floor Cleaner (lavendar Scent) $ 55.80 | $ 5,580.00 | $ 6.83|% 683.00 (% 6.70 | $ 670.00
96 50 |ea. Buffer Pads (Floor Cleaning Machine) $ 499 | $ 24950 | $ 268 |$ 13400 |$ 430 [ $ 215.00
20 |cs Fabuloso $ 43.80 $ 45.93 $ 29.94
Multi-Purpose Cleaners
97 20 cs Thrifty Pine, Cherry or Mint no bid $ 2192 |$ 43840 ($ 21.00 | $ 420.00
disinfectant APA register
5% active ingredients
98 30 drum Pine cleaner/disinfectant $ 36.90 | $ 1,107.00 | no bid $ 14500 | $  4,350.00
APA register min. 5% plcase
(55 gal/drum)
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Approved Approved Approved
Categ| QTY Unit ITEM DESCRIPTION
floor sealer, 25% solids
99 20 cs All purpose cleaner or $ 65.94 | $ 1,318.80 | $ 2765[$ 553.00 | $ 2340 [ $ 468.00
approved equal proportioner
(6 gals/case)
100 60 cs Comet or Ajax power cleanser $ 25.60 | $ 1,536.00 | $ 25.95 | $ 1,557.00 [ $ 2564 | $  1,538.40
or approved “equal”
101 15 cs Mr. Muscle oven cleaner or $ 3290 | $ 49350 | $ 26.83 |$ 40245 ($ 4130 | $ 619.50
approved “equal”
102 5 cs Foam type carpet cleaner $ 69.60 | $ 348.00 | $ 4065|% 20325 $ 4017 | $ 200.85
*103| 12 cs Glass cleaner (gal.) $ 1299 | $ 155.88 | $ 3341 ($ 40092 | $ 12.90 | $ 154.80
Concentrated
*104| 12 cs Glass cleaner foam spray $ 2388 | $ 286.56 | $ 2674 |$ 32088 (% 2577 | $ 309.24
*105 5 cs Enbac spray disinfectant $ 93.00 | $ 465.00 | $ 3515|$ 17575 ($ 53.00 | $ 265.00
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sales@executiveofficesupply.com

Gulf Coast Paper Co.

c/o Abraham Zarate
1101 Spid

Corpus Christi, TX 78416

956-645-6869

abezarate@sbcglobal.net

Patria Office Supplies
c/o Alexis Landin

301 E. Calton Rd.
Laredo, TX 78041
956-723-2332

landinalexis@yahoo.com

Approved Approved Approved

Categ| QTY Unit ITEM DESCRIPTION

106 20 cs Carroll Thick porcelain & no bid $ 2043 |$ 40860 [ $ 21.05 | $ 421.00
bowl cleaner or approved
llequaln

107 10 cont Industrial grade foam no bid $ 2916 [$ 29160 | $ 27.98 | $ 279.80
cleanser w/disinfectant for
stainless steel commodes
(quart spray)

108 8 cs Liquid extraction cleaner w/ no bid $ 2648 [$ 21184 |$ 36.78 | $ 294.24
built in anti-foam (6 gal/case)

109 7 cs Spray wood panel cleaner $ 4788 | $ 335.16 | $ 3925 ($ 27475 | % 3831 $ 268.17
SAMPLE REQUIRED

110 7 cs Drano pipe drain opener $ 4980 | $ 348.60 | $ 2488 [$ 17416 |$ 38.25 [ $ 267.75
or approved “equal”

111 10 cs Stainless steel cleaner $ 3348 | $ 334.80 | $ 4290 |$ 42900 | $ 3365($  336.50
aerosol USDA Approved

112 5 cs Dust mop treatment (gal.) $ 84.90 | $ 42450 | $ 2579 [$ 12895 | $ 81.10 | $ 405.50
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Bid Number: 2016-14

Webb County Purchasing Dept.

Bid Tabulation

Annual Contract for Janitorial Supplies

Laredo Office Supplies

c/o Jorge G. Juaristi

c/o Executive Office Supplies
3312 Santa Ursula Ave.
Laredo, TX 78040

sales@executiveofficesupply.com

Gulf Coast Paper Co.

c/o Abraham Zarate
1101 Spid

Corpus Christi, TX 78416

956-645-6869

abezarate@sbcglobal.net

Patria Office Supplies
c/o Alexis Landin

301 E. Calton Rd.
Laredo, TX 78041
956-723-2332

landinalexis@yahoo.com

Approved Approved Approved
Categ| QTY Unit ITEM DESCRIPTION
*113( 10 cs Spray furniture polish
for wood $ 33.48 $ 39.25 $ 38.31 383.10
SAMPLE REQUIRED
114 2 cs Chewing gum remover $ 62.40 124.80 | $ 4054 | $ 81.08 | $ 40.16 80.32
115 6 cs Urinal screen disposable $ 113.40 680.40 | $ 1892 |$ 11352 ($ 11.78 70.68
urinal maint. Super Uni-tabs
or approved “equal”
116 3 cs Stainless cleaner aero or approved equal $ 31.80 95.40 | $ 4290 ($ 12870 |$% 33.65 100.95
117 8 cs Window & mirror cleaner Spartan $ 25.90 207.20 | $ 2920 [$ 23360 | $ 22.44 179.52
concentrated glass or approved
equal
118 4 cs BriteBoy metal polish $ 43.80 175.20 | $ 2356 [$ 9424 |$ 18.70 74.80
5 |gallon ODO Ban Disinfectant $ 53.90 53.90 | $ 6460 |$ 6460 |$ 56.15 56.15
p gallon 11.23
Air Freshners
119 20 cs Air freshener spray $ 43.80 876.00 | $ 1896 |$  379.20 | $ 37.62 752.40
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Bid Number: 2016-14

Webb County Purchasing Dept.

Bid Tabulation

Annual Contract for Janitorial Supplies

Laredo Office Supplies

c/o Jorge G. Juaristi

c/o Executive Office Supplies
3312 Santa Ursula Ave.
Laredo, TX 78040

Gulf Coast Paper Co.

c/o Abraham Zarate
1101 Spid

Corpus Christi, TX 78416

956-645-6869

Patria Office Supplies
c/o Alexis Landin

301 E. Calton Rd.
Laredo, TX 78041
956-723-2332

sales@executiveofficesupply.com | abezarate@sbcglobal.net [landinalexis@yahoo.com
Approved Approved Approved
Categ| QTY Unit ITEM DESCRIPTION
120 5 cs Air 60 foul odor eliminator $ 2810 | $ 140,50 | $ 3483 ($ 17415 | $ 34.60 | $ 173.00
or approved “equal”
121 10 cs Powder rug & room deodorizer $ 4410 | $ 441.00 | $ 2787 |$ 27870 ($ 3227 | $ 322.70
SAMPLE REQUIRED
122 10 cs Deodorant blocks, 4 0z. with $ 1750 | $ 175.00 | $ 9.53 | $ 95.30 | $ 13.20 | $ 132.00
hangers (12/case)
123 5 cs Cherry or lemon air freshener $ 53.88 | $ 269.40 | $ 3710 |$ 18550 $ 2825 | $ 141.25
Liquid deodorant wick type
124 10 |cs Misty Air Sanitzer & Deodorizer TFR $ 40.80 | $ 408.00 | $ 40.06 [$ 40060 | $ 53.20 | $ 532.00
(Iltem# AMR A295-16)
10 |cs Lysol Disinfectant spray $ 65.90 | $ 659.00 | $ 7999 |$  799.90 [ $ 67.50 | $ 675.00
Insect Sprays
125 10 cs Insect spray killer $ 7188 | $ 718.80 | $ 4069 |$  406.90 | $ 53.00 | $ 530.00
126 10 cs Raid Roach & Ant killer or $ 55.80 | $ 558.00 | $ 4758 | $ 47580 | $ 53.00 | $ 530.00
approved “equal”
127 10 cs C.L.-44 wasp spray or $ 7188 | $ 718.80 | $ 4263 |$ 42630 [ $ 62.10 | $ 621.00
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Bid Number: 2016-14

Webb County Purchasing Dept.
Bid Tabulation

Annual Contract for Janitorial Supplies

Laredo Office Supplies

c/o Jorge G. Juaristi

c/o Executive Office Supplies

3312 Santa Ursula Ave.
Laredo, TX 78040

sales@executiveofficesupply.com

Gulf Coast Paper Co.

c/o Abraham Zarate
1101 Spid

Corpus Christi, TX 78416

956-645-6869

abezarate@sbcglobal.net

Patria Office Supplies
c/o Alexis Landin

301 E. Calton Rd.
Laredo, TX 78041
956-723-2332

landinalexis@yahoo.com

Approved Approved Approved

Categ| QTY Unit ITEM DESCRIPTION
approved “equal”

KitchenSupplies- Aprons,Gloves,Hairnets, Table SKirts

128 10 cs Plastic gloves med. size 18% $ 226.80 2,268.00 [ $ 8.56 | $ 85.60 | $ 13.00 130.00
synthetic bayprene latex &
nat. latex .020 thickness,
Granet #2444 or orange
Playtex #834

129 25 cs Disposable plastic gloves $ 45.90 1,147.50 | $ 200($  5000|$ 5.61 140.25

130 20 cs White, plastic disposable $ 78.50 1,570.00 | $ 1041 ($ 20820 | $ 478 95.60
aprons, USDA Approved

131 10 roll Disposable, re-usable poly $ 11.95 119.50 | $ 1881 |$ 188.10 [ $ 14.50 145.00
table skirt, 29”x14’

132 5 cs Med.weight mesh hair nets $ 79.40 397.00 | $ 20.05($ 14525 |$ 20.30 101.50
(144/case)

133 24 ea Neoprene Apron no bid $ 29.05($  697.20 | $ 38.50 924.00
19 Mil Thickness Medium
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Bid Number: 2016-14

Webb County Purchasing Dept.

Bid Tabulation

Annual Contract for Janitorial Supplies

Laredo Office Supplies

c/o Jorge G. Juaristi

c/o Executive Office Supplies

3312 Santa Ursula Ave.
Laredo, TX 78040

sales@executiveofficesupply.com

Gulf Coast Paper Co

c/o Abraham Zarate
1101 Spid

Corpus Christi, TX 78416

956-645-6869

abezarate@sbcglobal.net

Patria Office Supplies

c/o Alexis Landin
301 E. Calton Rd.
Laredo, TX 78041
956-723-2332

landinalexis@yahoo.com

Approved Approved Approved
Categ| QTY Unit ITEM DESCRIPTION
Weight
134 2 cs Grill brick 8x4x3 %2 no bid $ 2341 | $ 46.82 | $ 2435 | $ 48.70
135 15 cs Plastic sandwich bags $ 15.60 234.00 | $ 1219 ($ 18285($ 20.00 | $ 300.00
77x6-1/2”, Fold’n close W-F7
(1000/case)
*136( 20 roll Heavy duty aluminum foil $ 79.80 1,596.00 | $ 52.75 | $ 1,055.00 [ $ 56.20 | $  1,124.00
paper #625, 18”x1000 ft.
or approved “equal”
Plastics & Aluminum- Bottles/Bags/Foil/Pan Liners
137 20 ea Plastic bottle 32 oz. $ 2.65 53.00 | $ 055|$  11.00($ 0.63|$ 12.60
138 20 ea Plastic trigger sprayer 32 oz. $ 0.99 19.80 | $ 042 |$ 840 [ $ 081 (% 16.20
139 20 ea Plastic bottle 24 oz. $ 1.89 37.80 | $ 044 | $ 8.80 [ $ 049 | $ 9.80
140 20 ea Plastic trigger sprayer 24 oz. $ 0.99 19.80 | no bid $ 067 |$ 13.40
141 10 cs Pan liners, 16-3/8 x 24-3/8 no bid $ 3881 [$ 38810 $ 4135 [ $ 413.50
142 40 ea Plastic Bottle & Trigger $ 2.95 118.00 | $ 097 | $ 38.80 | $ 144 [ $ 57.60
Sprayer 2402
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Bid Number: 2016-14

Webb County Purchasing Dept.

Bid Tabulation

Annual Contract for Janitorial Supplies

Laredo Office Supplies

c/o Jorge G. Juaristi

c/o Executive Office Supplies

3312 Santa Ursula Ave.

Laredo, TX 78040

sales@executiveofficesupply.com

Gulf Coast Paper Co.

c/o Abraham Zarate

1101 Spid

Corpus Christi, TX 78416

956-645-6869

abezarate@sbcglobal.net

Patria Office Supplies

c/o Alexis Landin
301 E. Calton Rd.
Laredo, TX 78041

956-723-2332

landinalexis@yahoo.com

Approved

Approved

Approved

Categ

QTY

Unit

ITEM DESCRIPTION

143

10

Ccs

P.O. 75S medication plastic

$ 4480 | $

448.00

$ 31.00

$  310.00

$ 33.32

$ 333.20

cups, ¥ oz. or approved equal

144

10

Ccs

#39 medication paper souffle

$ 169.95 | $

1,699.50

$ 48.09

$  480.90

$ 48.30

$ 483.00

cups, ¥ 0z. or approved

uequaln

145

20

Cs

5 gal. bucket

$ 39950 | $

7,990.00

$ 160.00

$ 40.00

$ 800.00

Grand Total

135,786.61

$ 94,839.32

$ 119,680.38

(Must Include GRAND TOTAL)

*= Samples must be provided (if requested)
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