Webb County Purchasing Department
Bid Tabulation
Bid Opening Date: July 27, 2015

Bid Number: 2016-25

Gateway Glass & Mirrors J.R. Martinez Auto South Border Auto Glass
Bid For: Annual Contract for c/o Heriberto Garza c/o Jorge R. Martinez c/o Jesus Garcia
Automotive / Heavy Equipment 502 Guadalupe 520 S. Zapata Hwy 403 W. Saunders St.
Glass Replacement Laredo, TX 78040 Laredo, TX 78043 Laredo, TX 78041
956-723-2017 956-722-5106 956-724-6100
Contract Expires: 09.30.16 gatewayglassco@yahoo.com parts@jrmartinezauto.com borderauto glass@yahoo.com
If Extended Expires: 9.30.17 Approved Vendor Approved Vendor
QTY UNIT OF ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
MEASURE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
Auto Glass Replacement
each curved door glass, full door (car) $160.00 $1,120.00 $60.00 $420.00 $188.00 $1,316.00
5 each curved door glass, full door (truck) $160.00 $800.00 $60.00 $300.00 $188.00 $940.00
20 each curved windshield, one piece (passenger car) $75.00 $1,500.00 $90.00 $1,800.00 $240.00 $4,800.00
3 each flat windshield, one piece (passenger car) $110.00 $330.00 $90.00 $270.00 $285.00 $855.00
5 each curved windshield, one piece (truck) $110.00 $550.00 $90.00 $450.00 $240.00 $1,200.00
3 each flat windshield, one piece (truck) $75.00 $225.00 $70.00 $210.00 $523.00 $1,569.00
1 each curved quarter glass, (passenger car) $75.00 $75.00 $70.00 $70.00 $260.00 $260.00
1 each flat quarter glass, (truck) $75.00 $75.00 $60.00 $60.00 $263.00 $263.00
1 each rear door curved, (passenger car) $120.00 $120.00 $65.00 $65.00 $240.00 $240.00
3 each back glass, curved (passenger car) $120.00 $360.00 $195.00 $585.00 $267.00 $801.00
2 each back glass, flat (truck) $180.00 $360.00 $250.00 $500.00 $360.00 $720.00
2 each door glass, flat (truck) $180.00 $360.00 $55.00 $110.00 $238.00 $476.00
$5,875.00 $4,840.00 $13,440.00
Pricing for Heavy Equipment Glass
1 36x60 GTN. LAM. W/S Grater $322.50 $322.50 no bid $39.00 $39.00
1 57X14 GTN.LAM. Side Door Grater $286.00 $286.00 no bid $278.00 $278.00
1 52x37 CLR. LAM. W/S Grater $287.00 $287.00 no bid $402.00 $402.00
1 57X14 CLR. LAM. Side Door Grater $322.50 $322.50 no bid $252.00 $252.00
Pricing for Vehicle Glass
2 47x44 CLR. LAM. Back Glass Grater $308.00 $616.00 no bid $349.00 $698.00
2 52x49 GTN.LAM. W/S Grater $380.00 $760.00 no bid $383.00 $766.00
2 36x35 GTN.LAM. RT. Door Grater $188.00 $376.00 no bid $265.00 $530.00
2 36x35 ClIr. LAM. RT. Door Grater $188.00 $376.00 no bid $255.00 $510.00
$3,346.00 $3,475.00
GrandTotal| $9,221.00 $16,915.00
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Webb County Purchasing Department

Bid Tabulation
Bid Opening Date: July 27, 2015

Bid Number: 2016-25
Bid For: Annual Cont

Contract Expires: 09.30.16

ract for

Automotive / Heavy Equipment
Glass Replacement

If Extended Expires: 9.30.17

Gateway Glass & Mirrors

c/o Heriberto Garza

502 Guadalupe

Laredo, TX 78040

956-723-2017

gatewayglassco@yahoo.com

J.R. Martinez Auto South
c/o Jorge R. Martinez
520 S. Zapata Hwy
Laredo, TX 78043
956-722-5106
parts@jrmartinezauto.com

Border Auto Glass

c/o Jesus Garcia

403 W. Saunders St.
Laredo, TX 78041
956-724-6100

borderauto glass@yahoo.com

Approved Vendor

Approved Vendor

QTY UNIT OF
MEASURE

ITEM DESCRIPTION

UNIT
PRICE

TOTAL
PRICE

UNIT TOTAL
PRICE PRICE

UNIT TOTAL
PRICE PRICE

1 Per Hour Additonal Charges after 5pm $32.50 $15.00
Installation Charge $65.00
Discount
for Items not specified in this bid 15% cost + 25%
Business Hours: 8:00-5:00 8:00-5:00 8:00-5:00

5 days a week

5 days a week

5 days a week

Turnaround Time after P.O. is received 24 hours 24 hours 24 hours

Additional Types of Glass to be installed

1/5 Plate Glass $ 3.25 p/sq ft

Temperred Glass $ 7.50 p/sq ft

Laminated Glass $ 8.50 p/sq ft

Insulated Glass $ 12.50 p/sq ft

Wired Glass $ 17.50 p/sq ft

White Laminated Glass $ 13.50 p/sq ft

Bullet Proof Glass $ 112.50 p/sq ft

Privacy Color Glass $ 195.00 p/sq ft

#1506 $ 110.00
#1658 $ 110.00

#1872
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