Webb County Purchasing Dept. Ben E. Keith Foods Labatt Food Service
Bid Tabulation c/o Mario Jimenz c/o Enrique Alvarado
Opened: October 16, 2014 5505 Kaepa Rd. 902 N. Expressway 77
San Antonio, TX 78218 Harlingen, TX 78550
210-661-7997 956-428-0722
RFP 2015-60 956-324-9268
Annual Contract for Food Commodities mejimenez@benekeith.com ealvarado@Iabattfood.com
Approved Approved
Item # [Pack |Size Label Description Estimated Qty] Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price
9E+06 1|36 CT _ |M&M MARS 3 MUSKETEERS SINGLES 1 $ 2344 1% 2344 1% 2450 | $ 24.50
SE+06 1|10LB. |DSM 420 FZ PORK, FEET CUT 1 $ 184 (% 184 (% 2351% 2.35
SE+06 1|10LB HERIT VAL 539 BACON, COVERED WAGON 16 $ 3.00($% 48.00 | $ 204 1% 32.64
9E+06| 12|1LB FARMLAND 801 FZ BEEF SLICED BOLOGNA 41 $ 274 (% 11251 | $ 246 1% 100.86
9E+06 1|36 CT  |HERSHEY ALMOND JOY BAR 1.61 0Z $ 2344 1% 2344 1% 24.10 | $ 24.10
60303| 70|40z SUNCUP APPLE JUICE CRTN WVIT C 100% 9 $ 12621 $ 11358 | $ 11341 $ 102.06
2E+06 6| #10 MUSSELMANS APPLE SAUCE DIET NATURAL $ 30151 $ 180.90 | $ 26.04 | $ 156.24
81067| 72|40z LUCKY LF APPLE SAUCE DIET NATURAL 1 $ 25881 $ 25881 $ 19.04 1 $ 19.04
2E+06 6| #10 MUSSELMANS |  APPLE SAUCE GRADE A FANCY 33 $ 3017 | $ 995.61 | $ 27351 $ 902.55
105262 6|#10 SENECA APRICOTS, HALF LT SYR 164 $ 4509 [$ 7,39476 | $ 4232 |$  6,940.48
1E+07| 12[40z GERBER BABY FOOD, APPLESAUCE 4 $ 1081 | $ 4324 | $ 821|$% 32.84
1E+07| 12[40z GERBER BABY FOOD, BANANAS 4 $ 8.08 (3% 3232 1% 821|% 32.84
1E+07| 16[3.50Z |GERBER BABY FOOD, CARROTS 1 $ 8.08 (3% 8.08 (3% 1050 | $ 10.50
1E+07| 12[40z GERBER BABY FOOD, GREEN BEANS 2 $ 1062 | $ 21241 $ 821|% 16.42
1E+07| 16[3.50Z |GERBER BABY FOOD, PEACHES 4 $ 1061 | $ 4244 | $ 1050 | $ 42.00
1E+07| 12[40z GERBER BABY FOOD, PEARS 4 $ 8.08 (3% 3232 1% 821|% 32.84
1E+07| 12[40z GERBER BABY FOOD, PEAS 1 $ 8.08 (3% 8.08 (3% 821|% 8.21
3E+06 1|10 LB FAIRBURY BACON BITS, IMITATIN F412199 6 $ 19751 $ 11850 | $ 1518 | $ 91.08
6E+06| 12[1LB. DIAM CRYST BAKING SODA 2 $ 25.07 1| $ 50.14 | $ 1733 1% 34.66
2E+06 4|5LB L J MINOR BASE, BEEF 8 $ 15255|$ 1,220.40 | $ 148.10 | $  1,184.80
2E+06| 12|1LB FRANK COLN BASE, BEEF_NO MSG 3 $ 3030 | % 90.90 | $ 4772 [ $ 143.16
BE+06 1|20z DURKEE BAY LEAVES, WHOLE 1 $ 786 (% 786 (% 641 1% 6.41
3E+06[ 200{12 GM |AMERICANA BBQ SCE 12 GM 1 $ 9.66 | $ 9.66 | $ 559 [ $ 5.59
2E+06 6|#10 HANOVER BEANS, CHILI STLYE 4 $ 25401 % 101.60 | $ 25571$% 102.28
2E+06 6|#10 BUSH BEANS, CHIL/IMEXICAN STYLE 7 $ 25401 % 177.80 | $ 2468 | $ 172.76
9E+06| 12|2LB CLASSIC BEANS, GREEN REGULAR CUT 5 $ 1901 | $ 95.05 | $ 2135|$ 106.75
1E+06 6|#10 HART BEANS, GREEN SHORT CUT 111 $ 1847 |$ 2,050.17|$ 18.02 | $  2,000.22
1E+06 6|#10 STOKELY BEANS, GREEN, CUT 4 SV FANCY 12 $ 2442 1 $ 293.04 | $ 2296 | $ 275.52
2E+06 6|#10 HANOVER BEANS, PINTO 24 $ 2316 | $ 555.84 | $ 21.02 | $ 504.48
2E+06 6|#10 BUSH BEANS, PINTO 2 $ 2326 | $ 46.52 | $ 21.02 | $ 42.04
9E+06 1|20LB  |GARDEN FRE BEANS, R/IC GREEN 180 $ 1901 |$ 342180|% 16.58 | $  2,984.40
2E+06 6|#10 CASAFIESTA BEANS, REFRIED 42 $ 2594 1% 108948 |% 2556 [$  1,073.52
2E+06 6|#10 ROSARITA BEANS, REFRIED ORIGINAL 16 $ 2594 | $ 415.04 [ $ 2556 | $ 408.96
2E+06 6|30 0Z  |SANTIAGO BEANS, REFRIED SMOOTH STYLE 2 $ 28241 $ 56.48 | $ 1827 1| $ 36.54
SE+06 8|2.251B [DSM BEEF FOR FAJITA TNT STND PK 2 $ 9160 | $ 183.20 | $ 4451 $ 8.90
1E+06| 24120z  |BIG RED BIG RED CANNED 4 $ 9.30($ 3720 | $ 1050 | $ 42.00
9E+06| 12|320Z  |CLASSIC BLEND PEPPER & ONION FAJITA 2 $ 3460 | $ 69.20 | $ 2836 | $ 56.72
9E+06 1|20LB  |GARDEN FRE | BLEND, MIXED VEGETABLE 5-WAY 318 $ 1959 |$ 6,22962 | $ 17.37|$  5,523.66
9E+06 1|20LB  |GARDEN FRE BLEND, PEAS & CARROTS 69 $ 1878 |$ 129582 | % 17.37|$  1,198.53
9E+06 8|18 SLICE [ROTELLA'S BREAD, ITALIAN SANDWICH WHT 3 $ 21.78 | $ 6534 1% 1919 | $ 57.57
9E+06| 10[240zZ |EUROPEAN BREAD, PULLMAN WHITE (28 SL) 10 $ 9.26 | $ 92.60 | $ 2952 | $ 295.20
9E+06| 160|1 0Z KINGS DEL BREADED SHPD TENDERLOIN CN 23 $ 1163 | $ 26749 | $ 28.69 | $ 659.87
9E+06 1|168 CT |MARZETTI BREADSTICK, GARLIC PREBAK 6" 4 $ 2334 1% 9336 | $ 23441 $ 93.76
9E+06| 80|20z HORMEL BRKFST BAR EGG/CH/HAM WG CN 6 $ 40.29 | $ 241.74 | $ 37791 $ 226.74
9E+06 1|20LB  |GARDEN FRE BROCCOLI CUTS 314 $ 1890 |$ 593460 | % 13.85|$  4,348.90
9E+06| 12|2LB GARDN FRSH BROCCOLI FLORETS 36 $ 3210 |$ 1,15560|$ 20741 $ 746.64
3E+06| 12]|49.50Z |SWANSON BROTH, BEEF 13 $ 4898 | $ 636.74 | $ 29.79 1 $ 387.27
OE+06| 144|1.50Z |BAKECRAFTE BUN HOT DOG 6" 6 $ 1163 | $ 69.78 | $ 27541 % 165.24
9E+06 8|8/3.5 0Z |[EUROPEAN BUN JUMBO HAMBURGER 5" 7 $ 16.60 | $ 116.20 | $ 3270 | $ 228.90
9E+06| 72|40z FERNANDOS BURRITO BEEF/BEAN PF BULK 68 $ 2384 |% 162112|% 3443 |$  2,341.24
9E+06| 72|3.950Z |LOS CABOS BURRITO BEAN/CHEESE WG 19 $ 2384 1% 452.96 | $ 34171 $ 649.23
9E+06| 64|40z RUIZ BURRITO BF/BN RED CHILI RETL 398 $ 2384 |$ 9,48832|% 2479 |$  9,866.42
8E+06| 36|1LB GRASSLAND BUTTER, SOLIDS SALTED AA 4 $ 144.01 | $ 576.04 | $ 129.69 | $ 518.76
9E+06| 12|3.60Z |JIMMY DEAN BW-BISCUIT, BACON, EGG &CHZ 4 $ 1924 | $ 76.96 | $ 1784 1% 71.36
9E+06| 12|4.90z |JIMMY DEAN BW-BISCUIT, SAUS, EGG & CHZ 8 $ 1924 | $ 153.92 | $ 17941 $ 143.52
9E+06| 12|4.20z |JIMMY DEAN BW-MUFFIN, HAM, EGG, & CHZ 4 $ 1924 | $ 76.96 | $ 1793 1% 71.72
BE+06 1|220Z  |DURKEE CAJUN SEASONING 1 $ 1195 | $ 1195 | $ 1129 | $ 11.29
9E+06 4l1cT SARA LEE CAKE 9", VARIETY, PACK #2 1 $ 6135| % 6135| % 56.78 | $ 56.78
4E+06 6|5LB cMmI CAKE MIX, WHITE 5 $ 4430 | $ 22150 | $ 25.03 | $ 125.15
4E+06 6|5LB cMmI CAKE MIX, YELLOW 2 $ 2499 | $ 4998 | $ 25.00 | $ 50.00
2E+06 6|#10 STOKELY CARROTS, DICED 110 $ 2388 |% 262680 |% 2340 ($  2,574.00
9E+06 1|20LB _ |CLASSIC CARROTS, DICED 1 $ 1622 | $ 1622 | $ 1490 | $ 14.90
9E+06| 12|2LB CLASSIC CARROTS, DICED POLY BAG 1 $ 1829 | $ 1829 | $ 18.08 | $ 18.08
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2E+06 6|#10 STOKELY CARROTS, SLICED, FANCY 44 $ 2388 |% 105072 1% 2315|$ 1,018.60
9E+06 1|20LB  |CLASSIC CARROTS, SMOOTH SLICED 310 $ 1773 |$ 5496.30| % 13.18 | $  4,085.80
9E+06 1|10LB _ |AMERICAS CATFISH BRD NUGGETS 70 $ 3401 |%$ 2,380.70|% 2213 |$  1,549.10
6E+06| 96[10z GEN MILLS CEREAL APPLE CINN PK BOWLWG 59 $ 3843 |$ 2,267371% 20.06 [$ 1,183.54
7E+06| 96[BOWL  |KELLOGGS CEREAL APPLE JACKS 12 $ 3867 1% 464.04 | $ 35751 % 429.00
7E+06| 96[BOWL  |KELLOGGS CEREAL CORN FLAKES 28 $ 3867 |% 1,08276|% 34551 $ 967.40
6E+06 4[200z |GENMILLS CEREAL, CHEERIOS (BULK PACK) 9 $ 25.78 | $ 232.02 | $ 20.20 | $ 181.80
6E+06| 96[10z GEN MILLS CEREAL, CHEERIOS WG, BP 352 $ 3843 |$ 1352736 1% 20.06 [$ 7,061.12
6E+06| 96[10z GEN MILLS CEREAL, CINNAMON TOAST CR WG 18 $ 3843 1% 691.74 | $ 20.06 | $ 361.08
BE+06| 96[11/16 OZ |GEN MILLS CEREAL, CNTRY CORN FLAKES, WG 3 $ 3843 1% 11529 | $ 34551 $ 103.65
6E+06| 96[10z GEN MILLS CEREAL, FROSTED FLAKES WG,BP 210 $ 3890 |$ 8,169.00 | $ 20.06 [$  4,212.60
6E+06| 96[10z GEN MILLS CEREAL, GOLDEN GRAHAMS WG 115 $ 3890 |$ 447350|% 20.06 [$  2,306.90
6E+06| 96[10z GEN MILLS CEREAL, HONEY NUT CHEERIO WG 64 $ 3890 |$ 2,489.60|% 20.06 [$  1,283.84
6E+06| 96[10z GEN MILLS CEREAL, LUCKY CHARMS, BP,WG 152 $ 3843 |$ 584136|% 20.06 [$  3,049.12
BE+06| 96[3/40Z |GEN MILLS CEREAL, RICE CRUNCHNS, WG,BP 38 $ 3867 |% 146946 |% 3712 |$  1,410.56
6E+06| 96[1 3/18 OZ|GEN MILLS CEREAL, TOTAL RAISN BRAN WG 123 $ 3869 |$ 475887 1% 20.06 [$  2,467.38
6E+06| 96[10z GEN MILLS CEREAL, TRIX WG, BP 82 $ 3843 |$ 3,151.26|$ 20.06 [$  1,644.92
BE+06| 96[1.063 0Z |GEN MILLS CEREAL,R/S COCOA PUFFS WG 130 $ 3773 |$ 490490 | % 20.06 [$  2,607.80
6E+06| 96[10z GEN MILLS CEREAL,RICE CHEX, WG, BP 66 $ 3773|$ 249018 | % 20.06 [$  1,323.96
9E+06| 168|10Z LANDOLAKE CHEESE STICKS CHEDDAR IW 39 $ 4471 |$  1,74369 | $ 4542 |$ 1,771.38
9E+06 4|5LB KRAFT CHEESE,SLICED 160AMERICANPUL 1 $ 6590 | $ 6590 | $ 65.29 | $ 65.29
20119 6|1/2 GAL |PENNANT CHERRIES, MARA HALVES $ 61.65|$ 369.90 | $ 46.76 [ $ 280.56
4E+06 1|6 LB TEX SPICE CHILI POWDER 8 $ 2538 1% 203.04 | $ 2039 | $ 163.12
6E+06 1{170Z  |UNISTEL CHILI POWDER, LIGHT $ 848 (% 848 (3% 643 1% 6.43
3E+06 6|#10 STAGG CHILI W/BEANS 47 $ 6207 |$ 291729 |% 49.96 | $  2,348.12
9E+06| 30|70z FERNANDOS CHIMICHANGA SHREDDED BEEF 4 $ 54131 $ 21652 | $ 3855|$ 154.20
4E+06| 64]|1.380Z |MISS VICKI CHIP, POTATO JALAPENO 2 $ 3019 | $ 6038 | $ 31441 $ 62.88
4E+06| 104|102z CHEETOS CHIPS CHEESE CRUNCHY 3 $ 3180 | $ 9540 | $ 32941 $ 98.82
4E+06| 104|102z CHEETOS CHIPS CHEESE CRUNCHY HOT 39 $ 3180 |$ 124020 | % 3294 |$  1,284.66
4E+06| 64207 CHEETOS CHIPS CHEESE CRUNCHY HOT LSS 5 $ 28511 % 14255 | $ 20841 $ 149.20
4E+06| 64207 CHEETOS CHIPS CHEESE CRUNCHY LSS 27 $ 2851 | % 769.77 | $ 29931 $ 808.11
4E+06| 60|1.750Z |FRITOLAY CHIPS CLASSIC VARIETY PACK 2 $ 2556 | $ 5112 | $ 2834 1% 56.68
4E+06| 104|102z FRITOS CHIPS CORN 32 $ 31.80|$ 1,01760|%$ 3294 |$  1,054.08
4E+06| 104|102z FRITOS CHIPS CORN CHILI CHEESE 18 $ 28511 % 513.18 | $ 32941 $ 592.92
4E+06| 64202 FRITOS CHIPS CORN CHILI CHEESE LSS 8 $ 28511 % 228.08 | $ 29931 $ 239.44
4E+06| 60|1.375 OZ |LAYS CHIPS KETTLE CKD VARIETY PK 1 $ 2556 | $ 2556 | $ 27541 % 27.54
4E+06| 104|102z SUNCHIPS CHIPS MULTIGRAIN ORIGINAL WG 1 $ 3180 | $ 3180 | $ 33.80 | $ 33.80
4E+06 6|160Z |LAYS CHIPS POTATO BULK 4 $ 1388 | $ 55521 % 1665 | $ 66.60
4E+06| 64|1.50Z |LAYS CHIPS POTATO LSS 5 $ 2851 | % 14255 | $ 30.69 | $ 153.45
4E+06| 104|102z LAYS CHIPS POTATO REGULAR 3 $ 3180 | $ 9540 | $ 33.80 | $ 101.40
4E+06| 104|102z RUFFLES CHIPS POTATO RIDGED 2 $ 3180 | $ 63.60 | $ 33.80 | $ 67.60
4E+06| 104|102z DORITOS CHIPS TORTILLA COOL RANCH 2 $ 3180 | $ 63.60 | $ 33.80 | $ 67.60
4E+06| 64|1.750Z |DORITOS CHIPS TORTILLA COOL RNCH LSS 10 $ 2851 | % 285.10 | $ 31521 $ 315.20
4E+06| 104|102z DORITOS CHIPS TORTILLA NACHO 35 $ 31.80|$ 1,113.00|$ 3380 ($ 1,183.00
4E+06| 64|1.750Z |DORITOS CHIPS TORTILLA NACHO LSS 13 $ 2851 | % 370.63 | $ 31521 $ 409.76
4E+06| 104|.750Z |FUNYUNS CHIPS, ONION 9 $ 3180 | $ 286.20 | $ 3381 $ 304.29
4E+06|  64|1.375 OZ |MISS VICKI CHIPS,SEA SALT & VINEGAR 3 $ 3019 | $ 9057 | $ 3144 | $ 94.32
9E+06 2|5# GARCIA CHORIZO REGULAR 2 $ 2895 | $ 5790 | $ 20.171$ 40.34
4E+06 1|5LB TEX SPICE CINNAMON, GROUND 8 $ 24131 $ 193.04 | $ 18.08 | $ 144.64
BE+06 1|150Z  |TEX SPICE CINNAMON, GROUND 3 $ 822 (3% 2466 | $ 520 % 15.60
BE+06 1|16 0Z  |DURKEE CLOVES, GROUND 2 $ 1971 | $ 3942 1| % 14951 $ 29.90
8E+06| 24|120Z  |CANADA DRY CLUB SODA 9 $ 9.30($ 83.70 | $ 10741 $ 96.66
7E+06| 24[120Z  |SHASTA CLUB SODA CAN 4 $ 9.30($ 3720 | $ 1074 | $ 42.96
1E+06| 42150z |DE COFFEE, HOUSE BLEND 14 $ 25351 % 354.90 | $ 23.071$ 322.98
8E+06| 12|2LB DOUWE EGBT | COFFEE, HOUSE BLEND GROUND 280 $ 8093 |$ 2266040 |% 121.80 | $ 34,104.00
1E+06| 24|200z |cOCA cOLA COKE CLASSIC BOTTLES 11 $ 28.07 | $ 308.77 | $ 26.35|$ 289.85
1E+06| 24120z |cOCA CcOLA COKE CLASSIC CANNED 32 $ 1201 | $ 38432 | $ 11341 $ 362.88
9E+06 2|7LB RESER'S COLE SLAW SHREDDED 4 $ 20351 % 8140 | % 19.02 | $ 76.08
SE+06| 320|102z oTIS COOKIE DOUGH, DBLE CHOC CHIP 1 $ 3794 | $ 3794 | $ 5822 | $ 58.22
4E+06 1{10LB. |NABISCO COOKIES, ASSORTMENT 360 CT 9 $ 27.03|% 24327 | $ 18.10 | $ 162.90
4E+06| 48|1.40Z |NABISCO COOKIES, CHIPS AHOY SS 2 $ 2233 1% 44.66 | $ 17341 $ 34.68
4E+06 1{10LB. |NABISCO COOKIES, CHOCLTE CHIP 320 CT 52 $ 2265|% 1,17780|% 1736 | $ 902.72
4E+06| 60|2.50Z |GRANDMAS COOKIES, CHOCOLATE CHIP BIG 1 $ 1691 | $ 1691 | $ 17611 $ 17.61
4E+06 1|10 LB NABISCO COOKIES, OATMEAL 360 COUNT 96 $ 1998 |$ 1918.08|% 1507 |$  1,446.72
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4E+06| 60|2.50Z |GRANDMAS COOKIES, OATMEAL RAISIN 33 $ 1691 | $ 558.03 | $ 17611 $ 581.13
4E+06 1{10LB. |NABISCO COOKIES, SUGAR 320 CT 127 $ 1995|% 2,53365|% 1507 |$  1,913.89
1E+06| 2420 0Z. |GATORADE COOL BLUE RASPBERRY 14 $ 2160 | $ 30240 | $ 21671$ 303.38
9E+06 1|20LB  |GARDEN FRE CORN, CUT WHOLE KERNAL 678 $ 1843 |$ 12,49554 | $ 1623 |$ 11,003.94
2E+06 6|#10 HART CORN, WHOLE KERNEL 185 $ 28741% 531690 | % 24.06 [$  4,451.10
8E+06 1|5LB BORDEN COTTAGE CHEESE, LOW FAT 2 $ 10851 $ 2170 | $ 10.78 | $ 21.56
3E+06 6|#10 CHEF MATE COUNTRY GRAVY W/ SAUSAGE 2 $ 5297 | $ 105.94 | $ 62371 $ 124.74
7E+06| 24120z |CMIME COUNTRY TIME LEMONADE 3 $ 26.65|$ 79951 $ 10.66 | $ 31.98
4E+06| 100|1 0Z AUSTIN CRACKER ZOO ANIMALS 80 $ 2480 |$ 1,984.00|% 1494 1%  1,195.20
20385| 300|2CT KEEBLER CRACKER WHEAT 70 $ 2070 |$ 1,449.00| % 13481 $ 943.60
4E+06| 500|2 EA LANCE CRACKER, WHEAT TWINS 1 $ 2058 | $ 2058 | $ 20771 $ 20.77
4E+06| 500|2 CT NABISCO CRACKERS PREMIUM SALTINE 19 $ 12811 $ 24339 | $ 13481 $ 256.12
20495 20[3.80z |NABISCO CRACKERS, RITZ BULK 112 $ 21.70|$ 2,430401|% 1466 | $  1,641.92
20587| 150{.500Z  |NABISCO CRACKERS,TEDDY GRAHAM CINN 112 $ 2480 |$ 2777601 % 1798 |$  2,013.76
4E+06| 12|1LB NABISCO CRAKERS, PREM SALTINE BULK 85 $ 3293 |$ 2,799.05|% 1433 |$  1,218.05
4E+06] 12|100Z  |CHAPAS CRAKLINS CHICHARRONES 1 $ 3912 | $ 3912 | $ 3512 | $ 35.12
268508 6|#10 OCEAN SPR CRANBERRY SAUCE, JELLIED 17 $ 4235 $ 719.95 | $ 36.56 | $ 621.52
9E+06| 100|1 0Z RASKAS CREAM CHEESE SPREAD PC 2 $ 1736 1| $ 34721 % 4481 $ 8.96
8E+06| 360|3/80Z |DAIRYFRESH | CREAMER HALF&HALF SHELF STBL 7 $ 18551 $ 12985 | $ 11841 $ 82.88
8E+06| 400|3/8 0Z |BORDEN CREAMER, NON-DAIRY 1 $ 707 (% 707 (% 8.60 | $ 8.60
8E+06| 10|100 CT |CREAM WHIT CREAMER, NON-DAIRY "U" 2.5GM 13 $ 20251 $ 263.25 | $ 16.26 | $ 211.38
1E+06 4|30CT _ |KRAFT CRYSTAL LT ONTHEGO LEMONADE 10 $ 29.60 | $ 296.00 | $ 2468 | $ 246.80
1E+06 4|30CT  |KRAFT CRYSTAL LT ONTHEGO FRUITPNCH 6 $ 29.60 | $ 177.60 | $ 2468 | $ 148.08
1E+06 4|30CT _ |KRAFT CRYSTAL LT ONTHEGO PEACH TEA 6 $ 29.60 | $ 177.60 | $ 2468 | $ 148.08
1E+06 4|30CT  |KRAFT CRYSTAL LT ONTHEGO RASBERRY $ 29.60 | $ 177.60 | $ 2468 | $ 148.08
1E+06 4|30CT _ |KRAFT CRYSTAL LT ONTHEGO RSB/LEMON 2 $ 29.60 | $ 59.20 | $ 2468 | $ 49.36
4E+06 1|5LB TEX SPICE CUMIN, (COMINO) 12 $ 24.30 | $ 291.60 | $ 2248 | $ 269.76
BE+06 1|5LB DURKEE CUMIN, GROUND 3 $ 24301 $ 7290 | $ 22481 $ 67.44
4E+06 1|16 0z |TEX SPICE CUMIN, GROUND 2 $ 9838 (3% 19.76 | $ 6.00 | $ 12.00
1E+06 6| #10 HANOVER CUT GREEN BEANS 4SV 2 $ 18471 $ 3694 | $ 18.02 | $ 36.04
1E+06| 24120z |cOCA COLA DIET COKE CANNED 17 $ 1201 | $ 204.17 | $ 11341 $ 192.78
1E+06| 24|200z |cOCA CcOLA DIET COKE CLASSIC BOTTLES 13 $ 28.07 | $ 36491 | $ 26.35|$ 342.55
1E+06| 24[120z |DR PEPPER DIET DR PEPPER CANNED 4 $ 1201 | $ 48.04 | $ 11341 $ 45.36
1E+06| 24120z  |PEPSI DIET PEPSI 3 $ 9.13 [ $ 2739 1% 1050 | $ 31.50
1E+06| 24[120z |DR PEPPER DR PEPPER CANNED 24 $ 1201 | $ 288.24 | $ 11341 $ 272.16
1E+06| 24[200z  |DR PEPPER DR. PEPPER 0 $ 28.07 | $ = $ 2635 $ =
3E+06| 200|12GM__|PPI DRESSING, 1000 ISLAND 12GM $ 15151 $ 3030 | $ 8.01|$% 16.02
3E+06| 200|12GM__|PPI DRESSING, BMLK RANCH 12GM 36 $ 1551 | $ 558.36 | $ 7831% 281.88
3E+06| 200|12GM___|PPI DRESSING, FRENCH 12 GM 4 $ 1551 | $ 62.04 1% 7271% 29.08
3E+06| 200|12 GRAM|PPI DRESSING, ITALIAN 12 GM 11 $ 1451 1| $ 159.61 | $ 6.08 % 66.88
3E+06| 60|1.50Z |KEN'S DRESSING,BLEU CHEESE 1 $ 1528 | $ 1528 | $ 1259 | $ 12.59
1E+07 1|1LB PEPPER DRIED ARBOL PEPPER $ 23551 % 23551 % 8451 % 8.45
1E+07 1|1LB PEPPER DRIED CASCABEL PEPPER 2 $ 22151 % 4430 | $ 1289 | $ 25.78
1E+06| 12| 2GAL |TWIST DRINK MIX, FRUIT PUNCH 408 $ 2665|% 10,873.20 | $ 1355 |$  5,528.40
1E+06| 12[2GAL  |TWIST DRINK MIX, GRAPE 391 $ 2665|% 10,420.15| % 1355 |$  5,298.05
1E+06| 12[2GAL  |TWIST DRINK MIX, LEMONADE 377 $ 2665|% 10,047.05|% 1355|$% 5,108.35
1E+06| 12[2GAL  |TWIST DRINK MIX, ORANGE 375 $ 2665|% 9,993.75|% 1355|$  5,081.25
1E+06| 12[2GAL  |TWIST DRINK MIX, PINK LEMONADE 365 $ 2665|% 9,72725|% 1355 |$  4,945.75
9E+06| 60|30z MINH EGG ROLL CHICKEN WG 41 $ 4581 |$ 1.87821|$ 3647 |$  1,495.27
8E+06| 15|1 DOZEN |CAL MAINE EGGS, GRADE A MEDIUM LOOSE 10 $ 1919 | $ 191.90 | $ 2035| $ 203.50
8E+06| 15|1 DOZEN |CAL MAINE EGGS, GRADE A X-LARGE LOOSE 583 $ 23.78|$ 13,863.74 | % 23.87|$ 13,916.21
8E+06| 15|1 DOZEN |CAL MAINE EGGS, GRADE AA LARGE LOOSE 251 $ 23.78|$ 5968.78 | $ 2456 [$  6,164.56
4E+06 1|20 LB |0.B MAC. ELBOW MACARONI 54 $ 1866 |$ 100764 1% 1586 | $ 856.44
4E+06 1|20LB  |OBMAC ELBOW MACARONI THICK 32 $ 18.66 | $ 597.12 | $ 1684 | $ 538.88
4E+06| 150|1 0z KEEBLER ELF GRAHAMS ORIG W/CAL WG 4 $ 3831|% 15324 | $ 28.83 | $ 115.32
9E+06 2|5LB J SOULES FAJITAS, CHICKEN BRST STP FC 8 $ 28401 $ 22720 | $ 35381 $ 283.04
1E+06| 24[200Z |GATORADE FIERCE GRAPE 3 $ 2160 | $ 64.80 | $ 21671 $ 65.01
1E+06] 24[200Z. |GATORADE FIERCE MELON (WIDEMOUTH) 13 $ 24.00 | $ 312.00 | $ 2167 | $ 281.71
4E+06 1|50 LB MEDALLION FLOUR,ALL-PURPOSE H & R 2 $ 1528 | $ 3056 | $ 1833 | $ 36.66
5E+06 1|16 0Z  |DURKEE FOOD COLOR, EGG SHADE LIQUID 2 $ 6.38 | $ 12.76 | $ 496 | $ 9.92
9E+06| 144|150z |MRS BUTTER FRENCH TOAST 31 $ 3209 | $ 994.79 | $ 2499 | $ 774.69
9E+06| 180|.910Z |MRS BUTTER FRENCH TOAST STICKS 63 $ 21.741$ 136962 | % 1548 1| $ 975.24
9E+06 6|5LB SUN CROP FRIES, CC 3/8" 16 $ 2549 1| % 407.84 | $ 19.20 | $ 307.20
9E+06 6|4LB ORE IDA FRIES, POTATO SMILES 14 $ 3798 | $ 531.72 | $ 23.771$% 332.78



mailto:mejimenez@benekeith.com
mailto:ealvarado@labattfood.com

Webb County Purchasing Dept. Ben E. Keith Foods Labatt Food Service
Bid Tabulation c/o Mario Jimenz c/o Enrique Alvarado
Opened: October 16, 2014 5505 Kaepa Rd. 902 N. Expressway 77
San Antonio, TX 78218 Harlingen, TX 78550
210-661-7997 956-428-0722
RFP 2015-60 956-324-9268
Annual Contract for Food Commodities mejimenez@benekeith.com ealvarado@Iabattfood.com
Approved Approved
Item # [Pack |Size Label Description Estimated Qty] Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price
9E+06 6|5LB SUN CROP FRIES, SC 3/8" 641 $ 1721 |$ 1103161 |% 19.07 | $ 12,223.87
1E+07 6|5LB SAVORY FRIES, SC 3/8" 6 $ 17211 $ 103.26 | $ 19.07 | $ 114.42
9E+06 6|2.5LB  |HARVEST SP FRIES, SWEET POTATO WEDGE 4 $ 3191 | $ 12764 | $ 21.14 | $ 84.56
9E+06 6|5LB SAVORY FRIES, WEDGE 10-CUT 11 $ 3191 | $ 351.01 | $ 1758 | $ 193.38
326082| 36|40z DOLE FRUIT BOWL TROPICAL FRUIT 11 $ 2060 | $ 226.60 | $ 19.751 % 217.25
326090| 36|40Z DOLE FRUIT BOWL, DICED PEACHES JC 38 $ 2060 | $ 782.80 | $ 1941 1% 737.58
305557 6|#10 EMPRESS FRUIT COCKTAIL LS 11 $ 4335 $ 476.85 | $ 4184 ($ 460.24
305029 6|#10 SENECA FRUIT COCKTAIL, LIGHT SYRUP 156 $ 43.35|$ 6,762.60 | $ 4184 |$  6,527.04
326030 6|#10 PACKER FRUIT MIX, LS NO GRAPES 89 $ 4548 | $ 4,047.72|$ 3298 |$ 2,935.22
1E+06] 24[200Z. |GATORADE FRUIT PUNCH (WIDEMOUTH) 23 $ 2160 | $ 496.80 | $ 2167 | $ 498.41
4E+06| 96|.50Z BETTY CRCK FRUIT ROLL UPS, STRAWBERRY * 1 $ 2653 1% 26531 % 23.88 1| $ 23.88
1E+06| 24[200z Gatorade G2 FRUIT PUNCH 5 $ 2160 | $ 108.00 | $ 21671$ 108.35
BE+06 1|40 0Z  |DURKEE GARLIC SALT 1 $ 874 (3% 874 (3% 611 ]%$ 6.11
1E+07 1|5LB GARLIC GARLIC WHOLE PEELED 5# * 1 $ 16.69 | $ 16.69 | $ 2297 1% 22.97
BE+06 1|29 LB DURKEE GARLIC, GRANULATED 5 $ 1236 | $ 61.80 | $ 13637 | $ 681.85
4E+06| 12|240zZ  |ROYAL GELATIN, BERRY BLUE 11 $ 2722 1% 29942 | $ 24621 $ 270.82
5E+06| 48[3.250Z |SNACK PACK Gelatin, Straw/Or Sgr Free 7 $ 16.59 | $ 116.13 | $ 1491 | $ 104.37
4E+06| 12|240zZ  |ROYAL GELATIN, STRAWBERRY $ 2722 1% 108.88 | $ 24621 $ 98.48
1E+06| 24[200Z |GATORADE GLACIER FREEZE 1 $ 21.16 | $ 2116 | $ 21671 $ 21.67
4E+06| 60|10Z PEPPERIDGE GOLDFISH, CHEDDAR CHEESE 32 $ 16.19 | $ 518.08 | $ 15751 % 504.00
4E+06 1|10LB. |KEEBLER GRAHAM CRACKER WG BULK 5 $ 2474 1 $ 123.70 | $ 18.07 | $ 90.35
4E+06| 200|2 CT NABISCO GRAHAM CRACKERS 16 $ 2198 | $ 351.68 | $ 12.78 | $ 204.48
SE+06| 200|.5 0Z POCO PAC GRAPE JELLY - POUCH 2 $ 1036 | $ 20721 $ 898 |% 17.96
4E+06 6|24 0z |PIONEER GRAVY MIX, COUNTRY STYLE 43 $ 1791 1| $ 77013 | $ 1686 | $ 724.98
3E+06 6|14 0Z  |SHAWNEE GRAVY, SILVERSPOON BROWN 53 $ 2064 |$ 109392 |% 14.07 | $ 745.71
3E+06 6|24 0z |SHAWNEE GRAVY, SILVERSPOON PEPPERED 8 $ 1638 | $ 131.04 | $ 1198 | $ 95.84
3E+06 6|14 0Z  |SHAWNEE GRAVY, TURKEY 2 $ 2081 | $ 4162 | $ 1639 | $ 32.78
9E+06 8l6CT ROTELLA'S HAMBURGER BUN, WHITE 4" 5 $ 21211 $ 106.05 | $ 22941 $ 114.70
9E+06 6|5LB SIMPLOT HASHBROWN, 101 PATTY 131 $ 2145|% 2,809.95|% 23.62 [$  3,094.22
9E+06 6/3LB SIMPLOT HASHBROWN, CLASSIC IQF SHRED 2 $ 1781 | $ 35.62 | $ 13.36 | $ 26.72
9E+06| 12|20CT  |LAMBWESTON| HASHBROWN, SIDE O'BROWN 2.25 16 $ 48.17 | $ 77072 | $ 4185 $ 669.60
9E+06 1|36 CT  |HERSHEY HERSHEY W ALMONDS BAR 1.450Z 3 $ 2417 | $ 7251 1% 24.00 | $ 72.00
9E+06 66 CT. ROTELLA'S HOAGIE, HINGED SLICED 6"-7" 1 $ 18451 $ 18451 $ 1557 | $ 15.57
2E+06 6|#10 BUSH HOMINY WHITE 5 $ 21311 % 106.55 | $ 1984 1| $ 99.20
9E+06 4|1 D0z |BLUE BUNNY ICE CREAM CUP VANILLA 5 $ 17711 $ 88551 % 21621 $ 108.10
4E+06 4|1 D0z |BLUE BUNNY ICE CREAM SANDWICH VANILLA 2 $ 1712 | $ 3424 1 $ 23.10 | $ 46.20
4E+06 2|2D0Z _ |BLUE BUNNY ICE CREAM VAN NUTTY SUNDAE 7 $ 20.16 | $ 14112 | $ 35.03|$ 245.21
2E+06 6|#10 LACOMADRE JALAPENOS, NACHO SLICED 23 $ 24.06 | $ 553.38 | $ 24521 $ 563.96
2E+06 6|#10 FARO JALAPENOS, WHOLE 80/90 1 $ 22451 % 22451 % 24.04 | $ 24.04
2E+06 6|#10 LACOMADRE JALAPENOS,WHOLE FIELD 70/100 37 $ 22451 % 830.65 | $ 24.04 | $ 889.48
SE+06| 200|050z |PPI JAM, STRAWBERRY POUCH 13 $ 1299 | $ 168.87 | $ 10551 $ 137.15
5E+06| 200{0.50Z |PPI JELLY, ASST#3 (80G/40A/80MF) 8 $ 11.07 | $ 88.56 | $ 10.15 | $ 81.20
SE+06| 200|1/20Z |SMUCKER JELLY, STRAWBERRY 4 $ 16.02 | $ 64.08 | $ 1576 | $ 63.04
33565| 48|5.50Z |OCEANSPRAY JUICE GRAPEFRUIT 1 $ 1898 | $ 1898 | $ 16.63 | $ 16.63
9E+06| 96|4 0Z ARDMORE JUICE, APPLE KPAK 100% 13 $ 1834 1| $ 23842 | $ 1470 | $ 191.10
1E+06| 12[320z |MOTTS JUICE, CLAMATO 10 $ 2921 | $ 29210 | $ 28.40 | $ 284.00
927011| 24[100z  [TROPICANA JUICE, CRANBERRY 1 $ 18.76 | $ 18.76 | $ 19451 % 19.45
906008 8|46 0z |WELCH'S JUICE, GRAPE 17 $ 25401 % 431.80 [ $ 25511 $ 433.67
948000 4|1 GALLONREALEMON JUICE, LEMON 23 $ 3452 1% 793.96 | $ 3492 1| $ 803.16
949602| 200[4 GM PPI JUICE, LEMON 4 GM 23 $ 1052 | $ 241.96 | $ 657 1% 151.11
865423 48[550z [WELCH'S JUICE, ORANGE 18 $ 20851 $ 37530 | $ 22831 $ 410.94
927012| 24[100z  [TROPICANA JUICE, ORANGE 1 $ 18.26 | $ 1826 | $ 19451 % 19.45
9E+06| 12|46 0Z. |ARDMORE JUICE, ORANGE 100% ASEPTIC 1 $ 2862 | % 2862 | % 32731 $ 32.73
9E+06| 96|4 0Z ARDMORE JUICE, ORANGE KPAK 100% 17 $ 22401 $ 380.80 | $ 17311 $ 294.27
1E+06| 48[550Z |SUNSWEET JUICE, PRUNE ZIP-TOP 1 $ 3099 | $ 3099 | $ 3029 | $ 30.29
904516 8|46 0z |WELCH'S JUICE, WHITE GRAPE 100% 41 $ 23851 % 97785 $ 2521 |$  1,033.61
3E+06| 121350z |HUNT'S KETCHUP, 100% NAT SQ BOT RED 3 $ 12.63 | $ 3789 | $ 1585 | $ 47.55
1E+06| 16140z  |HEINZ KETCHUP, 140Z CLEAR USD 1 $ 2462 1% 2462 | $ 1767 1% 17.67
2E+06| 1000|9GM RED GOLD KETCHUP, FANCY 33% PC 107 $ 1810 |$ 1936.70 | $ 1458 | $  1,560.06
3E+06| 500|9GM PPI KETCHUP, FCY 9GM FOIL 1 $ 1749 | $ 1749 | $ 2158 | $ 21.58
3E+06) 1000|9 GM AMERICANA KETCHUP, POLY 9 GM 6 $ 23401 $ 14040 | $ 1899 | $ 113.94
3E+06| 500|9 GM AMERICANA KETCHUP, POLY 9GM 37 $ 1749 | $ 647.13 | $ 1058 | $ 391.46
3E+06 6|#10 HEINZ KETCHUP, TOMATO, FANCY 3 $ 3224 1% 96.72 | $ 20871 $ 62.61
BE+06 1|27 0z |DURKEE LEMON PEPPER SEASONING 16 $ 1113 | $ 178.08 | $ 884 |% 141.44
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Webb County Purchasing Dept. Ben E. Keith Foods Labatt Food Service
Bid Tabulation c/o Mario Jimenz c/o Enrique Alvarado
Opened: October 16, 2014 5505 Kaepa Rd. 902 N. Expressway 77
San Antonio, TX 78218 Harlingen, TX 78550
210-661-7997 956-428-0722
RFP 2015-60 956-324-9268
Annual Contract for Food Commodities mejimenez@benekeith.com ealvarado@Iabattfood.com
Approved Approved
Item # [Pack |Size Label Description Estimated Qty] Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price
1E+06] 24[200Z. |GATORADE LEMON-LIME (WIDEMOUTH) 17 $ 2160 | $ 367.20 | $ 2167 | $ 368.39
4E+06 1|20LB _ |JACKRABBIT LENTILS 2 $ 1538 | $ 3076 | $ 17.71 | $ 35.42
9E+06 1|48 CT _ |M&M MARS M&M PEANUT CANDY 1.74 OZ 2 $ 34041 $ 68.08 | $ 3226 | $ 64.52
217539 6|#10 CELEBRITY MANDARIN ORANGES, BROKEN PCS 66 $ 2878 |$ 189948 |% 2225|$  1,468.50
217521 6|#10 CELEBRITY MANDARIN ORANGES, WH SEC, LS 248 $ 3157 |$ 782936 |% 2761 |$ 6,847.28
9E+06 2|5LB GARDEN FRE MANGO, CHUNKS IQF 18 $ 16.50 | $ 297.00 | $ 15.02 | $ 270.36
8E+06| 30[|1LB VENTURA MARGARINE (OLEO SOLIDS) 333 $ 1762 |$ 586746 | $ 20471$ 6,816.51
8E+06| 900|5GM VENTURA MARGARINE, CUPS-SUNNYLAND 2 $ 1921 | $ 3842 1% 1441 1% 28.82
8E+06 2|1751LB [VENTURA MARGARINE, LIQUID $ 30.37 | $ 30.37 | $ 2953 | $ 29.53
3E+06 4|1 GAL. |KEN'S MAYONNAISE, EXTRA HEAVY DUTY 5 $ 3024 | $ 151.20 | $ 31.80 | $ 159.00
SE+06| 200|12 GM _ |AMERICANA MAYONNAISE, POLY 12GM 184 $ 1578 |$ 290352 |% 7.721%$  1,420.48
3E+06 4|1 GAL. |KEN'S MAYONNAISE, REDUCED CALORIE 8 $ 2436 | $ 194.88 | $ 2440 | $ 195.20
9E+06 1|5LB BOLNERS MENUDO MIX 1 $ 1017 | $ 1017 | $ 26341 $ 26.34
9E+06| 64[|2.7 0Z |TYSON MESQ NAT SHAPE BRST FILET FC 14 $ 4433 | $ 620.62 | $ 34.96 | $ 489.44
8E+06| 24|120Z  |VELVET MILK, EVAPORATED 4 $ 2216 | $ 88641 % 2249 | $ 89.96
9E+06 1|36 CT _ |M&M MARS MILKY WAY SINGLES 2 $ 2553 1% 51.06 | $ 22611 $ 45.22
9E+06 6|3LB MCCAIN MINI POTATO PANCAKE, HMSTYLE 2 $ 3499 | $ 69.98 | $ 25.65|$ 51.30
2E+06 6| #10 LIBBY'S MIX VEGETABLES L SODIUM 3 $ 2957 1% 8871 1% 29.29 | $ 87.87
2E+06 1|22LB ROGELIO MOLE 2 $ 10047 | $ 200.94 | $ 4887 [ $ 97.74
4E+06| 96|2.25 0z |OTIS SPUNK MUFFIN, BLUEBERRY IW 26 $ 4343 |$ 1,129.18 | $ 40.20 [ $  1,045.20
9E+06| 96|2-1/8 0Z |SARA LEE MUFFIN, BLUEBERRY, FROZEN 28 $ 4343 |$ 1,216.04|$ 40.20 [ $ 1,125.60
OE+06| 96|2-1/8 0Z |SARA LEE MUFFIN, CORN 1 $ 4367 | $ 4367 | $ 41.02 [ $ 41.02
1E+07 6|2LB FRED'S MUSHROOMS BATTERED $ 46.58 | $ 46.58 | $ 33.04 1% 33.04
2E+06 6|#10 CELEBRITY MUSHROOMS, PIECES AND STEMS 3 $ 47.09 | $ 14127 | $ 44.08 [ $ 132.24
3E+06| 500|5.5GM |AMERICANA MUSTARD, 5.5 GM 39 $ 1277 1% 498.03 [ $ 687 1% 267.93
3E+06| 200|5.5GM___|PPI MUSTARD, 5.5GM POLY 80 $ 856 (3% 684.80 | $ 380|$% 304.00
3E+06| 500|4.5GM |AMERICANA MUSTARD, POLY 4.5 GM 11 $ 1277 1% 14047 | $ 590 |$ 64.90
9E+06 1|10 LB BRIAR ST NAT PULLED WHT TRKY MEAT CKD 21 $ 4110 | $ 863.10 | $ 48.07 | $  1,009.47
8E+06) 2000|2 GM NJOY NON DAIRY CREAMER 23 $ 40.10 | $ 92230 | $ 38.46 | $ 884.58
BE+06 1|16 0Z  |DURKEE NUTMEG, GROUND 2 $ 1531 | $ 3062 | % 1210 | $ 24.20
4E+06| 48|1.30Z |KELLOGGS NUTRIGRAIN BAR APPLE CINN WG 1 $ 23.02 | $ 23.02 1% 1799 | $ 17.99
4E+06| 48|1.30Z |KELLOGGS NUTRIGRAIN YOG BAR STRAW WG 2 $ 23.02 | $ 46.04 | $ 1799 | $ 35.98
7E+06] 12[420Z |RALSTON OATS, QUICK WG 03681 30 $ 3670 | $ 1,101.00 | $ 30.76 | $ 922.80
8E+06 1|35LB. |BUNGE OIL, SALAD SOYBEAN 2 $ 2387 1% 4774 | $ 2521 1% 50.42
8E+06 1|1 6L ROLAND OLIVE OIL, EXTRA VIRGIN 2 $ 2527 1% 5054 | $ 2466 | $ 49.32
8E+06 1|1 GAL __|ROLAND OLIVE OIL, POMANCE 1 $ 15.05 | $ 15.05 | $ 16.12 | $ 16.12
4E+06 1|1 6L MARIO OLIVES, MANZ W/PIM 360CT 3 $ 1154 1| $ 3462 | $ 12.08 | $ 36.24
4E+06 6|#10 FRAGATA OLIVES, RIPE SLICED 2 $ 33131 % 66.26 | $ 3119 | $ 62.38
1E+07 4|3LB GOLDEN V ONION RINGS BEER BATTRD 5/8" 3 $ 43.80 | $ 13140 $ 24711 $ 74.13
1E+06] 24[200Z. |GATORADE ORANGE (WIDEMOUTH) 4 $ 2160 | $ 86.40 | $ 2167 | $ 86.68
BE+06 1|120Z  |TEX SPICE OREGANO, GROUND 6 $ 988 (3% 59.28 | $ 5941% 35.64
BE+06 4|1380z |OLD EL PAS PACE ENCHILADA SAUCE 3 $ 2537 1% 76111 $ 27331 $ 81.99
9E+06| 144|1.20Z |MRS BUTTER PANCAKES 475 $ 1628 |$ 7,733.00 | $ 1459 |$  6,930.25
OE+06| 144|1.20Z |AUNT JEMIM PANCAKES WHOLE GRAIN 164 $ 2256 |$ 369984 |% 1853 | $  3,038.92
BE+06 1|16 0Z  |TRADERS CH PAPRIKA 4 $ 9.30($ 3720 | $ 581]% 23.24
4E+06 1|10LB  |ZEREGA'S PASTA, EGG NOODLES 1/4" MED 9 $ 13.14 | $ 118.26 | $ 1319 | $ 118.71
4E+06 1|20LB  |ZEREGA'S PASTA, LONG SPAGHETTI 20" 14 $ 18.66 | $ 261.24 | $ 1834 | $ 256.76
4E+06 1|20LB  |ZEREGA'S PASTA, MEDIUM SHELLS 8 $ 18.66 | $ 149.28 | $ 1832 | $ 146.56
4E+06 2|10LB _ |OBMAC PASTA, PENNE RIGATI 2 $ 19.13 | $ 3826 | $ 1718 | $ 34.36
4E+06 2|10LB PATRIA PASTA, SPAGHETTI 10" 6 $ 18.66 | $ 111.96 | $ 1637 | $ 98.22
4E+06 2|10LB  |ZEREGA'S PASTA, SPAGHETTI THIN 10" 2 $ 18.66 | $ 37321 % 1630 | $ 32.60
4E+06 1|20 # OB MAC PASTA, VERNICELLI 5 $ 18.66 | $ 9330 | $ 1790 | $ 89.50
4E+06 2|10LB _ |OBMAC PASTA,SPAGHETTI THIN 10" 4 $ 18.66 | $ 74641 $ 1630 | $ 65.20
2E+06 6|#10 REDPACK PASTE, TOMATO 30 $ 3347 |% 1,004.10|% 3399 [$ 1,019.70
9E+06| 40|40z ROCHESTER PATTY, GRND BF 4/1 80/20 RND 1 $ 36.76 | $ 36.76 | $ 34751 $ 34.75
9E+06| 27|60z ROCHESTER PATTY, GRND BF 80/20 RND 19 $ 4231 $ 803.89 | $ 34721 $ 659.68
442269 6|#10 SENECA PEACHES, DICED CHO LT SYRP 136 $ 40.74|$ 554064 |$ 38.05[$ 5174.80
410121 6|#10 EMPRESS PEACHES, DICED L/S 234 $ 40.73|$ 9,530.82 | $ 38.05[$ 8,903.70
417121 6|#10 SENECA PEACHES, HALVES L/S 30-35 CT 2 $ 3899 | $ 7798 1% 36.74 | $ 73.48
438735 6|#10 SENECA PEACHES, SLICED W/SPLENDA 26 $ 4031 [$ 1,048.06 | $ 37591 $ 977.34
SE+06 6|5LB GARDENCLUB PEANUT BUTTER, CREAMY 9 $ 5171 1| $ 465.39 | $ 39451 $ 355.05
22568 6|#10 EMPRESS PEARS DICED LS 42 $ 4197 |$ 1,762.74|$ 3835($ 1,610.70
22750 6|#10 EMPRESS PEARS HALVES LS 8 $ 4226 | $ 338.08 | $ 3798 1| $ 303.84
480102 6|#10 PACKER PEARS, DICED (CHOICE) LS $ 4187 | $ 293.09 | $ 38.35| $ 268.45
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Item # [Pack |Size Label Description Estimated Qty] Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price
480145 6|#10 PACKER PEARS, DICED LIGHT SYRUP 241 $ 4187 | $ 10,090.67 | $ 3835 |$ 9,242.35
480079 6|#10 SENECA PEARS, HALVES L/SYR,BARTLETT 25 $ 4226 [$ 1,056.50 | $ 3798 | $ 949.50
480061 6|#10 SENECA PEARS, SLICED LT SYP 36 $ 4086 [$ 1,47096|$ 3844 |$ 1,383.84
2E+06 6|#10 STOKELY PEAS & CARROTS 52 $ 3597 |%$ 187044 1% 3246 [$  1,687.92
9E+06 1|20LB  |GARDEN FRE PEAS, GREEN 170 $ 1959|$ 3,33030| % 1842 |$  3,131.40
2E+06 6|#10 HART PEAS, SWEET X-STND 44 $ 3560|$% 156640 |% 2813 |$  1,237.72
6E+06 13000 CT |DIAM CRYST PEPPER, PACKET 8 $ 1733 1% 138.64 | $ 962 | % 76.96
2E+06 6|#10 MOODY DNBR PEPPERS, RED DICED 2 $ 48.08 | $ 96.16 | $ 4529 [ $ 90.58
1E+06| 24120z  |PEPSI PEPSI CANNED 10 $ 9.13 [ $ 9130 | $ 1054 | $ 105.40
1E+07 6|2LB FRED'S PICKLE CHIPS, BATTERED 1 $ 55.76 | $ 55.76 | $ 4264 [ $ 42.64
SE+06 1|5 GAL _ |CHEF SUPRE PICKLE, CC SLICED CT 2970 10 $ 2928 | $ 29280 | $ 1751 1% 175.10
SE+06 6|#10 HEINZ PICKLE, SPEAR KOSHER DILL 27 $ 33151 % 895.05 | $ 2950 | $ 796.50
9E+06 6|44 0Z  |MRS SMITHS PIE, PUMPKIN TNS 19 $ 3822 1% 726.18 | $ 3296 | $ 626.24
547653 6|#10 GIFT OF NT PINEAPPLE, CHUNKS NAT JUICE 12 $ 3250 | $ 390.00 | $ 20641 $ 355.68
566844 6|#10 GIFT OF NT PINEAPPLE, TIDBITS NAT JUICE 111 $ 3076 |$ 3,41436|% 2846 [$  3,159.06
569555 6|#10 GIFT OF NT PINEAPPLE,CRUSHED NAT JUICE 164 $ 3012 |$ 493968 |% 2817 |$  4,619.88
4E+06 1|50 LB |JACKRABBIT | PINTO BEANS, PREWASHED PAPER 210 $ 3797 |%$ 7973.70|% 3434 |$  7,211.40
OE+06| 96|4.650Z |TONYS PIZZA PEPPERONI SMART 4X6 224 $ 5488 |$ 12,293.12 | $ 51.03|$ 11,430.72
OE+06| 96|4.480Z |TONYS PIZZA PEPPERONI SMART 4X6 WG 140 $ 5488 |% 7,683.20|% 51.03 [$ 7,144.20
9E+06 2|10LB RESER'S POTATO DICE HMSTYL FRSH 5/8" 2 $ 16.86 | $ 33721 % 1710 | $ 34.20
2E+06| 12[280z  |BASIC AMR POTATO PEARLS, EXCEL 4 $ 56.40 | $ 225.60 | $ 52521 $ 210.08
2E+06| 10[20.17 OZ |BASIC AMER POTATO PEARLS, SWEET 3 $ 10.00 | $ 30.00 | $ 4322 ($ 129.66
2E+06 6|#10 HANOVER POTATOES, DICED 23 $ 2569 | $ 590.87 | $ 27341 % 628.82
2E+06 6|#10 TRUERECIPE | POTATOES, MASH INST COMPLETE 215 $ 5638 |$ 12,121.70 | $ 3825 |$ 8,223.75
2E+06| 12280z  |TRADITIONS POTATOES, MASHED FLAKE 41 $ 6153 |$ 252273|% 4120 |$  1,689.20
2E+06 6| #10 BRUCE POTATOES, NEW SLICED FANCY 1 $ 2569 | $ 2569 | $ 23.86 | $ 23.86
2E+06 6|2.25 LB |BASIC AMR POTATOES, SCALLOPED CASSEROL 2 $ 51311 % 102.62 | $ 4786 [ $ 95.72
4E+06| 88|10Z ROLD GOLD PRETZEL, TINY TWIST CLASSIC 9 $ 2691 | % 24219 | $ 28411 $ 255.69
SE+06 6|#10 GEHL'S PUDDING, BANANA 17 $ 25.03|$ 42551 [ $ 20.68 | $ 504.56
SE+06 6|#10 APPLE LF PUDDING, CHOCOLATE 6 $ 24731 $ 148.38 | $ 20.68 | $ 178.08
SE+06 6|#10 GEHL'S PUDDING, CHOCOLATE 11 $ 2473 1% 272.03 | $ 20.68 | $ 326.48
SE+06 6|#10 GEHL'S PUDDING, LEMON 5 $ 32741 % 163.70 | $ 31.871$ 159.35
SE+06 6|1 #10 GEHL'S PUDDING, VANILLA 20 $ 2473 1% 494.60 | $ 2898 | $ 579.60
OE+06| 48|3.50Z |SWISS MISS PUDDING, VANILLA R-T-S 4 $ 1662 | $ 66.48 | $ 17.06 | $ 68.24
9E+06[ 120[2 0z PENNANT PUFF DOUGH SQUARES 5"X5" 6 $ 4093 | $ 24558 | $ 43.89 | $ 263.34
2E+06 6|#10 SENECA PUMPKIN, FINEST FANCY 11 $ 4752 | $ 52272 | $ 40.33 [ $ 443.63
790626| 144|1.50Z |PACKER RAISINS, INDV PACK 6 $ 3487 1% 209.22 | $ 3014 | $ 180.84
790600| 24|150Z  |VALLEYPRID RAISINS, SEEDLESS 6 $ 4834 | $ 290.04 | $ 45.96 [ $ 275.76
3E+06 6|#10 CHEF BOY RAVIOLI, BEEF W MEAT SAUCE 16 $ 37351 % 597.60 | $ 34641 $ 554.24
3E+06 3|10CT _ [NATIONAL REG ROLL 3.13" THERM 7313SP 1 $ 47.09 | $ 47.09 | $ 4895 [ $ 48.95
SE+06 4|1 GAL _ |BEST MAID RELISH, DILL / 260 TBLSPN 1 $ 2552 1% 2552 1% 21.02 | $ 21.02
SE+06| 200|9 GM AMERICANA RELISH, SWEET 9GM 7 $ 1249 | $ 8743 1% 6.56 | $ 45.92
4E+06 6|36 02 |UNCLE BENS RICE PILAF ORIGINAL 8 $ 28551 % 22840 | $ 27.091$ 216.72
4E+06 1|50 LB FALCON RICE, LONG GRAIN 103 (15%) 62 $ 1784 |$ 1,106.08 | $ 20.25|$  1,255.50
4E+06 1|50 LB ADOLPHUS RICE, LONG GRAIN 4% (POLY) 54 $ 1784 | $ 963.36 | $ 20.85|$ 1,125.90
4E+06 1|25 LB FALCON RICE, LONG GRAIN 4% (POLY) 5 $ 10.28 | $ 5140 | $ 1167 | $ 58.35
4E+06 6|25.9 0z |UNCLE BENS RICE, MEXICAN FIESTA 12 $ 3201 |% 384.12 | $ 3012 | $ 361.44
1E+06] 24[200Z. |GATORADE RIPTIDE RUSH (WIDEMOUTH) 2 $ 2116 | $ 4232 | $ 2167 | $ 43.34
4E+06| 300|2CT NABISCO RITZ CRACKERS 13 $ 2713 1% 352.69 | $ 1651 | $ 214.63
9E+06 6|2LB HORMEL ROAST BEEF SLICED 3 $ 8135|% 244.05 | $ 66.65 | $ 199.95
1E+06| 24120z, |A&W ROOT BEER CANNED 6 $ 9.20($ 55.20 | $ 1064 | $ 63.84
BE+06 1|6 0Z DURKEE SAGE, RUBBED 1 $ 991 (3% 991 (3% 7.731% 7.73
3E+06 4|1 GAL. |KEN'S SALAD DRESSING 8 $ 2330 | $ 186.40 | $ 27171 $ 217.36
3E+06| 200|12GM__|PPI SALAD DRESSING, 12 GM 2 $ 14651 $ 2930 | $ 682|% 13.64
9E+06 2|5LB RESER'S SALAD, CHICKEN WHT&DRK 8 $ 3395 | % 27160 | $ 35221 % 281.76
9E+06 3|8LB RESER'S SALAD, ELBOW MACARONI 4 $ 3460 | $ 13840 | $ 3235|$ 129.40
9E+06 1|30LB RESER'S SALAD, POTATO HOMESTYLE 1 $ 4263 | $ 4263 | $ 39.78 | $ 39.78
9E+06 1|5.B RESER'S SALAD, SMOKED CHICKEN 3 $ 3395 | % 10185 | $ 1726 | $ 51.78
9E+06 2|5LB RESER'S SALAD, TUNA 5 $ 4571 | $ 22855 | $ 37.071$ 185.35
9E+06| 114|302z ADVANCE SALISBURY STEAK FC W/SOY CN 109 $ 8284 |% 9,02956|% 5316 [$ 5,794.44
36120 1|25# TRU FLO SALT EVAPORATED PLAIN 74 $ 492 1% 364.08 | $ 5.06 | $ 374.44
BE+06 1|3LB MORTON SALT, CARTONS KOSHER 1 $ 225($% 225(% 312 | $ 3.12
BE+06 13000 CT |DIAM CRYST SALT, PACKET 16 $ 785(% 125.60 | $ 6.36 | $ 101.76
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Webb County Purchasing Dept. Ben E. Keith Foods Labatt Food Service
Bid Tabulation c/o Mario Jimenz c/o Enrique Alvarado
Opened: October 16, 2014 5505 Kaepa Rd. 902 N. Expressway 77
San Antonio, TX 78218 Harlingen, TX 78550
210-661-7997 956-428-0722
RFP 2015-60 956-324-9268
Annual Contract for Food Commodities mejimenez@benekeith.com ealvarado@Iabattfood.com
Approved Approved
Item # [Pack |Size Label Description Estimated Qty] Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price
SE+06| 45|4.910Z |ADVANCE SANDWICH TKY/HAM/CHS IW 13 $ 2058 | $ 26754 | $ 4034 [ $ 524.42
52516 1|200CT _ |CHOLULA SAUCE HOT CHOLULA PORTION PA 89 $ 1012 | $ 900.68 | $ 11.26 | $  1,002.14
4E+06 6/160z.  |PIONEER SAUCE, ALFREDO (ADD WATER) 3 $ 7710 | $ 231.30 | $ 42.96 | $ 128.88
3E+06| 200{12GM |PPI SAUCE, BARBEQUE 12 GM 42 $ 1558 | $ 654.36 | $ 6.00 [ $ 252.00
3E+06 1|1 GA KEN'S SAUCE, BBQ CANNONBALL 3 $ 44,67 | $ 134.01 | $ 1197 | $ 35.91
7E+06 1|1 GAL __|FRANK'S SAUCE, BUFFALO WING $ 1012 | $ 1012 | $ 1497 1 $ 14.97
3E+06 6|#10 TRENTON SAUCE, CHEESE 05070 62 $ 3455|% 2,142101|% 3339 ($ 2,070.18
2E+06 6|#10 HUNTS SAUCE, CHILI 1 $ 26.17 | $ 2617 | $ 34321 $ 34.32
1E+07 6| #10 TIP TOP SAUCE, DLX SPAGHETT MARINARA 38 $ 3081|% 1,170.78|$ 24551 $ 932.90
3E+06 4|#10 HUNT'S SAUCE, MANWICH 4 $ 2466 | $ 98.64 | $ 22331 $ 89.32
3E+06 4|1 GAL _ |SAFARMS SAUCE, PICANTE MEDIUM 43 $ 3264 |% 1,40352|% 2633 |$ 1,132.19
3E+06 4|1 GAL _ |CAJUN CHEF SAUCE, RED HOT 1 $ 17731 $ 17731 $ 18.70 | $ 18.70
3E+06| 200|12GM ___|PPI SAUCE, TARTAR 12 GM 30 $ 14651 $ 439.50 | $ 853|% 255.90
2E+06 6|#10 REDPACK SAUCE, TOMATO 102 $ 1741 |$ 1775821 % 2154 |$ 2,197.08
4E+06 6|150Z |LAWRY'S SEASONING MIX, SLOPPY JOE 1 $ 24631 $ 2463 1% 2198 | $ 21.98
BE+06 1|21 0Z  |MRS DASH SEASONING, SALT FREE BULK 1 $ 1366 | $ 1366 | $ 15.03 | $ 15.03
8E+06 1|35LB. |RICELAND SHORTENING, CLEAR FRY 100 $ 2122 |$ 212200 | % 25.06 [$  2,506.00
8E+06 1/35LB BUNGE SHORTENING, LIQUID CLEAR ZTF 38 $ 2122 | $ 806.36 | $ 25.06 | $ 952.28
9E+06 1|5LB SCHREIBER SHRED MONTEREY JACK 4 $ 1859 | $ 7436 | $ 17.07 1 $ 68.28
9E+06 4|5LB SCHREIBER SHRED, CHEDDAR MILD FEATHER 31 $ 50.03|$ 1,829.93|% 6153 |$ 1,907.43
9E+06 4|5LB SCHREIBER SHRED, MONTEREY JACK FTHR* 2 $ 59.03 | $ 118.06 | $ 62.26 | $ 124.52
9E+06 6|5LB LANDOLAKES | SLICED AMERICAN WHITE 160CT 16 $ 95.73|$ 153168|% 86.13 [$  1,378.08
9E+06 1|5LB LANDOLAKE SLICED, AMERICAN PROCESS 120 206 $ 1596 |$ 3,287.76 | $ 1596 | $  3,287.76
9E+06 8|1.5LB |SCHREIBER SLICED, CHEDDAR .750Z 32CT* 1 $ 3677 1% 3677 1% 4426 [ $ 44.26
9E+06 6|5LB LANDOLAKE SLICED, PROC AMER 160 RIBBON 85 $ 7873|% 6,692.05|% 88.04 [$  7,483.40
9E+06 1/48CT _ |MAR'S SNICKER'S SINGLES 9 $ 34051 % 30645 | $ 32231 $ 290.07
1E+06| 24200z  |BIG RED SODA, BIG RED BOTTLES 1 $ 2180 | $ 2180 | $ 23321 $ 23.32
1E+06| 24[200Z  |SUNKIST SODA, SUNKIST BOTTLES 1 $ 2180 | $ 2180 | $ 23321 % 23.32
2E+06| 12[49.25 OZ |HEINZ SOUP, CREAM OF CHICKEN 5 $ 4314 | $ 21570 | $ 3576 | $ 178.80
4E+06| 100|1 0Z DAISY SOUR CREAM, 100% PURE POUCH 7 $ 11.76 | $ 8232 1% 12381 $ 86.66
4E+06 1|20 LB |0.B. MAC. SPAGHETTI, LONG 20" 6 $ 19831 $ 118.98 | $ 13551 % 81.30
1E+07 4|2.5LB  |SPINACH SPINACH CLEAN/TRIM FLAT LEAF 1 $ 17791 $ 17791 $ 16.68 | $ 16.68
9E+06 1/20 LB CLASSIC SPINACH, CHOPPED IQF 3 $ 36.74 | $ 11022 | $ 2312 | $ 69.36
SE+06 1|6 LB AZAR NUT SPRINKLES, RAINBOW 2 $ 1578 | $ 3156 | $ 1297 1% 25.93
1E+06| 24|200Z  |SPRITE SPRITE 2 $ 28.08 | $ 56.16 | $ 26.35|$ 52.70
1E+06| 24120z |SPRITE SPRITE CANNED 13 $ 1201 | $ 156.13 | $ 11341 $ 147.42
1E+06| 24|200Z  |SPRITE SPRITE ZERO 1 $ 28.08 | $ 28.08 | $ 26.35|$ 26.35
1E+06| 24120z |SPRITE SPRITE ZERO CANNED 4 $ 1201 | $ 48.04 | $ 11341 $ 45.36
9E+06| 168|10Z AMER HERIT STRING CHEESE MOZZARELLA /W 81 $ 46.38|$ 3,756.78 | $ 538|% 435.78
4E+06 6/3.5LB |UNCLE BENS STUFFING MIX, CORNBREAD 6 $ 61.03 | $ 366.18 | $ 65.52 | $ 393.12
9E+06 2|1250 CT_|IMPERIAL SUGAR SUB, PINK 30 $ 14721 $ 441.60 | $ 15151 $ 454.50
9E+06 1|50 LB PACKER SUGAR, EFG 4 $ 2401 | $ 96.04 | $ 2635 $ 105.40
9E+06 8|5 LB. IMPERIAL SUGAR, GRANULATED 1 $ 2571 1% 2571 1% 27191 $ 27.19
9E+06 1|50 LB.  |IMPERIAL SUGAR, GRANULATED EFG $ 26721 % 160.32 | $ 2491 | $ 149.46
9E+06 1|25LB. |IMPERIAL SUGAR, GRANULATED EFG 2 $ 1513 | $ 3026 | $ 15731 $ 31.46
9E+06 1|50LB  |WALRUS SUGAR, GRANULATED FINE 21 $ 2410 | $ 506.10 | $ 26.35|$ 553.35
9E+06| 12|2LB PACKER SUGAR, LIGHT BROWN 5 $ 2522 1% 126.10 | $ 25151 $ 125.75
9E+06) 2000|1 CT LABATT SUGAR,LABATT PACKETS 1/10 0Z 180 $ 14711$ 2,64780|% 12.83 |$  2,309.40
9E+06 6/2.5 LB |HARVEST SP SWEET POTATO BITES 3 $ 2881 | % 8643 | % 21.09 | $ 63.27
9E+06 12000 CT _|SWT-N-LOW SWEETENER INDIVIDUAL PACKET 44 $ 2769|% 121836|% 15151 $ 666.60
9E+06| 100|1 0Z CARY'S SYRUP CUP, SUGAR FREE 12 $ 15471 $ 185.64 | $ 1586 | $ 190.32
SE+06| 100|1 0z MAD FARMS SYRUP POUCH 313 $ 2006 |$ 6,27878 | % 7341$%  2,297.42
SE+06| 100|1.50Z |POCO PAC SYRUP, PANCAKE POUCH 16 $ 1026 | $ 164.16 | $ 812 | $ 129.92
SE+06| 100|102z BOCA GRAND SYRUP, PANCAKE POUCH 484 $ 1026 |$ 496584 1% 7341% 3,552.56
SE+06| 100|102z SMUCKER'S SYRUP, SUGAR FREE 47 $ 15471 $ 727.09 | $ 1586 | $ 745.42
3E+06 8|25CT _ |MISSION TACO SHELL YELLOW CORN 117 $ 1266 |$ 1,481.22|% 1254 |$  1,467.18
9E+06| 120|2 0Z RODRIGUEZ TAMALES, BEEF CN HEAT N SERV 23 $ 3164 | $ 72772 | $ 3450 | $ 793.50
9E+06| 120|1.50Z |RODRIGUEZ TAMALES, PORK REG 4 $ 3164 | $ 126.56 | $ 28.70 | $ 114.80
9E+06 6|5LB SIMPLOT TATER GEMS, ZGTF OVN 154 $ 3245|% 4997301 % 19.80 | $  3,049.20
11423 1{10LB  |TYSON RL TENDERLOIN FRITTER HMSTYL 1 $ 1959 | $ 1959 | $ 2210 | $ 22.10
2E+06 6|#10 RANCH STYL TEXAS STYLE PINTO BEANS 22 $ 28.01|%$ 616.22 | $ 30.02 | $ 660.44
9E+06| 96490z |TYSON THIGH, IQF MEDIUM 10 $ 54.55 | $ 545,50 | $ 3793 | $ 379.30
4E+06 1|20LB  |OBMAC THIN SPAGHETTI 4 $ 1888 | $ 7552 1% 1643 | $ 65.72
2E+06 6|#10 CASAFIESTA | TOMATILLOS, CRUSHED176085410 8 $ 3012 | $ 240.96 | $ 4111 ( $ 328.88
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Webb County Purchasing Dept. Ben E. Keith Foods Labatt Food Service
Bid Tabulation c/o Mario Jimenz c/o Enrique Alvarado
Opened: October 16, 2014 5505 Kaepa Rd. 902 N. Expressway 77
San Antonio, TX 78218 Harlingen, TX 78550
210-661-7997 956-428-0722
RFP 2015-60 956-324-9268
Annual Contract for Food Commodities mejimenez@benekeith.com ealvarado@Iabattfood.com
Approved Approved
Item # [Pack |Size Label Description Estimated Qty] Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price
1E+07 6| #10 TIP TOP TOMATOES, CRUSHED 1 $ 2416 | $ 2416 | $ 22621 $ 22.62
1E+07 6| #10 TIP TOP TOMATOES, DICED 7 $ 21341 $ 149.38 | $ 2112 | $ 147.84
1E+07 6| #10 TIP TOP TOMATOES, WHOLE PEELED 16 $ 1657 | $ 265.12 | $ 2082 $ 333.12
3E+06 6|2 LB MISSION TORTILLA CHIP YELLOW RND WG 4 $ 1448 | $ 5792 1% 1751 1% 70.04
9E+06 6|12Dz  |RUDYS TORTILLA CORN YELLOW 6" WG $ 23551 % 23551 % 1953 | $ 19.53
3E+06] 12|24CT  |RUDY'S TORTILLA FLOUR 6" RAW 3 $ 22171 $ 6651 | $ 20.06 | $ 60.18
9E+06| 12|24CT _ |RUDYS TORTILLA FLOUR 6" WG 50 $ 2217 1$ 1,10850 | $ 2369 [$  1,184.50
4E+06| 72|20Z PLANTERS TRAIL MIX, FRUIT & NUT 4 $ 39.66 | $ 158.64 | $ 33.65|$ 134.60
SE+06| 12|1LB JENNIE-O TRKY COMBO PACK BOL,SAL,HAM 8 $ 32931 % 26344 | $ 3594 1| $ 287.52
566860 6|#10 EMPRESS TROPICAL FRUIT SALAD 37 $ 4198 |$ 155326 |$ 33.00[$ 1,221.00
3E+06 6|66.5 0z |EMPRESS TUNA, CHUNK LIGHT IN WATER 21 $ 6650 |$ 139650 | % 5288 |$ 1,110.48
9E+06 1|36 CT _ |M&M MARS TWIX CARAM COOKIE BAR 1.790Z 9 $ 2553 1% 229.77 | $ 24.48 | $ 220.32
4E+06 1|10LB. |KEEBLER VANILLA WAFERS BULK 40 $ 1192 | $ 476.80 | $ 2149 1| $ 859.60
2E+06 6]#10 STOKELY VEGETABLES, MIXED (FANCY) 136 $ 2777 |$ 377672 | $ 29.35|$  3,991.60
OE+06| 144|.80Z. |AUNT JMIMA WAFFLE, ORIGINAL 4 $ 1407 | $ 56.28 | $ 1381 | $ 55.24
9E+06| 12|12 CT |MRSBUTTER WAFFLES, REGULAR SQUARES 344 $ 1407 | $ 4,840.08 | $ 13.02 |$  4,478.88
1E+06| 24[16.90Z |NESTLE PUR WATER, PURIFIED #101264 99 $ 384 (3% 380.16 | $ 579 1% 573.21
1E+06| 24[16.90Z |0ZARKA WATER, SPRING PLASTIC BOTTLE 16 $ 384($% 6144 1% 829 |% 132.64
4E+06 1|1 GAL. _|DIAM CRYST WORCESTERSHIRE SAUCE 4 $ 4101 $ 1640 | $ 917 1% 36.68
2E+06 6|#10 BRUCE YAMS, WHOLE 20-30CT, FANCY 7 $ 3547 1% 24829 | $ 35.071$ 245.49
8E+06| 48|40z TRIX YOGURT, RASPBERRY RAINBOW 13 $ 17341 $ 22542 | $ 1329 | $ 172.77
8E+06| 48|40z TRIX YOGURT, STRAWBERRY/BANANA 14 $ 17341 $ 24276 | $ 1329 | $ 186.06
8E+06| 48|40z YOPLAIT YOGURT, STRWBY/STRWBY BANANA 33 $ 17341 $ 57222 | $ 17141 $ 565.62
2E+06 6|#10 REDPACK ZUCCHINI AND TOMATOES 3 $ 336719 101.01 | $ 30.65|$ 91.95
9E+06| 12|2LB CLASSIC ZUCCHINI, SLICED C/C $ 2387 1% 4774 | $ 2558 | $ 51.16
GRAND TOTAL $ 540,342.38 $ 454,363.29
NO BIDS - REMOVED FROM TALLY
90035|  6|#10 LUCKY LF* APPLE SAUCE, GRADE Aktkees 2 no bid $ 2735 $ 54.70
SE+06]  1|30LB _ |DANKWORTH BACON 14/16 LIL BUTCHER 2 no bid $ 3241 % 6.48
6E+06 6|5 LB. DIAM CRYST BAKING POWDER 1 no bid $ 39.62 | $ 39.62
2E+06 4[79LB  [KNORR BASE, CALDO DE POLLO CHKN 2 no bid $ 65.55 | $ 131.10
6E+06| 84[4.40z |SIDEKICKS BLUE RASPBERRY- LEMON 100% 32 no bid $ 3052 [ $ 976.64
9E+06|  8|180Z |ROTELLA'S BREAD,WHEATY WHEAT SLICED 1 no bid $ 19.00 | $ 19.00
4E+06| 210|102 KEEBLER BUG BITES CINN GRAHAMS WG 22 no bid $ 4161 | $ 915.42
OE+06| 168|102z ULTRA BUN, SLIDER ROLL, SLICED, WG 1 no bid $ 29.071$ 29.07
9E+06| 96|5.20Z |LOS CABOS BURRITO BEAN/CHEESE WG IW 41 no bid $ 56.57 [$ 2,319.37
OE+06| 48|520z [LOS CABOS BURRITOS, Bean/Cheese WG BLK 12 no bid $ 27411 $ 328.92
9E+06 1|36 CT _ |NESTLE CANDY, BUTTERFINGER 3 $ 2524 1 $ 75.72 | no bid
4E+06| 72|30Z DAVE'S CARROT BREAKFAST BUN, WG IW 59 no bid $ 2575[$ 1519.25
1E+07| 50{20Z 0z |CARROT CARROTEENIES IW 50CT/20Z 4 no bid $ 10.26 | $ 41.04
9E+06 1|20 LB CLASSIC CARROTS, SLICED C/C 0 no bid $ 13.18 | $ o
OE+06| 12|2LB CLASSIC CARROTS, SLICED POLY BAG 4 $ 1829 | $ 73.16 | no bid
6E+06 4[28 0z [RALSTON CEREAL, TASTEEOS 0 no bid $ 1767 1% o
4E+06| 64|20z FRITOS CHIPS CORN REGULAR BG 4 no bid $ 29931 $ 119.72
4E+06| 64|20z CHEETOS CHIPS HOT LIMON CRUNCHY 1 no bid no bid
4E+06| 104|102z LAYS CHIPS SOUR CREAM & ONION 1 no bid $ 33.80 | $ 33.80
1E+06| 42|20z DOUWE EGB COFFEE, DECAF House Blend 2 no bid $ 33321 % 66.64
SE+06| 72|20z OTIS SPUNK COOKIE WT CHK MACAD NUT IW 4 no bid $ 25.67 [ $ 102.68
4E+06| 60|20z FAMOUSAMOS COOKIES CHOCOLATE CHIP 5 no bid $ 2221 ($ 111.05
4E+06| 48[2.00z [NABISCO COOKIES, OREO COOKIE SS 1 no bid $ 17241 $ 17.24
4E+06] 45[2.20Z |DAVE'S CRUMB SQUARE, WG IW 1 no bid $ 16.77 | $ 16.77
3E+06| 100|1.50Z |TAST PLEAS DRESSING, BMLK RANCH 1.5 OZ 1 no bid $ 1461 | $ 14.61
3E+06| 100[1 0z KRAFT DRESSING,HONEY DIJON CUP 1 no bid $ 1857 | $ 18.57
9E+06| 112|2.50 0Z |FERNANDOS ENCHILADA BEEF, WG, CN 11 no bid $ 3882 ($ 427.02
9E+06| 112|2.350Z |FERNANDOS ENCHILADA CHEESE, WG CN 18 no bid $ 3911 ($ 703.98
9E+06| 112|250z |FERNANDOS ENCHILADA CHICKEN, WG, CN 19 no bid $ 3939 [ $ 748.41
6E+06 1|16 0Z  |UNISTEL GARLIC POWDER 1 no bid $ 7.09 1% 7.09
6E+06 1|55LB |TRADERS CH GARLIC, GRANULATED 8 no bid $ 27.08 | $ 216.64
1E+06| 24[120Z  |FANTA GRAPE SODA 5 no bid $ 11341 $ 56.70
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RFP 2015-60
Annual Contract for Food Commodities

Webb County Purchasing Dept.
Bid Tabulation
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Ben E. Keith Foods
c/o Mario Jimenz
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San Antonio, TX 78218
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Approved Approved

Item # [Pack |Size Label Description Estimated Qty] Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price
4E+06 1|25LB  |KARP'S ICING, VANILLA BUTTER CREME 2 no bid $ 4165 $ 83.30
2E+06 1|#10 FARO JALAPENOS, NACHO SLICED 1 no bid $ 583|% 5.83
2E+06 1| #10 Locamadre JALAPENOS, NACHO SLICED 4 no bid $ 543 1% 21.72
OE+06| 40|4.230Z |APPLE &EVE JUICE APPLE JUICE 100% 1 no bid $ 883|% 8.83

807016 48[5.50Z. |LUCKY LEAF JUICE, APPLE WNIT C 2 no bid $ 22691 $ 45.38
OE+06| 40|4.230Z |APPLE &EVE JUICE, FRUIT PUNCH 100% 2 no bid $ 883|% 17.66
1E+07 1|1/2 GAL _|NAT BRANDS JUICE, LIME FRESH 4 no bid $ 784 1% 31.36
4E+06| 96[4 Oz TRUE BREW JUICE, ORANGE 100% 2 no bid $ 1964 | $ 39.28
OE+06| 40|4.230Z |APPLE &EVE JUICE, ORANGE TANGERINE 100% 1 no bid $ 883|% 8.83
1E+06| 48|6 OZ. DOLE JUICE, PINEAPPLE, UNSWEET 0 no bid $ 18451 % o
OE+06| 40|4.230Z |APPLE &EVE JUICE, WHITE GRAPE 100% 1 no bid $ 885|% 8.85
SE+06| 48|3.25 OZ [SNACK PACK JUICY GELS, STRAW/ORANGE SF 7 no bid no bid
3E+06 110 HUNT'S KETCHUP, FANCY 33% SOLID 1 no bid $ 5.05|$% 5.05
9E+06| 90|20z SUPER BAKE LOAF BLUEBERRY MINI 29 no bid $ 29551 $ 856.95
9E+06 4[5LB RESER'S MAC AND CHEESE BOIL N BAG 7 no bid $ 32831 $ 229.81
9E+06 4/6 LB. CAMPBELL MACARONI & CHEESE 1 no bid $ 290.271$ 29.27
3E+06 1|1 GAL. |KEN'S MAYONNAISE, HEAVY DUTY 1 no bid $ 984 1% 9.84
8E+06| 50[|HP BORDEN MILK, 1% HOMOGENIZED 8 no bid $ 16.03 | $ 128.24
8E+06| 50[|HP BORDEN MILK, HOMO 2% HALF PINTS 52 no bid $ 16.56 | $ 861.12
4E+06| 72|20Z oTIS MUFFINS, BLUEBERRY, IW WG 1 no bid $ 29.26 | $ 29.26
4E+06| 144|1.24 0Z |BETTY CRKR OATMEAL BARS CHOC CHIP WG 9 no bid $ 4094 [ $ 368.46
4E+06 6/16 0Z |GERBER OATMEAL CEREAL 1 no bid $ 22701 $ 22.70
OE+06| 48|3.50Z |SUNNY FRSH OMELET, CHEDDAR CHEESE 3 no bid $ 4228 [ $ 126.84
60301| 70|40z SUNCUP ORANGE JUICE CARTON 100% 10 no bid $ 1247 1% 124.70
1E+06| 24|120Z  |FANTA ORANGE SODA 2 no bid $ 11341 $ 22.68
1E+06| 24|120Z |FANTA ORANGE SODA Zero 3 no bid $ 11341 $ 34.02
9E+06| 72|3.030Z |EGGO PANCAKES MINI BLUEBERRY WG 15 no bid $ 28621 $ 429.30
OE+06| 288|.60Z  |AUNT JMIMA PANCAKES SILVER DOLLAR WG 18 no bid $ 23411 $ 421.38
4E+06| 144|207 PLANTERS PEANUTS, LIGHTLY SALTED 2 no bid $ 4217 $ 84.34
2E+06 6|#10 STOKELY PEAS, FANCY EARLY 4 SV 2 no bid $ 28.14 1| $ 56.28
OE+06| 96/4.68 0Z [THE MAX PIZZA TKY PEPP 4X6 LS WG 2 no bid $ 48.66 [ $ 97.32
OE+06| 96/4.650Z [NARDONES PIZZA, PEPP 4X6 WG 9 no bid $ 49.76 [ $ 447.84
9E+06 1|36 CT  |HERSHEY PLAIN CHOC CANDY BAR 1.55 0Z 4 no bid $ 2401 | $ 96.04
9E+06 1|5 LB RW |SUPREMO QUESO FRESCO 1 no bid $ 487 | $ 4.87
SE+06| 100[1.50z [POCO PAC RANCH DRESSING 4 no bid $ 7831% 31.32
9E+06 6|8 0z GERBER RICE CEREAL 1 no bid $ 1313 | $ 13.13
1E+07|  4[20CT  |KELLOGGS RICE KRISPIES SQUARE 1.30Z 19 no bid $ 33221 $ 631.18
9E+06|  3|8LB RESER'S SALAD, POTATO DICED MUSTARD 4 no bid $ 3235|$ 129.40
9E+06| 12|6.200Z |PIERRE SANDWICH PHILLY CHEESESTEAK 2 no bid $ 2249 | $ 44.98
9E+06| 12|50Z BRIDGFORD SANDWICH, HAM & CHEESE 1 no bid no bid
3E+06|  4|1GAL |LITTLEPIG SAUCE, BARBEQUE 608040110 15 no bid $ 17.01 | $ 255.15
3E+06 4|1 GAL |GARDENCLUB SAUCE, BBQ SMOKY 1 no bid $ 1701 | $ 17.01
4E+06 6|#10 CASAFIESTA SAUCE, ENCHILADA 1 no bid $ 290.01|$ 29.01
3E+06 1|1 GL LOUISIANA SAUCE, HOT WING 1 no bid $ 9.76 | $ 9.76
2E+06 4[85LB  [LA PATRONA SAUCE, RANCHERO 1 no bid $ 4752 [ $ 47.52
3E+06| 12|50Z MCILHENNY SAUCE, TABASCO HOT 2 no bid $ 3422 | $ 68.44
3E+06 1|1 GAL. |KEN'S SAUCE, TARTAR 1 no bid $ 10351 $ 10.35
3E+06| 200[{9 GM AMERICANA SAUCE, TARTAR 9GM 2 no bid $ 7211% 14.42
6E+06 1|25 LB DURKEE SEASONING SALT 4 no bid $ 33.09 | $ 132.36
6E+06 1|370Z  |DURKEE SEASONING SALT 1 no bid $ 6.07 % 6.07
1E+06| 24|120Z  |SEVEN UP SEVEN UP CANNED 4 no bid $ 1065 | $ 42.60
9E+06 1|5LB SCHREIBER SHRED, CHEDDAR MILD FEATHER 5 no bid $ 1688 | $ 84.40
1E+07| 100|2 0Z APPLE SLC RD APPLE IW 100/2 0Z 1 no bid $ 3072 | $ 30.72
OE+06]  8|1.5LB |LANDOLAKE SLICED MONTEREY JACK INTERL 1 no bid $ 46.18 [ $ 46.18
1E+07| 100|2 0Z APPLE SLICED RED APPLE IW 1/2 CUP 0 no bid $ 3072 | $ o
15116 1|5# SCHREIBER SLICED, SWISS 120 CT 2 no bid $ 1576 | $ 31.52
9E+06 1|5LB LANDOLAKE SLICED, SWISS PROCESS 160CT 1 no bid $ 1576 | $ 15.76
OE+06| 12|320Z  [SWT THINGS SWEET POTATO, MASHED 3 no bid $ 4022 [ $ 120.66
17115 24|230Z _ |ARIZONA TEA MUCHO MANGO 3 no bid $ 1999 | $ 59.97
1E+06| 24|120Z  |TRUE BREW TEA, BLACK SWEET LO CAL 6 no bid $ 1661 | $ 99.66
8E+06| 12|160Z  |SWEET LEAF TEA, RASPBERRY SWEET GLASS 5 no bid $ 1226 | $ 61.30
1E+07 6| #10 TIP TOP TOMATO, SAUCE 1 no bid $ 21571$ 21.57
9E+06 8[12CcT  [RUDYS TORTILLA FLOUR PRESS 12" 2 no bid $ 1583 | $ 31.66
9E+06| 12|24CT _ [RUDYS TORTILLA FLOUR PRESS 6" 1 no bid $ 18431 $ 18.43
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Webb County Purchasing Dept. Ben E. Keith Foods Labatt Food Service
Bid Tabulation c/o Mario Jimenz c/o Enrique Alvarado
Opened: October 16, 2014 5505 Kaepa Rd. 902 N. Expressway 77
San Antonio, TX 78218 Harlingen, TX 78550
210-661-7997 956-428-0722
RFP 2015-60 956-324-9268
Annual Contract for Food Commodities mejimenez@benekeith.com ealvarado@Iabattfood.com
Approved Approved
Item # [Pack |Size Label Description Estimated Qty] Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price
9E+06 1|24CT__ |RUDYS TORTILLA FLOUR PRESS 6" 15 no bid $ 269 |%$ 40.35
4E+06 1|50 LB PIONEER TORTILLA MIX, CORN 1 no bid $ 27.16 | $ 27.16
9E+06]  1|10LB  |CLRSPRING | TROUT RAINBOW MELTS WG 3.60Z 14 $ 7750 | $ 1,085.00 | no bid
2E+06 6[#10 STOKELY VEGETABLES, STEW (FANCY) 1 no bid $ 27.06 | $ 27.06
1E+06| 24[200z  |NESTLE WATER PURIFIED PURE LIFE 14 no bid $ 825|% 115.50
1E+06 6|1 GAL _ |NATURA WATER, DISTILLED 15 no bid $ 1026 | $ 153.90
1E+06| 48|8 OZ. OZARKA WATER, SPRING HALF PINT 37 no bid $ 1279 | $ 473.23
Packaging Differences
4E+06| 150|1 0z KEEBLER ANIMAL CRACKERS WG 10 $ 1320 | $ 132.00 | $ 26.09 | $ 260.90
2E+06 1|44LB __ |KNORR BASE, CALDO DE POLLO 1 $ 5135| % 5135|% 1289 | $ 12.89
2E+06 1|44LB _ |KNORR BASE, CALDO DE TOMATE 1 $ 5135|%$ 5135| % 1084 | $ 10.84
9E+06 1|25LB  |CUSTOM FDS | BASE, CHICKEN FLAVR GRANULES 14 $ 29.06 | $ 406.84 | $ 104.70 | $  1,465.80
2E+06| 12|1LB LEGOUT BASE, CHICKEN MEAT 1ST 1 $ 11.74 | $ 11.74 | $ 4861 [ $ 48.61
2E+06 1|1LB FRANK COLN BASE, CHICKEN NO MSG $ 9.66 [ $ 9.66 [ $ 512 | $ 5.12
2E+06 6/300z [COOKQUIK BEANS, REFRIED INST SMOOTH 9 $ 28.24 | $ 254.16 | $ 18.27 | $ 164.43
SE+06 8|2.25LB [DSM BEEF FOR FAJITA TNT STND PK 2 $ 9160 | $ 183.20 | $ 4451 $ 8.90
9E+06| 10[240zZ |EUROPEAN BREAD, PULLMAN WHITE (28 SL) 10 $ 9.26 | $ 92.60 | $ 2952 | $ 295.20
3E+06| 12|49.50Z |SWANSON BROTH, BEEF 13 $ 4898 | $ 636.74 | $ 29.79 1 $ 387.27
3E+06| 12|490Z  |SWANSON BROTH, CHICKEN NO MSG 2 $ 2820 | $ 56.40 | $ 30.18 | $ 60.36
OE+06| 288|1.20Z |BAKECRAFTE BUN SLIDER WG SL 2.5" $ 25151 % 25151 % 44.02 [ $ 44.02
6E+06 1|25 LB FIESTA PEPPER, BLACK GR. #32(TABLE) $ 266.67 | $ 533.34 | $ 206.52 | $ 413.04
9E+06 4[5LB JAIMITO CHEESE, QUESO FRESCO LOAF 2 $ 8140 | $ 162.80 | $ 5.08 [ $ 10.16
3E+06 6|#10 STAGG CHILI W/BEANS 47 $ 6207 |$ 291729 |% 49.96 | $  2,348.12
9E+06| 30|70z FERNANDOS CHIMICHANGA SHREDDED BEEF 4 $ 5413 | $ 21652 | $ 3855|$ 154.20
1E+07 1|320Z  |BLUE DIAMO MILK, ALMOND 16 $ 29471 $ 47152 [ $ 344 1% 55.04
2E+06 1|22LB  |ROGELIO MOLE 2 $ 10047 | $ 200.94 | $ 4887 [ $ 97.74
9E+06| 114|302z ADVANCE SALISBURY STEAK FC W/SOY CN 109 $ 8284 |% 9,02956|% 5316 [$ 5,794.44
4E+06| 12|50Z HEINZ WORCESTERSHIRE SAUCE 2 $ 36.86 | $ 7372 1% 1085 | $ 21.70
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