COUNTY OF WEBB

Purchasing Department

BID TABULATION

Bid Number: 2016-11

Triumph Mechanical Inc.

Bid For: Annual Contract for CEAP

c/o Ricardo Garza

Heating and Cooling Service Provider

1717 E. Plum |

Laredo, TX 78043

triumphmechanical@

956-285-5984

Dyahoo.com

item UNIT OF UNIT Labor Total
MEASURE PRICE PRICE
CRISIS WINDOW UNITS
Window AC unit 6,000 BTU $600.00 $300.00 $900.00
110 Volt. Enerav Star Rated
EER=10 and COP 3.11
Window AC unit 8,000 BTU $650.00 $300.00 $950.00
110 Volt, Energy Star Rated
EER=10 and COP 3.11
Window AC unit 10,000 BTU $850.00 $350.00 $1,200.00
110 Volt, Energy Star Rated
EER=10 and COP 3.11
Window AC unit 12,000 BTU $950.00 $350.00 $1,300.00
110 Volt, Energy Star Rated
EER=10 and COP 3.11
Window AC unit 15,000 BTU $1,115.00 $400.00 $1,515.00
110 Volt, Energy Star Rated
EER=10 and COP 3.11
Total $4,165.00 $1,700.00 5,865.00
CENTRAL COMPONENTS
2 ton condenser $1,200.00 $425.00 $1,625.00
2.5 ton condenser $1,300.00 $450.00 $1,750.00
3 ton condenser $1,450.00 $500.00 $1,950.00
3.5 ton condenser $1,525.00 $500.00 $2,025.00
4 ton condenser $1,600.00 $525.00 $2,125.00
5 ton condenser $1,775.00 $600.00 $2,375.00
2 ton evaporative coil $500.00 $375.00 $875.00
2.5 ton evaporative coil $545.00 $375.00 $925.00
3 ton evaporative coil $650.00 $525.00 $1,175.00
3.5 ton evaporative coil $650.00 $525.00 $1,175.00
4 ton evaporative coil $675.00 $525.00 $1,200.00
5 ton evaporative coil $750.00 $600.00 $1,350.00
2 ton Air Handler $650.00 $800.00 $1,450.00
2.5 ton Air Handler $690.00 $800.00 $1,490.00
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MEASURE PRICE PRICE
3 ton Air Handler $950.00 $800.00 $1,750.00
3.5 ton Air Handler $1,250.00 $850.00 $2,050.00
4 ton Air Handler $1,375.00 $950.00 $2,325.00
5 ton Air Handler $1,490.00 $1,100.00 $2,595.00
45,000 BTU Furnace $1,250.00 $1,800.00 $2,050.00
70,000 BTU Furnace $2,200.00 $2,000.00 $4,200.00
90,000 BTU Furnace $3,300.00 $2,800.00 $6,100.00
110,000 BTU Furnace $4,500.00 $3,300.00 $7,800.00
Central Thermostat $60.00 $125.00 $185.00
Return air grill and new filter $85.00 $150.00 $235.00
Electrical Whip/Disconnect $40.00 $150.00 $190.00
Drip pan for Central System $100.00 $225.00 $325.00
Replace 5 inch flex duct (per foot) (25 ft) $40.00 $225.00 $270.00
Replace 6 inch flex duct (per foot) (25 ft) $45.00 $225.00 $270.00
Replace 7 inch flex duct (per foot) (25 ft) $50.00 $225.00 $275.00
Replace 8 inch flex duct (per foot)(25 ft) $65.00 $300.00 $365.00
Replace 10 inch flex duct (per foot) (25 ft) $75.00 $350.00 $425.00
Replace 12 inch flex duct (per foot) (25 ft) $100.00 $400.00 $500.00
¥ Copper Line (LF) $100.00 $375.00 $475.00
718 Copper Line (LF) $200.00 $425.00 $625.00
1- 1/18 Copper Line (LF) $225.00 $425.00 $650.00
Copper Cover $275.00 $400.00 $675.00
Condenser Pad $60.00 $425.00 $485.00
Thermostat for Heat Pump $200.00 $200.00 $400.00
Contactors $75.00 $100.00 $175.00
Capacitors $60.00 $100.00 $160.00
Hard Start Kit $75.00 $100.00 $175.00
Control Board HVAC system $175.00 $150.00 $325.00
Total $32,380.00 $26,200.00 $57,545.00
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CEAP HVAC and Appliance Labor Rates, do not include Parts
Central Unit AC repair (Labor Only) Includes cleaning $275.00
Central Furnace/Air handler Repair (Labor Only) Includes cleaning $325.00
Window AC Repair (Labor Only, No Parts) $175.00
Includes cleaning
$20.00
HVAC assistant Labor Rate. P.HR
Crisis AC installation Labor Rate $110.00
P.HR
Electric Space Heater Rate $75.00
P.HR
Total $980.00
CEAP Portable Electric Space Heaters
Portable QOil no bid no bid
Electric Space Heater
Convective Energy Saving no bid no bid
Portable Electric Heaters
Portable Metal Space Heaters no bid no bid
Total $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Section | $65.00 p.hr
Crisis A/ICs
Section II. $65.00 p.hr
Central Components
Section Il1. 65.00-100.00 (p.hr
Labor Rates
Section IV. $65.00 p.hr

Electric Space Heater
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