Webb County Purchasing Department
Bid Tabulation

RFP 2017-63
Annual Contract for Produce

Contract Term: August 23, 2016- September 30, 2017
If extended expires: September 30, 2018

Ben E. Kieth

c/o Mario Jimenez

5505 Kaepa Rd.

San Anotnio, TX 78218
210-661-7997
mejimenez@benekeith.com

R.C. Food Service & Produce
c/o Alma Cavazos

305 Market St.

Laredo, TX 78040
956-796-999

almacavazos77@yahoo.com

Westside Produce
c/o Jose Gamez
5811 E. Saunders
Laredo, TX 78045
956-753-8700

pepe westsideproduce@yahoo.com

Incomplete Bid secondary Primary
Category Description Brand Pkg Size Quantity Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price  |Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price
1f1- APPLE RED DL XF WSH PACKER 1/40LB 7 $ 35.87| $ 251.09
PRODUCE |64 CT $14.00 $98.00 $18.00 $126.00
2|1- APPLE RED DL XF WSH PACKER 1/72CT 2 no bid
PRODUCE |72 CT $20.00 $40.00 $18.00 $36.00
3[1- APPLE RED DL XF WSH MARKON 1/40LB 69 $ 3459| $ 2,386.71
PRODUCE |88 CT $21.00 $1,449.00 $25.00 $1,725.00
411 - APPLE RED DL FCY WSH [MARKON 1/40LB 2 $ 32.09( $ 64.18
PRODUCE  |113CT $24.00 $48.00 $18.00 $36.00
1- APPLE RED DL FCY WSH |MARKON 1/40LB 17 $ 33.27| $ 565.59
PRODUCE  |125 CT $25.00 $425.00 $18.00 $306.00
6[1- APPLE RED DL FCY WSH [MARKON 1/40LB 86 $ 33.37| $ 2,869.82
PRODUCE  |138 CT $25.00 $2,150.00 $21.00 $1,806.00
7(1- APPLE RED DL FCY 138  |PACKER 1/138CT 282 no bid
PRODUCE  |cT $25.00 $7,050.00 $25.00 $7,050.00
8|1- APPLE RED DL XF PACKER 1/51B 5 $ 10.69| $ 53.45
PRODUCE $3.00 $15.00 $3.00 $15.00
91 - APPLE GOLD DL XF WSH |MARKON 1/40LB 13 $ 40.87 | $ 531.31
PRODUCE |88 CT $26.00 $338.00 $25.00 $325.00
10]1- APPLE GRANNY SMITH PACKER 1/12CT 3 no bid
PRODUCE $3.00 $9.00 $2.00 $6.00
111 - APPLE GRANNY SMTH PACKER 1/72CT 1 no bid
PRODUCE  |FCY 72 T $24.00 $24.00 $22.00 $22.00
12]1- APPLE GRANNY SMTH MARKON 1/88CT 8 no bid
PRODUCE  |Fcy 88 cT $28.00 $224.00 $25.00 $200.00
131 - APPLE GRANNY SMTH PACKER 1/ 40#TR 15 no bid
PRODUCE  |FCY 100 CT PK $24.00 $360.00 $21.00 $315.00
141 - APPLE GRANNY SMTH PACKER 1/125CT 34 no bid
PRODUCE  |FCY 125 €T $30.00 $1,020.00 $31.00 $1,054.00
151 - APPLE SLICES RED USA  |SUN RICH 24/20z 539 $ 14.29| $ 7,702.31
PRODUCE $8.50 $4,581.50 $8.00 $4,312.00
16]1 - APPLE SLICED BAGS PACKER 100/2 0z 23 no bid
PRODUCE $20.50 $471.50 $19.00 $437.00
1-PRODUCE [AVOCADOS ANY CASE 3 $ 60.37 $ 18111  ¢39.50 $118.50 $69.00 $207.00
171 - BANANA PREMIUM US #1 |PACKER 1/40LB 18 no bid
PRODUCE $17.50 $315.00 $17.00 $306.00
18(1 - BANANA GREEN TIP PACKER 1/40LB 996 $ 2437 $ 24,272.52
PRODUCE $17.50 $17,430.00 $19.00 $18,924.00
19]1- BANANA PREMIUM PACKER 1/10LB 19 no bid
PRODUCE $3.00 $57.00 $3.00 $57.00
20(1 - BLUEBERRY FRESH PACKER 6/60Z 24 no bid
PRODUCE $10.00 $240.00 $9.00 $216.00
211 - STRAWBERRY MARKON 8/1LB 399 $ 16.88| $ 6,735.12
PRODUCE  |CLAMSHELL $16.00 $6,384.00 $12.00 $4,788.00
221 - STRAWBERRY WITH PACKER 4/16 0Z 1 no bid
PRODUCE  |STEM $16.00 $16.00 $12.00 $12.00
23|1- LEMON CHOICE 95 CT PACKER 1/95cCCT 1 no bid
PRODUCE $20.50 $20.50 $18.00 $18.00
241 - LEMON STANDARD 200 |PACKER 1/200CT 10 $ 4257 $ 425.70
PRODUCE |cT $28.00 $280.00 $34.00 $340.00
251 - JUICE LEMON FRESH MARKON 16/1QT 1 $ 4387 $ 43.87
PRODUCE __|SOUEEZE $40.50 $40.50 $24.00 $24.00
26(1 - LIME PERSIAN #1 200 CT |PACKER 1/200CT 24 no bid
PRODUCE $18.50 $444.00 $10.00 $240.00
27|1- ORANGE FANCY 88 CT PACKER 1/35LB 17 no bid
PRODUCE $20.50 $348.50 $19.00 $323.00
28(1 - ORANGE CHO 56 CT PACKER 1/35LB 2 no bid
PRODUCE $20.50 $41.00 $10.50 $21.00
29|1- ORANGE CHO 88 CT PACKER 1/88CT 74 $ 28.79| $ 2,130.46
PRODUCE $20.50 $1,517.00 $10.50 $777.00
30(1- ORANGE CHO 113 CT PACKER 1/113CT 20 no bid
PRODUCE $20.50 $410.00 $10.50 $210.00
31)1- ORANGE CHO 138 CT PACKER 1/138CT 1,004 $ 28.18| $ 28,292.72
PRODUCE $18.50 $18,574.00 $19.00 $19,076.00
321 - JUICE ORANGE FRESH SUN ORCHARD |4 /1 GAL 1 $ 35.88| $ 35.88
PRODUCE OUEEZED $40.00 $40.00 $10.00 $10.00
33|1- ORANGE FANCY 22 CT PACKER 1/22CT 4 $ 13.48| $ 53.92
PRODUCE $4.50 $18.00 $5.00 $20.00
341 - TANGERINE CHILEAN PACKER 1/VOL FILL 10 no bid
PRODUCE $10.00 $100.00 $25.00 $250.00
35|1- FRUIT SALAD DELUX SUN RICH 1/81LB 7 $ 25.48| $ 178.36
PRODUCE _ |P'aPPL $6.00 $42.00 $12.00 $84.00
36(1 - PINEAPPLE CHUNKS SUN RICH 1/8LBTUB 1 $ 25.48| $ 25.48
PRODUCE |k $6.00 $6.00 $12.00 $12.00
37|1- CANTALOUPE US#1 9 CT [PACKER 1/35LB 143 $ 17.48| $ 2,499.64
PRODUCE $14.50 $2,073.50 $15.00 $2,145.00
38(1 - CANTALOUPE US#1 15 PACKER 1/35LB 25 $ 18.00| $ 450.00
PRODUCE  |cT $14.50 $362.50 $15.00 $375.00
39|1- CANTALOUPE US#1 6 CT [PACKER 1/6CT 3 $ 13.57| $ 40.71
PRODUCE $14.50 $43.50 $6.00 $18.00
40|11 - CANTALOUPE US#1 3 CT |PACKER 1/3CT 5 $ 9.79| $ 48.95
PRODUCE $4.00 $20.00 $3.00 $15.00
4111 - HONEYDEW MELONS US |PACKER 1/3CT 50 $ 12.29| $ 614.50
PRODUCE |#13cCT $5.00 $250.00 $3.00 $150.00
4211 - HONEYDEW MELONS US |PACKER 1/3CT 6 no bid
PRODUCE  |#13cCT $5.00 $30.00 $3.00 $18.00
43|1 - HONEYDEW MELON US PACKER 1/30LB 11 $ 18.09| $ 198.99
PRODUCE |#16cCT $14.50 $159.50 $11.00 $121.00
4411 - HONEYDEW MELONS PACKER 1/30LB 97 $ 20.88| $ 2,025.36
PRODUCE _|US#1 9 CT $14.50 $1,406.50 $12.00 $1,164.00
45|11 - WATERMELON PACKER 1/EACH 100 $ 8.48| & 848.00
PRODUCE $3.75 $375.00 $3.00 $300.00
46|11 - WATERMELON SEEDLESS |PACKER 1/EACH 24 $ 8.48| $ 203.52
PRODUCE  |RED $3.75 $90.00 $3.00 $72.00
4711 - WATERMELON SEEDLESS [PACKER 1/EACH 4 no bid
PRODUCE  |RED $3.75 $15.00 $3.00 $12.00
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48[1 - GRAPE GREEN SEEDLESS [PACKER 1/181B 12 $ 5157 $ 618.84

PRODUCE $28.50 $342.00 $16.00 $192.00
49[1 - GRAPE GREEN SEEDLESS [PACKER 1/51B 5 $ 18.57| $ 92.85

PRODUCE $5.00 $25.00 $5.00 $25.00
501 - GRAPE RED SEEDLESS 5 |PACKER 1/5L8 1 $ 19.07[ $ 19.07

probuce s $5.00 $5.00 $5.00 $5.00
51[1- PEACH RIPE N READY  |PACKER 1/201B 64 $ 43.79] $ 2,802.56

PRODUCE  |48/60 $20.00 $1,280.00 $18.00 $1,152.00
52[1- PEAR D'ANJOU US #1  |PACKER 1/Cs 5 $ 55.87] $ 279.35

PRODUCE $27.00 $135.00 $27.00 $135.00
53[1 - PEAR D'ANJOU US #1  |PACKER 1/Cs 52 $ 28.18] $ 1,465.36

PRODUCE. $27.00 $1,404.00 $27.00 $1,404.00
54[1- PEAR D'ANJOU US #1  |PACKER 1/Cs 1 no bid

PRODUCE $27.00 $27.00 $27.00 $27.00
55[1 - PEAR D'ANJOU US #1  |PACKER 1/Cs 9 $ 55.87| $ 502.83

PRODUCE $27.00 $243.00 $27.00 $243.00
56[1 - PLUM BLACK RIPE N PACKER 1/201B 5 $ 28.18] $ 140.90

prODUCE  |READY $20.00 $100.00 $18.00 $90.00
57[1- PLUM BLACK RIPE N PACKER 1/201B 28 $ 36.29] $ 1,016.12

PRODUCE  |READY $20.00 $560.00 $18.00 $504.00
58[1 - KIWI FRUIT #1 33/36 CT |PACKER 1/FLAT 101 $ 16.29] $ 1,645.29

PRODUCE $12.00 $1,212.00 $13.00 $1,313.00
591 - MANGO US#1 9/12 CT  |PACKER 1/CTN 2 $ 13.79] $ 27.58

PRODUCE $8.00 $16.00 $5.00 $10.00
601 - FIGS BROWN 35-40CT  |PACKER 1/5L8 6 $ 36.29] $ 217.74

proDUCE  |bRIED $40.00 $240.00 $25.00 $150.00
61[1- PUREE SAMPLE MORE  |PERFECT PUREE|L / 14 CT 2 no bid

PRODUCE  |FRUIT $40.00 $80.00 $10.50 $21.00
62[1- PUREE SAMPLE TOP PERFECT PUREE[1/ 16 CT 8 no bid

prRODUCE  |FLavORS $40.00 $320.00 $13.50 $108.00
63[1 - PAPAYA MEXICAN PACKER 1/9-12CT 17 $ 46.29] $ 786.93

PRODUCE $14.00 $238.00 $9.00 $153.00
64[1- BROCCOLI FLORETS MARKON 4/3LBCTN 3 $ 2287] $ 68.61

prODUCE  licELEss $9.00 $27.00 $10.00 $30.00
65[1 - BROCCOLI CROWNS MARKON 1/201B 12 $ 24.88] $ 298.56

PRODUCE  |1cELESS $9.00 $108.00 $10.50 $126.00
66[1 - CABBAGE GREEN US#1  [PACKER 1/50LBCS 1 $ 11.88] $ 11.88

PRODUCE $9.00 $9.00 $9.00 $9.00
67[1- CABBAGE GREEN JUMBO [PACKER 1/50LB 22 no bid

PRODUCE cTN $11.50 $253.00 $12.00 $264.00
68[1 - CABBAGE GREEN PACKER 1/101B BG 9 no bid

PRODUCE $2.50 $22.50 $3.00 $27.00
691 - CABBAGE RED PACKER 1/101B SK 1 $ 12.88] $ 12.88

PRODUCE $3.00 $3.00 $3.00 $3.00
70[1 - KIWI FRUIT 118 COUNT [PACKER 1/118CT 10 $ 1257[ $ 125.70

PRODUCE $26.00 $260.00 $27.00 $270.00
71[1- SPRING MIX PACKER 2/1518B 4 $ 9.88| $ 39.52

PRODUCE | CONVENTIONAL $9.00 $36.00 $11.00 $44.00
72[1- CARROT JUMBO PACKER 1/50LB 32 $ 17.57[ $ 562.24

PRODUCE | TX/MEX/MICH BAG $14.00 $448.00 $12.50 $400.00
73[1- CARROT JUMBO PACKER 1/25LB 3 $ 12.57| $ 37.71

PRODUCE cTN $6.50 $19.50 $6.00 $18.00
74]1- CARROT JUMBO PACKER 1/251B 3 $ 19.69[ $ 59.07

PRODUCE $6.50 $19.50 $6.00 $18.00
75[1 - CARROT JUMBO US #1 [PACKER 1/10 LB BX 3 $ 9.87| $ 29.61

PRODUCE $3.00 $9.00 $3.00 $9.00
76[1 - CARROT SHRED MARKON 2/51B 31 $ 12.69] $ 393.39

PRODUCE $7.00 $217.00 $5.00 $155.00
77]1- CARROTEENIES 100 2 OZ [PACKER 100/20Z 145 $ 19.69| $ 2,855.05

PRODUCE $24.50 $3,552.50 $10.00 $1,450.00
78[1- CARROT SNACK WITH  [GRIMMWAY  [36/4 0z 1 $ 31.89] $ 31.89

PRODUCE __|RANCH DIP FARMS $12.50 $12.50 $15.00 $15.00
791 - CAULIFLOWER FLORETS |MARKON 2/3LBPKG 67 $ 16.88] $ 1,130.96

PRODUCE $10.00 $670.00 $12.00 $804.00
801 - CELERY MED MARKON 1/401B 30 $ 2065 $ 619.50

PRODUCE __|FOODSERVICE PACK $16.00 $480.00 $24.00 $720.00
811 - CELERY STALK MARKON 1/6CT 44 $ 11.88( $ 522.72

PRODUCE $2.50 $110.00 $3.00 $132.00
82[1- CELERY STALK MARKON 1/6CT 51 $ 8.79[ s 448.29

PRODUCE $2.50 $127.50 $3.00 $153.00
83[1 - CELERY STICKS MARKON 4/518B 11 $ 34.69| $ 381.59

PRODUCE $17.00 $187.00 $12.00 $132.00
84[1- HERB BASIL FRESH BOX |PACKER 1/118 4 $ 9.29( s 37.16

PRODUCE $8.50 $34.00 $8.00 $32.00
85[1 - HERB THYME FRESH PACKER 1/80z 5 $ 8.79| $ 43.95

PRODUCE $8.50 $42.50 $8.00 $40.00

1-PRODUCE |CILANTRO 6 CT PACKER 1/118 16 $ 13.37[ $ 213.92 $5.00 $80.00 $2.00 $32.00
861 - CILANTRO 1 LB CELLO  [TAYLOR 1/118 214 $ 7.87| $ 1,684.18

PRODUCE | WaSH & TRI $7.00 $1,498.00 $2.00 $428.00
87[1- CILANTRO BUNCHED MARKON 10/3CT 1 $ 14.19] $ 14.19

prODUCE 1073 oT $14.00 $14.00 $6.00 $6.00
881 - CARROT BABY PEELED ~ |MARKON 2/518B 62 $ 13.37[ $ 828.94

PRODUCE $9.00 $558.00 $8.00 $496.00
891 - LETTUCE ROMAINE RED |PACKER 1/24CT 1 $ 10.09] $ 10.09

PrRODUCE  |BABY $12.00 $12.00 $10.00 $10.00
90]1 - LETTUCE ROMAINE PACKER 1/24CT 1 $ 14.98] $ 14.98

PRODUCE | GREEN BABY $12.00 $12.00 $10.00 $10.00
911 - CUCUMBER SELECT US  [PACKER 1/11/98U 11 $ 3338] $ 367.18

PRODUCE  l#1 $14.50 $159.50 $16.00 $176.00
92[1 - CUCUMBER SELECT PACKER 1/5LB BAG 63 $ 10.09] $ 635.67

PRODUCE $3.50 $220.50 $3.00 $189.00
93[1- CUCUMBER 24 CT PACKER 1/24CT 2 $ 14.98] $ 29.96

PRODUCE $6.00 $12.00 $8.00 $16.00
941 - GARLIC WHITE PACKER 1/51B 1 $ 25.18] $ 25.18

PRODUCE $13.50 $13.50 $13.00 $13.00
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95[1 - LETTUCE ICEBERG 24 CT [PACKER 1/Cs 46 $ 21.29] $ 979.34
PRODUCE $20.50 $943.00 $13.00 $598.00
96]1 - LETTUCE ICEBERG PREM |MARKON 1/24CT 523 $ 2257 $  11,804.11
PRODUCE  |PALLETIZD $20.50 $10,721.50 $21.00 $10,983.00
97(1- LETTUCE SHRED 1/8 IN  [MARKON 4/518 1 $ 22.39] $ 22.39
prODUCE |k $16.50 $16.50 $11.00 $11.00
981 - LETTUCE ROMAINE 24 CT [MARKON 1/24CT 17 $ 20.37| $ 346.29
PRODUCE |k $18.00 $306.00 $24.00 $408.00
991 - LETTUCE ROMAINE MARKON 2/5LB BAG 8 $ 21.69| $ 173.52
PRODUCE | WASHETRIM K $14.50 $116.00 $11.50 $92.00
100[1 - SALAD MIX MARKON 4/518B 1 $ 22.39| $ 22.39
PRODUCE _|ICEBERG/ROM 50/50 $12.50 $12.50 $12.00 $12.00
1011 - SALAD MIX W/BAG MARKON 4/5LB BAG 5 $ 1157 $ 57.85
PRODUCE $12.50 $62.50 $12.00 $60.00
102(1 - ONION WHITE JUMBO  [PACKER 1/50LB SK 10 $ 24.07| $ 240.70
PRODUCE  |Us#1 $14.50 $145.00 $15.00 $150.00
103[1 - ONION WHITE JUMBO  [PACKER 1/10LB 10 $ 1259 $ 125.90
probUCE  lusza BAG $2.50 $25.00 $3.50 $35.00
1041 - ONION PEARL PEELED  [PACKER 1/51B 1 no bid
PRODUCE $5.00 $5.00 $12.00 $12.00
105(1 - ONION YELLOW JUMBO  [PACKER 1/50LB 80 $ 22.79] $ 1,823.20
PRODUCE $14.50 $1,160.00 $15.00 $1,200.00
1061 - ONION YELLOW JUMBO  [PACKER 1/10LB 4 $ 11.37 $ 45.48
PRODUCE cTN $3.00 $12.00 $3.50 $14.00
107(1 - ONION YELLOW JUMBO  [PACKER 1/10LB 68 no bid
PRODUCE cTN $3.00 $204.00 $3.50 $238.00
108(1 - PEA SNO GREEN US #1  |PACKER 1/101B 3 $ 45.07| $ 135.21
PRODUCE $26.00 $78.00 $28.00 $84.00
1091 - PEPPER BELL GREEN LG [PACKER 1/11/9BU 105 $ 37.48| $ 3,935.40
T (T $18.50 $1,942.50 $21.00 $2,205.00
110(1 - PEPPER BELL GREEN PACKER 1/11/98U 51 $ 20.07| $ 1,023.57
PRODUCE | US#1 CHOPPR $18.50 $943.50 $14.00 $714.00
1111 PEPPER BELL GREEN PACKER 1/5LBCS 179 $ 14.87( $ 2,661.73
PRODUCE $3.00 $537.00 $3.00 $537.00
1121 - PEPPER BELL RED PACKER 1/5LBCS 8 no bid
PRODUCE $2.50 $20.00 $5.00 $40.00
1131 - PEPPER BELL GOLD PACKER 1/5LB BAG 8 $ 15.09[ $ 120.72
PRODUCE $2.50 $20.00 $5.00 $40.00
1141 - PEPPER SERRANO PACKER 1/5LBCS 107 $ 9.38( $ 1,003.66
PRODUCE $2.90 $310.30 $2.00 $214.00
1151 - PEPPER SERRANO US #1 [PACKER 1/10LBCS 2 $ 12.19( $ 24.38
PRODUCE $3.00 $6.00 $3.00 $6.00
1161 - PEPPER SERRANO PACKER 1/VOL FILL 30 $ 26.38| $ 791.40
PRODUCE $3.00 $90.00 $20.00 $600.00
1171 - PEPPER BELL RED PACKER 1/11/9BU 1 $ 42.37| $ 42.37
prODUCE  |cHoPPER $18.00 $18.00 $19.00 $19.00
118(1 - PEPPER HABANERO PACKER 1/81B 1 $ 4318 $ 43.18
PRODUCE $17.50 $17.50 $21.00 $21.00
1191 - PEPPER ANCHO PACKER 1/51B 2 $ 33.87| $ 67.74
PRODUCE $10.00 $20.00 $10.00 $20.00
120(1 - POTATO RED "B" SIZE  |PACKER 1/10LB 3 $ 1229 $ 36.87
PRODUCE  |us#1 BAG $4.00 $12.00 $5.00 $15.00
1211 POTATO RED "B" SIZE  [PACKER 1/50 LB SK 1 $ 21.88| $ 21.88
probUCE  lusza $24.00 $24.00 $26.00 $26.00
1221 - POTATO RUSSET 50 CT  |PACKER 1/50LB 143 $ 2269| $ 3,244.67
PRODUCE  |us#1 cTN $15.00 $2,145.00 $12.00 $1,716.00
1231 - POTATO RUSSET 60CT  [PACKER 1/50LB 88 $ 18.48( $ 1,626.24
probUCE  lusza TN $15.00 $1,320.00 $11.50 $1,012.00
1241 - POTATO RUSSET 70 CT  |PACKER 1/50LB 8 $ 18.48( $ 147.84
PRODUCE  |us#1 cTN $15.00 $120.00 $11.50 $92.00
1251 - POTATO RUSSET 90 CT  [PACKER 1/50LB 2 $ 16.48| $ 32.96
probUCE  lusza TN $15.00 $30.00 $11.50 $23.00
1261 - POTATO RUSSET 40 CT  |PACKER 1/501LB 1 $ 17.87( $ 17.87
PRODUCE  |us #1 $15.00 $15.00 $11.00 $11.00
1271 POTATO RUSSET #2 IDA [PACKER 1/50 LB BX 87 $ 1287 $ 1,119.69
probUCE |10 07 UTL $14.00 $1,218.00 $14.00 $1,218.00
128[1 - SPINACH WASHED & MARKON 4/2518B 46 $ 18.48( $ 850.08
PRODUCE | TRIMMED $18.00 $828.00 $19.00 $874.00
1291 - SQUASH ZUCCHINI FCY ~ [MARKON/COMB 1 / 10LB 102 $ 13.18( $ 1,344.36
PRODUCE  |arEEN s TN $7.00 $714.00 $6.00 $612.00
130(1 - SQUASH ZUCCHINI MED [PACKER 1/201BCS 37 $ 26.19| $ 969.03
PRODUCE _ [18-25 LB $14.00 $518.00 $12.00 $444.00
1311 - TOMATO 4 X 4 2 LAYER |RRGILMORE [1/201B 7 no bid
PRODUCE $12.50 $87.50 $5.00 $35.00
1321 - TOMATO 4X5 2 LAYER  [PACKER 1/20LB 27 $ 20.68| $ 558.36
PRODUCE cTN $12.50 $337.50 $5.00 $135.00
1331 - TOMATO 5X6 2 LAYER  |PACKER 1/201B 2 no bid
PRODUCE $12.50 $25.00 $5.00 $10.00
1341 - TOMATO 5X6 1 LAYER  [PACKER 1/101B 201 $ 19.38( $ 3,895.38
PRODUCE $7.50 $1,507.50 $4.00 $804.00
135(1 - TOMATO 5X6 VINE RIPE |PACKER 1/201B 49 $ 18.79| $ 920.71
prRODUCE |2 LaYER $14.00 $686.00 $6.00 $294.00
1361 - TOMATO ROMA #2 PACKER 1/251B 55 $ 15.68( $ 862.40
PRODUCE $10.00 $550.00 $6.00 $330.00
1371 - TOMATO ROMA #1 PACKER 1/25LB 14 $ 18.18( $ 254.52
PRODUCE e $10.00 $140.00 $16.00 $224.00
1381 - TOMATO BULK CAFE PACKER 1/25LB 490 $ 1257 $ 6,159.30
PRODUCE cTN $14.50 $7,105.00 $16.00 $7,840.00
1391 - TOMATO 6 X 6 LARGE  |PACKER 1/25LB 17 $ 21.29] $ 361.93
PRODUCE cTN $14.50 $246.50 $9.00 $153.00
140(1 - APPLE SLICES RED USA  |UNKNOWN 20/40z 102 no bid no bid
PRODUCE  |20/4 07 $20.50 $2,091.00 $6.00 $612.00
GRAND TOTAL $ 152,793.88 $122,476.30 $114,628.00
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