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COUNTY OF WEBB 
Purchasing Department
BID TABULATION

Bid 2017-82 BrennTag SouthWest, Inc. DPC Industries Fort Bend Services, Inc. ChemTrade Manley Bros. of Indiana, Inc.
Annual Contract for Water Plant Chemicals c/o Gayle Tullier c/o Lenny Leal c/o David James c/o Elizabeth Ryno c/o Anthony Bottomley

1632 Haden Road 5245 Sunbelt PO Box 1688 90 East Halsey Road 300 S. Vermillion St.
Contract Term: Houston, TX 77015 Corpus Chrisit, TX 78408 Stafford, TX 77583 Parsippany, NJ 07054 Troy Grove, IL 61372
October 1, 2016 to September 30, 2017 713-330-8570 361-289-6947 djames@fortbendservices.com bids@chemtradelogistics.com 815-539-7486

gtollefsen@brenntag.com lleal@dxgroup.com 281-261-5199 800-631-8050 info@manleybros.com
If extended, this contract will expire:
September 30, 2018 Primary-Alum (1%, 2%, 3%) Primary- Chlorine Primary-Polymer Secondary- Alum Primary- Silica Sand

Primary-Chlorine HTH Primary- Anhy.Amonia
Primary-Copper Sulfate
Primary- Polymer
Primary-Phosphoirc Acid
Primary-Antiscalent 

Est. Qty per 
MONTH

UOM Chemical Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

37,800 LBS Alum Sulfate ( 1% Copper) 
per lb

0.0898  $     3,394.44 no bid no bid $0.0920 $3,477.60 no bid

37,800 LBS Alum Sulfate ( 2% Copper) 
per lb

0.095  $     3,591.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid

37,800 LBS Alum Sulfate ( 3% Copper) 
per lb

0.1010  $     3,817.80 no bid no bid no bid no bid

8 150LB Cyl Chlorine No bid  No bid $228.00 $1,824.00 no bid no bid no bid

3 55 LBS Chlorine HTH (granular) 
per/lb (will be shipped in 

100LB Containters-
Brenntag)

1.76  $         290.40 no bid no bid no bid no bid

24 50 LB Bags Copper Sulfate (granular) 
 

97.49  $     2,339.76 no bid no bid no bid no bid

Total  $ 13,433.40 $1,824.00 $3,477.60

Est. Qty per 
Quarter (or 

every 3MOS)

UOM Chemical Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

2 1 ton Cyl Chlorine no bid $915.00 $1,830.00 no bid no bid no bid

3 450 LB 
Drums

Polymer (Magnafloc E-38) 
(negative Charge) per 

drum

 $           765.00  $     2,295.00 no bid

$767.25 $2,301.75

no bid

no bid
2 Tons Silica Sand (50# bags 

Grade 65 sand)
no bid no bid no bid no bid $413.67 $827.34

2 Pallets Silica Sand (50# bags 
Grade 65 sand)

no bid no bid no bid no bid $1,241.00 $2,482.00

55 Gallon  $           874.50  $         874.50 no bid no bid no bid no bid
Drum

 Total  $   3,169.50 $1,830.00 $2,301.75 $3,309.34

Est. Qty. p/ 
YEAR

UOM Chemical Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

8 150LB 
Cylinders

Anhydrous Ammonia no bid $360.00 $2,880.00 no bid no bid no bid

4 55 gallon 
drums

Antiscalant per/drum  $       1,259.95  $     5,039.80 no bid no bid no bid no bid

800 Gallons Urea Gas no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

Total  $   5,039.80 $2,880.00

1 Phosphoric Acid per drum
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