
Webb County Purchasing Department 
Bid Tabulation 

Andy's Auto & Bus J.R. Martinez Auto South, LLC Rotex Truck Center, Inc TOP Gun Performance 
Bid Number: 2015-23 11901 Sara Rd. 520 S. Zapata Hwy. 11802 Sara Rd. 3100 Guadalup Building C
Annual Contract for Auto Shop Laredo, TX 78045 Laredo, TX 78043 Laredo, TX 78045 Laredo, TX 78040
Service Repair- To include Parts 956-722-7321 956-722-8106 956-722-1250 956-319-2036

Robert@andys-air.com parts@jrmartinezauto.com robert@rotextrucks.com jorge@topgunperformancetuning.com
Contract Expires: 09.30.17 Contact: Robert Rosas Contact: Jorge R. Martinez Contact: Robert Rosas, Jr. Contact: Jorge Ramos 
If Extended Expires: 09.30.18 Secondary- Cars, Light Duty Trucks, Primary-Tractor/Trailers Primary- Cars, Light Duty Trucks, 

Secondary- Heavy Duty Trucks & Heavy Duty Trucks Tertiary- Heavy Duty Trucks & Heavy Duty Trucks
ITEM DESCRIPTION  Price Price Price Price

Item I. Passenger Cars
Labor Rate Per Hour $38.50 $32.50 No Bid $25.00

Item II. Light & Medium Duty Trucks (1/2 -3/4 Ton)
Labor Rate Per Hour $38.50 $32.50 $125.00 $25.00

Item III. Heavy Duty Trucks (1 ton & over)
Labor Rate Per Hour $38.50 no bid $125.00 $25.00

Item IV. Tractor Trailers (Peter Built & International)
Labor Rate Per Hour no bid no bid $125.00 no bid

Item V. Heavy Equipment Repair
Labor Rate Per Hour no bid no bid no bid no bid

\
Parts Discount for Passengar Car 20% 15 % (List Price) no bid 20%

Parts Discount for Light & Med. Duty Trucks 20% 15% (List Price) 10-35% (List Price) 20%
Parts Discount for Heavy Duty Trucks 20% 15 % (List Price) 10-35% (List Price) 20%

Parts Discount for Tractor Trailers (Peter Built & International) no bid no bid 10-35% (List Price) no bid
Parts Discount for Heavy Equipment no bid no bid no bid

Turn-around Time 1-3 days 1-2 days 1-3 days 1-2 Days
Does your Company Provide Wrecker Service? No Yes no yes
What are the wrecker charges to the  County within City limits? n/a $0.00 n/a no bid
What are the wrecker charges p/mile to County outside of City limits? n/a $3.00 n/a no bid
How Many certified mechanics do you employ? 6 6 10 3
What equipment is used for diagnostic trouble shooting? Snap On Tools Snap on Diagnostic Laptops Mustang Chassis

International Cummins Software Hunter w/ Cummins Software PowerDyne 
Allison Software Allison Software HPTuners

Eaton Software Innovate Motorsport
Snap On Microsan 
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