Webb County Purchasing Department
Bid Tabulation

Bid Number: 2017-20

Annual Contract for Car Washes

Contract Expires: 09.30.17

If Extended Expires: 09.30.18

ITEM | -Full Service Car Wash

Power Car Wash

3019 San Dario

Laredo, TX 78041

956-725-0288

carmenliliacrv@hotmail.com

Contact:Carmen Hinojosa
Primary- Detailing

Secondary- Car & Hand Washes

Royal Car Wash
7305 San Dario #347
Laredo, TX 78041
956-763-3385
laser@border.net
Contact: Glen Ruiz

Primary-Self Service Car Washes

Top Gun Performance Tunning LLC
3100 Guadalupe St. Building C
Laredo, TX 78040

956-229-7854
jorge@topgunperformancetuning.com

Primary- Car Washes & Hand Washes

Automobiles & Light Duty Pick-Ups $11.50 no bid $10.00
Detailing for Autos & Light Duty P/Us $80.00 $120.00
Vans, Suburbans, Expeditions, & Heavy Duty Pick-ups $11.50 no bid $10.00
Detailing for VVans,Suburbans, Tahoes, Expeditions, & Heavy Duty $80.00 $120.00
Shampoo & Stain Removal of Carpets/Seats $80.00 $60.00
ITEM 2-Self Service Car Wash (Drive Thru) no bid $5.00 - Super Wash no bid
$6.00- Deluxe Wash
$7.00 Premium Wash
$8.00- Royal Triple Wash
Item 3- Hand Wash (Car Wash)
No Car Washing Machinery can be used for this
portion of the contract.
Full Service Hand Wash for $18.00 no bid $17.00
Automobiles & Light Duty Pick-Ups
Full Service Hand Wash for Vans, Suburbans, $25.00 no bid $23.00
Expeditions, & Heavy Duty (Dully) Pick-Ups
Vehicles that come in with excess Dirt/Mud EXTRA
will be charged an extra fee

Hours:

9-6PM (6 days per week)

8-5pm (6 days per week)

Turnaround Time:

Not Stated

4 Hours
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