RFP 2017-96

Annual Contract for Meats

Webb County
Purchasing Dept.
Bid Tabulation

Contract Term: October 24, 2016 to September 30, 2017

Ben E. Keith

c/o Mario Jimenez
5505 Kaepa Ct.

San Antonio, TX 78218
361-510-9620

mejimenez@benekeith.col

Five Star Correctional Services, Inc.
c/o Bob Austin

498 Beeman Ave.

Dallas, TX 75223

214-821-9000

fo@fivestarcorrectional.com

Labatt Food Service
c/o Enrique Alvarado
902 N. Expressway 77
Harlingen, TX 78550
956-286-4934

ealvarado@labattfood.com

RFP 2014-88 "3 month contract for Meats" (Fixed Price Required) Approved Alternate Bid Approved
Category Description Brand or Equivilent Pkg Size Quantity Case Price/per LB Price Per LB
5 - FRESH MEAT BRISKET BNLS | 1BP 6/ CATCH 94 K
NR 7120 $ 2.28 |2800 calorie $0.95 $ 2.39
5 - FRESH MEAT BRISKET BNLS | 1BP 5/ 11-14%# 39
N/R #120 $ 2.28 [Menu per meal $ 2.39
5 - FRESH MEAT BEEF MENUDO | SUPREME MEAT 2/518 11
COOKED $ 19.80 $ 24.95
5 - FRESH MEAT BEEF GROUND | CREEKSTONE FARMS |8 /5 LB 1 K
FINE 8119 $ 2.84 |3000 Calorie $1.01 $ 2.71
5 - FRESH MEAT BEEF GROUND | PACKER 8 / 10#CW 17
EINE 73/27 $ 1.64 |Menu per meal $ 1.54
5 - FRESH MEAT CHICKEN BREAST|PACKER 1/401B 65
RANDOM BLSL
S 50.93 $ 48.72
3- FROZEN MEAT  |BEEF STEW SUPREME MEAT 1/101B 37
MEAT 1 IN CUBE
S 3.64 $ 5.63
3- FROZEN MEAT  |BEEF STEW SUPREME MEAT 1/10LB. 274
MEAT 1/2 IN
CUBE $ 4.59 S 4.27
3 - FROZEN MEAT  |BACON ENDS & |FARMLAND 1/151B 63
PR 19.90 $ 1.60
S 107.90 S 94.20
NO BID Items -
Removed from
Tallv
5 - FRESH MEAT BEEF GROUND | 1BP 8 / 10#CW 66 K
FINE 80/20 $ 1.79 no bid
5 - FRESH MEAT BEEF GROUND | 1BP 8710 LB.CW 60
EINE 73/27 $ 179 $ 1.54
5 - FRESH MEAT BEEF GROUND | PACKER 2/518 397 K
FINE 80/20 no bid $ 2.90
5 - FRESH MEAT BEEF GROUND | IBP 8/5L8. 66
EINE 81/19 $ 1.94 $ 2.71
5 - FRESH MEAT BEEF GROUND _ |JBS SWIFT 8/10LB 68 K
FINE 73/27 no bid $ 1.54
5 - FRESH MEAT BEEF GROUND  |JBS SWIFT 8/10LB 2 K
FINE 81/19 no bid $ 2.01
5 - FRESH MEAT BEEF GROUND _|WINN MEAT 1/101B 1
80/20 n $ 2.90
5 - FRESH MEAT BEEF STEW SUPREME MEAT 7/15LB 4 K
MEAT DICED no bid $ 4.27
5 - FRESH MEAT BEEF PATTIES |WINN MEAT 20/80Z 4
80/20 W 807 $ 27.18 $ 29.05
3- FROZEN MEAT  |BEEF STEW WINN MEAT 2/518 8
VEAT 10 $ 7.28 $ 5.63
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Sysco Central Texas, Inc.
1260 Schwab Rd

New Braunfels, TX 78132
830-730-1209

dresch.rebecca@ctx.sysco.com

Price Per LB
$ 3.15
$ 3.10
$ 25.80
$ 2.89
$ 2.59
$ 59.90
$ 4.49
$ 5.99
$ 45.60
S 153.51
$ 2.78
no bid
$ 80.00
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
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