
County of Webb
Purchasing Dept.
Bid Tabulation 

Bid Number: 2017-57 Southern Sanitation Trashco
Bid For: Annual Contract for Refuse Collection c/o Roberto Trevino c/o Leticia Resendez

220 Guadalupe PO Box 450635
Contract Term: Oct. 24, 2016 to Sept. 30, 2017 Laredo, TX 78040 Laredo, TX 78045
If Extended Expires: Sept. 30, 2018 sales@southernsanitation.net lety@trashcoinc.com

956-723-3333 956-725-9693
Primary 

Location No. of Size of No. of Price Per Total Price TOTAL
Containers Container (YD) Pick-ups Pick-up Price Per Pick UP PRICE

ADMINISTRATION BLD. 1 10 3 116.13$                   348.40$            104.29$              312.87$            
1110 WASHINGTON

AGRICULTRUAL BUILDING 1 8 2 100.36$                   200.72$            95.00$                190.00$            
7209 E. SAUNDERS

CASA BLANCA GOLF COURSE 1 8 2 100.36$                   200.72$            95.00$                190.00$            

EL AGUILA TRANSPORTATION 1 2 1 47.32$                     47.32$              43.75$                43.75$              
4801 DAUGHERTY/CAA

EL CENIZO COM.CENTER 1 8 3 95.33$                     286.00$            86.87$                260.61$            
3519 CECILIA LANE

JAIL DIVISION 1 8 6 91.00$                     546.00$            112.50$              675.00$            
SAN AGUSTIN & WASHINGTON

JUSTICE CENTER 1 10 5 113.36$                   566.80$            97.29$                486.45$            
1110 VICTORIA

JUSTICE OF THE PEACE PCT 2. 1 4 1 92.56$                     92.56$              80.00$                80.00$              
901 SO. MILMO
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Purchasing Dept.
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Bid Number: 2017-57 Southern Sanitation Trashco
Bid For: Annual Contract for Refuse Collection c/o Roberto Trevino c/o Leticia Resendez

220 Guadalupe PO Box 450635
Contract Term: Oct. 24, 2016 to Sept. 30, 2017 Laredo, TX 78040 Laredo, TX 78045
If Extended Expires: Sept. 30, 2018 sales@southernsanitation.net lety@trashcoinc.com

956-723-3333 956-725-9693
Primary 

Location No. of Size of No. of Price Per Total Price TOTAL
Containers Container (YD) Pick-ups Pick-up Price Per Pick UP PRICE

JUSTICE OF THE PEACE PCT#4 1 4 1 92.56$                     92.56$              80.00$                80.00$              
8501 SAN DARIO

LA PRESA COMMUNITY 1 8 1 124.80$                   124.80$            118.75$              118.75$            
1983 MANGANA HEIN RD

RIO BRAVO COMM CNTR. 1 8 2 100.36$                   200.72$            95.00$                190.00$            
1607 ORQUIDIA

SELF HELP CENTER 1 2 1 47.32$                     47.32$              43.75$                43.75$              
8116 HWY 359

SHERIFF DEPARTMENT 1 8 1 124.80$                   124.80$            115.75$              115.75$            
902 VICTORIA

TEX –MEX BUILDING 1 4 1 92.56$                     92.56$              -$                    
WASHINGTON & CONVENT

WATER UTILITIES 1 4 1 92.56$                     92.56$              80.00$                80.00$              
515 MARTHA DRIVE

WEBB COUNTY YOUTH VILLAGE 2 10 1 145.60$                   145.60$            139.95$              139.95$            
111 CAMINO NUEVO RD per bin 
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Bid Number: 2017-57 Southern Sanitation Trashco
Bid For: Annual Contract for Refuse Collection c/o Roberto Trevino c/o Leticia Resendez

220 Guadalupe PO Box 450635
Contract Term: Oct. 24, 2016 to Sept. 30, 2017 Laredo, TX 78040 Laredo, TX 78045
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956-723-3333 956-725-9693
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Containers Container (YD) Pick-ups Pick-up Price Per Pick UP PRICE

WEBB COUNTY WATER 1 2 1 -$                         no bid no bid
UTILITES
1800 MARGARITA
RIO BRAVO

WEBB COUNTY TITLE BUILDING 1 4 1 -$                         80.00$                80.00$              
1620 SANTA URSULA
LAREDO, TX 78040

HEAD STARTS 
El Cenizo Center 1 4 1 92.56$                     92.56$              80.00$                80.00$              
3549 Cecilia Ln.

Finely 1 4 2 72.02$                     144.04$            70.00$                140.00$            
125 Atlanta Dr

Floyd I,II,III Center 1 10 3 116.13$                   348.40$            104.29$              312.87$            
4704 Naranjo

Jesus Garcia 1 4 2 72.02$                     144.04$            70.00$                140.00$            
2518 Cedar
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Jorge De La Garza 1 4 2 72.02$                     144.04$            70.00$                140.00$            
2519 Guerrero

Larga Vista Center 1 2 2 43.16$                     86.32$              43.75$                87.50$              
5411 Cisneros

Little Folks Center 1 10 2 124.80$                   249.60$            117.50$              235.00$            
1233 Paseo De Danubio

Little Palominos Cntr. 1 4 3 64.31$                     192.92$            63.33$                189.99$            
West End Washington

Prada Center 1 4 2 72.02$                     144.04$            70.00$                140.00$            
4908 Zapata Hwy 83

Roosevelt Center 1 4 1 92.56$                     92.56$              80.00$                80.00$              
3301 Sierra Vista

Sierra Vista Center 1 10 3 116.13$                   348.40$            104.29$              312.87$            
102 Sierra

Tatangelos Center 1 8 2 100.36$                   200.72$            95.00$                190.00$            
2400 S. Jarvis
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Villa Alegre 1 8 1 124.80$                   124.80$            120.00$              120.00$            
3501 Eagle Pass

Added Locations

CSCD/PAL 1 2 1 47.32$                     47.32$              80.00$                80.00$              

Records Management 1 2 1 47.32$                     47.32$              43.75$                43.75$              

CAA Meals on Wheels 1 4 2 72.02$                     144.04$            67.63$                135.26$            

Larga Vista Community Center 1 2 2 43.16$                     86.32$              43.75$                87.50$              

Old Juvenile (Drug Court) 4101 Juarez 1 2 2 43.16$                     86.32$              43.75$                87.50$              

GRAND TOTAL 5,933.20$       5,689.12$    
Size of Container

2 CU. YD. 448.24$                   393.75$              
4 CU. YD. 1,468.48$                1,342.09$           
8 CU. YD. 2,009.28$                2,048.86$           

10 CU. YD. 2,007.20$                1,931.96$           
15 CU. YD. 90.00$                     p/haul no bid
30 CU. YD. 140.00$                   p/haul no bid
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