Webb County
Purchasing Department
Bid Tabulation

Bid 2018-04

"Annual Contract for Heavy Equipment Parts"

RDO Equipment Co.

c/o Jose R. Cantu

102 Wilcox Rd.

Laredo, TX 78043

(956) 718-1909
jcantu@rdoequipment.com

Bid 2018-04 "Annual Contract for Heavy Equipment Parts"
Item Description Est.Qty.P/yr | Unit Price Extended Price
ITEM A: TIPS & BLADES
1 Tip Caterpillar 1U3252 15 $25.93 $388.95
2 Tip Caterpillar 1U3302 15 $36.28 $544.20
3 Tip Caterpillar 6Y039 15 $49.28 $739.20
4 Blade Caterpillar T74863 10 $61.14 $611.40
1/2x8x 7, 3/4 Hole

5 Retainer 1U2405 10 No Bid

6 Pin 8€6259 20 $6.24 $124.80
7 Retainer 86259 20 $2.91 $58.20
8 Pin 107-3308 10 No Bid

9 Bolt 5144773 10 No Bid

10 Nut 2J3506 20 No Bid

11 Tip L100896 15 No Bid

12 Blade 8D2786 20 No Bid

13 Blade T74842 25 $108.06 $2,701.50
14 Blade 7D-1158 10 No Bid

15 Balde-Motor grader 8d-2757 15 No Bid

16 Blade-Case backhoes 112946A1 10 No Bid

17 Balde-Brush hog 67743 20 No Bid

18 Balde-Brush hog 67744 10 No Bid

19 Bolt-Brush hog 7919 10 No Bid

20 Jam nut-Brush hog 252 10 No Bid

21 Lock washer-Brush hog 20322 10 No Bid

22 Cutting edge-Bull dozer 9W-1878 15 No Bid

23 End bits-Bull dozer 9W-8874 12 No Bid

24 End bits-Bull dozer 9W-8875 9 No Bid
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25 Cutting edge-Earth scraper 4T-6613 10 No Bid
26 Cutting edge-Earth scraper 4T-6611 10 No Bid
27 Tooth-Motor grader 9937 10 No Bid
28 Pin-Motor grader 9938 15 No Bid
29 Shank-Motor grader 8110 15 No Bid
30 Ripper tooth-Motor grader 195-7234 5 No Bid
31 Tooth-Earth scraper 3252HX 15 No Bid
32 Tooth Deere front loader 1U-3252 20 $25.93 $518.60
33 Pin-John Deere front loader 132-4763 25 No Bid
34 Washer-John Deere front loader 149-5733 20 No Bid
35 Tooth-963 Track Loader 1U-3302 10 $36.28 $362.80
36 Pin-963 Track Loader 107-3308 15 No Bid
37 Retainer-Track Loader 8E-6259 15 $6.24 $93.60
38 Tooth-963 Track Loader 6Y-0309 10 $49.28 $492.80
(rear ripper)
39 Pin-963 Track Loader 114-0358 10 No Bid
40 Retainer-963 Track Loader 10 No Bid
114-0359 (rear ripper)
41 Tooth-Case Motor grader 75251673 15 No Bid
42 Roll pin-Case Motor grader 10 No Bid
75251674
43 Shank-Case Motor grader 10 No Bid
73162856
a4 Tooth-Bull dozer (ripper) 15 No Bid
6Y-0352
45 Pin-Bull dozer (ripper) 9W-2678P 15 No Bid
Need: 114-0358 & 114-0359 15 No Bid
46 Retainer-Bull dozer (ripper) 10 $6.24 $62.40
T8E6359
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47 Tooth-Backhoe TF-23D 15 $12.08 $181.20
48 Pin-Backhoes TF-23P 10 $4.67 $46.70
49 Blade bolt-Motor grader 3F-5108 10 No Bid
50 Blade nut-Motor grader 4K-0367 15 No Bid
51 Balde washer-Motor grader 3B-4510 10 No Bid
52 Tooth # 6Y0359 15 $76.37 $1,145.55
53 Vail Pin # 79309300 10 $11.82 $118.20
54 Pin (79309300) 10 $11.82 $118.20
55 Tip (AT166866) 15 $8.87 $133.05
56 Cutting Edge (T187987) 10 $173.10 $1,731.00
57 End Bit (T187249) 12 $106.86 $1,282.32
58 End Bit ( T187244) 10 $117.93 $1,179.30
59 Edge T32742 Bobcat 12 $145.36 $1,744.32
60 Ripper Tooth 6Y0309 5 $49.28 $246.40
61 Pin 1368308 5 No Bid
62 End Bit T187243 5 $117.93 $589.65

GRAND TOTAL $1,249.90 $15,214.34
(Must be included)
ITEM B: Non Captive/Equipment Parts
ACCESSORIES Discounts
1. Schedule None
List None
Dealer None
Jobber None
2.FIXED Discount Off Price List for items not listed None
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