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COUNTY OF WEBB 
Purchasing Department
BID TABULATION

Bid 2018-19 BrennTag SouthWest, Inc. DPC Industries Voluntary Voluntary Evergreen Southwest, LLC Chameleon Industries
Annual Contract for Water Plant Chemicals c/o Gayle Tullier c/o Lenny Leal Price Price c/o Chuck Jones c/o Jason L. Garza

1632 Haden Road 5245 Sunbelt Reduction Reduction PO Box 40843 PO Box 853027
Contract Term: Houston, TX 77015 Corpus Chrisit, TX 78408 Austin, TX 78704 Mesquite, TX 75185
October 1, 2017 to September 30, 2018 713-330-8570 361-289-6947 10% New (512) 660-2883 (972) 880-1493

gtollefsen@brenntag.com lleal@dxgroup.com Reduction Hourly chuck@egsw.us info@chameleonindustries.com

Price 
Primary-Alum (1%, 2%, 3%) Primary- Chlorine 10/1/2016 - Primary - Micro-Solve Grease
Primary-Chlorine HTH Primary- Anhy.Amonia 9/30/2017 de-emulsifier
Primary-Copper Sulfate
Primary- Polymer
Primary-Phosphoirc Acid
Primary-Antiscalent 

Est. Qty per 
MONTH

UOM Chemical Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

48,000 LBS Alum Sulfate ( 1% Copper) 
per lb

0.0898  $     4,310.40 No Bid No Bid $0.1100 $5,280.00

48,000 LBS Alum Sulfate ( 2% Copper) 
per lb

0.095  $     4,560.00 No Bid No Bid $0.1250 $6,000.00

48,000 LBS Alum Sulfate ( 3% Copper) 
per lb

0.1010  $     4,848.00 No Bid No Bid $0.1400 $6,720.00

3 1 ton Cyl Chlorine No Bid No Bid $915.00 $2,745.00 $91.50 $823.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

10 100 LB Chlorine HTH (granular) 
per/lb (will be shipped in 

100LB Containters-
Brenntag)

1.76  $         290.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

48 50 LB 
Bags

Copper Sulfate (granular) 
per bag

97.49  $     4,679.52 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

45,000 LBS Liquid Ammonium Sulfate 
(Aquamine LAS)

0.1198  $     5,391.00 No Bid No Bid $0.14 $6,300.00

3 450 LB 
Drum

Polymer (Superfloc A-
1820) Negative (-) Charge

 $           765.00  $     2,295.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

3 Tons Silica Sand (50# bags 
Grade 65 sand)

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

800 Gallons Urea Gas No Bid  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

45,000 LBS Blended Aluminum 
Sulfate, Polymer, Copper, 

& Iron (2456)

0.1574  $     7,083.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

45,000 LBS Blended Aluminum 
Sulfate, Polymer, Copper 

(2409)

0.1345  $     6,052.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

80 LBS Calcium Hypochlorite 
(HTH) 100 LBS

No Bid  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

25 Pails De-Sulph-A-Nator (Odor 
Control Agent) 5 gal pail

No Bid  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

25 Pails EHC-33 (Degreaser 
Bacteria) 50 packets-25LB 

pail

No Bid  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

25 Pails Micro-Solve (Grease de-
emulsifier) 5 gal pail

No Bid  No Bid 
$250.00 $6,250.00

No Bid No Bid
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COUNTY OF WEBB 
Purchasing Department
BID TABULATION

Bid 2018-19 BrennTag SouthWest, Inc. DPC Industries Voluntary Voluntary Evergreen Southwest, LLC Chameleon Industries
Annual Contract for Water Plant Chemicals c/o Gayle Tullier c/o Lenny Leal Price Price c/o Chuck Jones c/o Jason L. Garza

1632 Haden Road 5245 Sunbelt Reduction Reduction PO Box 40843 PO Box 853027
Contract Term: Houston, TX 77015 Corpus Chrisit, TX 78408 Austin, TX 78704 Mesquite, TX 75185
October 1, 2017 to September 30, 2018 713-330-8570 361-289-6947 10% New (512) 660-2883 (972) 880-1493

gtollefsen@brenntag.com lleal@dxgroup.com Reduction Hourly chuck@egsw.us info@chameleonindustries.com

Price 
Primary-Alum (1%, 2%, 3%) Primary- Chlorine 10/1/2016 - Primary - Micro-Solve Grease
Primary-Chlorine HTH Primary- Anhy.Amonia 9/30/2017 de-emulsifier
Primary-Copper Sulfate
Primary- Polymer
Primary-Phosphoirc Acid
Primary-Antiscalent 

Est. Qty per 
MONTH

UOM Chemical Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

48,000 LBS Alum Sulfate ( 1% Copper) 
per lb

0.0898  $     4,310.40 No Bid No Bid $0.1100 $5,280.00

Total  $   39,509.82 $0.00 $6,250.00 $24,300.00
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