
COUNTY OF WEBB 
Purchasing Department
BID TABULATION

Oak Farms / Hygeia Dairy
Bid 2018-15 Annual Contract for Meats, Milk & Bread c/o Brandon Harjo

1314 Fredricksburg Rd.
San Antonio, TX 78201

Term: October 1, 2017 thru September 30, 2018 (210) 732-1111
brandon_harjo@deanfoods.com

Est. Qty Description Unit Price Extended Price
384,000 1/2 Pint Whole Fluid Milk           $0.25 $95,884.80
26,958 1/2 Pint (Unflavored) Low Fat $0.24 $6,577.75
1,500 Gallon of Whole Milk $3.59 $5,385.00
3,300 Gallon 1% fat milk $3.41 $11,253.00

11,844 1/2 Pint Chocolate Milk $0.25 $2,946.79
1,125 3 oz. Ice Cream   No Bid

19,870 1 Gal. Low Fat Milk $3.49 $69,346.30
100,000 Whole Milk ½ pints $0.25 $24,970.00
50,000 Soy Milk 1 Qt $2.15 $107,500.00
50,000 Soy Milk 1 Pint No Bid
3,000 Lactate Free Milk 2 gal $3.15 $9,450.00
3,000 Almond Milk 1/2 Gal $3.85 $11,550.00
5,000 Skim Milk ½ Pints $0.24 $1,220.00

Grand Total $346,083.64

MILK



COUNTY OF WEBB 
Purchasing Department
BID TABULATION

Flowers Baking Co. of San Antonio
Bid 2018-15 Annual Contract for Meats, Milk & Bread c/o Abel Menchaca

6000 NE Loop 410
San Antonio, TX 78218

Term: October 1, 2017 thru September 30, 2018 (210) 661-2361
abel.menchaca@flocorp.com
sandra.arce@flocorp.com

Item ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT Extended
PRICE PRICE

1 Bread, Sliced, 20oz (loaves) loaf, 6,000 $1.29 $7,740.00
White, enriched (fresh bread) loaves

Item 740-1014-0

2 Bread, Sliced, 20oz (loaves) loaf, 6,000 $1.45 $8,700.00
Wheat, enriched or whole grain (fresh bread) loaves

bread)
Item 102-1526-0

3 Raisin Bread, 16oz 3,000 $2.24 $6,720.00
Item 103-21770 pkgs 16 oz

4 Country Rolls, 32 oz 36 $2.49 $89.64
Item 740-2916-0 pkgs 32 oz

5 Pecan Rolls, 8 oz 36 no bid
pkgs

6 Raisin Rolls, 8 oz. 36 no bid
pkgs

7 Apple Fruit, 8 oz. 36 no bid
pkgs

8 Hamburger Buns 36 $3.51 $126.36
Item 100-2670-0 pkgs 30 ct

Bread

mailto:abel.menchaca@flocorp.com
mailto:sandra.arce@flocorp.com


9 Hotdog Buns 36 $1.86 $66.96
Item 100-2748-0 pkgs 16 ct

10 Steak Buns 36 $3.60 $129.60
Item 100-2796-0 pkgs 24 ct

Grand Total $23,572.56

COUNTY OF WEBB 
Purchasing Department
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