Bid: 2019-02
Annual Contract Auto, Truck & Heavy Equipment Repairs

Service to include Parts

Contract Term

October 1, 2018 to September 30, 2019

South Texas Auto Rebuilders
2720 Guadalupe St.

Laredo, TX 78043

(956) 723-8711
sotxauto@yahoo.com

Contact: Jose L. Villarreal

Toro Motors LLC dba Toro Auto Sales
1001 Guadalupe St.

Laredo, TX 78043

(956) 853-8676
bids@toroautosales.com

Contact: James L. Gonzalez

Rotex Truck Center, Inc
11802 Sara Rd.

Laredo, TX 78045

(956) 722-1250
robert@rotextrucks.com

Contact: Robert Rosas, Jr.

Andy's Auto & Bus Air
11901 Sara Rd.
Laredo, TX 78045
(956) 722-7321
robert@andys-air.com

Contact: Robert Rosas

Tractor/Trailers A/C Repair
ITEM DESCRIPTION Price Price Price Price
Item | Passenger Cars
Labor Rate Per Hour 30.00 $59.95 No Bid No Bid
Item Il Light & Medium Duty Trucks (1/2 -3/4 Ton)
Labor Rate Per Hour $30.00 $59.95 No Bid No Bid
Item Ill_Heavy Duty Trucks (1 ton & over)
Labor Rate Per Hour $30.00 $59.95 No Bid No Bid
Item IV_Passenger Vans
Labor Rate Per Hour $30.00 $59.95 No Bid No Bid
Item V_Tractor Trailers (Peter Built & International)
Labor Rate Per Hour $150.00 No Bid $75.00 No Bid
Item V_Heavy Equipment Repair

Labor Rate Per Hour $150.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Parts Discount for Passenger Car 10% (List Price) 15% (List Price) N/A 20% (List Price)
Parts Discount for Light & Med. Duty Trucks 10% (List Price) 15% (List Price) N/A 20% (List Price)
Parts Discount for Heavy Duty Trucks 10% (List Price) 15% (List Price) N/A 20% (List Price)
Parts Discount for Passenger Vans 10% (List Price) 15% (List Price) N/A 20% (List Price)
Parts Discount for Tractor Trailers (Peter Built & International) 10% (List Price) N/A 20-30% (List Price) N/A
Parts Discount for Heavy Equipment 10% (List Price) N/A N/A

A/C Repairs Heavy Duty Vehicles Only
Labor Rate Per Hour $45.00 $59.95 $75.00 $38.50
A/C Parts Discount 10% (List Price) 15% (List Price) 20-30% (List Price) 20% (List Price)

Turn-around Time

Does your Company Provide Wrecker Service?

What are the wrecker charges to the County within City limits?

What are the wrecker charges p/mile to County outside of City limits?

How Many certified mechanics do you employ?

1-2 days, dependent on extent of
repair
No
N/A
N/A
8

What is used for di

ic trouble shooting?

Ford IDS

International / Cummins Software

Allison Software

Aultel

GM MDI, GM Tech Il

1-2 days, dependent on extent of repair
Yes
$65.00 (1 ton or less)
$3.00 (1 ton or less)
4
Autel, Robinair, CPS

Hunter Engineering

Branick, S&K, Rotary

1-3 days
No
N/A
N/A
15
Navistar Software

Cummins Software

Allison Software

1-3 Days
No
N/A
N/A
6

Snap on
Cummins Software

International Software

Allison Software
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