MILK

Annual Contract for Meats, Milk & Bread

Contract Term:
October 01, 20178to September 30, 2019

Oak Farms / Hygeia Dairy

c/o Brandon Harjo

1314 Fredricksburg Rd.

San Antonio, TX 78201
(210) 732-1111
brandon harjo@deanfi

oods.com

Est. Qt Description Unit Price Extended Price
384,000 1/2 Pint Whole Fluid Milk $0.2449 $94,041.60
26,958 1/2 Pint (Unflavored) Low Fat $0.2399 $6,467.22
1,500 Gallon of Whole Milk $3.5900 $5,385.00
3,300 Gallon 1% fat milk $3.5900 $11,847.00
11,844 1/2 Pint Chocolate Milk $0.2399 $2,841.38|
1,125 3 o0z. Ice Cream No Bid
19,870 1 Gal. Low Fat Milk $3.4900 $69,346.30
100,000 Whole Milk % pints $0.2449 $24,490.00
50,000 Soy Milk 1 Qt $2.1500 $107,500.00
3,000 Lactate Free Milk 2 gal $3.1500 $9,450.00
3,000 Almond Milk 1/2 Gal $3.8000 $11,400.00
5,000 Skim Milk % Pints $0.2440 $1,220.00
Grand Total $343,988.50
R.C. Food Service & Produce Inc.
Bid 2019-08 c/o Alma A. Cavazos

Annual Contract for Meats, Milk & Bread

Contract Term:

MEAT

120 Market St.
Laredo, TX 78046
(956) 796-9999

October 01, 2018 to September 30, 2019 almacavazos77@yahoo.com
Category Description Brand or Pkg Size Qty Pe Size If | Unit Extended State Item#
Equivalent Different | Price Price

1 5 - FRESH MEAT BRISKET BNLS NR IBP 6/ CATCH 94 65 LB $4.09( $24,989.90
#120

5 5 - FRESH MEAT BRISKET BNLS N/R  |IBP 5 /11-14# 39 65 LB $4.99( $12,649.65
#120

3 5 - FRESH MEAT BEEF MENUDO SUPREME MEAT |2/51LB 11 $35.00 $385.00
COOKED

4 5 - FRESH MEAT BEEF GROUND FINE |CREEKSTONE 8/5LB 1 $3.99 $159.60
81/19 FARMS

5 5 - FRESH MEAT BEEF GROUND FINE |PACKER 8/ 10#CW 17, $2.59 $3,522.40
73/27

6 5 - FRESH MEAT BEEF GROUND FINE |IBP 8/ 10#CW 66 $3.89( $20,539.20
80/20

2 5 - FRESH MEAT BEEF GROUND FINE |IBP 8/10 60 $2.65( $12,720.00
73/27 LB CW

8 5 - FRESH MEAT BEEF GROUND FINE |PACKER 2/51LB 397 $48.90( $19,413.30
80/20

9 5 - FRESH MEAT BEEF GROUND FINE |IBP 8/5 LB 66 $3.95( $10,428.00
81/19

10 5 - FRESH MEAT BEEF GROUND FINE [JBS SWIFT 8/ 10LB 68 $2.75[ $14,960.00
73/27

1 5 - FRESH MEAT BEEF GROUND FINE [JBS SWIFT B/ 10LB 2 $3.95 $632.00
81/19

1 5 - FRESH MEAT BEEF GROUND WINN MEAT 1/10LB 1 $3.89 $38.90
80/20



mailto:almacavazos77@yahoo.com

13 5 - FRESH MEAT BEEFSTEW MEAT SUPREME MEAT |7 /1.51B 4 $72.50 $290.00
DICED
14 5 - FRESH MEAT BEEF PATTIES 80/20 |WINN MEAT 20/ 8oz 4 $39.50 $158.00
W 802
5 - FRESH MEAT CHICKEN BREAST PACKER 1/40LB 65 $69.00 $4,485.00
15 RANDOM
B1SL
16 3 - FROZEN MEAT BEEF STEW MEAT 1 |SUPREME MEAT |1 /10LB 37| $75.00 $2,775.00
IN CUBE
17 3 - FROZEN MEAT BEEF STEW MEAT SUPREME MEAT |1/10LB 274 $70.00 $19,180.00
1/2 IN CUBE
18 3 - FROZEN MEAT BEEFSTEW MEAT WINN MEAT 2/5LB 8 $72.00 $576.00
1X1
19 3 - FROZEN MEAT BACON ENDS & FARMLAND 1/15LB 63 $35.00 $2,205.00
PIECES
GRAND TOTAL $150,106.95
Ben E. Keith Foods
Bid 2019-08 M EAT c/o Ronald M. Brown
Annual Contract for Meats, Milk & Bread 5505 Kaepa Ct.
San Antonio, TX 78218
Contract Term: (800) 661-7998
October 01, 2018 to September 30, 2019 rmbrown@benekeith.com
Category Description Brand or Pkg Size Qty Pe Size If | Unit Extended State Item#
Equivalent Different | Price Price
1 3 - CENTER OF PLATE BACON ENDS & KIOLBASA 51 $23.60 $1,203.60 134216
PIECES
) 3 - CENTER OF PLATE BEEF STEW MEAT 1 |WOLVERIN 30 $34.10 $1,023.06 135388
IN CUBE
3 - CENTER OF PLATE CHICKEN BREAST PACKER 246 $56.90 $13,997.40 487420
3 RANDOM
BLSL
4 3 - CENTER OF PLATE BRISKET BNLS NR IBP 21 $3.19 $4,348.89 500245
#120
5 3 - CENTER OF PLATE BEEF GROUND FINE |PACKER 220 $2.22 $39,070.85 506080
73/27
6 3 - CENTER OF PLATE BEEF PATTY 4/1 HOLTEN 4 $20.22 $80.87 506104
WITH TVP
7 3 - CENTER OF PLATE BEEF PATTY 75/25 |HOLTEN 69 $21.45 $1,480.22 506123
4/1
3 3 - CENTER OF PLATE BEEF GROUND FINE |[IBP 12 $2.41 $2,131.14 506275
81/19
9 3 - CENTER OF PLATE BEEF GROUND FINE |ELLINGTN 2 $1.99 $3,234.72 506475
73/27
10 3 - CENTER OF PLATE BEEF GROUND SUPREME 3 $38.94 $116.82 506497
90/10
GRAND TOTAL $66,687.56
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Bid 2019-08

BREAD

Annual Contract for Meats, Milk & Bread

Contract Term:
October 01, 2018 to September 30, 2019

Flowers Baking Co. of San Antonio
c/o Abel Menchaca

6000 NE Loop 410

San Antonio, TX 78218

(210) 661-2361
abel.menchaca@flocorp.com

sandra.arce@flocorp.com

Iltem ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT Extended
PRICE PRICE
1 Bread, Sliced, 200z (loaves) loaf, 6,000 $1.29 $7,740.00
White, enriched (fresh bread) loaves
Item 740-1014-0 ButterKrust
2 Bread, Sliced, 200z (loaves) loaf, 6,000 $1.45 $8,700.00
Wheat, enriched or whole grain loaves
bread) Nature's Own
Item 102-1526-0 Whole Wheat
3 Raisin Bread, 160z 3,000 $2.24 $6,720.00
Item 103-21770 pkgs 16 oz
Sun-Maid
4 Country Rolls, 32 oz 36 $2.49 $89.64
Item 740-2916-0 pkgs 320z
ButterKrust
5 Pecan Rolls, 8 oz 36 no bid
pkgs
6 Raisin Rolls, 8 oz. 36 no bid
pkgs
7 Apple Fruit, 8 oz. 36 no bid
pkgs
8 Hamburger Buns 696 $3.51 $2,442.96
Item 100-2670-0 pkgs 30 ct
Flowers
9 Hotdog Buns 348 $1.86 $647.28
Item 100-2748-0 pkgs 16 ct
Flowers
10 Steak Buns 88 $3.60 $316.80
Item 100-2796-0 pkgs 24 ct
Flowers

Grand Total

$26,656.68
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