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Annual Contract for Water Plant Chemicals

October 1, 2018 to September 30, 2019

Est. Qty per 
MONTH

UOM Chemical Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

48,000 LBS Alum Sulfate ( 1% Copper) per 
lb

 $           0.0967  $        4,641.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $                0.10  $        4,800.00 

48,000 LBS Alum Sulfate ( 2% Copper) per 
lb

 $           0.1045  $        5,016.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $                0.11  $        5,280.00 

48,000 LBS Alum Sulfate ( 3% Copper) per 
lb

 $           0.1120  $        5,376.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $                0.12  $        5,760.00 

4 1 ton Cyl Chlorine No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
10 100 LB Chlorine HTH (granular) per/lb 

(will be shipped in 100LB 
Containters-Brenntag)

 $           196.00  $        1,960.00  $              179.00  $          1,790.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

48 50 LB Bags Copper Sulfate (granular) per 
bag

 $           113.49  $        5,447.52  $                96.00  $          4,608.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

45,000 LBS Liquid Ammonium Sulfate 
(Aquamine LAS)

 $           0.1120  $        5,040.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

3 465 LB Drum Polymer (Superfloc A-1820) 
Negative (-) Charge

 $           765.00  $        2,295.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

3 Tons Silica Sand (50# bags Grade 65 
sand)

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

800 Gallons Urea Gas No Bid  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
45,000 LBS Blended Aluminum Sulfate, 

Polymer, Copper, & Iron 
(2456)

 $           0.1695  $        7,627.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

45,000 LBS Blended Aluminum Sulfate, 
Polymer, Copper (2409)  $           0.1355  $        6,097.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

80 LBS Calcium Hypochlorite (HTH) 
100 LBS

 $               1.96  $           156.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

25 Pails De-Sulph-A-Nator (Odor 
Control Agent) 5 gal pail

No Bid  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

25 Pails EHC-33 (Degreaser Bacteria) 
50 packets-25LB pail No Bid  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Contract Term: 

BrennTag SouthWest, Inc.

c/o Thomas Crain Jr.

704 E. Wintergreen Rd.

Lancaster, TX 75134

(972) 218-3500

gtollefsen@brenntag.com 

Bid 2019-16

Chemrite, Inc

c/o Aaron Opp

5202 Belle Wood Court, Ste. 104

Buford, GA 30518

(770) 271-5576

aaron@chemrite.com chuck@egsw.us

(512) 660-2883

Austin, TX 78704

PO Box 40843

c/o Chuck Jones

Evergreen Southwest, LLC Chemtrade Chemicals US LLC

c/o Elizabeth Ryno

90 East Halsey Rd

Parsippany, NJ 07054

(800) 441-2659

bids@chemtradelogistics.com
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25 Pails Micro-Solve (Grease de-
emulsifier) 5 gal pail

No Bid  No Bid No Bid No Bid 250.00$            6,250.00$        No Bid No Bid

10 Bottle Permethrin (Insecticide) No Bid  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Total  $      43,657.92 $6,398.00 $6,250.00 15,840.00$      
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