Bid 2021-05
Annual Contract for Fuel

Contract Term:
October 1, 2020 to September 30, 2021

Arguindegui Oil Co. II, Ltd.
c/o Jose H. Lopez

6551 Star Ct.

Laredo, TX 78041

(956) 722-5251
beto.lopez@argpetro.com

Sun Coast Resources, Inc.

c/o Terri Bateman

6405 Cavalcade, Building 1
Houston, Texas 77026

(713) 429-6702
national@suncoastresources.com

Petroleum Traders Corp.

c/o Gayle Newton

7120 Pointe Inverness Way
Fort Wayn, IN 46801

(888) 637-7661
gnewton@petroleumtraders.com

Gonzalez Auto Parts
c/o Joe Gage

4220 San Bernardo Ave.
Laredo, TX 78041
(956) 726-9766
bids@gapautoparts.com

ITEM DESCRIPTION

Item 1

Item 2

Item 3

Item 4

Item 5

Item 6

Item 7

Item 8

Item 9

Item 10

Item 11

Regular Unleaded Gasoline
Price per gallon-transport load
OPIS Laredo Rack Low

State Tax

Other charges:
Loading Fee
Federal Lust Fee
Federal Oil Spill Fee
Pump Charge
Freight Charge
Profit Margin

Total Price p/gallon - Reg. Unleaded

Low Sulfer, Diesel #2 Branded Fuel
Price per gallon-transport load
OPIS Laredo Rack Low

State Tax

Other Charges:

State Diesel Tax - Loading Fee
Federal Lust Fee

Federal Qil Spill Fee

Federal Diesel Tax

Pump Charge

Freight Charge

Profit Margin

Total Price p/gallon Diesel #2

Diesel Exhaust Fluid (DEF)
2 1/2 gallon jug w/ spout

Qil - 15w40 price per gal

Grease - 55 gal drum

Transmission Fluid ATF - 55 gal drum

Antifreeze Red - 55 gal drum

Antifreeze 100% Green - 55 gal drum

Hydraulic Fluid AOC Premium - price per gal

Mineral Spirits - price per gal

Additional Charges

DEF Delivery Charge

Demurrage Charge

Free disposal of used oil and filters?

$1.2570
$0.2000

$0.0010
$0.0010
$0.00214
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0349

$1.4960

$1.2695
$0.2000

$0.0010
$0.0010
$0.0021
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0275

$1.5011

$7.75

$6.5300
$399.00 for 35/1 Keg.
$329.9500

$252.35
$328.80

$4.97

$6.00

Standby time $125.00/ hr.
first hour free

YES

$1.3488
$0.2000

$0.0010
$0.0010
$0.0019
$0.0000
$0.0275
$0.0375

$1.6177

$1.3896
$0.2000

$0.0010
$0.0010
$0.0021
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0275
$0.0375

$1.6587

10.60 per case
$7.07
$1,448.00
$471.35
$1,072.50
$742.50
$4.33

$2.35

$95.00 (If under 200 Gallons are
Ordered)

NO

$1.2585
$0.2000

$0.0008
$0.0010
$0.0019
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0311

$1.4933

$1.2895
$0.2000

$0.0000
$0.0010
$0.0021
$0.0000
$0.0000
$0.0292
$0.0007

$1.5225

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

NO

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$7.99

$8.05
$807.87
$519.57
$484.08
$366.97

$8.17

No Bid

YES
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