Bid 2020-06
Annual Contract for Janitorial Supplies

Contract Term:
October 1, 2019 to September 30, 2020

Patria Office Supply

c/o Alexis Landin

301 E. Calton Rd.
Laredo, TX 78041

(956) 723-2332
landinalexis@yahoo.com

Executive Office Supply

c/o Jorge Gonzalez Juaristi
3312 Santa Ursula Ave.
Laredo, TX 78040

(956) 722-6791
sales@executiveofficesupply.com

Gulf Coast Paper Co.

c/o Abraham Zarate
1101 SPID

Corpus Christi, TX 78416
(956) 645-6869
abezarate@sbcglobal.net

TexChem Corp

c/o Rosie Reyes

1502 Farragut St.
Laredo, TX 78040

(956) 723-1221
rosie@texcheminc.com

HillYard Texas

c/o Rosie Reyes

12871 Wetmore Rd.
San Antonio, TX 78247
(800) 728-4120
rreyes@hillyard.com

Discount for Janitorial Supplies

33 -35% Off

35% Off

40 -50% Off

30% Off

30% Off

Source of Discount

Patria Catalog

Catalog Price

Catalog

Hillyard Catalog Price

Catalog Price

Annual Contract for Janitorial Supplies

Contract Term:
October 1, 2018 to September 30, 2019

Las Vegas, NV 89145
(888) 237-9797
admin@thinkgte.com

Montgomery, NY 12549
(845) 782-6800
interboro@frontiernet.net

Cleveland, OH 44114
(216) 706-9250
bids@siteone.com

Brooklyn, NY 11230
(718) 677-1065
unipakcorp@aol.com

Discount for Janitorial Supplies 30% Off 50% Off 0-10% Off 34% Off
Gloves & Trash Can Liners Gloves & Trash Can Liners
Source of Discount Catalog Price Catalog Price Shelf Price Catalog Price

Cooperative Contract

None

Buyboard 529-17

Buyboard 519-16

www.thinkgte.com

www.siteone.com

www.unipakcorp.net

Cooperative Contract None None Buyboard 569-18 Buyboard 569-18 Buyboard 569-18
Groupo GTE Interboro Packaging Corp. SiteOne Landscape Supply |Unipak Corp
c/o Greg Taylor c/o Matty Rosenberg c/o Keith McGinty Brian Marcus

Bid 2019-06 10161 Park Run Dr Ste. 150 | 114 Bracken Rd. 1385 East 36th Street PO Box 300027
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Bid 2021-06
Annual Contract for Janitorial Supplies

Contract Term:
October 1, 2020 to September 30, 2021

Hillyard Texas

c/o Rosie Reyes

12871 Wetmore Rd.
San Antonio, TX 78247
(800) 728-4120
rreyes@hillyard.com

Patria Office Supply

c/o Alexis Landin

301 E. Calton Rd.
Laredo, TX 78041

(956) 723-2332
landinalexis@yahoo.com

TexChem Corp

c/o Rosie Reyes

1502 Farragut St.
Laredo, TX 78040

(956) 723-1221
rosie@texcheminc.com

Qty | U/M [Description Item # Unit Cost | Total Cost Item # Unit Cost | Total Cost Item # Unit Cost | Total Cost
49| cases |Hand Roll Towels - 880N VDC88ON| S 21.18 | S 1,037.82 S 19.25(S 943.25 VDC88ON| S 21.18 | S 1,037.82
30| cases |Toilet Tissue 96 Rolls VDCRT500| S 39.87 | S 1,196.10 S 30985 929.40 VDCRT500| S 39.87 | S 1,196.10
21| boxes |Toilet Tissue Jumbo 12" 20020 SCATJ1222A| S 2597 | S  545.37 S 2289 |S 480.69| SCATJ1222A| S 2597 | S  545.37
38| cases |Toilet Tissue Jumbo 12" 2212-6 VvDC2212| S 2997 | S 1,138.86 S 22.89|S 869.82 VvDC2212| S 29.97 | S 1,138.86
28| cases [Toilet Tissue Jumbo 9" VDC1209( S 2961 |S  829.08 S 20.10|S 562.80 VDC1209( S 29.61 |S  829.08
48| boxes [Multi-fold Towels 548-K VDC548K| S  18.95 | S 909.60 S 1898 (S 911.04 VDC548K| S 18.95 | S 909.60
30| boxes [Can Liners, Large Bags LHV-4348 LHV434816N| S 19.67 [ S  590.10 S 27.10|S 813.00 | LHv434816N| S 19.67 | S  590.10
35| boxes [Can Liners, Small Bags LHV-2433 LHV24338N| S 16.71 S  584.85 S 2850|S 997.50| LHV24338N|S 16.71|S  584.85
15| each |White Polishing Floor Pads 5 per box HIL42020] S  3.77 | S 56.55 Case S 360(S 54.00 HIL42020( S 3.77 | S 56.55
10| each |Black Polishing Floor Pads 5 per box HIL42720| S 3.77 | S 37.70 Case S 360(S 36.00 HIL42720( S 3.77 | S 37.70
14| cases |Hand Soap 4 per box HIL0039403| S 46.55|S  651.70 S 2450|S 343.00| HILO039403| S 46.55|S  651.70
18| boxes |Hand Sanitizer 4 per box HIL0O041003| S 59.62 | S 1,073.16 No Bid HIL0041003| S 59.62 | S 1,073.16
10| cases [Lysol Toilet Cleaner HIL0010904| S 32.04 [ S  320.40| 74278CT [S 3890|S 389.00| HILo0o10904| S 32.04|S 320.40

7| boxes |Sparkling Disinfectant Bowl Cleaner HIL0010404 | S 2868 | S 200.76 | 1038799 |S 32.45|S 227.15| HiLo010404| S 28.68 S  200.76
7| boxes |Window Cleaner HIL0080225| S 89.04 | S  623.28 | 4714AEA | S 2295(S$S 160.65| HILO080225| S 89.04 [ S  623.28
4| boxes |Top Clean HIL0081025 | S 97.44 | S  389.76 No Bid HIL0081025| S 97.44|S  389.76
5| boxes |Vindicator Cleaner HIL0080625 | S 119.36 | S  596.80 No Bid HIL0080625 | S 119.36 | S  596.80
11| cases |Re-juv-nal Cleaner HIL0081625| S 52.08 | S  572.88 No Bid HILO081625| S 52.08 | S  572.88
3| boxes |Super Shine All HILO080825| S 74.32 | S  222.96 No Bid HILO080825| S 74.32 | S  222.96
3| each |Super Spray Buff HIL0010404| S  6.18 | S 18.54 | DIVERSEY | S 1298 | S 38.94 | HILO010404| S 6.18 | S 18.54
3| each |Floor Stripper 5 gal container HIL00015007| S 38.30 | S  114.90 |BAREBONES| S 81.30 S  243.90 | HILoo015007( S 38.30|S  114.90
3| each |Floor Sealer 5 gal container HIL0034407| S 68.96 | S 206.88| w/Stand [$S 96.30|S 288.90| HIL0034407| S 6896 |S  206.88
6| boxes |Floor Wax 5 gal container HIL0052207| S 62.51 S  375.06 2417 S 101.18 | S 607.08 | HILO052207 S 62.51|S  375.06
2| boxes |Orange Mop Head 12 per box HIL24956| S 46.68 | S 93.36 | 5020RMED | S 12863 |S 257.26 HIL24956| S 46.68 | S 93.36
2| boxes |Green Mop Heads 12 per box HIL24946| S  46.68 | S 93.36 503GN S 168.45|S 336.90 HIL24946| S  46.68 | S 93.36
2| boxes |White Mop Heads 12 per box HIL24965| S  33.96 | S 67.92 | 502WHCT | S 100.88|S 201.76 HIL24965[ S 33.96 | S 67.92
2| boxes |Dust Mop Heads 24" 12 per box HIL53197| S 52.32 (S 104.64 1324 S 112.88|S 225.76 HIL53197| S 52.32 S 104.64
2| boxes |Dust Mop Heads 36" 12 per box HIL53198 | S 59.40 | S  118.80 1336 S 151.05|S 302.10 HIL53198 | S 59.40 (S  118.80
4| boxes [Dust Mop Heads 48" 12 per box HIL53199| S 81.60|S 326.40 S 239.25|S 957.00 HIL53199( S 81.60|S  326.40
12| each |Doodle Bug Brown Scrub Pads HIL29960| S  2.31 | S 27.72 20/Box |S 18.90 (S 18.90 MINO8005| S  2.31 (S 27.72

Additional Discount for Janitorial Supplies not listed 30% 33-45% 30%

Source of Discount Catalog Catalog Catalog

Cooperative Contract BuyBoard 569-18 N/A BuyBoard 569-18

Samples can be provide upon request YES YES YES

Bid 2021-06

Annual Contract for Janitorial Supplies

Contract Term:
October 1, 2020 to September 30, 2021

Hand Safety, LLC

¢/o Ramon Flanigan
831 Reynolds Ln
Wichita Falls, TX

(940) 337-1481
ramon@handsafety.us

Global Equipment Company

c¢/o William Rose
11 Harbor Park Drive

Port Washington, NY 11050

(678) 969-6676

dhimelick@globalindustrial.com

Interboro Packaging Corp.
c/o Tony Einhorn

114 Bracken Road
Montgomery, NY 12549
(845) 782-6800
interboro@frontiernet.net

Qty | U/M [Description

Item # Unit Cost

Total Cost

Item # Unit Cost

Total Cost

Item # Unit Cost | Total Cost
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49| cases |Hand Roll Towels - 880N S - B2273838| S 56.70 | S 2,778.30 S -
30| cases |[Toilet Tissue 96 Rolls S - S - S -
21| boxes |Toilet Tissue Jumbo 12" 20020 S - S - S -
38| cases |Toilet Tissue Jumbo 12" 2212-6 S - S - S -
28| cases |Toilet Tissue Jumbo 9" S - B1143920| S 37.95|S 1,062.60 S -
48| boxes |Multi-fold Towels 548-K S - S - S -
30| boxes [Can Liners, Large Bags LHV-4348 S - 670272| S 51.00 [ S 1,530.00 NT-4348-X-Hvy S12.32 | S  369.60
35| boxes [Can Liners, Small Bags LHV-2433 S - B1105628 S 34.11 [ S 1,193.85 | INT-2433-Reg S14.24 | S  498.40
15| each |White Polishing Floor Pads 5 per box S - 261165WH| S 32.95|S  494.25 S -
10| each [Black Polishing Floor Pads 5 per box S - 261165BK| S 3295 |S  329.50 S -
14| cases [Hand Soap 4 per box S - B1143923| S 17.00 | $  238.00 S -
18| boxes |Hand Sanitizer 4 per box PC-9014| S 127.00 | S 2,286.00 2407521 S 78.95|S 1,421.10 S -
10| cases |Lysol Toilet Cleaner S - 640410 S 37.20 S 372.00 S -
7| boxes |Sparkling Disinfectant Bowl Cleaner S - 640410 S 37.20 S  260.40 S -
7| boxes |Window Cleaner S - B936490( S 78.00 | S  546.00 S -
4| boxes |Top Clean S - B2228805| S 6294 |S  251.76 S -
5| boxes |Vindicator Cleaner S - B2304871| S 73.65|S  368.25 S -
11| cases |Re-juv-nal Cleaner S - S - S -
3| boxes |Super Shine All S - S - S -
3| each |Super Spray Buff S - B2228817| S 91.04 |S  273.12 S -
3| each |Floor Stripper 5 gal container S - S - S -
3| each |Floor Sealer 5 gal container S - B56915| S 106.94 [ S  320.82 S -
6| boxes |Floor Wax 5 gal container S - S - S -
2| boxes |Orange Mop Head 12 per box S - S - S -
2| boxes |Green Mop Heads 12 per box S - S - S -
2| boxes |White Mop Heads 12 per box S - S - S -
2| boxes |Dust Mop Heads 24" 12 per box S - B598575| S 326.99 | S  653.98 S -
2| boxes |Dust Mop Heads 36" 12 per box S - B598577| S 365.30 | S  730.60 S -
4| boxes |Dust Mop Heads 48" 12 per box S - B654908| S 23199 |S  927.96 S -
12| each |Doodle Bug Brown Scrub Pads S - B134551| S 69.94 | S  839.28 S -
Additional Discount for Janitorial Supplies not listed alf 15% 10% 50%
Source of Discount Catalog Catalog Catalog
Cooperative Contract TIPS 200604 1GPA 19-01 PV-01 N/A
Samples can be provide upon request YES YES YES




