
Contract Term: 

Est. Qty Description Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price

384,000 1/2 Pint Whole Fluid Milk           $0.2398 $92,083.20 $0.2900 $111,360.00

26,958 1/2 Pint (Unflavored) Low Fat $0.2349 $6,332.43 $0.2800 $7,548.24

1,500 Gallon of Whole Milk $3.5900 $5,385.00 $3.8900 $5,835.00

3,300 Gallon 1% fat milk $3.5900 $11,847.00 $3.7900 $12,507.00

11,844 1/2 Pint Chocolate Milk $0.2349 $2,782.16 $0.2900 $3,434.76

1,125 3 oz. Ice Cream   No Bid No Bid

19,870 1 Gal. Low Fat Milk $3.5900 $71,333.30 $3.7900 $75,307.30

100,000 Whole Milk ½ pints $0.2398 $23,980.00 $0.2900 $29,000.00

50,000 Soy Milk 1 Qt $2.1500 $107,500.00 No Bid

3,000 Lactate Free Milk 2 gal $3.1500 $9,450.00 No Bid

3,000 Almond Milk 1/2 Gal $3.8000 $11,400.00 No Bid

5,000 Skim Milk ½ Pints $0.2349 $1,174.50 $0.2800 $1,400.00

Grand Total $343,267.59 $246,392.30

Contract Term: 

Item ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT Extended

PRICE PRICE

1 Bread, Sliced, 20oz (loaves) loaf, $1.87 $11,227.50

White, enriched (fresh bread)

24oz

8 / pack

2 Bread, Sliced, 20oz (loaves) loaf, $2.07 $12,442.50

Wheat, enriched or whole grain 

(fresh bread)bread) 24 oz

8 / pack

3 Raisin Bread, 16oz $4.49 $13,455.00

28oz

6 / pack

4 Country Rolls, 32 oz $3.45 $496.44

24 ct

4 / pack

5 Pecan Rolls, 8 oz No Bid

6 Raisin Rolls, 8 oz. No Bid

7 Apple Fruit, 8 oz. No Bid

8 Hamburger Buns $0.24 $167.04

20 ct

2 pack

9 Hotdog Buns $0.20 $69.60

12 ct

6 pack

9 Danish $0.87 $1,508.40

Assorted Ind. Wrapped 3.25 oz

24 / pack

10 Steak Buns $0.55 $59.85

2.52 oz

6 in.

Grand Total $39,426.33

Category Description Brand or Equivalent Qty
Pkg Size If

Different
Unit Price

Extended 

Price
State Item#

1 3 - CENTER OF PLATE
BACON ENDS & 

PIECES

KIOLBASA
50

15 LB
 $     23.96  $  1,198.00 

134216

2 3 - CENTER OF PLATE
BEEF STEW MEAT 1 

IN  CUBE

WOLVERIN
50

5 LB
 $     39.95  $  1,997.50 

135388

3 3 - CENTER OF PLATE

CHICKEN BREAST 

RANDOM

BLSL

PACKER

250

10 LB

 $     56.90  $14,225.00 

487420

4 3 - CENTER OF PLATE
BRISKET BNLS NR 

#120

IBP
30

12 LB
 $       3.09  $        92.70 

500245

5 3 - CENTER OF PLATE

BEEF GROUND FINE 

73/27 FROZEN

PACKER

220

10 #CW

 $       2.39  $      525.80 

506080

6 3 - CENTER OF PLATE
BEEF PATTY 4/1 

WITH TVP

HOLTEN
50

4 OZ
 $     31.95  $  1,597.50 

506104

7 3 - CENTER OF PLATE
BEEF PATTY 75/25 

4/1

HOLTEN
70

4 OZ
 $     26.95  $  1,886.50 

506123

8 3 - CENTER OF PLATE
BEEF GROUND FINE 

81/19

IBP
20

5 LB
 $       2.74  $        54.80 

506275

9 3 - CENTER OF PLATE
BEEF GROUND FINE 

73/27

ELLINGTN
20

10 LB
 $       2.49  $        49.80 

506475

10 3 - CENTER OF PLATE
BEEF GROUND 

90/10

SUPREME
20

5 LB
 $     43.95  $      879.00 

506497

GRAND TOTAL $22,506.60

Rotellas

Item 398681

45 pkgs

Item 290220

3 pkgs

36

pkgs

87 pkgs

Mrs. Baird

Item 290155

Item 418011

pkgs

36

pkgs

Frsh/Kth

36 pkgs

Bimbo

36

Frsh/Kth

Whole Wheat

Item 290073

500 pkgs

Rotellas

Item 394094

5505 Kaepa Ct.

San Antonio, TX 78218

73 pkgs

(800) 661-7998

rmbrown@benekeith.com

QTY

750 loaves

Frsh/Kth

 Annual Contract for Meats, Milk & Bread

October 01, 2020 to September 30, 2021 brandon_harjo@deanfoods.com

Bid 2021-08

Oak Farms / Hygeia Dairy

BREAD Ben E. Keith Foods

c/o Ronald M. Brown

Bid 2021-08

 Annual Contract for Meats, Milk & Bread

Bid 2020-08

 Annual Contract for Meats, Milk & Bread

c/o Ronald M. Brown

5505 Kaepa Ct.

Chef P

White

Item 290020

750 loaves

rmbrown@benekeith.com

MILK c/o Brandon Harjo

1314 Fredricksburg Rd.

San Antonio, TX 78201

(210) 732-1111

October 01, 2019 to September 30, 2020

October 01, 2020 to September 30, 2021

San Antonio, TX 78218

Contract Term: (800) 661-7998

Ben E. Keith Foods

MEAT

New Dairy Texas LLC (Borden Dairy)

c/o Vince Varjabedian

71 Strandtman Cove

Austin, TX 78702

(210) 867-1253

vince.varjabedian@bordendairy.com
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