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9097776 450 MRKN/FC BEAN GREEN REGULAR CUT 18.91$    101919 15 FOSTER CORN DOG ALL MEAT 4 OZ 48.66$      15 FOSTER CORN DOG ALL MEAT 4 OZ 37.90$      

9236654 5 BRIDGFRD BISCUIT BAKED BUTTERMILK 29.59$    124523 10 ELLINGTN CORN DOG TURKEY MINI 33.17$      5 REDSTONE POTATO WEDGE SKIN ON EX LARGE 38.60$      

9240038 20 NYFROZEN BREADSTICK GARLIC 6 IN BULK 26.87$    127425 240 EGGO WAFFLE EGGO TRADITIONAL 4 IN 22.49$      10 ELLINGTN CORN DOG TURKEY MINI 30.10$      

9090383 170 MRKN/FC BROCCOLI CUT 13.89$    139235 250 KTH/HOME FRENCH FRIES SC 3/8 IN 23.15$      240 EGGO WAFFLE EGGO TRADITIONAL 4 IN 22.30$      

9090383 120 MRKN/FC BROCCOLI CUT 13.89$    334355 450 MRKN/FC BEAN GREEN REGULAR CUT 19.47$      90 FARMERS FRENCH FRIES SC 3/8 IN 21.65$      

9090393 5 MRKN/FC BROCCOLI FLORET IQF 21.81$    335208 290 MRKN/FC BROCCOLI CUT 20.53$      450 MRKN/FC BEAN GREEN REGULAR CUT 18.50$      

9242226 5 TURANO BUN MINI BRIOCHE SLIDER 32.76$    335299 5 MRKN/FC BROCCOLI FLORET IQF 35.31$      170 MRKN/FC BROCCOLI CUT 15.40$      

8978119 540 4HOMBRES BURRITO BEEF & BEAN 45.45$    336345 150 MRKN/FC CARROT DICED 3/8 X 3/8 18.80$      120 MRKN/FC BROCCOLI CUT 15.40$      

9342809 30 SARA LEE CAKE BUTTER POUND IW 13.72$    336348 30 MRKN/FC CARROT CRINKLE CUT 19.98$      5 MRKN/FC BROCCOLI FLORET IQF 23.90$      

9098824 30 MRKN/FC CARROT CRINKLE CUT 18.04$    337112 20 MRKN/FC CAULIFLOWER IQF 23.35$      150 MRKN/FC CARROT DICED 3/8 X 3/8 16.76$      

4541020 150 MRKN/FC CARROT DICED 3/8 X 3/8 16.81$    338602 730 MRKN/FC CORN CUT 19.27$      30 MRKN/FC CARROT CRINKLE CUT 17.90$      

9092231 10 MRKN/FC CAULIFLOWER IQF 20.79$    343555 90 MRKN/FC PEA GREEN 19.82$      10 MRKN/FC CAULIFLOWER IQF 19.65$      

9092231 10 MRKN/FC CAULIFLOWER IQF 20.79$    345103 45 MRKN/FC SQUASH YELLOW SLICED 23.47$      10 MRKN/FC CAULIFLOWER IQF 19.65$      

8977119 10 POSADA CHIMICHANGA BEEF SHREDDED 48.07$    345503 20 MRKN/FC SQUASH ZUCCHINI SLICED 1/4IN 27.54$      730 MRKN/FC CORN CUT 17.07$      

9090540 730 MRKN/FC CORN CUT 17.85$    349136 190 MRKN/FC VEGETABLE MIXED 5 WAY 20.69$      90 MRKN/FC PEA GREEN 19.25$      

8968331 15 FOSTER CORN DOG ALL MEAT 4 OZ 36.74$    349712 150 MRKN/FC VEGETABLE BLEND PEAS & CARROTS 20.09$      25 MRKN/FC SQUASH YELLOW SLICED 16.75$      

8884000 20 FOSTER CORN DOG CHICKEN 36.02$    360811 90 ORE IDA POTATO TATER TOTS 46.01$      20 MRKN/FC SQUASH YELLOW SLICED 16.75$      

8883939 10 ELLINGTN CORN DOG TURKEY MINI 30.14$    361069 15 ORE IDA HASHBROWN GOLDEN PATTY 29.09$      10 MRKN/FC SQUASH ZUCCHINI SLICED 1/4IN 26.20$      

9235972 5 PILLSBRY DOUGH BISCUIT BUTTERMILK 40.41$    361191 5 LAMB SUP HASHBROWN 2 1/2 OZ PATTY 40.33$      10 MRKN/FC SQUASH ZUCCHINI SLICED 1/4IN 26.20$      

8979140 5 FERNANDO ENCHILADA BEEF 28.75$    361226 170 LAMB SUP HASHBROWN SIDE O BROWNS 64.74$      190 MRKN/FC VEGETABLE MIXED 5 WAY 19.05$      

8977090 5 FERNANDO ENCHILADA CHICKEN 25.64$    362156 15 LMB WSTN POTATO WEDGE NATURAL CUT 43.64$      150 MRKN/FC VEGETABLE BLEND PEAS & CARROTS 18.00$      

9024860 250 LMB WSTN FRENCH FRIES RC 3/8 IN 36.45$    363411 5 HSPLENDR POTATO SWEET WEDGE 36.33$      250 LMB WSTN FRENCH FRIES RC 3/8 IN 32.50$      

9024589 90 FARMERS FRENCH FRIES SC 3/8 IN 34.96$    363415 5 LAMB SUP POTATO MASHED ROASTED GARLIC 42.33$      90 ORE IDA POTATO TATER TOTS 40.75$      

8855099 5 PAPETTIS FRENCH TOAST PLAIN ROUND 4 IN 81.00$    363427 40 LAMB SUP POTATO MASHED TRADITIONAL 42.00$      15 ORE IDA HASHBROWN GOLDEN PATTY 27.85$      

9335514 370 GRABITZR FRENCH TOAST STICK 47.68$    370008 20 FOSTER CORN DOG CHICKEN 33.58$      5 LAMB SUP HASHBROWN 2 1/2 OZ PATTY 34.95$      

9020104 5 LAMB SUP HASHBROWN 2 1/2 OZ PATTY 29.44$    370990 15 J DEAN SANDWICH SAUS EGG & CHEESE 18.81$      170 LAMB SUP HASHBROWN SIDE O BROWNS 49.70$      

9020104 15 ORE IDA HASHBROWN GOLDEN PATTY 29.44$    383460 5 STOUFFER LASAGNA MEAT 81.63$      10 LAMB NAT POTATO WEDGE NATURAL CUT 38.60$      

9020104 170 LAMB SUP HASHBROWN SIDE O BROWNS 29.44$    384418 190 TONYS PIZZA CHEESE 4X6 WHOLE GRAIN 43.43$      5 HSPLENDR POTATO SWEET WEDGE 33.40$      

9163155 5 STOUFFER LASAGNA MEAT 77.58$    384420 25 TONYS PIZZA PEPPERONI WHOLE GRAIN 49.02$      5 LAMB SUP POTATO MASHED ROASTED GARLIC 36.40$      

4033222 5 CHEF P MUFFIN BLUEBERRY 26.48$    385014 540 4HOMBRES BURRITO BEEF & BEAN 24.91$      40 LAMB SUP POTATO MASHED TRADITIONAL 37.40$      

9232323 5 CHEF P MUFFIN MINI BLUEBERRY 26.28$    385229 10 POSADA CHIMICHANGA BEEF SHREDDED 56.73$      20 FOSTER CORN DOG CHICKEN 33.65$      

9330013 100 MBTRWRTH PANCAKE ORIGINAL 22.64$    385406 5 FERNANDO ENCHILADA BEEF 26.65$      10 J DEAN SANDWICH SAUS EGG & CHEESE 17.65$      

9330013 200 A JEMIMA PANCAKE WG 3.75 IN 22.64$    385424 5 FERNANDO ENCHILADA CHICKEN 23.62$      5 J DEAN SANDWICH SAUS EGG & CHEESE 17.65$      

9095622 90 MRKN/FC PEA GREEN 20.56$    385792 40 RODRIGUZ TAMALE BEEF IN HUSK 1.5 OZ 33.40$      5 STOUFFER LASAGNA MEAT 76.00$      

9273012 15 CHEF P PIE PUMPKIN 10 INCH PREBAKED 40.02$    394606 20 NYFROZEN BREADSTICK GARLIC 6 IN BULK 25.25$      190 TONYS PIZZA CHEESE 4X6 WHOLE GRAIN 43.50$      

8901238 190 TONYS PIZZA CHEESE 4X6 WHOLE GRAIN 50.32$    394691 5 TURANO BUN MINI BRIOCHE SLIDER 37.97$      25 TONYS PIZZA PEPPERONI WHOLE GRAIN 49.60$      

8901265 25 TONYS PIZZA PEPPERONI WHOLE GRAIN 62.80$    399560 20 BRIDGFRD BISCUIT BAKED BUTTERMILK 29.71$      540 4HOMBRES BURRITO BEEF & BEAN 24.85$      

8973068 5 LAMB SUP POTATO MASHED ROASTED GARLIC 38.87$    401166 240 KRUSTEAZ WAFFLE BELGIAN 4 INCH 37.44$      10 POSADA CHIMICHANGA BEEF SHREDDED 48.00$      

2106383 40 LAMB SUP POTATO MASHED TRADITIONAL 70.22$    401215 370 GRABITZR FRENCH TOAST STICK 25.31$      5 FERNANDO ENCHILADA BEEF 26.75$      

9024580 5 HSPLENDR POTATO SWEET WEDGE 37.31$    401336 200 A JEMIMA PANCAKE 3.75IN WG 22.15$      5 FERNANDO ENCHILADA CHICKEN 24.15$      

9050576 90 ORE IDA POTATO TATER TOTS 47.74$    401352 100 MBTRWRTH PANCAKE ORIGINAL 19.19$      40 RODRIGUZ TAMALE BEEF IN HUSK 1.5 OZ 30.65$      

9020108 10 LAMB NAT POTATO WEDGE NATURAL CUT 42.93$    407174 5 CHEF P MUFFIN BLUEBERRY                    (R) 46.50$      20 NYFROZEN BREADSTICK GARLIC 6 IN BULK 24.00$      

9020120 5 REDSTONE POTATO WEDGE SKIN ON EX LARGE 43.48$    407235 5 CHEF P MUFFIN MINI BLUEBERRY               (R) 24.07$      5 TURANO BUN MINI BRIOCHE SLIDER 38.29$      

8915054 10 J DEAN SANDWICH SAUS EGG & CHEESE 20.51$    408067 5 MEX ORIG TORTILLA WRAP HONEY WHEAT 10IN 26.67$      5 BRIDGFRD BISCUIT BAKED BUTTERMILK 29.20$      

8915054 5 J DEAN SANDWICH SAUS EGG & CHEESE 20.51$    412859 5 PILLSBRY DOUGH BISCUIT BUTTERMILK 30.25$      15 KRUSTEAZ WAFFLE BELGIUM 7 IN ROUND IW

9091358 25 MRKN/FC SQUASH YELLOW SLICED 16.81$    414473 30 SARA LEE CAKE BUTTER POUND IW                (R) 13.06$      20 KRUSTEAZ WAFFLE BELGIAN 4 INCH 38.95$      

9091358 20 MRKN/FC SQUASH YELLOW SLICED 16.81$    430075 15 CHEF P PIE PUMPKIN 10 INCH PREBAKED        (R) 38.12$      370 GRABITZR FRENCH TOAST STICK 23.50$      

9095796 10 MRKN/FC SQUASH ZUCCHINI SLICED 1/4IN 16.80$    100934 15 PACKER TILAPIA FILLET 5-7 OZ 27.51$      200 A JEMIMA PANCAKE WG 3.75 IN 21.85$      

9095796 10 MRKN/FC SQUASH ZUCCHINI SLICED 1/4IN 16.80$    101756 5 COVERWGN BACON SLAB SLICED RANDOM #2 60.94$      100 MBTRWRTH PANCAKE ORIGINAL 17.60$      

7040087 40 RODRIGUZ TAMALE BEEF IN HUSK 1.5 OZ 55.89$    102198 15 GRANSABR CHICKEN FAJITA MEAT ESPECIAL 4.17$        5 CHEF P MUFFIN BLUEBERRY 25.45$      

8979061 5 MEX ORIG TORTILLA WRAP HONEY WHEAT 10IN 21.96$    104374 35 BONICI MEATBALL BEEF & CHICKEN 34.21$      5 CHEF P MUFFIN MINI BLUEBERRY 22.90$      

9081814 150 MRKN/FC VEGETABLE BLEND PEAS & CARROTS 17.54$    104890 30 TYSON CHICKEN MEAT DICED 1/2 IN 37.53$      5 MEX ORIG TORTILLA WRAP HONEY WHEAT 10IN 21.90$      

9095655 190 MRKN/FC VEGETABLE MIXED 5 WAY 19.27$    106559 5 COCINAGR CHILI NO BEANS 62.18$      5 PILLSBRY DOUGH BISCUIT BUTTERMILK 28.30$      

9342658 20 KRUSTEAZ WAFFLE BELGIAN 4 INCH 38.21$    106944 25 GRANSABR CHICKEN FAJITA STRIP COOKED 40.22$      30 SARA LEE CAKE BUTTER POUND IW 11.90$      

9342658 15 KRUSTEAZ WAFFLE BELGIUM 7 IN ROUND IW 38.21$    108599 5 TYSON CHICKEN DRUMSTICK BRD COOKED 98.17$      15 CHEF P PIE PUMPKIN 10 INCH PREBAKED 37.20$      

9409854 240 EGGO WAFFLE EGGO TRADITIONAL 4 IN 22.52$    114966 5 TYSON CHICKEN CRUMBLED COOKED 50.59$      5 PAPETTIS FRENCH TOAST PLAIN ROUND 4 IN

1911338 5 H VALUE BACON ENDS & PIECES 22.78$    115457 160 MINUTEMN CHICKEN PATTY BREADED COOKED 63.10$      15 PACKER TILAPIA FILLET 5-7 OZ 26.15$      

1911338 50 KIOLBASA BACON ENDS AND PIECES 22.78$    115464 540 MINUTEMA BEEF & CHICKEN PATTY 3 OZ CKD 98.79$      5 COVERWGN BACON SLAB SLICED RANDOM #2 16.10$      

5469772 5 COVERWGN BACON SLAB SLICED RANDOM #2 10.91$    128888 30 HILSHIRE TURKEY BREAST SLICED .5 OZ 43.77$      15 GRANSABR CHICKEN FAJITA MEAT LACOCINA 2.90$        

No Bid 390 MINUTEMA BEEF & CHICKEN PATTY 3 OZ CKD -$        129022 10 HILSHIRE ROAST BEEF SLICED .5 OZ EA 66.50$      35 BONICI MEATBALL BEEF & CHICKEN 30.90$      

No Bid 150 MINUTEMA BEEF & CHICKEN PATTY 3 OZ CKD -$        130709 5 BRIARSTR HAM SHAVING SMKD BNLS 2.12$        20 INTRSTAT POLLOCK RECT BRD WG CN 3.6 OZ 30.90$      

9397021 10 KTH/VALY BEEF FAJITA MEAT COOKED 78.56$    135388 30 WOLVERIN BEEF STEW 1X1 41.06$      30 TYSON CHICKEN MEAT DICED 1/2 IN 31.10$      

8941403 160 ADVANCE BEEF SALISBURY FLAME BROILED 109.94$  144042 10 ADVANCEP CHICKEN NUGGET BREAST MEAT 24.85$      5 COCINAGR CHILI NO BEANS 58.60$      

8941403 60 ADVANCE BEEF SALISBURY FLAME BROILED 109.94$  146484 940 HIGHLINE POLLOCK RECT BRD WG CN 3.6 OZ 40.59$      25 GRANSABR CHICKEN FAJITA STRIP COOKED 38.20$      

8952752 75 ADVANCE BEEF STEAK FINGER COOKED CN 26.68$    153358 50 PROTIMEX BACON ENDS AND PIECES 23.47$      5 TYSON CHICKEN DRUMSTICK BRD COOKED 41.50$      

8952752 15 ADVANCE BEEF STEAK FINGER COOKED CN 26.68$    399593 5 J DEAN BISCUIT SAUSAGE EGG & CHEESE 20.38$      5 TYSON CHICKEN CRUMBLED COOKED 47.00$      

8952796 370 ADVANCE BEEF STEAK FRITTER 4/1 COOKED 27.92$    487158 10 TYSON CHICKEN THIGH IQF RAW 44.87$      120 MINUTEMN CHICKEN PATTY BREADED COOKED 24.15$      

8952796 80 ADVANCE BEEF STEAK FRITTER 4/1 COOKED 27.92$    487189 20 TYSON CHICKEN THIGH IQF RAW 44.94$      40 MINUTEMN CHICKEN PATTY BREADED COOKED 24.15$      

5009993 30 WOLVERIN BEEF STEW 1X1 88.80$    487620 5 TYSON CHICKEN BREAST FILLET MESQ CKD 44.72$      390 MINUTEMA BEEF & CHICKEN PATTY 3 OZ CKD 81.30$      
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No Bid 5 J DEAN BISCUIT BACON EGG & CHEESE IW -$        487701 30 ADVANCEP CHICKEN BREAST PATTY BRD 28.53$      150 MINUTEMA BEEF & CHICKEN PATTY 3 OZ CKD 81.30$      

8915054 5 J DEAN BISCUIT SAUSAGE EGG & CHEESE 20.51$    488030 80 PACKER CHICKEN LEG QUARTER RANDOM FZN 25.14$      30 HILSHIRE TURKEY BREAST SLICED .5 OZ 43.35$      

No Bid 430 FARMLAND BOLOGNA SLICED -$        488128 10 BONICI CHICKEN WING BONELESS COOKED 40.93$      10 HILSHIRE ROAST BEEF SLICED .5 OZ EA 62.75$      

8914814 5 HORMEL BREAKFAST BAR HAM EGG CHEESE 47.62$    492029 100 BUTTERBL TURKEY FRANK 8/1 6 IN 19.74$      5 BRIARSTR HAM SHAVING SMKD BNLS 1.75$        

No Bid 60 TYSON CHICKEN BREAST FILLET MESQ CKD -$        492249 15 BREADRDY TURKEY SLICED BREAD READY 51.68$      50 KIOLBASA BACON ENDS AND PIECES 21.80$      

8668783 5 ADVANCE CHICKEN BREAST PATTY BRD 31.01$    492340 155 ELLINGTN TURKEY SLICED SMOKED .70 OZ 49.67$      30 WOLVERIN BEEF STEW 1X1 36.55$      

8668783 30 ADVANCE CHICKEN BREAST PATTY BRD 31.01$    492681 100 CAROLINA TURKEY HAM DICED CURED 21.65$      10 ADVANCE CHICKEN NUGGET BREAST MEAT 19.25$      

No Bid 5 TYSON CHICKEN CRUMBLED COOKED -$        492954 15 BUTTERBL TURKEY LUNCHMEAT COMBO 34.73$      5 J DEAN BISCUIT BACON EGG & CHEESE IW 20.00$      

8669911 5 TYSON CHICKEN DRUMSTICK BRD COOKED 42.41$    509009 10 KTH/VALY BEEF FAJITA MEAT COOKED 69.41$      5 J DEAN BISCUIT SAUSAGE EGG & CHEESE 19.15$      

8942872 15 GRANSABR CHICKEN FAJITA MEAT LACOCINA 34.78$    509414 220 ADVANCE BEEF SALISBURY FLAME BROILED 99.27$      940 VIKING POLLOCK RECT BRD COOKED 3.6OZ 34.70$      

8942872 25 GRANSABR CHICKEN FAJITA STRIP COOKED 34.78$    509618 25 SMARTPIC MEATLOAF PATTY DELUXE 74.65$      40 ADVANCE CHICKEN NUGGET BREAST MEAT CKD 19.25$      

8861015 80 PACKER CHICKEN LEG QUARTER RANDOM FZN 22.55$    510413 90 ADVANCE BEEF STEAK FINGER COOKED CN 37.95$      10 TYSON CHICKEN THIGH IQF RAW 52.65$      

8878445 30 TYSON CHICKEN MEAT DICED 1/2 IN 33.56$    510496 450 ADVANCE BEEF STEAK FRITTER 4/1 COOKED 38.51$      20 TYSON CHICKEN THIGH IQF RAW 52.65$      

8668781 10 ADVANCE CHICKEN NUGGET BREAST MEAT 25.04$    522422 465 FONTANIN MEATBALL ITALIAN .5 OZ 41.77$      5 TYSON CHICKEN WING DRUMMETTE 51.00$      

8668781 40 ADVANCE CHICKEN NUGGET BREAST MEAT CKD 25.04$    526592 15 APF RED VEAL PATTY CHICKEN FRIED 42.35$      60 TYSON CHICKEN BREAST FILLET MESQ CKD 42.55$      

8668783 120 MINUTEMN CHICKEN PATTY BREADED COOKED 31.01$    530107 5 H VALUE BACON ENDS & PIECES 24.12$      5 ADVANCE CHICKEN BREAST PATTY BRD 24.15$      

8668783 40 MINUTEMN CHICKEN PATTY BREADED COOKED 31.01$    532351 10 QTF PORK PATTY RIB SHAPE COOKED CN 44.16$      30 ADVANCE CHICKEN BREAST PATTY BRD 24.15$      

8666019 10 TYSON CHICKEN THIGH IQF RAW 38.86$    532421 20 KINGS PORK RIB PATTY W/BBQ SAUCE 57.00$      80 PACKER CHICKEN LEG QUARTER RANDOM FZN 24.75$      

8666019 20 TYSON CHICKEN THIGH IQF RAW 38.86$    536111 450 FARMLAND FRANK ALL MEAT 8/1 20.77$      10 BONICI CHICKEN WING BONELESS COOKED 36.00$      

8867312 10 BONICI CHICKEN WING BONELESS COOKED 36.11$    536313 15 TYSON FRANK ALL MEAT 10/1 6 INCH 27.35$      100 BUTTERBL TURKEY FRANK 8/1 6 IN 17.60$      

8868095 5 TYSON CHICKEN WING DRUMMETTE 51.01$    538043 30 HORMEL HAM SLICED WATER ADDED 43.74$      10 HORMEL TURKEY BREAST OVEN ROASTD 115.00$   

3153004 5 COCINAGR CHILI NO BEANS 91.48$    538306 5 NATCHOIC HAM SLICED SMOKED .5 OZ 59.24$      15 HORMEL TURKEY SLICED BREAD READY 51.90$      

8778002 15 TYSON FRANK ALL MEAT 10/1 6 INCH 39.62$    540057 400 KTH/VALY SAUSAGE PATTY 1.25 OZ COOKED 37.84$      140 ELLINGTN TURKEY SLICED SMOKED .70 OZ 48.45$      

8778645 450 FARMLAND FRANK ALL MEAT 8/1 27.99$    541092 15 NATCHOIC SAUSAGE LINK NATURAL COOKED 33.06$      15 ELLINGTN TURKEY SLICED SMOKED .70 OZ 48.45$      

9402579 100 SMITHFLD HAM DICED 1/4 INCH IQF 34.89$    158485 5 J BAR B SAUSAGE SMOKED ROPE 24.46$      5 CAROLINA TURKEY HAM DICED CURED 21.10$      

8934004 5 BRIARSTR HAM SHAVING SMKD BNLS 50.58$    541205 85 ALAMO SAUSAGE CHORIZO ALL BEEF 23.57$      50 CAROLINA TURKEY HAM BUFFET DELUXE 30.75$      

8591019 5 HORMEL HAM SLICED SMOKED .5 OZ 57.29$    541383 50 ECKRICH SAUSAGE SMOKED ROPE 32.21$      15 JENNIE O TURKEY MEAT PULLED WHITE

8934004 30 HORMEL HAM SLICED WATER ADDED 50.58$    541413 245 J DEAN SAUSAGE LINK COOKED SKINLESS 33.58$      5 BUTTERBL TURKEY LUNCHMEAT COMBO 31.50$      

8886673 15 FARMLAND LUNCH MEAT COMBO PACK 37.81$    544370 5 HORMEL BREAKFAST BAR HAM EGG CHEESE 45.71$      10 KTH/VALY BEEF FAJITA MEAT COOKED 62.80$      

9290014 35 BONICI MEATBALL BEEF & CHICKEN 31.91$    547005 50 MARGHRTA SALAMI HARD SLICED 68.26$      160 ADVANCE BEEF SALISBURY FLAME BROILED 55.60$      

9290012 350 FONTANIN MEATBALL ITALIAN .5 OZ 37.61$    139472 430 BUTTERBL TURKEY BOLOGNA SLICED .5 OZ 50.13$      60 ADVANCE BEEF SALISBURY FLAME BROILED 55.60$      

9290012 115 FONTANIN MEATBALL ITALIAN .5 OZ 37.61$    102291 5 FRITOLAY CHIP VARIETY LSS FIESTA PACK 29.92$      20 SMARTPIC MEATLOAF PATTY DELUXE 59.75$      

8942809 20 SMARTPIC MEATLOAF PATTY DELUXE 113.59$  102766 300 BLACKHIV BEAN PINTO TRIPLE CLEAN DRIED 44.41$      5 SMARTPIC MEATLOAF PATTY DELUXE 59.75$      

8942809 5 SMARTPIC MEATLOAF PATTY DELUXE 113.59$  104927 30 GRANSABR PEPPER BLACK GROUND FINE 42.24$      75 ADVANCE BEEF STEAK FINGER COOKED CN 26.65$      

8825045 940 VIKING POLLOCK RECT BRD COOKED 3.6OZ 34.41$    104928 10 GRANSABR CHILI POWDER LIGHT 26.22$      15 ADVANCE BEEF STEAK FINGER COOKED CN 26.65$      

8825045 20 INTRSTAT POLLOCK RECT BRD WG CN 3.6 OZ 34.41$    104929 5 GRANSABR GARLIC GRANULATED 31.89$      370 ADVANCE BEEF STEAK FRITTER 4/1 COOKED 27.90$      

8945554 10 QTF PORK PATTY RIB SHAPE COOKED CN 40.28$    106058 15 GRANSABR CHIP TORTILLA YELLOW ROUND 16.59$      80 ADVANCE BEEF STEAK FRITTER 4/1 COOKED 27.90$      

8945554 20 KINGS PORK RIB PATTY W/BBQ SAUCE 40.28$    106830 5 SMOKEHSE SAUCE BBQ SWEET & SMOKY             (R) 43.64$      350 FONTANIN MEATBALL ITALIAN .5 OZ 32.10$      

8934029 10 HILSHIRE ROAST BEEF SLICED .5 OZ EA 73.26$    106860 20 GLACIER WATER NATURAL DISTILLED 3.68$        115 FONTANIN MEATBALL ITALIAN .5 OZ 32.10$      

8922564 50 ARMOUR SALAMI HARD SLICED 70.20$    110417 45 GRANSABR PEPPER JALAPENO NACHO SLICED 25.35$      15 APF RED VEAL PATTY CHICKEN FRIED 42.30$      

9169927 85 ALAMO SAUSAGE CHORIZO ALL BEEF 24.10$    112278 5 JHS CHOCOLATE ENROBER ZTF 70.48$      5 H VALUE BACON ENDS & PIECES 21.25$      

8957075 20 TENN PRD SAUSAGE LINK .75OZ COOKED MILD 31.51$    113583 5 LAKESIDE CARROT SLICED MEDIUM 29.74$      10 QTF PORK PATTY RIB SHAPE COOKED CN 44.40$      

8957075 245 J DEAN SAUSAGE LINK COOKED SKINLESS 31.51$    117439 10 ELLINGTN STUFFING MIX CORNBREAD 59.32$      20 KINGS PORK RIB PATTY W/BBQ SAUCE 38.20$      

8957075 15 BEKO SAUSAGE LINK MILD 1 OZ COOKED 31.51$    811024 15 KTH/HOME BASE CHICKEN FLAVOR SOUP 50.57$      450 FARMLAND FRANK ALL MEAT 8/1 19.55$      

8957075 15 NATCHOIC SAUSAGE LINK NATURAL COOKED 31.51$    640345 50 ELGTNCOF COFFEE TRADITIONAL GROUND 73.37$      15 TYSON FRANK ALL MEAT 10/1 6 INCH 26.05$      

8927105 400 KTH/VALY SAUSAGE PATTY 1.25 OZ COOKED 33.08$    122273 60 ELLINGTN RICE LONG GRAIN 4% BROKEN           (R) 21.65$      30 HORMEL HAM SLICED WATER ADDED 43.90$      

8933947 50 ECKRICH SAUSAGE SMOKED ROPE 43.32$    122642 115 ELLINGTN DRINK MIX FRUIT PUNCH 33.86$      5 HORMEL HAM SLICED SMOKED .5 OZ 57.65$      

8933947 5 S MAID SAUSAGE SMOKED ROPE COOKED 43.32$    122643 110 ELLINGTN DRINK MIX LEMONADE POWDERED 33.86$      100 SMITHFLD HAM DICED 1/4 INCH IQF

8806511 15 PACKER TILAPIA FILLET 5-7 OZ 30.29$    122644 100 ELLINGTN DRINK MIX PEACH POWDERED 33.86$      400 KTH/VALY SAUSAGE PATTY 1.25 OZ COOKED 34.20$      

5474008 10 HORMEL TURKEY BREAST OVEN ROASTD 50.16$    122646 140 ELLINGTN DRINK MIX ORANGE POWDERED 33.86$      15 NATCHOIC SAUSAGE LINK NATURAL COOKED 31.75$      

5474008 30 HILSHIRE TURKEY BREAST SLICED .5 OZ 50.16$    122647 110 ELLINGTN DRINK MIX PINK LEMONADE PWD 33.86$      5 S MAID SAUSAGE SMOKED ROPE COOKED 30.15$      

8938276 100 BUTTERBL TURKEY FRANK 8/1 6 IN 18.42$    122648 65 ELLINGTN DRINK MIX GRAPE POWDERED 33.86$      85 ALAMO SAUSAGE CHORIZO ALL BEEF 21.20$      

8883936 50 CAROLINA TURKEY HAM BUFFET DELUXE 18.48$    122649 100 ELLINGTN DRINK MIX CHERRY POWDERED 33.86$      50 ECKRICH SAUSAGE SMOKED ROPE 29.90$      

8887741 5 CAROLINA TURKEY HAM DICED CURED 34.89$    123269 50 ELLINGTN SAUCE PICANTE MEDIUM HOT 43.99$      245 J DEAN SAUSAGE LINK COOKED SKINLESS 30.75$      

8886673 5 BUTTERBL TURKEY LUNCHMEAT COMBO 37.81$    123271 5 ELLINGTN SAUCE ENCHILADA MILD RTU 35.88$      20 TENN PRD SAUSAGE LINK .75OZ COOKED MILD 30.75$      

No Bid 15 JENNIE O TURKEY MEAT PULLED WHITE -$        123289 10 ELLINGTN PUDDING BANANA RTS 34.67$      15 BEKO SAUSAGE LINK MILD 1 OZ COOKED

5474008 15 HORMEL TURKEY SLICED BREAD READY 50.16$    123293 15 ELLINGTN PUDDING TAPIOCA RTS 36.07$      5 HORMEL BREAKFAST BAR HAM EGG CHEESE 41.75$      

8601061 140 ELLINGTN TURKEY SLICED SMOKED .70 OZ 52.86$    123884 100 ELLINGTN CHILI WITH BEANS                    (R) 67.48$      50 ARMOUR SALAMI HARD SLICED 58.10$      

8601061 15 ELLINGTN TURKEY SLICED SMOKED .70 OZ 52.86$    124165 5 KTH/VALY MUSTARD PREPARED                    (R) 12.13$      430 FARMLAND BOLOGNA SLICED 34.10$      

8941153 15 APF RED VEAL PATTY CHICKEN FRIED 72.33$    124180 5 ELLINGTN PEANUT BUTTER CREAMY                (R) 60.92$      15 FARMLAND LUNCH MEAT COMBO PACK 35.55$      

1690011 15 ELLINGTN APPLESAUCE FANCY UNSWEETENED 32.12$    124810 5 ORCHARDN APRICOT HALVES EX LIGHT SYRUP 46.92$      5 FRITOLAY CHIP VARIETY LSS FIESTA PACK 28.80$      

81076 20 MUSSELMN APPLESAUCE NATURAL IND CUP 30.42$    125049 15 ELLINGTN APPLESAUCE FANCY UNSWEETENED 31.38$      250 BLACKHIV BEAN PINTO TRIPLE CLEAN DRIED 24.75$      

1690011 5 MOTTS APPLESAUCE NATURAL NO SUGAR 32.12$    125642 5 KTH/VALY PEAR HALF 30-35 CT NW CHOICE 44.05$      30 GRANSABR PEPPER BLACK GROUND FINE 37.80$      

81042 10 MOTTS APPLESAUCE STRAWBERRY IND CUP 30.39$    125644 5 KTH/VALY PEACH HALF 30-35CT EX LT SYRUP 43.39$      10 GRANSABR CHILI POWDER LIGHT 25.05$      

326114 5 ORCHARDN APRICOT HALVES EX LIGHT SYRUP 51.88$    125647 5 KTH/VALY FRUIT COCKTAIL CHOICE X LT SYR 45.74$      5 GRANSABR GARLIC GRANULATED 31.60$      

6415681 5 CLABGIRL BAKING SODA 21.62$    125648 5 KTH/VALY PEACH DICED EXTRA LT SYRUP 43.39$      10 GRANSABR CHIP TORTILLA YELLOW ROUND 15.45$      

2422335 15 KTH/HOME BASE BEEF FLAVOR 35.84$    125649 10 ELLINGTN FRUIT COCKTAIL CHOICE HVY SYR 46.33$      5 GRANSABR CHIP TORTILLA YELLOW ROUND 15.45$      

2422335 5 MINORS BASE BEEF NO MSG 35.84$    125658 110 ELLINGTN TOMATO SAUCE FANCY CALIFORNIA 21.92$      5 SMOKEHSE SAUCE BBQ SWEET & SMOKY 20.10$      

2423120 15 KTH/VALY BASE CHICKEN FLAVOR SOUP PASTE 7.13$      125660 50 ELLINGTN SAUCE SPAGHETTI RTU 27.80$      20 GLACIER WATER NATURAL DISTILLED 4.75$        
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Bid 2021-13 Annual Contract for Processed Foods

Contract Term: October 1, 2020 thru September 30, 2021

Annual Contract is not limited to the items listed below.  Please request pricing for additional item from vendor.

RC Food Service & Produce

c/o Alma Cavazos

120 Market St.

Laredo, TX 78040

(956) 796-9999

almacavazos77@yahoo.com

Labatt Food Service

c/o Enrique Alvarado

902 N. Expressway 77

Harlingen, TX 78550

(956) 428-0722

ealvarado@labattfood.com

Ben E. Keith

mejimenez@benekeith.com

(361) 510-9620

San Antonio, TX 78218

55054 Kaepa Ct.

c/o Matt Brown

2423120 5 KTH/PREM BASE CHICKEN PASTE REFRIGERATE 7.13$      139312 5 LAKESIDE VEGETABLE MIXED 34.74$      45 GRANSABR PEPPER JALAPENO NACHO SLICED 24.00$      

1541457 75 BUSH BEAN PINTO FANCY 21.56$    134840 15 EWIMPORT PEACH SLICED IN LIGHT SYRUP 43.32$      5 JHS CHOCOLATE ENROBER ZTF 67.80$      

4356002 250 BLACKHIV BEAN PINTO TRIPLE CLEAN DRIED 50.40$    134841 5 EWIMPORT MANDARIN ORANGE WHOLE SEGMENT 41.94$      5 LAKESIDE CARROT SLICED MEDIUM 26.60$      

4356002 25 GRANSABR BEAN PINTO TRIPLE CLEAN DRIED 50.40$    134842 10 EWIMPORT MANDARIN ORANGE BROKEN LT SYR 36.38$      10 ELLINGTN STUFFING MIX CORNBREAD 57.90$      

1561232 70 SANTIAGO BEAN REFRIED DEHYDRATED 33.58$    134843 5 EWIMPORT PINEAPPLE CRUSHED IN JUICE 36.88$      5 RICHS ICING BUTTERCREME WHITE ZTF

4356002 30 NEWALLIA BEANS PINTO WHOLE DRIED 50.40$    134852 15 EWIMPORT TUNA CHUNK LIGHT IN WATER 71.36$      15 KTH/VALY BASE CHICKEN FLAVOR SOUP PASTE 48.75$      

1591510 15 KTH/CHO BEET SLICED IRREGULAR 33.62$    134924 15 EWIMPORT FRUIT TROPICAL LT SYRUP 43.56$      50 S&D COFFEE QUALITY GROUND 135.00$   

1591510 55 LAKESIDE BEET SLICED MEDIUM 33.62$    136714 20 CMCFOOD OIL FRYING LIQUID CLEAR 20.87$      60 ELLINGTN RICE LONG GRAIN 4% BROKEN 17.85$      

4071108 5 CONTMILL CAKE MIX WHITE 28.18$    137312 15 MISSION TOSTADA YELLOW 5.5IN 40.11$      115 ELLINGTN DRINK MIX FRUIT PUNCH 31.90$      

4071110 10 CONTMILL CAKE MIX YELLOW 29.73$    140384 55 LAKESIDE BEET SLICED MEDIUM 30.62$      110 ELLINGTN DRINK MIX LEMONADE POWDERED 31.90$      

1627504 5 LAKESIDE CARROT SLICED MEDIUM 28.34$    146968 75 1906 KETCHUP INDIVIDUAL 9 GRAM PC 19.05$      100 ELLINGTN DRINK MIX PEACH POWDERED 31.90$      

3730005 15 KELLOGGS CEREAL BAR RICE KRISPIE TREAT 43.88$    148023 10 THANKYOU PUDDING LEMON RTS 38.91$      140 ELLINGTN DRINK MIX ORANGE POWDERED 31.90$      

No Bid 5 KELLOGGS CEREAL BAR STWBY YOGURT -$        148725 5 BUENO MOLE BUENO 112.06$   110 ELLINGTN DRINK MIX PINK LEMONADE PWD 31.90$      

3730003 200 M O M CEREAL BOWL APPLE ZINGS 43.88$    600044 15 MUSSELMN APPLESAUCE NATURAL IND CUP 31.33$      65 ELLINGTN DRINK MIX GRAPE POWDERED 31.90$      

No Bid 10 M O M CEREAL BOWL BERRY COLOSSAL -$        600059 10 RUBYKIST SAUCE CRANBERRY JELLIED 48.59$      100 ELLINGTN DRINK MIX CHERRY POWDERED 31.90$      

6495113 10 M O M CEREAL BOWL CINNAMON TOASTERS 45.34$    600081 5 DOLE FRUIT TROPICAL IN JUICE 20.59$      50 ELLINGTN SAUCE PICANTE MEDIUM HOT 34.50$      

6490009 5 GENMILLS CEREAL BOWL COCOA PUFFS 45.34$    600088 5 DOLE FRUIT TROPICAL SALAD LIGHT SYR 44.94$      5 ELLINGTN SAUCE ENCHILADA MILD RTU 32.60$      

3730005 150 M O M CEREAL BOWL CRISPY RICE 43.88$    600385 15 COUSINS PINEAPPLE CHUNK IN SYRUP 29.41$      10 ELLINGTN PUDDING BANANA RTS 33.80$      

6573521 140 M O M CEREAL BOWL RAISIN BRAN 43.88$    620112 80 RUBYKIST JUICE LEMON 100% JUICE 39.51$      10 ELLINGTN PUDDING LEMON RTS 18.50$      

3730004 120 M O M CEREAL BOWL TOOTIE FRUITIES 43.88$    630001 20 DASANI WATER DASANI PURIFIED 7.35$        15 ELLINGTN PUDDING TAPIOCA RTS 35.16$      

6601546 25 QUAKER CEREAL OATS QUICK 39.02$    149873 65 NIAGARA WATER DRINKING PURIFIED 5.21$        100 ELLINGTN CHILI WITH BEANS 63.95$      

2722858 5 MIPUEBLO CHEESE SAUCE CHEDDAR AGED 48.74$    630178 5 CRYSTLGT DRINK MIX IND LEMONADE SF 26.72$      5 KTH/VALY MUSTARD PREPARED 3.30$        

2722877 5 GEHLS CHEESE SAUCE MILD CHEDDAR 37.41$    630191 10 CRYSTLGT DRINK MIX IND FRUIT PUNCH SF 30.85$      5 ELLINGTN PEANUT BUTTER CREAMY 57.90$      

2722877 100 MIPUEBLO CHEESE SAUCE NACHO 37.41$    630281 5 CRYSTLGT DRINK MIX FRUIT PUNCH SF 39.94$      5 ORCHARDN APRICOT HALVES EX LIGHT SYRUP 44.10$      

6187751 10 GRANSABR CHILI POWDER LIGHT 6.74$      630660 5 GATORADE GATORADE MIX VARIETY 2.5 GAL 108.00$   15 ELLINGTN APPLESAUCE FANCY UNSWEETENED 26.00$      

3132107 100 ELLINGTN CHILI WITH BEANS 82.32$    639062 5 COFFMATE CREAMER COFFEE MATE SHAKER 20.68$      5 KTH/VALY PEAR HALF 30-35 CT NW CHOICE 38.46$      

3778047 35 CHEETOS CHIP CHEETO CRUNCHY 39.20$    639322 30 KEITH CREAMER PC NON DAIRY PACKET 21.41$      5 KTH/VALY FRUIT COCKTAIL CHOICE X LT SYR 42.95$      

3778036 10 CHEETOS CHIP CHEETO HOT CRUNCHY 34.54$    640282 30 ELGTNCOF COFFEE 100% COLOMBIAN FP 67.89$      5 KTH/VALY PEACH DICED EXTRA LT SYRUP 39.60$      

3778049 15 DORITOS CHIP DORITO COOLER RANCH 39.20$    640424 10 FOLGERS COFFEE REG ULTRA ROAST FP 106.99$   110 ELLINGTN TOMATO SAUCE FANCY CALIFORNIA 20.00$      

3778050 30 DORITOS CHIP DORITO NACHO CHEESE 39.20$    650082 75 BUSHBEST BEAN PINTO FANCY 26.12$      50 ELLINGTN SAUCE SPAGHETTI RTU 25.89$      

3778042 45 FRITOLAY CHIP FRITO CORN CHILI CHEESE 39.29$    650172 5 ALLENS CORN CREAM STYLE                    (R) 35.70$      5 ELLINGTN VEGETABLE MIXED FANCY 30.80$      

3778043 35 FRITOLAY CHIP FRITO CORN ORIGINAL 39.20$    650212 15 BUSHBEST HOMINY WHITE 21.81$      15 EWIMPORT PEACH SLICED IN LIGHT SYRUP 42.10$      

No Bid 5 FUNYUNS CHIP FUNYUN FLAMIN HOT LSS -$        650326 200 IDAHOAN POTATO MASHED INSTANT REAL          (R) 57.24$      5 EWIMPORT MANDARIN ORANGE WHOLE SEGMENT 37.65$      

3777611 10 CHAPAS CHIP PORK CRACKLIN 47.14$    650354 20 RESERS POTATO RUSSET DICED BLANCHED 18.94$      10 EWIMPORT MANDARIN ORANGE BROKEN LT SYR 33.09$      

3778044 35 LAYS CHIP POTATO REG SINGLE SERVE 39.20$    650380 5 PRINCELA POTATO SWEET CUT FANCY              (R) 38.34$      15 EWIMPORT PINEAPPLE CHUNK IN JUICE 23.50$      

3778029 10 SUNCHIPS CHIP SUNCHIP ORIGINAL 39.29$    650432 130 KTH/HOME TOMATO WHOLE PEELED 20.44$      15 EWIMPORT TUNA CHUNK LIGHT IN WATER 59.35$      

3113146 10 GRANSABR CHIP TORTILLA YELLOW ROUND 21.22$    650492 20 HUNTS TOMATO PASTE                        (R) 43.33$      15 EWIMPORT FRUIT TROPICAL LT SYRUP 31.85$      

3113146 5 GRANSABR CHIP TORTILLA YELLOW ROUND 21.22$    650613 20 DEL SOL TOMATILLO CRUSHED 40.30$      20 CMCFOOD OIL FRYING LIQUID CLEAR 19.65$      

3778095 5 FRITOLAY CHIP VARIETY LSS FIESTA PACK 31.52$    654008 130 ADOLPHUS RICE LONG GRAIN ADOLPHUS 22.48$      15 MISSION TOSTADA YELLOW 5.5IN 16.75$      

No Bid 5 JHS CHOCOLATE ENROBER ZTF -$        654203 5 PRODUCER RICE PILAF MIX SEASONED             (R) 25.52$      5 LAKESIDE VEGETABLE MIXED 30.80$      

6181176 5 SPICECLS CINNAMON GROUND 5.52$      660017 5 LIL PIG SAUCE BBQ                           (R) 18.11$      55 LAKESIDE BEET SLICED MEDIUM 28.90$      

3672011 5 CORALBAY COCONUT SNOWFLAKE 27.67$    660505 5 MIPUEBLO CHEESE SAUCE CHEDDAR AGED 39.74$      30 NEWALLIA BEANS PINTO WHOLE DRIED 24.70$      

8243323 30 ELGTNCOF COFFEE 100% COLOMBIAN FP 42.16$    660556 5 GEHLS CHEESE SAUCE MILD CHEDDAR 37.60$      5 GATORADE GATORADE MIX FRUIT PUNCH POUCH 104.85$   

8245681 50 S&D COFFEE QUALITY GROUND 19.86$    660583 100 MIPUEBLO CHEESE SAUCE NACHO 40.58$      10 MOTTS APPLESAUCE STRAWBERRY IND CUP 27.40$      

8245681 10 FOLGERS COFFEE REG ULTRA ROAST FP 19.86$    139893 160 CHOLULA SAUCE HOT PC CHOLULA 13.91$      5 MOTTS APPLESAUCE NATURAL NO SUGAR 26.10$      

3730520 25 NABISCO COOKIE ANIMAL CRACKER 22.33$    662037 15 KTH/HOME MAYONNAISE HEAVY DUTY GF            (R) 27.57$      20 MUSSELMN APPLESAUCE NATURAL IND CUP 28.45$      

3801008 240 NABISCO COOKIE BULK ASSORTMENT 29.44$    662606 10 HID VALY DRESSING PC RANCH ORIGINAL CUP 29.87$      10 RUBYKIST SAUCE CRANBERRY JELLIED 41.55$      

3802550 70 GRANDMAS COOKIE OATMEAL RAISIN 21.22$    674050 90 KEITH MUSTARD PC POLY POUCH 13.20$      10 KTH/EXCL FRUIT COCKTAIL CHOICE HVY SYR 50.50$      

3786549 30 NABISCO COOKIE VANILLA WAFER IND 23.82$    674060 300 KEITH MAYONNAISE PC 18.94$      5 DOLE FRUIT TROPICAL IN JUICE 20.50$      

1679299 5 ALLENS CORN CREAM STYLE 39.31$    674077 5 PPI DRESSING PC ITALIAN 14.92$      5 DOLE FRUIT TROPICAL SALAD LIGHT SYR 44.00$      

3700004 5 LANCE CRACKER CRUSHED SALTINES 18.35$    674120 40 KEITH JUICE LEMON PC 10.88$      5 KTH/CHO PEACH HALF 30-35CT LIGHT SYRUP 38.25$      

3700003 5 NABISCO CRACKER GRAHAM TEDDY CUB 18.53$    674146 5 PPI DRESSING PC RANCH BUTTERMILK 15.62$      5 HORIZON PINEAPPLE CRUSHED COARSE 43.30$      

3757507 10 NABISCO CRACKER RITZ 30.18$    674271 5 FRENCHS MUSTARD PC POUCH 200 CT 9.97$        5 COUSINS PINEAPPLE CHUNK IN SYRUP 23.50$      

3741774 20 NABISCO CRACKER SALTINE 16.31$    674675 5 BULLSEYE SAUCE PC BBQ BULLSEYE 13.03$      5 CARBOTRL PEACH HALF IN JUICE 38.25$      

8265563 5 NESTLE CREAMER COFFEE MATE SHAKER 39.42$    674812 120 KRAFT SAUCE PC TARTAR CREAMY 15.24$      80 RUBYKIST JUICE LEMON 100% JUICE 12.10$      

8269710 30 CREAMER PC NON DAIRY PACKET 42.69$    675001 70 KEITH SWEETENER SUGAR KEITH PC 14.54$      20 DASANI WATER DASANI PURIFIED 7.15$        

8269710 15 N JOY CREAMER PC NON-DAIRY PACKET 42.69$    675029 85 SWTDLITE SWEETENER PINK PACKET 15.88$      20 DASANI WATER DASANI PURIFIED 7.15$        

4441986 5 MCORMICK CUMIN COMINO GROUND 6.60$      675030 5 EQUAL SWEETENER EQUAL PACKET 29.24$      65 PURELIFE WATER DRINKING PURIFIED 4.85$        

4441986 25 SPICECLS CUMIN COMINO GROUND 6.60$      676006 30 KEITH PEPPER PC POUCH 19.75$      5 CRYSTLGT DRINK MIX IND LEMONADE SF 28.15$      

3471059 5 PPI DRESSING PC ITALIAN 16.07$    676007 40 KEITH SALT PC POUCH 10.81$      10 CRYSTLGT DRINK MIX IND FRUIT PUNCH SF 28.80$      

3471117 5 PPI DRESSING PC RANCH BUTTERMILK 17.20$    676026 40 MORTON SALT IODIZED TABLE 9.53$        5 CRYSTLGT DRINK MIX FRUIT PUNCH SF 43.00$      

3329803 10 HID VALY DRESSING PC RANCH ORIGINAL CUP 23.01$    677005 530 MADEIRA SYRUP PC POUCH 10.20$      5 GATORADE GATORADE MIX VARIETY 2.5 GAL 107.50$   

No Bid 100 ELLINGTN DRINK MIX CHERRY POWDERED -$        677014 85 PPI JELLY PC ASSORTED CUP 9.61$        15 N JOY CREAMER PC NON-DAIRY PACKET 20.85$      

1267545 115 ELLINGTN DRINK MIX FRUIT PUNCH 20.18$    677034 25 KEITH JELLY PC GRAPE CUP 10.69$      5 NESTLE CREAMER COFFEE MATE SHAKER 20.80$      

1284099 5 CRYSTLGT DRINK MIX FRUIT PUNCH SF 32.39$    677255 35 SMUCKERS SYRUP PC PANCAKE CUP 13.19$      30 CREAMER PC NON DAIRY PACKET 20.85$      

1281066 65 ELLINGTN DRINK MIX GRAPE POWDERED 20.18$    680012 10 BAYOU PICKLE DILL SLICE HAMBURGER CC 22.94$      30 ELGTNCOF COFFEE 100% COLOMBIAN FP

1284099 10 CRYSTLGT DRINK MIX IND FRUIT PUNCH SF 32.39$    680085 5 HEINZ PICKLE DILL SPEAR KOSHER 37.73$      10 FOLGERS COFFEE REG ULTRA ROAST FP 20.70$      

1284076 5 CRYSTLGT DRINK MIX IND LEMONADE SF 31.14$    682109 5 ROLAND OLIVE GREEN QUEEN PIMENTO STFD 100.53$   75 BUSH BEAN PINTO FANCY 21.50$      

1284578 110 ELLINGTN DRINK MIX LEMONADE POWDERED 20.18$    685022 15 EMBASA PEPPER CHIPOTLE 19.24$      15 KTH/CHO BEET SLICED IRREGULAR 28.95$      
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Bid 2021-13 Annual Contract for Processed Foods

Contract Term: October 1, 2020 thru September 30, 2021

Annual Contract is not limited to the items listed below.  Please request pricing for additional item from vendor.

RC Food Service & Produce

c/o Alma Cavazos

120 Market St.

Laredo, TX 78040

(956) 796-9999

almacavazos77@yahoo.com

Labatt Food Service

c/o Enrique Alvarado

902 N. Expressway 77

Harlingen, TX 78550

(956) 428-0722

ealvarado@labattfood.com

Ben E. Keith

mejimenez@benekeith.com

(361) 510-9620

San Antonio, TX 78218

55054 Kaepa Ct.

c/o Matt Brown

1281100 140 ELLINGTN DRINK MIX ORANGE POWDERED 20.18$    685130 20 SANMARCO PEPPER JALAPENO WHOLE 25.82$      5 ALLENS CORN CREAM STYLE 30.80$      

No Bid 100 ELLINGTN DRINK MIX PEACH POWDERED -$        688090 5 GOLDMEDL FLOUR ALL PURPOSE MEDALLION 13.83$      15 BUSHS HOMINY WHITE 20.70$      

1284577 110 ELLINGTN DRINK MIX PINK LEMONADE PWD 19.21$    688131 5 MASECA FLOUR CORN TORTILLA WHT #0 21.61$      5 KTH/EXCL VEGETABLE MIXED FANCY 30.75$      

3823372 5 GOLDMEDL FLOUR ALL PURPOSE MEDALLION 13.68$    691400 10 CONTMILL CAKE MIX YELLOW 26.84$      200 IDAHOAN POTATO MASHED INSTANT REAL 57.20$      

8973015 5 MASECA FLOUR CORN TORTILLA WHT #0 24.67$    691401 5 CONTMILL CAKE MIX WHITE 26.84$      20 RESERS POTATO RUSSET DICED BLANCHED 18.00$      

326109 10 KTH/EXCL FRUIT COCKTAIL CHOICE HVY SYR 50.65$    692003 5 CORALBAY COCONUT SNOWFLAKE 28.24$      5 PRINCELA POTATO SWEET CUT FANCY 30.10$      

326109 5 KTH/VALY FRUIT COCKTAIL CHOICE X LT SYR 50.65$    696131 5 CLABGIRL BAKING SODA 27.13$      5 PRINCELA POTATO SWEET CUT FANCY 30.10$      

326109 5 DOLE FRUIT TROPICAL IN JUICE 50.65$    697100 5 ARGO STARCH CORN 19.87$      130 KTH/HOME TOMATO WHOLE PEELED 18.80$      

566860 15 EWIMPORT FRUIT TROPICAL LT SYRUP 33.41$    699026 170 MISSION TACO SHELL 5 IN YELLOW 19.19$      20 HUNTS TOMATO PASTE 39.80$      

566860 5 DOLE FRUIT TROPICAL SALAD LIGHT SYR 33.41$    699195 35 FRITOLAY CHIP FRITO CORN ORIGINAL 37.33$      20 INDEL TOMATILLO CRUSHED 29.30$      

6184212 5 GRANSABR GARLIC GRANULATED 13.27$    699197 35 LAYS CHIP POTATO REG SINGLE SERVE 37.33$      25 GRANSABR BEAN PINTO TRIPLE CLEAN DRIED 30.50$      

6182216 15 TXCUSTOM GARLIC GRANULATED 40.26$    699199 35 CHEETOS CHIP CHEETO CRUNCHY 37.33$      130 ADOLPHUS RICE LONG GRAIN ADOLPHUS 18.76$      

6184113 15 TXCUSTOM GARLIC POWDER 9.74$      699202 15 DORITOS CHIP DORITO COOLER RANCH 37.33$      5 PRODUCER RICE PILAF MIX SEASONED 23.40$      

No Bid 5 GATORADE GATORADE MIX FRUIT PUNCH POUCH -$        699203 30 DORITOS CHIP DORITO NACHO CHEESE 37.33$      5 LIL PIG SAUCE BBQ 16.90$      

No Bid 5 GATORADE GATORADE MIX VARIETY 2.5 GAL -$        699205 10 SUNCHIPS CHIP SUNCHIP ORIGINAL 37.33$      5 MIPUEBLO CHEESE SAUCE CHEDDAR AGED 39.20$      

4860250 110 JELLO GELATIN STRAWBERRY SUGAR FREE 16.12$    699208 5 ROLDGOLD PRETZEL TINY TWISTS LOW FAT 31.59$      5 GEHLS CHEESE SAUCE MILD CHEDDAR 37.20$      

3761236 30 N VALLEY GRANOLA BAR CHEWY VARIETY PACK 45.95$    699222 5 FUNYUNS CHIP FUNYUN FLAMIN HOT LSS 32.89$      100 MIPUEBLO CHEESE SAUCE NACHO 38.45$      

3445698 60 MORRISON GRAVY MIX BROWN COUNTRY STYLE 15.53$    699640 10 CHAPAS CHIP PORK CRACKLIN 49.64$      160 CHOLULA SAUCE HOT PC CHOLULA 9.95$        

3445696 20 MORRISON GRAVY MIX COUNTRY STYLE PEPPER 14.82$    151771 45 BELLACIB PASTA SHELL MEDIUM 7/8 IN 20.75$      15 KTH/HOME MAYONNAISE HEAVY DUTY GF 26.00$      

3445696 10 MORRISON GRAVY MIX PEPPERED 14.82$    151772 60 BELLACIB PASTA ELBOW MACARONI 20.64$      10 HID VALY DRESSING PC RANCH ORIGINAL CUP 23.95$      

3445695 5 PIONEER GRAVY MIX TURKEY 19.73$    151774 20 BELLACIB PASTA EGG NOODLE WIDE 1/2 IN 17.00$      75 RED GOLD KETCHUP INDIVIDUAL 9 GRAM PC 23.40$      

1716000 15 BUSHS HOMINY WHITE 22.91$    151775 100 BELLACIB PASTA SPAGHETTI 10 IN 20.73$      90 MUSTARD PC POLY POUCH 5.90$        

4080207 5 RICHS ICING BUTTERCREME WHITE ZTF 35.75$    151779 5 BELLACIB PASTA FETTUCCINE 10 IN 21.20$      300 MAYONNAISE PC 10.50$      

4592010 85 PPI JELLY PC ASSORTED CUP 12.99$    700122 10 ZEREGA PASTA EGG NOODLE 7/8 IN 15.00$      5 PPI DRESSING PC ITALIAN 14.90$      

3451093 25 JELLY PC GRAPE CUP 13.59$    156614 5 ZEREGA PASTA SHELL SMALL 21.20$      70 SAUCE PC TARTAR 7.80$        

949602 80 RUBYKIST JUICE LEMON 100% JUICE 11.88$    157954 10 ZEREGA PASTA VERMICELLI 10 INCH 23.49$      40 JUICE LEMON PC 9.85$        

949602 40 JUICE LEMON PC 11.88$    765084 60 MYHMTWN PUDDING VANILLA RTS 28.47$      5 PPI DRESSING PC RANCH BUTTERMILK 15.50$      

3249257 75 RED GOLD KETCHUP INDIVIDUAL 9 GRAM PC 38.67$    765085 55 MYHMTWN PUDDING CHOCOLATE RTS 28.47$      5 FRENCHS MUSTARD PC POUCH 200 CT 5.90$        

22515 10 EWIMPORT MANDARIN ORANGE BROKEN LT SYR 35.61$    767052 110 JELLO GELATIN STRAWBERRY SUGAR FREE 9.75$        15 HEINZ SAUCE PC TARTAR 7.80$        

22510 5 EWIMPORT MANDARIN ORANGE WHOLE SEGMENT 37.73$    768012 15 GLDHRVST SALAD COLESLAW CREAMY GF 45.10$      5 BULLSEYE SAUCE PC BBQ BULLSEYE 13.15$      

4741400 5 KRAFT MARSHMALLOW JET PUFFED 25.20$    768022 15 RESERS SALAD PASTA MACARONI 40.10$      30 KRAFT SAUCE PC TARTAR CREAMY 7.80$        

3660004 15 KTH/HOME MAYONNAISE HEAVY DUTY GF 32.36$    768031 10 RESERS SALAD POTATO REGULAR 40.10$      70 SWEETENER SUGAR KEITH PACKET

4592200 300 MAYONNAISE PC 10.31$    768084 10 RESERS SALAD POTATO REGULAR 34.59$      85 SWTDLITE SWEETENER PINK PACKET 14.60$      

2200000 5 BUENO MOLE AUTENTICO ROJO 118.40$  768103 5 GLDHRVST SALAD POTATO MUSTARD GF 40.61$      5 EQUAL SWEETENER EQUAL PACKET 28.50$      

3372257 90 MUSTARD PC POLY POUCH 5.68$      769019 10 GLDHRVST SALAD TUNA SUPREME GF 49.46$      30 PEPPER PC POUCH 12.75$      

3372257 5 FRENCHS MUSTARD PC POUCH 200 CT 5.68$      769192 10 RESERS SALAD CHICKEN WHITE GOURMET 48.47$      40 SALT PC POUCH 7.40$        

4575023 5 KTH/VALY MUSTARD PREPARED 3.33$      769195 25 RESERS SALAD CHICKEN SMOKED 36.47$      40 MORTON SALT IODIZED TABLE 4.70$        

2145500 5 MARCOS NOPALITO 31.93$    771310 20 NABISCO CRACKER SALTINE 15.53$      530 PPI SYRUP PC POUCH 11.50$      

7996500 20 CMCFOOD OIL FRYING LIQUID CLEAR 22.13$    771349 5 LANCE CRACKER CRUSHED SALTINES 12.84$      85 PPI JELLY PC ASSORTED CUP 9.65$        

3821001 5 ROLAND OLIVE GREEN QUEEN PIMENTO STFD 83.21$    771375 5 TEDYGRAM CRACKER GRAHAM CINNAMON TEDDY       (R) 40.71$      25 JELLY PC GRAPE CUP 9.65$        

6174528 20 MCORMICK PARSLEY FLAKES 11.67$    771379 10 NABISCO CRACKER RITZ 28.74$      35 SMUCKERS SYRUP PC PANCAKE CUP 12.65$      

4151812 10 ZEREGA PASTA EGG NOODLE 7/8 IN 12.58$    771754 5 CHEX SNACK MIX SIMPLY CHEX STWBRY        (R) 27.51$      10 BAYOU PICKLE DILL SLICE HAMBURGER CC 19.50$      

4151812 20 CORTONA PASTA EGG NOODLE WIDE 1/2 INCH 12.58$    771826 25 NABISCO COOKIE ANIMAL CRACKER               (R) 13.35$      5 HEINZ PICKLE DILL SPEAR KOSHER 26.70$      

4152089 60 CORTONA PASTA ELBOW MACARONI 18.34$    772018 30 NILLAWAF COOKIE VANILLA WAFER IND            (R) 22.69$      5 ROLAND OLIVE GREEN QUEEN PIMENTO STFD 73.10$      

4152096 5 CORTONA PASTA FETTUCCINE 10 IN 23.53$    772046 70 GRANDMAS COOKIE OATMEAL RAISIN 20.08$      15 EMBASA PEPPER CHIPOTLE 19.20$      

4179875 45 CORTONA PASTA SHELL MEDIUM 7/8 INCH 23.04$    772513 5 KELLOGGS CEREAL BAR STRAWBERRY               (R) 25.98$      20 SANMARCO PEPPER JALAPENO WHOLE 24.50$      

4171716 5 CORTONA PASTA SHELL SMALL 23.53$    772710 240 NABISCO COOKIE BULK ASSORTMENT 27.35$      5 GOLDMEDL FLOUR ALL PURPOSE MEDALLION 13.90$      

4152106 100 CORTONA PASTA SPAGHETTI LONG 10IN 18.34$    772722 15 KELLOGGS SNACK  RICE KRISPIE TREAT           (R) 44.24$      5 MASECA FLOUR CORN TORTILLA WHT #0 20.05$      

4301362 10 CORTONA PASTA VERMICELLI 10 INCH 23.04$    772803 30 N VALLEY GRANOLA BAR CHEWY VARIETY PACK      (R) 45.86$      10 CONTMILL CAKE MIX YELLOW 26.90$      

326110 5 KTH/VALY PEACH DICED EXTRA LT SYRUP 49.41$    774022 5 SPICECLS CINNAMON GROUND 26.22$      5 CONTMILL CAKE MIX WHITE 26.90$      

435685 5 KTH/CHO PEACH HALF 30-35CT LIGHT SYRUP 37.85$    774054 5 MCORMICK CUMIN COMINO GROUND 10.91$      5 CORALBAY COCONUT SNOWFLAKE 26.85$      

435685 5 CARBOTRL PEACH HALF IN JUICE 37.85$    774055 25 SPICECLS CUMIN COMINO GROUND 22.79$      5 CLABGIRL BAKING SODA 21.60$      

326108 15 EWIMPORT PEACH SLICED IN LIGHT SYRUP 47.56$    774080 75 MCORMICK PEPPER LEMON SEASONING 12.81$      5 ARGO STARCH CORN 19.40$      

1184003 5 ELLINGTN PEANUT BUTTER CREAMY 58.73$    774425 5 LAWRYS SEASONING SALT NO MSG 146.80$   170 MISSION TACO SHELL 5 IN YELLOW 13.40$      

481650 5 KTH/VALY PEAR HALF 30-35 CT NW CHOICE 49.41$    774464 50 MCORMICK SEASONING CAJUN BAYOU NO MSG 14.59$      5 MISSION TOSTADA SHELL 5.5IN YELLOW 16.85$      

4448791 30 GRANSABR PEPPER BLACK GROUND FINE 43.62$    774726 20 MCORMICK PARSLEY FLAKES 4.69$        35 FRITOLAY CHIP FRITO CORN ORIGINAL 34.60$      

4448791 5 TXCUSTOM PEPPER BLACK GROUND TABLE 43.62$    774745 5 TXCUSTOM PEPPER BLACK GROUND TABLE 55.00$      35 LAYS CHIP POTATO REG SINGLE SERVE 34.60$      

2008670 15 EMBASA PEPPER CHIPOTLE 19.71$    774870 15 TXCUSTOM GARLIC POWDER 10.29$      35 CHEETOS CHIP CHEETO CRUNCHY 34.60$      

1983141 45 GRANSABR PEPPER JALAPENO NACHO SLICED 27.67$    774926 5 TXCUSTOM SEASONING MENUDO MIX 10.29$      15 DORITOS CHIP DORITO COOLER RANCH 34.60$      

1988963 20 SANMARCO PEPPER JALAPENO WHOLE 25.88$    774962 15 TXCUSTOM GARLIC GRANULATED 160.89$   30 DORITOS CHIP DORITO NACHO CHEESE 34.60$      

6184303 75 MCORMICK PEPPER LEMON SEASONING 11.11$    779123 100 KTH/HOME SHORTENING CLEAR FRY LIQUID 19.98$      10 SUNCHIPS CHIP SUNCHIP ORIGINAL 34.60$      

6331243 30 PEPPER PC POUCH 12.80$    780002 50 IMPERIAL SUGAR PURE CANE GRANULATED 18.15$      10 CHEETOS CHIP CHEETO HOT CRUNCHY 35.60$      

5162344 10 BAYOU PICKLE DILL SLICE HAMBURGER CC 19.51$    780009 5 IMPERIAL SUGAR BROWN LIGHT IN BAG 28.26$      5 ROLDGOLD PRETZEL TINY TWISTS LOW FAT 29.30$      

5162370 5 HEINZ PICKLE DILL SPEAR KOSHER 27.39$    782051 70 SANTIAGO BEAN REFRIED DEHYDRATED 30.78$      45 FRITOLAY CHIP FRITO CORN CHILI CHEESE 34.50$      

547653 15 EWIMPORT PINEAPPLE CHUNK IN JUICE 27.94$    782258 5 MARCOS NOPALITO 28.49$      5 FUNYUNS CHIP FUNYUN FLAMIN HOT LSS 31.35$      

547653 5 COUSINS PINEAPPLE CHUNK IN SYRUP 27.94$    783217 5 CHICSEA TUNA CHUNK LIGHT IN WATER           (R) 65.42$      10 CHAPAS CHIP PORK CRACKLIN 47.50$      

566854 5 HORIZON PINEAPPLE CRUSHED COARSE 25.09$    785065 60 HUNTS SAUCE MANWICH SLOPPY JOE 28.97$      45 CORTONA PASTA SHELL MEDIUM 7/8 INCH 19.15$      

2106383 200 IDAHOAN POTATO MASHED INSTANT REAL 70.22$    786201 15 CHEFBOY RAVIOLI BEEF RTU 40.59$      60 CORTONA PASTA ELBOW MACARONI 19.15$      

1551240 20 RESERS POTATO RUSSET DICED BLANCHED 25.13$    793036 20 SMUCKERS SYRUP CUP DIET PANCAKE 15.80$      20 CORTONA PASTA EGG NOODLE WIDE 1/2 INCH 13.00$      
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Bid 2021-13 Annual Contract for Processed Foods

Contract Term: October 1, 2020 thru September 30, 2021

Annual Contract is not limited to the items listed below.  Please request pricing for additional item from vendor.

RC Food Service & Produce

c/o Alma Cavazos

120 Market St.

Laredo, TX 78040

(956) 796-9999

almacavazos77@yahoo.com

Labatt Food Service

c/o Enrique Alvarado

902 N. Expressway 77

Harlingen, TX 78550

(956) 428-0722

ealvarado@labattfood.com

Ben E. Keith

mejimenez@benekeith.com

(361) 510-9620

San Antonio, TX 78218

55054 Kaepa Ct.

c/o Matt Brown

2140424 5 PRINCELA POTATO SWEET CUT FANCY 32.93$    797025 20 MORRISON GRAVY MIX COUNTRY STYLE PEPPER      (R) 18.94$      100 CORTONA PASTA SPAGHETTI LONG 10IN 17.60$      

2140424 5 PRINCELA POTATO SWEET CUT FANCY 32.93$    797058 60 MORRISON GRAVY MIX BROWN COUNTRY STYLE       (R) 21.71$      5 CORTONA PASTA FETTUCCINE 10 IN 19.60$      

3778022 5 ROLDGOLD PRETZEL TINY TWISTS LOW FAT 33.26$    797130 5 TRIO SAUCE MIX ALFREDO TRIO 83.16$      10 ZEREGA PASTA EGG NOODLE 7/8 IN 12.17$      

5020011 10 ELLINGTN PUDDING BANANA RTS 35.81$    797240 5 PIONEER GRAVY MIX TURKEY                    (R) 21.78$      5 CORTONA PASTA SHELL SMALL 19.55$      

5020045 55 MYHMTWN PUDDING CHOCOLATE RTS 35.81$    797246 10 MORRISON GRAVY MIX PEPPERED                  (R) 17.40$      10 CORTONA PASTA VERMICELLI 10 INCH 19.15$      

5020062 10 ELLINGTN PUDDING LEMON RTS 18.61$    799010 5 GENMILLS CEREAL BOWL COCOA PUFFS 45.27$      60 MYHMTWN PUDDING VANILLA RTS 26.90$      

5034012 15 ELLINGTN PUDDING TAPIOCA RTS 36.29$    799205 25 QUAKER CEREAL OATS QUICK 39.39$      55 MYHMTWN PUDDING CHOCOLATE RTS 26.15$      

5020003 60 MYHMTWN PUDDING VANILLA RTS 35.81$    799258 10 M O M CEREAL BOWL CINNAMON TOASTERS 29.79$      110 JELLO GELATIN STRAWBERRY SUGAR FREE 9.20$        

790600 5 CHAMPN RAISIN SEEDLESS SELECT 59.78$    799847 10 M O M CEREAL BOWL BERRY COLOSSAL 29.79$      15 GLDHRVST SALAD COLESLAW CREAMY GF 24.70$      

3100500 15 CHEFBOY RAVIOLI BEEF RTU 41.00$    799848 200 M O M CEREAL BOWL APPLE ZINGS 29.79$      15 RESERS SALAD PASTA MACARONI 39.10$      

4225504 60 ELLINGTN RICE LONG GRAIN 4% BROKEN 23.61$    799849 120 M O M CEREAL BOWL TOOTIE FRUITIES 29.79$      10 RESERS SALAD POTATO 39.10$      

4225504 130 ADOLPHUS RICE LONG GRAIN ADOLPHUS 23.61$    799851 140 M O M CEREAL BOWL RAISIN BRAN 29.79$      10 RESERS SALAD POTATO REGULAR 33.75$      

4234161 5 PRODUCER RICE PILAF MIX SEASONED 5.05$      799853 150 M O M CEREAL BOWL CRISPY RICE 29.79$      5 GLDHRVST SALAD POTATO MUSTARD GF 38.25$      

14132 25 RESERS SALAD CHICKEN SMOKED 42.00$    800362 5 CHAMPN RAISIN SEEDLESS SELECT 70.73$      10 GLDHRVST SALAD TUNA SUPREME GF 44.25$      

8779098 10 RESERS SALAD CHICKEN WHITE GOURMET 50.89$    800711 5 KRAFT MARSHMALLOW JET PUFFED 19.54$      10 RESERS SALAD CHICKEN WHITE GOURMET 41.95$      

8778425 15 GLDHRVST SALAD COLESLAW CREAMY GF 24.73$    809020 10 CAMPBELL SOUP CHICKEN NOODLE 19.20$      25 RESERS SALAD CHICKEN SMOKED 35.55$      

8778961 15 RESERS SALAD PASTA MACARONI 42.09$    811004 15 KTH/HOME BASE BEEF FLAVOR                    (R) 35.73$      20 NABISCO CRACKER SALTINE 14.65$      

8770117 10 RESERS SALAD POTATO 42.09$    811174 5 MINORS BASE BEEF NO MSG 164.51$   5 LANCE CRACKER CRUSHED SALTINES 12.20$      

8778953 5 GLDHRVST SALAD POTATO MUSTARD GF 42.09$    104973 5 MASTERS CHEESE CHEDDAR JACK SHRD FANCY 76.55$      5 NABISCO CRACKER GRAHAM TEDDY CUB 18.50$      

8770117 10 RESERS SALAD POTATO REGULAR 42.09$    119460 280 ELLINGTN MARGARINE SOLIDS PURE VEG           (R) 24.53$      10 NABISCO CRACKER RITZ 27.30$      

8779072 10 GLDHRVST SALAD TUNA SUPREME GF 49.05$    121671 10 FRSH/KTH COTTAGE CHEESE 4%                   (R) 17.99$      5 GENMILLS SNACK MIX SIMPLY CHEX STWBRY 25.20$      

6313043 40 MORTON SALT IODIZED TABLE 4.72$      121801 10 SCHREIBR CHEESE CHEDDAR SHRD IMITATION       (R) 36.50$      25 NABISCO COOKIE ANIMAL CRACKER 12.65$      

6331250 40 SALT PC POUCH 7.45$      121802 130 SCHREIBR CHEESE AMERICAN 184 SLICES          (R) 67.67$      30 NABISCO COOKIE VANILLA WAFER IND 21.50$      

3206117 5 LIL PIG SAUCE BBQ 18.86$    132679 5 SCHREIBR CHEESE SWISS AMERICAN 120 SL        (R) 68.30$      70 GRANDMAS COOKIE OATMEAL RAISIN 18.85$      

3206117 5 SMOKEHSE SAUCE BBQ SWEET & SMOKY 18.86$    139372 5 GLDHRVST CHEESE SWISS AMERICAN 160 SL        (R) 67.55$      5 KELLOGGS CEREAL BAR STWBY YOGURT 25.25$      

268508 10 RUBYKIST SAUCE CRANBERRY JELLIED 43.36$    144918 15 LAVAQUTA CHEESE QUESO FRESCO MEXICANO 33.24$      240 NABISCO COOKIE BULK ASSORTMENT 26.00$      

5010060 5 ELLINGTN SAUCE ENCHILADA MILD RTU 32.13$    142362 470 ELLINGTN EGG FRESH SHELL XL USDA AA 18.86$      15 KELLOGGS CEREAL BAR RICE KRISPIE TREAT 43.40$      

52516 160 CHOLULA SAUCE HOT PC CHOLULA 10.75$    283641 50 LIGHT&FT YOGURT STWBRY/RASP/BLUEBERRY        (R) 20.33$      30 N VALLEY GRANOLA BAR CHEWY VARIETY PACK 35.95$      

2280018 60 HUNTS SAUCE MANWICH SLOPPY JOE 30.42$    283861 5 LIGHT&FT YOGURT VARIETY PACK                 (R) 20.33$      5 SPICECLS CINNAMON GROUND 5.50$        

3576006 5 TRIO SAUCE MIX ALFREDO TRIO 76.26$    118455 30 ELLINGTN EGG WHOLE EASY EGG W/CITRIC 55.28$      5 MCORMICK CUMIN COMINO GROUND 10.35$      

3202330 5 BULLSEYE SAUCE PC BBQ BULLSEYE 19.74$    393795 5 PAPETTIS EGG OMELETTE W/CHEDDAR CHS 50.32$      25 SPICECLS CUMIN COMINO GROUND 6.55$        

3449634 70 SAUCE PC TARTAR 7.67$      669005 20 DAISY SOUR CREAM PC 10.76$      75 MCORMICK PEPPER LEMON SEASONING 12.15$      

3449634 15 HEINZ SAUCE PC TARTAR 7.67$      735028 120 GLDHRVST CHEESE AMERICAN SLICED 160 CT 70.02$      5 LAWRYS SEASONING SALT NO MSG 7.60$        

3449634 30 KRAFT SAUCE PC TARTAR CREAMY 7.67$      740016 5 LANDOLAK CHEESE CHEDDAR SHRED FEATHER        (R) 85.55$      50 MCORMICK SEASONING CAJUN BAYOU NO MSG 13.05$      

3295516 50 ELLINGTN SAUCE PICANTE MEDIUM HOT 34.52$    740125 5 GLDHRVST CHEESE CHEDDAR CUBED .75 IN         (R) 44.34$      20 MCORMICK PARSLEY FLAKES 4.45$        

2280016 50 ELLINGTN SAUCE SPAGHETTI RTU 32.28$    747115 5 MASTERS CHEESE MOZZ FEATHER SHRED 77.76$      5 TXCUSTOM PEPPER BLACK GROUND TABLE 43.60$      

6181069 50 MCORMICK SEASONING CAJUN BAYOU NO MSG 14.19$    15 TXCUSTOM GARLIC POWDER 9.65$        

9398626 5 TXCUSTOM SEASONING MENUDO MIX 30.58$    5 TXCUSTOM SEASONING MENUDO MIX 10.00$      

6185417 5 LAWRYS SEASONING SALT NO MSG 7.62$      15 TXCUSTOM GARLIC GRANULATED 13.20$      

7996534 100 KTH/HOME SHORTENING CLEAR FRY LIQUID 21.18$    100 KTH/HOME SHORTENING CLEAR FRY LIQUID 19.95$      

9380009 5 GENMILLS SNACK MIX SIMPLY CHEX STWBRY 26.68$    50 IMPERIAL SUGAR PURE CANE GRANULATED 30.00$      

2602506 10 CAMPBELL SOUP CHICKEN NOODLE 22.24$    5 IMPERIAL SUGAR BROWN LIGHT IN BAG 25.90$      

6453005 5 ARGO STARCH CORN 21.13$    70 SANTIAGO BEAN REFRIED DEHYDRATED 22.95$      

3861000 10 ELLINGTN STUFFING MIX CORNBREAD 74.51$    5 MARCOS NOPALITO 27.95$      

8523755 5 IMPERIAL SUGAR BROWN LIGHT IN BAG 29.48$    5 BUENO MOLE AUTENTICO ROJO 75.00$      

8520009 10 CARGILL SUGAR GRANULATED 18.87$    5 CHICSEA TUNA CHUNK LIGHT IN WATER 59.25$      

8520009 50 IMPERIAL SUGAR PURE CANE GRANULATED 18.87$    60 HUNTS SAUCE MANWICH SLOPPY JOE 27.50$      

8568511 5 EQUAL SWEETENER EQUAL PACKET 32.11$    15 CHEFBOY RAVIOLI BEEF RTU 38.60$      

7100005 85 SWTDLITE SWEETENER PINK PACKET 16.96$    20 SMUCKERS SYRUP CUP DIET PANCAKE 15.10$      

8526014 70 SWEETENER SUGAR KEITH PACKET 19.48$    20 MORRISON GRAVY MIX COUNTRY STYLE PEPPER 14.75$      

5010042 20 SMUCKERS SYRUP CUP DIET PANCAKE 15.47$    60 MORRISON GRAVY MIX BROWN COUNTRY STYLE 15.45$      

5010020 35 SMUCKERS SYRUP PC PANCAKE CUP 16.51$    5 TRIO SAUCE MIX ALFREDO TRIO 76.01$      

4650678 530 PPI SYRUP PC POUCH 11.34$    5 PIONEER GRAVY MIX TURKEY 19.00$      

3113355 170 MISSION TACO SHELL 5 IN YELLOW 16.84$    10 MORRISON GRAVY MIX PEPPERED 14.75$      

7780000 20 INDEL TOMATILLO CRUSHED 30.76$    5 GENMILLS CEREAL BOWL COCOA PUFFS 40.95$      

2272576 20 HUNTS TOMATO PASTE 40.84$    25 QUAKER CEREAL OATS QUICK 38.75$      

2304004 110 ELLINGTN TOMATO SAUCE FANCY CALIFORNIA 31.78$    10 M O M CEREAL BOWL CINNAMON TOASTERS 29.10$      

2281001 130 KTH/HOME TOMATO WHOLE PEELED 23.20$    10 M O M CEREAL BOWL BERRY COLOSSAL 29.10$      

4335632 5 MISSION TOSTADA SHELL 5.5IN YELLOW 16.87$    200 M O M CEREAL BOWL APPLE ZINGS 29.10$      

4335632 15 MISSION TOSTADA YELLOW 5.5IN 16.87$    120 M O M CEREAL BOWL TOOTIE FRUITIES 29.10$      

2792315 15 EWIMPORT TUNA CHUNK LIGHT IN WATER 54.39$    140 M O M CEREAL BOWL RAISIN BRAN 29.10$      

2792315 5 CHICSEA TUNA CHUNK LIGHT IN WATER 54.39$    150 M O M CEREAL BOWL CRISPY RICE 29.10$      

1803105 5 LAKESIDE VEGETABLE MIXED 33.95$    5 CHAMPN RAISIN SEEDLESS SELECT 67.10$      

1803105 5 ELLINGTN VEGETABLE MIXED FANCY 33.95$    5 KRAFT MARSHMALLOW JET PUFFED 19.35$      

1803105 5 KTH/EXCL VEGETABLE MIXED FANCY 33.95$    10 CAMPBELL SOUP CHICKEN NOODLE 18.25$      

1131120 20 DASANI WATER DASANI PURIFIED 7.72$      15 KTH/HOME BASE BEEF FLAVOR 33.55$      

1131120 20 DASANI WATER DASANI PURIFIED 7.72$      5 MINORS BASE BEEF NO MSG 35.00$      

1550007 65 PURELIFE WATER DRINKING PURIFIED 3.44$      5 KTH/PREM BASE CHICKEN PASTE REFRIGERATE 7.10$        

1130045 20 GLACIER WATER NATURAL DISTILLED 4.01$      10 CARGILL SUGAR GRANULATED 18.00$      
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Item 

Qty in 

Cases Label Description Case Price Item 

Qty in 

Cases Label Description Case Price Item 

Qty in 

Cases Label Description Case Price

Bid 2021-13 Annual Contract for Processed Foods

Contract Term: October 1, 2020 thru September 30, 2021

Annual Contract is not limited to the items listed below.  Please request pricing for additional item from vendor.

RC Food Service & Produce

c/o Alma Cavazos

120 Market St.

Laredo, TX 78040

(956) 796-9999

almacavazos77@yahoo.com

Labatt Food Service

c/o Enrique Alvarado

902 N. Expressway 77

Harlingen, TX 78550

(956) 428-0722

ealvarado@labattfood.com

Ben E. Keith

mejimenez@benekeith.com

(361) 510-9620

San Antonio, TX 78218

55054 Kaepa Ct.

c/o Matt Brown

8660018 130 SCHREIBR CHEESE AMERICAN 184 SLICES 95.13$    5 MASTERS CHEESE CHEDDAR JACK SHRD FANCY 54.90$      

8660018 120 GLDHRVST CHEESE AMERICAN SLICED 160 CT 95.13$    10 FRSH/KTH COTTAGE CHEESE 4% 15.00$      

15475 5 GLDHRVST CHEESE CHEDDAR CUBED .75 IN 42.94$    280 ELLINGTN MARGARINE SOLIDS PURE VEG 22.65$      

8660212 5 MASTERS CHEESE CHEDDAR JACK SHRD FANCY 73.88$    10 SCHREIBR CHEESE CHEDDAR SHRD IMITATION 34.10$      

8660082 10 SCHREIBR CHEESE CHEDDAR SHRD IMITATION 73.88$    130 SCHREIBR CHEESE AMERICAN 184 SLICES 50.00$      

8660082 5 LANDOLAK CHEESE CHEDDAR SHRED FEATHER 73.88$    5 SCHREIBR CHEESE SWISS AMERICAN 120 SL 52.00$      

8662003 5 MASTERS CHEESE MOZZ FEATHER SHRED 73.88$    5 GLDHRVST CHEESE SWISS AMERICAN 160 SL 52.00$      

8656001 15 V&V CHEESE QUESO FRESCO WHEEL 26.25$    470 ELLINGTN EGG FRESH SHELL XL USDA AA 16.80$      

8660066 5 SCHREIBR CHEESE SWISS AMERICAN 120 SL 63.89$    300 PACKER EGG FRESH SHELL XL 16.80$      

8660066 5 GLDHRVST CHEESE SWISS AMERICAN 160 SL 63.89$    50 YOPLAIT YOGURT TRIX STWBRY/BAN BASH LF 17.25$      

8206020 10 FRSH/KTH COTTAGE CHEESE 4% 9.36$      5 LIGHT&FT YOGURT STWBRY/RASP/BLUEBERRY 19.30$      

8206020 5 DAISY COTTAGE CHEESE LOW FAT SM CURD 9.36$      5 LIGHT&FT YOGURT VARIETY PACK 19.75$      

8165060 300 PACKER EGG FRESH SHELL XL 19.07$    5 DAISY COTTAGE CHEESE LOW FAT SM CURD 15.00$      

8165060 470 ELLINGTN EGG FRESH SHELL XL USDA AA 19.07$    30 PAPETTIS EGG WHOLE LIQUID W/CITRIC 45.00$      

8859016 5 PAPETTIS EGG OMELETTE W/CHEDDAR CHS 47.19$    5 PAPETTIS EGG OMELETTE W/CHEDDAR CHS 46.75$      

8856024 30 PAPETTIS EGG WHOLE LIQUID W/CITRIC 56.86$    20 DAISY SOUR CREAM PC 15.00$      

8145620 280 ELLINGTN MARGARINE SOLIDS PURE VEG 26.08$    120 GLDHRVST CHEESE AMERICAN SLICED 160 CT 51.00$      

3529923 20 DAISY SOUR CREAM PC 10.99$    5 LANDOLAK CHEESE CHEDDAR SHRED FEATHER 58.00$      

No Bid 5 LIGHT&FT YOGURT STWBRY/RASP/BLUEBERRY -$        5 GLDHRVST CHEESE CHEDDAR CUBED .75 IN 32.00$      

8170017 50 YOPLAIT YOGURT TRIX STWBRY/BAN BASH LF 19.72$    5 MASTERS CHEESE MOZZ FEATHER SHRED 55.75$      

No Bid 5 LIGHT&FT YOGURT VARIETY PACK -$        15 V&V CHEESE QUESO FRESCO WHEEL 27.75$      
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