
Ben E. Keith Foods

c/o Matt Brown

17635 Ben E. Keith Way

Selma, TX 78154

(210) 507-6276

rmbrown@benekeith.com
mejimenez@benekeith.com

Description Brand Pkg Size Qty

Unit 

Price Extended Price Description Brand Pkg Size Qty Case Price Extended Price

APPLE RED DL XF WSH 64 CT PACKER 1 / 40 LB 5 No Bid APPLE RED DL FCY WSH 113 CT MRKN/F

C

40 LB 70  $      34.18 2,392.60$           

APPLE RED DL XF WSH 72 CT PACKER 1 / 72 CT 5 No Bid APPLE RED DL FCY WSH 138 CT MRKN/F

C

40 LB 280  $      35.38 9,906.40$           

APPLE RED DL XF WSH 88 CT MARKON 1 / 40 LB 70 No Bid APPLE RED DL XF FRSH/KT

H

5 LB 5  $        9.88 49.40$                 

APPLE RED DL FCY WSH 113 CT MARKON 1 / 40 LB 5 No Bid APPLE GRANNY SMTH FCY 88 CT MRKN/F

C

88 CT 10  $      42.88 428.80$              

APPLE RED DL FCY WSH 125 CT MARKON 1 / 40 LB 20 25.00$     500.00$              APPLE GRANNY SMTH FCY 113 CT MRKN/F

C

113 CT 35  $      41.98 1,469.30$           

APPLE RED DL FCY WSH 138 CT MARKON 1 / 40 LB 80 25.00$     2,000.00$           APPLE SLICED RED USA SUN 

RICH

2 OZ 500  $      16.07 8,035.00$           

APPLE RED DL FCY 138 CT PACKER 1 / 138 CT 280 No Bid BANANA GREEN TIP PACKER 40 LB 1000  $      27.07 27,070.00$         

APPLE RED DL XF PACKER 1 / 5 LB 5 No Bid BANANA PREMIUM PACKER 10 LB 20  $        9.19 183.80$              

APPLE GOLD DL XF WSH 88 CT MARKON 1 / 40 LB 10 No Bid BLUEBERRY DRISCOL

L

6 OZ 25  $      37.57 939.25$              

APPLE GRANNY SMITH PACKER 1 / 12 CT 5 No Bid STRAWBERRY CLAMSHELL                (R) MRKN/F

C

1 LB 400  $      35.68 14,272.00$         

APPLE GRANNY SMTH FCY 72 CT PACKER 1 / 72 CT 5 No Bid LEMON CHOICE 200 CT MRKN/E

SN

35 LB 10  $      43.48 434.80$              

APPLE GRANNY SMTH FCY 88 CT MARKON 1 / 88 CT 10 No Bid JUICE LEMON FRESH SQUEEZED PACKER QT 5  $      26.18 130.90$              

APPLE GRANNY SMTH FCY 100 CT PACKER 1 / 40#TR PK 15 No Bid ORANGE CHOICE 88 CT MRKN/E

SN

88 CT 20  $      39.38 787.60$              

APPLE GRANNY SMTH FCY 125 CT PACKER 1 / 125 CT 35 No Bid ORANGE CHOICE 113 CT MRKN/E

SN

113 CT 20  $      38.59 771.80$              

APPLE SLICES RED USA SUN RICH 24 / 2 OZ 500 No Bid ORANGE CHOICE 138 CT MRKN/E

SN

138 CT 100  $      28.29 2,829.00$           

APPLE SLICED BAGS PACKER 100 / 2 OZ 20 22.00$     440.00$              JUICE ORANGE FRESH SQUEEZED MRKN/R

SS

1 GAL 5  $      38.39 191.95$              

BANANA PREMIUM US #1 PACKER 1 / 40 LB 20 No Bid CANTALOUPE US#1 6 CT FRSH/KT

H

6 CT 140  $      20.09 2,812.60$           

BANANA GREEN TIP PACKER 1 / 40 LB 1000 21.00$     21,000.00$        CANTALOUPE US#1 3 CT FRSH/KT

H

3 CT 5  $      13.18 65.90$                 

BANANA PREMIUM PACKER 1 / 10 LB 20 No Bid HONEYDEW MELONS US #1 3 CT FRSH/KT

H

3 CT 50  $      12.09 604.50$              

BLUEBERRY FRESH PACKER 6 / 6 OZ 25 No Bid WATERMELON SEEDLESS RED FRSH/KT

H

EACH 25  $      10.68 267.00$              

STRAWBERRY CLAMSHELL MARKON 8 / 1 LB 400 26.00$     10,400.00$        GRAPE GREEN SEEDLESS FRSH/KT

H

5 LB 5  $      16.29 81.45$                 

STRAWBERRY WITH STEM PACKER 4 / 16 OZ 5 No Bid GRAPE RED SEEDLESS 5 LB FRSH/KT

H

5 LB 5  $      14.59 72.95$                 

LEMON CHOICE 95 CT PACKER 1 / 95 CCT 5 No Bid PLUM RED US #1 4X5 CALIFORNIA PACKER 28 LB 30  $      40.68 1,220.40$           

LEMON STANDARD 200 CT PACKER 1 / 200 CT 10 No Bid AVOCADO HASS RIPE 48 CT PACKER 48 CT 5  $      46.69 233.45$              

JUICE LEMON FRESH SQUEEZE MARKON 16 / 1 QT 5 No Bid KIWI FRUIT #1 33/36 CT PACKER 7 1/2 L 100  $      24.18 2,418.00$           

LIME PERSIAN #1 200 CT PACKER 1 / 200 CT 25 25.00$     625.00$              MANGO US#1 9/12 CT PACKER CTN 5  $      14.38 71.90$                 

ORANGE FANCY 88 CT PACKER 1 / 35 LB 20 No Bid BROCCOLI CROWN ICELESS MRKN/F

C

20 LB 15  $      20.79 311.85$              

ORANGE CHO 56 CT PACKER 1 / 35 LB 5 No Bid CABBAGE GREEN US#1 PACKER 50 LB C 20  $      27.57 551.40$              

ORANGE CHO 88 CT PACKER 1 / 88 CT 70 No Bid CABBAGE RED US#1 CALIFORNIA PACKER 50 LB 5  $      30.07 150.35$              

ORANGE CHO 113 CT PACKER 1 / 113 CT 20 No Bid SPRING MIX CONVENTIONAL             (R) MRKN/R

SS

1.5 LB 5  $      11.98 59.90$                 

ORANGE CHO 138 CT PACKER 1 / 138 CT 1000 26.50$     26,500.00$        CARROT JUMBO TX/MEX/MICH PACKER 50LB BA 30  $      21.38 641.40$              

JUICE ORANGE FRESH SQUEEZED SUN ORCHARD 4 / 1 GAL 5 No Bid CARROT JUMBO PACKER 25 LB 5  $      18.47 92.35$                 

ORANGE FANCY 22 CT PACKER 1 / 22 CT 5 No Bid CARROT JUMBO  US #1 MRKN/F

C

10 LB B 5  $      13.87 69.35$                 

TANGERINE CHILEAN PACKER 1 / VOL FILL 10 31.00$     310.00$              CARROT SHRED MRKN/R

SS

5 LB 30  $      14.27 428.10$              

FRUIT SALAD DELUX P'APPL SUN RICH 1 / 8 LB 5 12.00$     60.00$                CARROT CARROTEENIE 100 2 OZ PACKER 2 OZ 140  $      22.58 3,161.20$           

PINEAPPLE CHUNKS       K SUN RICH 1 / 8 LB TUB 5 No Bid PEAR D ANJOU 110 CT MRKN/F

C

110 CT 50  $      54.87 2,743.50$           

CANTALOUPE US#1 9 CT PACKER 1 / 35 LB 140 26.00$     3,640.00$           CILANTRO 1 LB CELLO WASH & TRI PACKER 1 LB 200  $      11.18 2,236.00$           

CANTALOUPE US#1 15 CT PACKER 1 / 35 LB 25 No Bid CANTALOUPE 12 CT MRKN/F

C

12 CT 140  $      30.57 4,279.80$           

CANTALOUPE US#1 6 CT PACKER 1 / 6 CT 5 No Bid HONEYDEW MELON 6 CT MRKN/F

C

30 LB 100  $      24.18 2,418.00$           

CANTALOUPE US#1 3 CT PACKER 1 / 3 CT 5 No Bid FRUIT SALAD DELUXE PRESV FREE       (R) MRKN/R

SS

8 LB 5  $      27.87 139.35$              

HONEYDEW MELONS US #1 3 CT PACKER 1 / 3 CT 50 No Bid LETTUCE ICEBERG PREM PALLETIZD MRKN/F

C

24 CT 500  $      32.07 16,035.00$         

HONEYDEW MELONS US #1 3 CT PACKER 1 / 3 CT 5 No Bid LETTUCE SHRED 1/8 IN   K            (R) MRKN/R

SS

5 LB 5  $      17.68 88.40$                 

HONEYDEW MELON US #1 6 CT PACKER 1 / 30 LB 10 No Bid LETTUCE ROMAINE 24 CT MRKN/F

C

24 CT 10  $      38.57 385.70$              

HONEYDEW MELONS US#1 9 CT PACKER 1 / 30 LB 100 No Bid LETTUCE ROMAINE WASH&TRIM           (R) MRKN/R

SS

5 LB BA 5  $      24.38 121.90$              

WATERMELON PACKER 1 / EACH 100 No Bid SALAD MIX ICEBERG/ROM 50/50         (R) MRKN/R

SS

5 LB 5  $      23.48 117.40$              

WATERMELON SEEDLESS RED PACKER 1 / EACH 25 5.00$        125.00$              SALAD MIX W/BAG MRKN/R

SS

5 LB BA 5  $      18.37 91.85$                 

WATERMELON SEEDLESS RED PACKER 1 / EACH 5 No Bid LIME PERSIAN #1 200 CT MRKN/F

C

40 LB 5  $      43.38 216.90$              

GRAPE GREEN SEEDLESS PACKER 1 / 18 LB 10 26.00$     260.00$              GRAPE GREEN SEEDLESS MRKN/E

SN

19 LB 10  $      44.87 448.70$              

GRAPE GREEN SEEDLESS PACKER 1 / 5 LB 5 No Bid ONION WHITE JUMBO US#1 PACKER 50 LB S 10  $      29.18 291.80$              

GRAPE RED SEEDLESS 5 LB PACKER 1 / 5 LB 5 No Bid ONION WHITE JUMBO US#1 FRSH/KT

H

10LB BA 10  $      10.57 105.70$              

PEACH RIPE N READY 48/60 PACKER 1 / 20 LB 60 23.50$     1,410.00$           ONION YELLOW JUMBO PACKER 50 LB 80  $      17.88 1,430.40$           

PEAR D'ANJOU US #1 PACKER 1 / CS 5 No Bid ONION YELLOW JUMBO FRSH/KT

H

10LB CT 70  $      10.79 755.30$              

PEAR D'ANJOU US #1 PACKER 1 / CS 50 29.50$     1,475.00$           PEPPER BELL GREEN CHOPPER MRKN/E

SN

1 1/9 B 50  $      30.18 1,509.00$           

PEAR D'ANJOU US #1 PACKER 1 / CS 5 No Bid PEPPER BELL RED FRSH/KT

H

5 LB CS 10  $      17.47 174.70$              

PEAR D'ANJOU US #1 PACKER 1 / CS 10 No Bid PEPPER BELL GOLD FRSH/KT

H

5 LB BA 10  $      16.27 162.70$              

PLUM BLACK RIPE N READY PACKER 1 / 20 LB 5 No Bid PEPPER SERRANO FRSH/KT

H

5 LB CS 100  $      12.87 1,287.00$           

PLUM BLACK RIPE N READY PACKER 1 / 20 LB 30 22.00$     660.00$              PEPPER SERRANO PACKER VOL FIL 30  $      38.27 1,148.10$           

KIWI FRUIT #1 33/36 CT PACKER 1 / FLAT 100 No Bid PEPPER BELL RED CHOPPER MRKN/E

SN

1 1/9 B 5  $      47.38 236.90$              

MANGO US#1 9/12 CT PACKER 1 / CTN 5 No Bid PEPPER HABANERO PACKER 8 LB 5  $      40.47 202.35$              

FIGS BROWN 35-40CT DRIED PACKER 1 / 5 LB 5 No Bid PEPPER ANCHO FRSH/KT

H

5 LB 5  $      44.77 223.85$              

PUREE SAMPLE MORE FRUIT PERFECT PUREE 1 / 14 CT 5 No Bid POTATO RED B SIZE US#1 FRSH/KT

H

10LB BA 5  $      13.07 65.35$                 

PUREE SAMPLE TOP FLAVORS PERFECT PUREE 1 / 16 CT 10 No Bid POTATO RED B SIZE US#1 PACKER 50 LB 5  $      52.07 260.35$              

Bid 2021-14 Annual Contract for Produce

Contract Term: October 1, 2020 thru September 30, 2021

Annual Contract is not limited to the items listed below.  Please request pricing for additional item from vendor.

pepe_westsideproduce@yahoo.com 

Laredo, TX 78045

(956) 753-8700

Westside Produce

c/o Jose Gamez

PO Box 452289
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Ben E. Keith Foods

c/o Matt Brown

17635 Ben E. Keith Way

Selma, TX 78154

(210) 507-6276

Annual Contract is not limited to the items listed below.  Please request pricing for additional item from vendor.

Laredo, TX 78045

(956) 753-8700

Westside Produce

c/o Jose Gamez

PO Box 452289

PAPAYA MEXICAN PACKER 1 / 9-12 CT 20 No Bid POTATO RUSSET 50 CT IDA MRKN/F

C

50# CTN 140  $      34.57 4,839.80$           

BROCCOLI FLORETS ICELESS MARKON 4 / 3 LB CTN 5 No Bid POTATO RUSSET 60 CT IDA MRKN/F

C

50LB CT 90  $      34.57 3,111.30$           

BROCCOLI CROWNS ICELESS MARKON 1 / 20 LB 15 No Bid POTATO RUSSET 70 CT IDA MRKN/F

C

50LB CT 10  $      34.57 345.70$              

CABBAGE GREEN US#1 PACKER 1 / 50 LB CS 5 No Bid POTATO RUSSET 90 CT IDA MRKN/F

C

50LB CT 5  $      27.07 135.35$              

CABBAGE GREEN JUMBO PACKER 1 / 50LB CTN 20 16.50$     330.00$              POTATO RUSSET #2 IDA 10 OZ UTL MRKN/E

SN

50 LB B 5  $      25.79 128.95$              

CABBAGE GREEN PACKER 1 / 10 LB BG 10 No Bid SPINACH TRIPLE WASHED MRKN/R

SS

2.5 LB 50  $      22.49 1,124.50$           

CABBAGE RED PACKER 1 / 10 LB SK 5 No Bid SQUASH ZUCCHINI FCY GREEN FRSH/KT

H

10LB CT 100  $      16.87 1,687.00$           

KIWI FRUIT 118 COUNT PACKER 1 / 118 CT 10 No Bid SQUASH ZUCCHINI MED 18-25 LB PACKER VOL FIL 40  $      26.07 1,042.80$           

SPRING MIX CONVENTIONAL PACKER 2 / 1.5 LB 5 No Bid TOMATO 5X5 2 LAYER MRKN/F

C

20 LB 5  $      31.09 155.45$              

CARROT JUMBO TX/MEX/MICH PACKER 1 / 50LB BAG 30 16.00$     480.00$              TOMATO 4X5 2 LAYER MRKN/F

C

22 LB 25  $      32.37 809.25$              

CARROT JUMBO PACKER 1 / 25LB CTN 5 No Bid TOMATO 5X6 VINE RIPE 2 LAYER PACKER 20 LB 200  $      28.18 5,636.00$           

CARROT JUMBO PACKER 1 / 25 LB 5 No Bid TOMATO BULK CAFE PACKER 25LB CT 500  $      21.29 10,645.00$         

CARROT JUMBO  US #1 PACKER 1 / 10 LB BX 5 No Bid FRUIT MIXED 100% JUICE DOLE 4 OZ 867  $      23.09 20,019.03$         

CARROT SHRED MARKON 2 / 5 LB 30 No Bid

CARROTEENIES 100 2 OZ PACKER 100 / 2 OZ 140 No Bid

CARROT SNACK WITH RANCH DIP GRIMMWAY FARMS 36 / 4 OZ 5 No Bid

CAULIFLOWER FLORETS MARKON 2 / 3 LB PKG 70 No Bid

CELERY MED FOODSERVICE PACK MARKON 1 / 40 LB 30 23.00$     690.00$              

CELERY STALK MARKON 1 / 6 CT 40 No Bid

CELERY STALK MARKON 1 / 6 CT 50 No Bid

CELERY STICKS MARKON 4 / 5 LB 10 No Bid

HERB BASIL FRESH BOX PACKER 1 / 1 LB 5 No Bid

HERB THYME FRESH PACKER 1 / 8 OZ 5 No Bid

CILANTRO 1 LB CELLO WASH & TRI TAYLOR 1 / 1 LB 200 No Bid

CILANTRO BUNCHED 10/3 CT MARKON 10 / 3 CT 5 21.00$     105.00$              

CARROT BABY PEELED MARKON 2 / 5 LB 60 No Bid

LETTUCE ROMAINE RED BABY PACKER 1 / 24 CT 5 No Bid

LETTUCE ROMAINE GREEN BABY PACKER 1 / 24 CT 5 No Bid

CUCUMBER SELECT US #1 PACKER 1 / 1 1/9 BU 10 No Bid

CUCUMBER SELECT PACKER 1 / 5 LB BAG 60 19.50$     1,170.00$           

CUCUMBER 24 CT PACKER 1 / 24 CT 5 No Bid

GARLIC WHITE PACKER 1 / 5 LB 5 No Bid

LETTUCE ICEBERG 24 CT PACKER 1 / CS 40 No Bid

LETTUCE ICEBERG PREM PALLETIZD MARKON 1 / 24 CT 500 26.50$     13,250.00$        

LETTUCE SHRED 1/8 IN   K MARKON 4 / 5 LB 5 No Bid

LETTUCE ROMAINE 24 CT   K MARKON 1 / 24 CT 20 No Bid

LETTUCE ROMAINE WASH&TRIM K MARKON 2 / 5 LB BAG 10 No Bid

SALAD MIX ICEBERG/ROM 50/50 MARKON 4 / 5 LB 5 No Bid

SALAD MIX W/BAG MARKON 4 / 5 LB BAG 5 No Bid

ONION WHITE JUMBO US#1 PACKER 1 / 50 LB SK 10 No Bid

ONION WHITE JUMBO US#1 PACKER 1 / 10LB BAG 10 No Bid

ONION PEARL PEELED PACKER 1 / 5 LB 5 No Bid

ONION YELLOW JUMBO PACKER 1 / 50 LB 80 21.00$     1,680.00$           

ONION YELLOW JUMBO PACKER 1 / 10LB CTN 5 No Bid

ONION YELLOW JUMBO PACKER 1 / 10LB CTN 70 No Bid

PEA SNO GREEN US #1 PACKER 1 / 10 LB 5 No Bid

PEPPER BELL GREEN LG US#1 PACKER 1 / 1 1/9 BU 100 22.00$     2,200.00$           

PEPPER BELL GREEN US#1 CHOPPR PACKER 1 / 1 1/9 BU 50 22.00$     1,100.00$           

PEPPER BELL GREEN PACKER 1 / 5 LB CS 180 No Bid

PEPPER BELL RED PACKER 1 / 5 LB CS 10 No Bid

PEPPER BELL GOLD PACKER 1 / 5 LB BAG 10 No Bid

PEPPER SERRANO PACKER 1 / 5 LB CS 100 No Bid

PEPPER SERRANO US #1 PACKER 1 / 10 LB CS 5 No Bid

PEPPER SERRANO PACKER 1 / VOL FILL 30 24.00$     720.00$              

PEPPER BELL RED CHOPPER PACKER 1 / 1 1/9 BU 5 No Bid

PEPPER HABANERO PACKER 1 / 8 LB 5 No Bid

PEPPER ANCHO PACKER 1 / 5 LB 5 No Bid

POTATO RED "B" SIZE US#1 PACKER 1 / 10LB BAG 5 No Bid

POTATO RED "B" SIZE US#1 PACKER 1 / 50 LB SK 5 No Bid

POTATO RUSSET 50 CT US#1 PACKER 1 / 50LB CTN 140 18.50$     2,590.00$           

POTATO RUSSET 60CT US#1 PACKER 1 / 50LB CTN 90 No Bid

POTATO RUSSET 70 CT US#1 PACKER 1 / 50LB CTN 10 No Bid

POTATO RUSSET 90 CT US#1 PACKER 1 / 50LB CTN 5 No Bid

POTATO RUSSET 40 CT US #1 PACKER 1 / 50 LB 5 No Bid

POTATO RUSSET #2 IDA 10 OZ UTL PACKER 1 / 50 LB BX 90 18.50$     1,665.00$           

SPINACH WASHED & TRIMMED MARKON 4 / 2.5 LB 50 19.00$     950.00$              

SQUASH ZUCCHINI FCY GREEN MARKON/COMBS 1 / 10LB CTN 100 22.00$     2,200.00$           



Ben E. Keith Foods

c/o Matt Brown

17635 Ben E. Keith Way

Selma, TX 78154

(210) 507-6276

Annual Contract is not limited to the items listed below.  Please request pricing for additional item from vendor.

Laredo, TX 78045

(956) 753-8700

Westside Produce

c/o Jose Gamez

PO Box 452289

SQUASH ZUCCHINI MED 18-25 LB PACKER 1 / 20 LB CS 40 No Bid

TOMATO 4 X 4 2 LAYER R R GILMORE 1 / 20 LB 10 No Bid

TOMATO 4X5 2 LAYER PACKER 1 / 20LB CTN 25 No Bid

TOMATO 5X6 2 LAYER PACKER 1 / 20 LB 5 No Bid

TOMATO 5X6 1 LAYER PACKER 1 / 10 LB 200 No Bid

TOMATO 5X6 VINE RIPE 2 LAYER PACKER 1 / 20 LB 50 No Bid

TOMATO ROMA #2 PACKER 1 / 25 LB 60 No Bid

TOMATO ROMA #1 PACKER 1 / 25LB LUG 15 No Bid

TOMATO BULK CAFE PACKER 1 / 25LB CTN 500 19.00$     9,500.00$           

TOMATO 6 X 6 LARGE PACKER 1 / 25LB CTN 20 No Bid

APPLE SLICES RED USA 20/4 OZ UNKNOWN 20 / 4 OZ 100 No Bid

AVOCADOS ANY CASE 5 No Bid

CILANTRO 6 CT PACKER 1 / 1 LB 15 No Bid

ASSORTED FRESH FRUIT CUPS 4 OZ 31200 0.45$        14,040.00$        

FRESH FRENCH FRIES 4/5 LB 900 14.50$     13,050.00$        

FRESH SALAD MIX 4/5 LB 800 16.50$     13,200.00$        


