Bid 2022-06

Annual Contract for Janitorial Supplies

Contract Term:
October 1, 2021 to September 30, 2022

Gulf Coast Paper Co.

c/o Abraham Zarate

1101 S. Padre Island Dr.

Corpus Christi, TX

(361) 852-5252
abraham.zarate@imperialdade.com

Patria Office Supply

c/o Alexis Landin
301 E. Calton Rd.

Laredo, TX 78041

(956) 723-2332

landinalexis@yahoo.com

Executive Office Supply
c/o Jorge Gonzalez Juaristi
3015 Flores Ave.

Laredo, TX 78040

(956) 722-6791

sales@executiveofficesupply.com

TexChem Corp
c/o Rosie Reyes

1502 Farragut St.
Laredo, TX 78040

(956) 723-1221

rosie@texcheminc.com

Qty | U/M |Description Item # Unit Cost | Total Cost Item # Unit Cost | Total Cost Item # Unit Cost | Total Cost Item # Unit Cost | Total Cost
49| cases|Hand Roll Towels - 880N M30700( $ 19.44 | S  952.56 R6800 S 2010 (S 984.90 MOR-R6800| $ 20.50 | $ 1,004.50 VDC88ON| $ 30.97 | $ 1,517.53
30| cases|Toilet Tissue 96 Rolls TT2| S 3250 | $ 975.00 6144 S 2950 |$ 885.00 GJ0-2540096| S 28.95 | $ 868.50 VDCRT500{ S 40.28 | $ 1,208.40
21| boxed Toilet Tissue Jumbo 12" 20020 TI1222A| S 27.00 [ S  567.00 1513 $ 2435(|S 511.35 GJO-3520006| S 30.95 | S  649.95 SCATJ1222A| $ 29.08 | $  610.68
38| cases|Toilet Tissue Jumbo 12" 2212-6 TI1222A| $ 27.00 [ $ 1,026.00 1513 S 2435]|$ 925.30 GEN-1513| $  25.90 | $ 984.20 vDC2212| $ 3211 | $ 1,220.18
28| cases|Toilet Tissue Jumbo 9" TI0922A| S 27.00 [ S  756.00 115100 S 2080 |S 582.40 SoL-23501| $ 27.95 S  782.60 vDC1209| $ 30.10 | S  842.80
48| boxes Multi-fold Towels 548-K N21500| $ 17.20 | $  825.60 21040 $ 19.98 |$  959.04 GJO-21040| $ 18.99 | $  911.52 vDC548k| $  20.50 | $  984.00
30| boxes|Can Liners, Large Bags LHV-4348 R4348N17| S 28.00 | $  840.00 H434816N S 2790 |S 837.00 | IBSVALH4348N16| S 33.95 [ S 1,018.50 LHV434816N| S 25.85 | $  775.50
35| boxes|Can Liners, Small Bags LHV-2433 R2433N6| $ 2140 | $ 749.00 H24338N S 26.99|$ 944.65 GJ0-01010] $ 26.95 | $ 943.25 LHV24338N| $ 25.10 | $ 878.50
15| each |White Polishing Floor Pads 5 per box 20MWBP| S 2.87 | $ 43.05 4020WHI 5 3.75|S 56.25 BWK-4020WHI| S  8.99 | $  134.85 HIL42020| S 476 | S 71.40
10| each |Black Polishing Floor Pads 5 per box 20MSTRP| $ 287 | $ 28.70 4020BLA S 375|$ 37.50 GJO-90213BK| $ 1299 [ $  129.90 HIL42720| $ 476 | $ 47.60
14| cases|Hand Soap 4 per box L00087| S 15.00 | $  210.00 NO BID S 5 5 - GJO-02105CT| $ 2399 |S$  335.86 HIL0039403| S 51.89 | $  726.46
18| boxes/Hand Sanitizer 4 per box 79604| S 58.81 | $ 1,058.58 NO BID $ - GJ0-962504CT| $ 93.00 | $ 1,674.00 HIL0041003| S 63.02 | $ 1,134.36
10| cases|Lysol Toilet Cleaner LysoLsB| $ 39.68 | $  396.80 | RAC74278CT |$ 3790 |S  379.00 RAC74278CT| S 36.99 [ S  369.90 HIL0010904| S 32.04 | $  320.40

7| boxes|Sparkling Disinfectant Bowl Cleaner SPARCLING| $ 23.43|S$ 164.01 | AMR1038799 | $ 32.40|S$ 226.80 GJ0-99676| S 21.99 | $  153.93 HIL0010404 | $ 28.68 | $  200.76
7| boxesWindow Cleaner F00013| $ 1550 [ $  108.50 | BWK4714A |$ 2295 |S  160.65 BWK-47112A| S 34.99 | $ 24493 HIL0080225| S 109.96 | $  769.72
4| boxes|Top Clean pmcg| $ 2179 | $ 87.16 NO BID S - CPC-04307CT| $ 29.85 | $  119.40 HIL0081025 | $ 107.94 | $  431.76
5| boxedq Vindicator Cleaner c00185| $ 3750 [ $  187.50 NO BID 5 5 DVO-CBD540441| $ 2995 | $  149.75 HIL0080625 | $ 139.84 [ S  699.20
11| cases|Re-juv-nal Cleaner HALT28| $  32.99 | $  362.89 NO BID S - RAMPC12001227| $ 56.99 | $  626.89 HIL0081625| $  70.28 | $  773.08
3| boxes|Super Shine All D00080 S 16.50 | $ 49.50 NO BID S 5 FKL-F330126| $ 91.00 [ $  273.00 HIL0080825| S 98.75 | $  296.25
3| each [Super Spray Buff D00081| $ 10.00 | $ 30.00 NO BID S - S - DVOCBD540458| $  11.19 | $ 33.57 HIL0010404| $  7.90 | $ 23.70
3| each |Floor Stripper 5 gal container D20287| S 45.00 | $  135.00 1058PL S 86.838|S 260.64 FKL-F218026| S 68.90 [ $  206.70 HIL00015007| S 49.30 | S  147.90
3| each [Floor Sealer 5 gal container NONBASES| $  55.00 | $§  165.00 0591PL $ 103.06 | S 309.18 FKL-F139026] S 79.50 [ $  238.50 HIL0034407| $ 83.26 | $  249.78
6| boxes|Floor Wax 5 gal container SUNNYSIDES| S 54.16 | $  324.96 0953PL $ 10837 | S  650.22 NOBID| $ 5 5 - HIL0052207| S 75.37 | $  452.22
2| boxesOrange Mop Head 12 per box 3261| $ 4752 |$ 95.04 5020R $ 13250 | $  265.00 GJO-LOR1BCT| $ 99.00 [ $  198.00 HIL24956| $  59.64 | §  119.28
2| boxes|Green Mop Heads 12 per box 3361| S 4752 | S 95.04 5026N $ 13250 [ S  265.00 GJO-MGR1BCT| $ 81.00 |$  162.00 HIL24946| S 59.64 | S  119.28
2| boxesWhite Mop Heads 12 per box 3141| $ 4752 | S 95.04 502WHCT S 102.80 | $ 205.60 GJO-N24COTCT| $  49.00 | $ 98.00 HIL24965| S 47.28 | $ 94.56
2| boxes|Dust Mop Heads 24" 12 per box 4424/ S 5820 | S  116.40 BWK1324 S 109.32 | S 218.64 GJO-00245CT| S 63.00 | $  126.00 HIL53197| S 56.27 | S  112.54
2| boxes/Dust Mop Heads 36" 12 per box 4436| S 66.95 | S 133.90 BWK1336 S 146.40 | $ 292.80 GJ0-00365CT| S 85.00 | $ 170.00 HIL53198 | S 6438 | S 128.76
4| boxes|Dust Mop Heads 48" 12 per box 4448 S 79.61 | S  318.44 BWK1348 $ 23160 | S 926.40 GJO-00485CT| $ 104.00 | $  416.00 HIL53199| S 84.75 | S  339.00
12| each |Doodle Bug Brown Scrub Pads 8541 $ 853 |$ 102.36 BWK403 S 093]|$ 18.90 BWK403| $ 19.95 [ $  239.40 MINOg005| $ 275 | $ 33.00

Additional Discount for Janitorial Supplies not listed

above NO BID 33-40% 25%-45% 30%

Source of Discount Catalog Catalog Catalog Catalog

Cooperative Contract N/A N/A BuyBoard 569-18

Samples can be provide upon request YES YES YES



mailto:sales@executiveofficesupply.com
mailto:landinalexis@yahoo.com
mailto:rosie@texcheminc.com
mailto:abraham.zarate@imperialdade.com

Bid 2022-06

Annual Contract for Janitorial Supplies

Quill LLC

c/o Karrie Szalkowski
100 Schelter Rd.
Lincolnshire, IL 60069
(800) 634-4809

Interboro Packaging Corp.
c/o Blimie Itzkowitz

114 Bracken Road
Montgomery, NY 12549
(845) 782-6800

Ben E. Keith Foods

c/o Ronald M. Brown
17635 Ben E. Keith Way
Selma, TX 78154

(210) 661-7997

Contract Term: bid@quill.com interboro@frontiernet.net rmbrown@benekeith.com
October 1, 2021 to September 30, 2022
Qty | U/M [Description Item # Unit Cost | Total Cost Item # Unit Cost | Total Cost Item # Unit Cost | Total Cost
49| cases|Hand Roll Towels - 880N 365375| S 25.38 | $ 1,243.62 S - 881027| S 25.87
30| cases|Toilet Tissue 96 Rolls 365377| S 41.59 | $ 1,247.70 5 - 882005 S  35.98
21| boxeg Toilet Tissue Jumbo 12" 20020 13102Q| $ 49.00 | $ 1,029.00 S - 882027| S 34.79
38| cases|Toilet Tissue Jumbo 12" 2212-6 NO BID S - 5 - 115847| $  25.98
28| cases|Toilet Tissue Jumbo 9" 849365 S 3262 |$  913.36 S - 882013| S 24.99
48| boxes|Multi-fold Towels 548-K 887854/ S 21.08 [ $ 1,011.84 5 - 881017| S 22.86
30| boxes|/Can Liners, Large Bags LHV-4348 NO BID S - INT-4348-X-Hvy $14.72 | S 441.60 879279 $46.89
35| boxes|/Can Liners, Small Bags LHV-2433 NO BID S - INT-2433-Reg $16.84 [ S  589.40
15| each |White Polishing Floor Pads 5 per box 4020WEQ| $  19.74|$  296.10 S -
10| each |Black Polishing Floor Pads 5 per box 4020BKQ| $ 18.17 | $  181.70 5 -
14| cases|Hand Soap 4 per box 920351| $ 26.47 |$  370.58 S - 885606| S 61.29
18| boxes/Hand Sanitizer 4 per box 24458688 S 70.57 | $ 1,270.26 5 - 148661 S 76.38
10| cases|Lysol Toilet Cleaner 24392443| $ 1860 | S  186.00 S -
7| boxes|Sparkling Disinfectant Bowl Cleaner NO BID S - 5 - 885175 S 27.95
7| boxegWindow Cleaner NO BID S - S - 169256 S 34.86
4| boxes|Top Clean NO BID S - 5 -
5| boxegVindicator Cleaner NO BID S - S -
11| cases|Re-juv-nal Cleaner NO BID S - 5 -
3| boxes|Super Shine All NO BID S - S -
3| each |Super Spray Buff NO BID S - S -
3| each [Floor Stripper 5 gal container 805854| S 50.20 | $  150.60 S -
3| each [Floor Sealer 5 gal container 913187| S 69.08 | S  207.24 5 -
6| boxes|Floor Wax 5 gal container NO BID S - S -
2| boxesOrange Mop Head 12 per box NO BID S - 5 - 889167| S  10.98
2| boxesGreen Mop Heads 12 per box NO BID S - S - 889168| S 10.98
2| boxesWhite Mop Heads 12 per box 852064CBRCT| S  42.67 | $ 85.34 5 - 889106| S  6.79
2| boxes/Dust Mop Heads 24" 12 per box NO BID S - S - 889127| S  8.97
2| boxes/Dust Mop Heads 36" 12 per box NO BID S - 5 -
4| boxes|Dust Mop Heads 48" 12 per box NO BID S - S - 889129| $  9.95
12| each |Doodle Bug Brown Scrub Pads 8541Q| $ 1252 (S  150.24 5 -
Additional Discount for Janitorial Supplies not listed
above 0% 50%
Source of Discount Catalog Catalog Catalog
Cooperative Contract N/A N/A
Samples can be provide upon request NO YES
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