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8968331 15 FOSTER CORN DOG ALL MEAT 4 OZ 37.84$     1E+05 15 Packer Tilapia Fillet 5-7 Oz 31.95$     15 FOSTER CORN DOG ALL MEAT 4 OZ Chicken 45.25$     
9020120 5 REDSTONE POTATO WEDGE SKIN ON EX LARGE 45.07$     1E+05 5 Coverwgn Bacon Slab Sliced Random #2 60.94$     5 REDSTONE POTATO WEDGE SKIN ON EX LARGE 42.90$     
8968372 10 ELLINGTN CORN DOG TURKEY MINI 34.29$     1E+05 15 Gransabr Chicken Fajita Meat Especial 4.17$       10 ELLINGTN CORN DOG TURKEY MINI 35.00$     
9409854 240 EGGO WAFFLE EGGO TRADITIONAL 4 IN 24.46$     1E+05 300 Blackhiv Bean Pinto Triple Clean Dried 44.41$     240 EGGO WAFFLE EGGO TRADITIONAL 4 IN 25.90$     
9024589 90 FARMERS FRENCH FRIES SC 3/8 IN 35.81$     1E+05 35 Bonici Meatball Beef & Chicken 42.95$     90 FARMERS FRENCH FRIES SC 3/8 IN 20.50$     
9097776 450 MRKN/FC BEAN GREEN REGULAR CUT 21.81$     1E+05 30 Tyson Chicken Meat Diced 1/2 In 38.76$     450 MRKN/FC BEAN GREEN REGULAR CUT 22.30$     
9090383 170 MRKN/FC BROCCOLI CUT 14.46$     1E+05 30 Gransabr Pepper Black Ground Fine 42.24$     170 MRKN/FC BROCCOLI CUT 22.75$     
9090383 120 MRKN/FC BROCCOLI CUT 14.46$     1E+05 10 Gransabr Chili Powder Light 26.22$     120 MRKN/FC BROCCOLI CUT 22.75$     
9090393 5 MRKN/FC BROCCOLI FLORET IQF 22.68$     1E+05 5 Gransabr Garlic Granulated 31.89$     5 MRKN/FC BROCCOLI FLORET IQF 23.16$     
4541020 150 MRKN/FC CARROT DICED 3/8 X 3/8 17.02$     1E+05 5 Masters Cheese Cheddar Jack Shrd Fancy 57.98$     150 MRKN/FC CARROT DICED 3/8 X 3/8 17.64$     
9098824 30 MRKN/FC CARROT CRINKLE CUT 19.09$     1E+05 15 Gransabr Chip Tortilla Yellow Round 18.99$     30 MRKN/FC CARROT CRINKLE CUT 19.66$     
9092231 10 MRKN/FC CAULIFLOWER IQF 21.49$     1E+05 5 Cocinagr Chili No Beans 62.18$     10 MRKN/FC CAULIFLOWER IQF 22.00$     
9092231 10 MRKN/FC CAULIFLOWER IQF 21.49$     1E+05 5 Smokehse Sauce Bbq Sweet & Smoky             47.96$     10 MRKN/FC CAULIFLOWER IQF 22.00$     
9090540 730 MRKN/FC CORN CUT 20.46$     1E+05 20 Glacier Water Natural Distilled 3.68$       730 MRKN/FC CORN CUT 21.85$     
9095622 90 MRKN/FC PEA GREEN 22.12$     1E+05 25 Gransabr Chicken Fajita Strip Cooked 42.89$     90 MRKN/FC PEA GREEN 22.61$     
9091358 25 MRKN/FC SQUASH YELLOW SLICED 17.12$     1E+05 5 Tyson Chicken Drumstick Brd Cooked 98.17$     25 MRKN/FC SQUASH YELLOW SLICED 17.73$     
9091358 20 MRKN/FC SQUASH YELLOW SLICED 17.12$     1E+05 45 Gransabr Pepper Jalapeno Nacho Sliced 27.96$     20 MRKN/FC SQUASH YELLOW SLICED 17.73$     
9091358 10 MRKN/FC SQUASH ZUCCHINI SLICED 1/4IN 17.12$     1E+05 5 Jhs Chocolate Enrober Ztf 70.48$     10 MRKN/FC SQUASH ZUCCHINI SLICED 1/4IN 17.73$     
9091358 10 MRKN/FC SQUASH ZUCCHINI SLICED 1/4IN 17.12$     1E+05 5 Lakeside Carrot Sliced Medium 29.74$     10 MRKN/FC SQUASH ZUCCHINI SLICED 1/4IN 17.73$     
9095655 190 MRKN/FC VEGETABLE MIXED 5 WAY 21.00$     1E+05 5 Tyson Chicken Crumbled Cooked 55.92$     190 MRKN/FC VEGETABLE MIXED 5 WAY 23.75$     
9092322 150 MRKN/FC VEGETABLE BLEND PEAS & CARROTS 20.19$     1E+05 160 Minutemn Chicken Patty Breaded Cooked 63.97$     150 MRKN/FC VEGETABLE BLEND PEAS & CARROTS 21.75$     
9024589 250 LMB WSTN FRENCH FRIES RC 3/8 IN 35.81$     1E+05 540 Minutemn Beef & Chicken Patty 3 Oz Ckd 98.79$     250 LMB WSTN FRENCH FRIES RC 3/8 IN 20.50$     
9024589 90 ORE IDA POTATO TATER TOTS 35.81$     1E+05 10 Ellingtn Stuffing Mix Cornbread 59.32$     90 ORE IDA POTATO TATER TOTS 35.50$     
9024589 15 ORE IDA HASHBROWN GOLDEN PATTY 35.81$     1E+05 30 Ellingtn Egg Whole Easy Egg W/Citric 55.28$     15 ORE IDA HASHBROWN GOLDEN PATTY 31.00$     
9024589 5 LAMB SUP HASHBROWN 2 1/2 OZ PATTY 35.81$     1E+05 280 Ellingtn Margarine Solids Pure Veg           (R) 36.95$     5 LAMB SUP HASHBROWN 2 1/2 OZ PATTY 31.00$     
9024589 170 LAMB SUP HASHBROWN SIDE O BROWNS 35.81$     1E+05 10 Frsh/Kth Cottage Cheese 4%                   (R) 19.97$     170 LAMB SUP HASHBROWN SIDE O BROWNS 31.00$     
9020108 10 LAMB NAT POTATO WEDGE NATURAL CUT 44.52$     1E+05 10 Schreibr Cheese Cheddar Shrd Imitation       (R) 36.50$     10 LAMB NAT POTATO WEDGE NATURAL CUT 44.50$     
9024580 5 HSPLENDR POTATO SWEET WEDGE 38.45$     1E+05 130 Schreibr Cheese American 184 Slices          (R) 67.67$     5 HSPLENDR POTATO SWEET WEDGE 38.57$     
8973068 5 LAMB SUP POTATO MASHED ROASTED GARLIC 39.35$     1E+05 60 Ellingtn Rice Long Grain 4% Broken           (R) 21.65$     5 LAMB SUP POTATO MASHED ROASTED GARLIC 39.45$     
2106383 40 LAMB SUP POTATO MASHED TRADITIONAL 71.61$     1E+05 115 Ellingtn Drink Mix Fruit Punch 35.95$     40 LAMB SUP POTATO MASHED TRADITIONAL 63.55$     
8884000 20 FOSTER CORN DOG CHICKEN 36.02$     1E+05 110 Ellingtn Drink Mix Lemonade Powdered 35.95$     20 FOSTER CORN DOG CHICKEN 45.25$     
8915054 10 J DEAN SANDWICH SAUS EGG & CHEESE 20.95$     1E+05 100 Ellingtn Drink Mix Peach Powdered 35.95$     10 J DEAN SANDWICH SAUS EGG & CHEESE 21.48$     
8915054 5 J DEAN SANDWICH SAUS EGG & CHEESE 20.95$     1E+05 140 Ellingtn Drink Mix Orange Powdered 35.95$     5 J DEAN SANDWICH SAUS EGG & CHEESE 21.48$     
9163155 5 STOUFFER LASAGNA MEAT 80.55$     1E+05 110 Ellingtn Drink Mix Pink Lemonade Pwd 35.95$     5 STOUFFER LASAGNA MEAT 79.71$     
8901238 190 TONYS PIZZA CHEESE 4X6 WHOLE GRAIN 51.82$     1E+05 65 Ellingtn Drink Mix Grape Powdered 35.95$     190 TONYS PIZZA CHEESE 4X6 WHOLE GRAIN 66.00$     
8901265 25 TONYS PIZZA PEPPERONI WHOLE GRAIN 62.80$     1E+05 100 Ellingtn Drink Mix Cherry Powdered 35.95$     25 TONYS PIZZA PEPPERONI WHOLE GRAIN 65.75$     
8978119 540 4HOMBRES BURRITO BEEF & BEAN 45.45$     1E+05 10 Ellingtn Pudding Banana Rts 35.95$     540 4HOMBRES BURRITO BEEF & BEAN 51.40$     
8977119 10 POSADA CHIMICHANGA BEEF SHREDDED 49.68$     1E+05 15 Ellingtn Pudding Tapioca Rts 35.95$     10 POSADA CHIMICHANGA BEEF SHREDDED 49.54$     
8979140 5 FERNANDO ENCHILADA BEEF 29.94$     1E+05 100 Ellingtn Chili With Beans                    (R) 67.96$     5 FERNANDO ENCHILADA BEEF 30.26$     
8977090 5 FERNANDO ENCHILADA CHICKEN 25.64$     1E+05 5 Kth/Valy Mustard Prepared                    (R) 13.97$     5 FERNANDO ENCHILADA CHICKEN 26.05$     
7040087 40 RODRIGUZ TAMALE BEEF IN HUSK 1.5 OZ 4.92$       1E+05 5 Orchardn Apricot Halves Ex Light Syrup 46.92$     40 RODRIGUZ TAMALE BEEF IN HUSK 1.5 OZ
9240038 20 NYFROZEN BREADSTICK GARLIC 6 IN BULK 27.68$     1E+05 15 Ellingtn Applesauce Unsweetened Fancy 31.38$     20 NYFROZEN BREADSTICK GARLIC 6 IN BULK
9241065 5 TURANO BUN MINI BRIOCHE SLIDER 31.15$     1E+05 5 Kth/Valy Pear Half 30-35 Ct Nw Choice 48.96$     5 TURANO BUN MINI BRIOCHE SLIDER
9236654 5 BRIDGFRD BISCUIT BAKED BUTTERMILK 29.59$     1E+05 5 Kth/Valy Peach Half 30-35Ct Ex Lt Syrup 48.76$     5 BRIDGFRD BISCUIT BAKED BUTTERMILK
9342658 15 KRUSTEAZ WAFFLE BELGIUM 7 IN ROUND IW 38.21$     1E+05 5 Kth/Valy Fruit Cocktail Choice X Lt Syr 49.78$     15 KRUSTEAZ WAFFLE BELGIUM 7 IN ROUND IW
9342658 20 KRUSTEAZ WAFFLE BELGIAN 4 INCH 38.21$     1E+05 5 Kth/Valy Peach Diced Extra Lt Syrup 48.94$     20 KRUSTEAZ WAFFLE BELGIAN 4 INCH
9335514 370 GRABITZR FRENCH TOAST STICK 48.09$     1E+05 10 Ellingtn Fruit Cocktail Choice Hvy Syr 49.92$     370 GRABITZR FRENCH TOAST STICK 49.00$     
9330043 200 A JEMIMA PANCAKE WG 3.75 IN 28.40$     1E+05 110 Ellingtn Tomato Sauce Fancy California 24.97$     200 A JEMIMA PANCAKE WG 3.75 IN 64.44$     
9330043 100 MBTRWRTH PANCAKE ORIGINAL 28.40$     1E+05 50 Ellingtn Sauce Spaghetti Rtu 30.97$     100 MBTRWRTH PANCAKE ORIGINAL 29.75$     
4033222 5 CHEF P MUFFIN BLUEBERRY 26.48$     1E+05 240 Eggo Waffle Eggo Traditional 4 In 24.97$     5 CHEF P MUFFIN BLUEBERRY
9232323 5 CHEF P MUFFIN MINI BLUEBERRY 27.34$     1E+05 30 Hilshire Turkey Breast Sliced .5 Oz 47.65$     5 CHEF P MUFFIN MINI BLUEBERRY
8979061 5 MEX ORIG TORTILLA WRAP HONEY WHEAT 10IN 22.99$     1E+05 10 Hilshire Roast Beef Sliced .5 Oz Ea 68.92$     5 MEX ORIG TORTILLA WRAP HONEY WHEAT 10IN
9235972 5 PILLSBRY DOUGH BISCUIT BUTTERMILK 41.67$     1E+05 5 Briarstr Ham Shaving Smkd Bnls 2.59$       5 PILLSBRY DOUGH BISCUIT BUTTERMILK
9342809 30 SARA LEE CAKE BUTTER POUND IW 14.26$     1E+05 5 Schreibr Cheese Swiss American 120 Sl        (R) 64.87$     30 SARA LEE CAKE BUTTER POUND IW
9273012 15 CHEF P PIE PUMPKIN 10 INCH PREBAKED 41.64$     1E+05 5 Ewimport Mandarin Orange Whole Segment 44.94$     15 CHEF P PIE PUMPKIN 10 INCH PREBAKED 43.30$     
8855099 5 PAPETTIS FRENCH TOAST PLAIN ROUND 4 IN 85.40$     1E+05 10 Ewimport Mandarin Orange Broken Lt Syr 39.95$     5 PAPETTIS FRENCH TOAST PLAIN ROUND 4 IN
8806511 15 PACKER TILAPIA FILLET 5-7 OZ 35.14$     1E+05 5 Ewimport Pineapple Crushed In Juice 42.95$     15 PACKER TILAPIA FILLET 5-7 OZ 35.34$     
5469772 5 COVERWGN BACON SLAB SLICED RANDOM #2 2.27$       1E+05 15 Ewimport Tuna Chunk Light In Water 68.97$     5 COVERWGN BACON SLAB SLICED RANDOM #2 20.25$     
8930215 15 GRANSABR CHICKEN FAJITA MEAT LACOCINA 40.95$     1E+05 15 Ewimport Fruit Tropical Lt Syrup 49.92$     15 GRANSABR CHICKEN FAJITA MEAT LACOCINA 35.00$     
9290014 35 BONICI MEATBALL BEEF & CHICKEN 35.02$     1E+05 30 Wolverin Beef Stew 1X1 39.95$     35 BONICI MEATBALL BEEF & CHICKEN 35.22$     
8825045 20 INTRSTAT POLLOCK RECT BRD WG CN 3.6 OZ 34.41$     1E+05 15 Mission Tostada Yellow 5.5In 40.11$     20 INTRSTAT POLLOCK RECT BRD WG CN 3.6 OZ 34.62$     
8878445 30 TYSON CHICKEN MEAT DICED 1/2 IN 34.78$     1E+05 250 Kth/Home French Fries Sc 3/8 In 23.15$     30 TYSON CHICKEN MEAT DICED 1/2 IN
3153004 5 COCINAGR CHILI NO BEANS 93.59$     1E+05 5 Lakeside Vegetable Mixed 34.74$     5 COCINAGR CHILI NO BEANS 68.86$     
8930215 25 GRANSABR CHICKEN FAJITA STRIP COOKED 40.95$     1E+05 5 Gldhrvst Cheese Swiss American 160 Sl        (R) 67.55$     25 GRANSABR CHICKEN FAJITA STRIP COOKED
8669914 5 TYSON CHICKEN DRUMSTICK BRD COOKED 127.60$   1E+05 160 Cholula Sauce Hot Pc Cholula 13.91$     5 TYSON CHICKEN DRUMSTICK BRD COOKED
No bid 5 TYSON CHICKEN CRUMBLED COOKED No bid 1E+05 470 Ellingtn Egg Fresh Shell Xl Usda Aa 18.86$     5 TYSON CHICKEN CRUMBLED COOKED

8668783 120 MINUTEMN CHICKEN PATTY BREADED COOKED 31.01$     1E+05 10 Advancep Chicken Nugget Breast Meat 26.59$     120 MINUTEMN CHICKEN PATTY BREADED COOKED
8668783 40 MINUTEMN CHICKEN PATTY BREADED COOKED 31.01$     1E+05 15 Lavaquit Cheese Queso Fresco Mexicano 33.24$     40 MINUTEMN CHICKEN PATTY BREADED COOKED
8931247 390 MINUTEMA BEEF & CHICKEN PATTY 3 OZ CKD 119.85$   1E+05 940 Highline Pollock Rect Brd Wg Cn 3.6 Oz 40.59$     390 MINUTEMA BEEF & CHICKEN PATTY 3 OZ CKD
8931247 150 MINUTEMA BEEF & CHICKEN PATTY 3 OZ CKD 119.85$   1E+05 75 1906 Ketchup Individual 9 Gram Pc 19.05$     150 MINUTEMA BEEF & CHICKEN PATTY 3 OZ CKD
5474008 30 HILSHIRE TURKEY BREAST SLICED .5 OZ 45.36$     1E+05 10 Thankyou Pudding Lemon Rts 38.91$     30 HILSHIRE TURKEY BREAST SLICED .5 OZ 45.33$     
8934029 10 HILSHIRE ROAST BEEF SLICED .5 OZ EA 76.66$     1E+05 5 Bueno Mole Bueno 112.06$   10 HILSHIRE ROAST BEEF SLICED .5 OZ EA 75.90$     
No bid 5 BRIARSTR HAM SHAVING SMKD BNLS No bid 1E+05 65 Niagara Water Drinking Purified 5.95$       5 BRIARSTR HAM SHAVING SMKD BNLS

1911338 50 KIOLBASA BACON ENDS AND PIECES 25.27$     2E+05 45 Bellacib Pasta Shell Medium 7/8 In 20.75$     50 KIOLBASA BACON ENDS AND PIECES 17.88$     
5420135 30 WOLVERIN BEEF STEW 1X1 5.20$       2E+05 60 Bellacib Pasta Elbow Macaroni 20.64$     30 WOLVERIN BEEF STEW 1X1 87.80$     
8668781 10 ADVANCE CHICKEN NUGGET BREAST MEAT 25.04$     2E+05 20 Bellacib Pasta Egg Noodle Wide 1/2 In 17.00$     10 ADVANCE CHICKEN NUGGET BREAST MEAT 25.95$     

Bid 2022-13 Annual Contract for Processed Foods
Contract Term: October 1, 2021 thru September 30, 2022

Annual Contract is not limited to the items listed below.  Please request pricing for additional item from vendor.
RC Food Service & Produce
c/o Alma Cavazos
120 Market St.
Laredo, TX 78040
(956) 796-9999
almacavazos77@yahoo.com

Labatt Food Service
c/o Enrique Alvarado
902 N. Expressway 77
Harlingen, TX 78550
(956) 428-0722
ealvarado@labattfood.com

Ben E. Keith

rmbrown@benekeith.com
mejimenez@benekeith.com

(210) 661-7997
Selma, TX 78154
17635 Ben E. Keith Way
c/o Matt Brown

mailto:mejiminez@benekeith.com
mailto:ealvarado@labattfood.com
mailto:mejiminez@benekeith.com
mailto:mejimenez@benekeith.com


Item 
Qty in 
Cases Label Description Case Price Item 

Qty 
in 

Cases Label Description Case Price Item 

Qty 
in 

Cases Label Description Case Price

Bid 2022-13 Annual Contract for Processed Foods
Contract Term: October 1, 2021 thru September 30, 2022

Annual Contract is not limited to the items listed below.  Please request pricing for additional item from vendor.
RC Food Service & Produce
c/o Alma Cavazos
120 Market St.
Laredo, TX 78040
(956) 796-9999
almacavazos77@yahoo.com

Labatt Food Service
c/o Enrique Alvarado
902 N. Expressway 77
Harlingen, TX 78550
(956) 428-0722
ealvarado@labattfood.com

Ben E. Keith

rmbrown@benekeith.com
mejimenez@benekeith.com

(210) 661-7997
Selma, TX 78154
17635 Ben E. Keith Way
c/o Matt Brown

No bid 5 J DEAN BISCUIT BACON EGG & CHEESE IW No bid 2E+05 100 Bellacib Pasta Spaghetti 10 In 21.95$     5 J DEAN BISCUIT BACON EGG & CHEESE IW
8915054 5 J DEAN BISCUIT SAUSAGE EGG & CHEESE 20.95$     2E+05 5 Bellacib Pasta Fettuccine 10 In 21.95$     5 J DEAN BISCUIT SAUSAGE EGG & CHEESE
8825045 940 VIKING POLLOCK RECT BRD COOKED 3.6OZ 34.41$     2E+05 5 Zerega Pasta Shell Small 21.95$     940 VIKING POLLOCK RECT BRD COOKED 3.6OZ 34.62$     
8668781 40 ADVANCE CHICKEN NUGGET BREAST MEAT CKD 25.04$     2E+05 10 Zerega Pasta Vermicelli 10 Inch 23.49$     40 ADVANCE CHICKEN NUGGET BREAST MEAT CKD 26.50$     
8666019 10 TYSON CHICKEN THIGH IQF RAW 42.75$     2E+05 5 J Bar B Sausage Smoked Rope 24.46$     10 TYSON CHICKEN THIGH IQF RAW
8666019 20 TYSON CHICKEN THIGH IQF RAW 42.75$     3E+05 50 Light&Ft Yogurt Stwbry/Rasp/Blueberry        (R) 20.33$     20 TYSON CHICKEN THIGH IQF RAW
8868095 5 TYSON CHICKEN WING DRUMMETTE 56.47$     3E+05 5 Light&Ft Yogurt Variety Pack                 (R) 20.33$     5 TYSON CHICKEN WING DRUMMETTE
No bid 60 TYSON CHICKEN BREAST FILLET MESQ CKD No bid 3E+05 450 Mrkn/Fc Bean Green Regular Cut 19.47$     60 TYSON CHICKEN BREAST FILLET MESQ CKD

8668783 5 ADVANCE CHICKEN BREAST PATTY BRD 31.01$     3E+05 290 Mrkn/Fc Broccoli Cut 21.65$     5 ADVANCE CHICKEN BREAST PATTY BRD 36.50$     
8668783 30 ADVANCE CHICKEN BREAST PATTY BRD 31.01$     3E+05 5 Mrkn/Fc Broccoli Floret Iqf 35.31$     30 ADVANCE CHICKEN BREAST PATTY BRD 36.50$     
8861015 80 PACKER CHICKEN LEG QUARTER RANDOM FZN 24.46$     3E+05 150 Mrkn/Fc Carrot Diced 3/8 X 3/8 18.96$     80 PACKER CHICKEN LEG QUARTER RANDOM FZN 25.75$     
8867312 10 BONICI CHICKEN WING BONELESS COOKED 36.11$     3E+05 30 Mrkn/Fc Carrot Crinkle Cut 20.67$     10 BONICI CHICKEN WING BONELESS COOKED
8938276 100 BUTTERBL TURKEY FRANK 8/1 6 IN 28.29$     3E+05 20 Mrkn/Fc Cauliflower Iqf 25.97$     100 BUTTERBL TURKEY FRANK 8/1 6 IN 23.80$     
8938276 10 HORMEL TURKEY BREAST OVEN ROASTD 28.29$     3E+05 730 Mrkn/Fc Corn Cut 19.78$     10 HORMEL TURKEY BREAST OVEN ROASTD
8938276 15 HORMEL TURKEY SLICED BREAD READY 28.29$     3E+05 90 Mrkn/Fc Pea Green 20.47$     15 HORMEL TURKEY SLICED BREAD READY
8601061 140 ELLINGTN TURKEY SLICED SMOKED .70 OZ 53.59$     3E+05 45 Mrkn/Fc Squash Yellow Sliced 23.47$     140 ELLINGTN TURKEY SLICED SMOKED .70 OZ 53.36$     
8601061 15 ELLINGTN TURKEY SLICED SMOKED .70 OZ 53.59$     3E+05 20 Mrkn/Fc Squash Zucchini Sliced 1/4In 27.54$     15 ELLINGTN TURKEY SLICED SMOKED .70 OZ 53.36$     
8887741 5 CAROLINA TURKEY HAM DICED CURED 37.93$     3E+05 190 Mrkn/Fc Vegetable Mixed 5 Way 20.92$     5 CAROLINA TURKEY HAM DICED CURED
8883936 50 CAROLINA TURKEY HAM BUFFET DELUXE 3.08$       3E+05 150 Mrkn/Fc Vegetable Blend Peas & Carrots 20.92$     50 CAROLINA TURKEY HAM BUFFET DELUXE
No bid 15 JENNIE O TURKEY MEAT PULLED WHITE No bid 4E+05 90 Ore Ida Potato Tater Tots 47.95$     15 JENNIE O TURKEY MEAT PULLED WHITE

8886673 5 BUTTERBL TURKEY LUNCHMEAT COMBO 37.81$     4E+05 15 Ore Ida Hashbrown Golden Patty 30.86$     5 BUTTERBL TURKEY LUNCHMEAT COMBO
9397021 10 KTH/VALY BEEF FAJITA MEAT COOKED 94.38$     4E+05 5 Lamb Sup Hashbrown 2 1/2 Oz Patty 40.33$     10 KTH/VALY BEEF FAJITA MEAT COOKED
8941403 160 ADVANCE BEEF SALISBURY FLAME BROILED 121.33$   4E+05 170 Lamb Sup Hashbrown Side O Browns 66.72$     160 ADVANCE BEEF SALISBURY FLAME BROILED
8941403 60 ADVANCE BEEF SALISBURY FLAME BROILED 121.33$   4E+05 15 Lmb Wstn Potato Wedge Natural Cut 45.76$     60 ADVANCE BEEF SALISBURY FLAME BROILED
8942809 20 SMARTPIC MEATLOAF PATTY DELUXE 123.78$   4E+05 5 Mccain Potato Sweet Wedge 37.97$     20 SMARTPIC MEATLOAF PATTY DELUXE
8942809 5 SMARTPIC MEATLOAF PATTY DELUXE 123.78$   4E+05 5 Lamb Sup Potato Mashed Roasted Garlic 45.86$     5 SMARTPIC MEATLOAF PATTY DELUXE
8951361 75 ADVANCE BEEF STEAK FINGER COOKED CN 49.59$     4E+05 40 Lamb Sup Potato Mashed Traditional 42.95$     75 ADVANCE BEEF STEAK FINGER COOKED CN
8951361 15 ADVANCE BEEF STEAK FINGER COOKED CN 49.59$     4E+05 20 Foster Corn Dog Chicken 33.58$     15 ADVANCE BEEF STEAK FINGER COOKED CN
8951361 370 ADVANCE BEEF STEAK FRITTER 4/1 COOKED 49.59$     4E+05 15 J Dean Sandwich Saus Egg & Cheese 19.67$     370 ADVANCE BEEF STEAK FRITTER 4/1 COOKED
8951361 80 ADVANCE BEEF STEAK FRITTER 4/1 COOKED 49.59$     4E+05 5 Stouffer Lasagna Meat 84.57$     80 ADVANCE BEEF STEAK FRITTER 4/1 COOKED
9290012 350 FONTANIN MEATBALL ITALIAN .5 OZ 37.61$     4E+05 190 Tonys Pizza Cheese 4X6 Whole Grain 43.96$     350 FONTANIN MEATBALL ITALIAN .5 OZ 37.75$     
9290012 115 FONTANIN MEATBALL ITALIAN .5 OZ 37.61$     4E+05 25 Tonys Pizza Pepperoni Whole Grain 49.02$     115 FONTANIN MEATBALL ITALIAN .5 OZ 37.75$     
8941153 15 APF RED VEAL PATTY CHICKEN FRIED 76.53$     4E+05 10 Posada Chimichanga Beef Shredded 56.73$     15 APF RED VEAL PATTY CHICKEN FRIED
1911338 5 H VALUE BACON ENDS & PIECES 25.27$     4E+05 5 Fernando Enchilada Beef 26.65$     5 H VALUE BACON ENDS & PIECES
8945554 10 QTF PORK PATTY RIB SHAPE COOKED CN 44.15$     4E+05 5 Fernando Enchilada Chicken 23.62$     10 QTF PORK PATTY RIB SHAPE COOKED CN
8945554 20 KINGS PORK RIB PATTY W/BBQ SAUCE 44.15$     4E+05 40 Rodriguz Tamale Beef In Husk 1.5 Oz 37.86$     20 KINGS PORK RIB PATTY W/BBQ SAUCE
8778645 450 FARMLAND FRANK ALL MEAT 8/1 39.26$     4E+05 5 Papettis Egg Omelette W/Cheddar Chs 54.78$     450 FARMLAND FRANK ALL MEAT 8/1 39.85$     
8778002 15 TYSON FRANK ALL MEAT 10/1 6 INCH 50.11$     4E+05 20 Nyfrozen Breadstick Garlic 6 In Bulk 27.96$     15 TYSON FRANK ALL MEAT 10/1 6 INCH
8934004 30 HORMEL HAM SLICED WATER ADDED 52.22$     4E+05 5 Turano Bun Mini Brioche Slider 37.97$     30 HORMEL HAM SLICED WATER ADDED 51.75$     
8591019 5 HORMEL HAM SLICED SMOKED .5 OZ 59.99$     4E+05 20 Bridgfrd Biscuit Baked Buttermilk 29.71$     5 HORMEL HAM SLICED SMOKED .5 OZ
8922571 100 SMITHFLD HAM DICED 1/4 INCH IQF 37.45$     4E+05 5 J Dean Biscuit Sausage Egg & Cheese 20.38$     100 SMITHFLD HAM DICED 1/4 INCH IQF 37.60$     
8927105 400 KTH/VALY SAUSAGE PATTY 1.25 OZ COOKED 39.45$     4E+05 240 Krusteaz Waffle Belgian 4 Inch 37.44$     400 KTH/VALY SAUSAGE PATTY 1.25 OZ COOKED 43.75$     
8928319 15 NATCHOIC SAUSAGE LINK NATURAL COOKED 44.47$     4E+05 370 Grabitzr French Toast Stick 26.74$     15 NATCHOIC SAUSAGE LINK NATURAL COOKED
8933947 5 S MAID SAUSAGE SMOKED ROPE COOKED 43.32$     4E+05 5 Chef P Muffin Blueberry                    (R) 46.50$     5 S MAID SAUSAGE SMOKED ROPE COOKED
9169927 85 ALAMO SAUSAGE CHORIZO ALL BEEF 2.60$       4E+05 5 Chef P Muffin Mini Blueberry               (R) 24.96$     85 ALAMO SAUSAGE CHORIZO ALL BEEF 27.50$     
8933947 50 ECKRICH SAUSAGE SMOKED ROPE 43.32$     4E+05 5 Mex Orig Tortilla Wrap Honey Wheat 10In 26.67$     50 ECKRICH SAUSAGE SMOKED ROPE 52.20$     
8928319 245 J DEAN SAUSAGE LINK COOKED SKINLESS 44.47$     4E+05 5 Pillsbry Dough Biscuit Buttermilk 30.25$     245 J DEAN SAUSAGE LINK COOKED SKINLESS
8928319 20 TENN PRD SAUSAGE LINK .75OZ COOKED MILD 44.47$     4E+05 30 Sara Lee Cake Butter Pound Iw                (R) 13.06$     20 TENN PRD SAUSAGE LINK .75OZ COOKED MILD
8928319 15 BEKO SAUSAGE LINK MILD 1 OZ COOKED 44.47$     4E+05 15 Chef P Pie Pumpkin 10 Inch Prebaked        (R) 38.99$     15 BEKO SAUSAGE LINK MILD 1 OZ COOKED
8914814 5 HORMEL BREAKFAST BAR HAM EGG CHEESE 53.07$     5E+05 10 Tyson Chicken Thigh Iqf Raw 44.87$     5 HORMEL BREAKFAST BAR HAM EGG CHEESE
8922564 50 ARMOUR SALAMI HARD SLICED 71.82$     5E+05 20 Tyson Chicken Thigh Iqf Raw 44.94$     50 ARMOUR SALAMI HARD SLICED
No bid 430 FARMLAND BOLOGNA SLICED No bid 5E+05 5 Tyson Chicken Breast Fillet Mesq Ckd 44.72$     430 FARMLAND BOLOGNA SLICED 52.12$     

8886673 15 FARMLAND LUNCH MEAT COMBO PACK 37.81$     5E+05 80 Packer Chicken Leg Quarter Random Fzn 25.14$     15 FARMLAND LUNCH MEAT COMBO PACK
No bid 5 FRITOLAY CHIP VARIETY LSS FIESTA PACK No bid 5E+05 10 Bonici Chicken Wing Boneless Cooked 40.93$     5 FRITOLAY CHIP VARIETY LSS FIESTA PACK

4356002 250 BLACKHIV BEAN PINTO TRIPLE CLEAN DRIED 41.75$     5E+05 100 Butterbl Turkey Frank 8/1 6 In 19.74$     250 BLACKHIV BEAN PINTO TRIPLE CLEAN DRIED 37.50$     
4448791 30 GRANSABR PEPPER BLACK GROUND FINE 43.81$     5E+05 15 Breadrdy Turkey Sliced Bread Ready 51.68$     30 GRANSABR PEPPER BLACK GROUND FINE
6187751 10 GRANSABR CHILI POWDER LIGHT 7.11$       5E+05 155 Ellingtn Turkey Sliced Smoked .70 Oz 49.67$     10 GRANSABR CHILI POWDER LIGHT
6182216 5 GRANSABR GARLIC GRANULATED 40.26$     5E+05 100 Butterbl Turkey Ham Diced Cured 21.65$     5 GRANSABR GARLIC GRANULATED
3113146 10 GRANSABR CHIP TORTILLA YELLOW ROUND 22.48$     5E+05 15 Butterbl Turkey Lunchmeat Combo 34.73$     10 GRANSABR CHIP TORTILLA YELLOW ROUND 18.50$     
3113146 5 GRANSABR CHIP TORTILLA YELLOW ROUND 22.48$     5E+05 10 Kth/Valy Beef Fajita Meat Cooked 71.86$     5 GRANSABR CHIP TORTILLA YELLOW ROUND 18.50$     
3206117 5 SMOKEHSE SAUCE BBQ SWEET & SMOKY 18.86$     5E+05 220 Advancep Beef Salisbury Flame Broiled 99.27$     5 SMOKEHSE SAUCE BBQ SWEET & SMOKY
1130045 20 GLACIER WATER NATURAL DISTILLED 4.01$       5E+05 25 Smartpic Meatloaf Patty Deluxe 74.65$     20 GLACIER WATER NATURAL DISTILLED
1983141 45 GRANSABR PEPPER JALAPENO NACHO SLICED 28.91$     5E+05 90 Advance Beef Steak Finger Cooked Cn 41.78$     45 GRANSABR PEPPER JALAPENO NACHO SLICED 33.00$     
No bid 5 JHS CHOCOLATE ENROBER ZTF No bid 5E+05 450 Advance Beef Steak Fritter 4/1 Cooked 38.51$     5 JHS CHOCOLATE ENROBER ZTF

1627504 5 LAKESIDE CARROT SLICED MEDIUM 28.45$     5E+05 465 Fontanin Meatball Italian .5 Oz 44.67$     5 LAKESIDE CARROT SLICED MEDIUM
3861000 10 ELLINGTN STUFFING MIX CORNBREAD 74.51$     5E+05 15 Apf Red Veal Patty Chicken Fried 42.35$     10 ELLINGTN STUFFING MIX CORNBREAD
4060205 5 RICHS ICING BUTTERCREME WHITE ZTF 65.89$     5E+05 5 H Value Bacon Ends & Pieces 24.12$     5 RICHS ICING BUTTERCREME WHITE ZTF
2423120 15 KTH/VALY BASE CHICKEN FLAVOR SOUP PASTE 7.67$       5E+05 10 Qtf Pork Patty Rib Shape Cooked Cn 44.16$     15 KTH/VALY BASE CHICKEN FLAVOR SOUP PASTE
8245681 50 S&D COFFEE QUALITY GROUND 19.54$     5E+05 20 Kingcmnd Pork Rib Patty W/Bbq Sauce 57.00$     50 S&D COFFEE QUALITY GROUND

36005 60 ELLINGTN RICE LONG GRAIN 4% BROKEN 22.49$     5E+05 450 Farmland Frank All Meat 8/1 20.77$     60 ELLINGTN RICE LONG GRAIN 4% BROKEN 21.95$     
1267545 115 ELLINGTN DRINK MIX FRUIT PUNCH 20.18$     5E+05 15 Tyson Frank All Meat 10/1 6 Inch 36.78$     115 ELLINGTN DRINK MIX FRUIT PUNCH 20.75$     
1284578 110 ELLINGTN DRINK MIX LEMONADE POWDERED 20.18$     5E+05 30 Hormel Ham Sliced Water Added 43.74$     110 ELLINGTN DRINK MIX LEMONADE POWDERED 20.75$     
No bid 100 ELLINGTN DRINK MIX PEACH POWDERED No bid 5E+05 5 Natchoic Ham Sliced Smoked .5 Oz 59.24$     100 ELLINGTN DRINK MIX PEACH POWDERED

1281100 140 ELLINGTN DRINK MIX ORANGE POWDERED 20.18$     5E+05 400 Kth/Valy Sausage Patty 1.25 Oz Cooked 37.84$     140 ELLINGTN DRINK MIX ORANGE POWDERED
1284577 110 ELLINGTN DRINK MIX PINK LEMONADE PWD 19.21$     5E+05 15 Natchoic Sausage Link Natural Cooked 36.96$     110 ELLINGTN DRINK MIX PINK LEMONADE PWD
No bid 65 ELLINGTN DRINK MIX GRAPE POWDERED No bid 5E+05 85 Alamo Sausage Chorizo All Beef 23.57$     65 ELLINGTN DRINK MIX GRAPE POWDERED
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Bid 2022-13 Annual Contract for Processed Foods
Contract Term: October 1, 2021 thru September 30, 2022

Annual Contract is not limited to the items listed below.  Please request pricing for additional item from vendor.
RC Food Service & Produce
c/o Alma Cavazos
120 Market St.
Laredo, TX 78040
(956) 796-9999
almacavazos77@yahoo.com

Labatt Food Service
c/o Enrique Alvarado
902 N. Expressway 77
Harlingen, TX 78550
(956) 428-0722
ealvarado@labattfood.com

Ben E. Keith

rmbrown@benekeith.com
mejimenez@benekeith.com

(210) 661-7997
Selma, TX 78154
17635 Ben E. Keith Way
c/o Matt Brown

No bid 100 ELLINGTN DRINK MIX CHERRY POWDERED No bid 5E+05 50 Eckrich Sausage Smoked Rope 36.67$     100 ELLINGTN DRINK MIX CHERRY POWDERED
3295516 50 ELLINGTN SAUCE PICANTE MEDIUM HOT 38.84$     5E+05 245 J Dean Sausage Link Cooked Skinless 33.58$     50 ELLINGTN SAUCE PICANTE MEDIUM HOT
5010060 5 ELLINGTN SAUCE ENCHILADA MILD RTU 32.31$     5E+05 5 Hormel Breakfast Bar Ham Egg Cheese 48.78$     5 ELLINGTN SAUCE ENCHILADA MILD RTU
5020011 10 ELLINGTN PUDDING BANANA RTS 37.47$     5E+05 50 Margher Salami Hard Sliced 72.65$     10 ELLINGTN PUDDING BANANA RTS
5020062 10 ELLINGTN PUDDING LEMON RTS 19.32$     6E+05 15 Musselmn Applesauce Natural Ind Cup 34.82$     10 ELLINGTN PUDDING LEMON RTS
5034012 15 ELLINGTN PUDDING TAPIOCA RTS 39.62$     6E+05 10 Rubykist Sauce Cranberry Jellied 48.59$     15 ELLINGTN PUDDING TAPIOCA RTS
3132107 100 ELLINGTN CHILI WITH BEANS 84.78$     6E+05 5 Dole Fruit Tropical In Juice 20.59$     100 ELLINGTN CHILI WITH BEANS 72.50$     
4575023 5 KTH/VALY MUSTARD PREPARED 3.33$       6E+05 5 Dole Fruit Tropical Salad Light Syr 47.84$     5 KTH/VALY MUSTARD PREPARED
1184003 5 ELLINGTN PEANUT BUTTER CREAMY 58.73$     6E+05 15 Cousins Pineapple Chunk In Syrup 41.74$     5 ELLINGTN PEANUT BUTTER CREAMY
326114 5 ORCHARDN APRICOT HALVES EX LIGHT SYRUP 51.88$     6E+05 80 Rubykist Juice Lemon 100% Juice 39.51$     5 ORCHARDN APRICOT HALVES EX LIGHT SYRUP

1690011 15 ELLINGTN APPLESAUCE FANCY UNSWEETENED 34.59$     6E+05 20 Dasani Water Dasani Purified 7.35$       15 ELLINGTN APPLESAUCE FANCY UNSWEETENED
481650 5 KTH/VALY PEAR HALF 30-35 CT NW CHOICE 49.41$     6E+05 5 Crystlgt Drink Mix Ind Lemonade Sf 30.82$     5 KTH/VALY PEAR HALF 30-35 CT NW CHOICE 34.50$     
326109 5 KTH/VALY FRUIT COCKTAIL CHOICE X LT SYR 53.12$     6E+05 5 Crystlgt Drink Mix Fruit Punch Sf 46.82$     5 KTH/VALY FRUIT COCKTAIL CHOICE X LT SYR
326110 5 KTH/VALY PEACH DICED EXTRA LT SYRUP 54.35$     6E+05 5 Gatorade Gatorade Mix Variety 2.5 Gal 108.00$   5 KTH/VALY PEACH DICED EXTRA LT SYRUP 33.50$     

2304004 110 ELLINGTN TOMATO SAUCE FANCY CALIFORNIA 32.08$     6E+05 5 Nestle Creamer Coffee Mate Shaker 20.68$     110 ELLINGTN TOMATO SAUCE FANCY CALIFORNIA 24.76$     
2280016 50 ELLINGTN SAUCE SPAGHETTI RTU 32.15$     6E+05 30 Keith Creamer Pc Non Dairy Packet 21.41$     50 ELLINGTN SAUCE SPAGHETTI RTU 28.58$     
1803105 5 ELLINGTN VEGETABLE MIXED FANCY 34.07$     6E+05 30 Elgtncof Coffee 100% Columbian Fp 67.89$     5 ELLINGTN VEGETABLE MIXED FANCY 33.00$     
326108 15 EWIMPORT PEACH SLICED IN LIGHT SYRUP 51.88$     6E+05 50 Elgtncof Coffee Traditional Ground 73.37$     15 EWIMPORT PEACH SLICED IN LIGHT SYRUP 42.00$     
22510 5 EWIMPORT MANDARIN ORANGE WHOLE SEGMENT 37.73$     6E+05 10 Folgers Coffee Reg Ultra Roast Fp 106.99$   5 EWIMPORT MANDARIN ORANGE WHOLE SEGMENT
22515 10 EWIMPORT MANDARIN ORANGE BROKEN LT SYR 33.93$     7E+05 75 Bushbest Bean Pinto Fancy 26.12$     10 EWIMPORT MANDARIN ORANGE BROKEN LT SYR 35.60$     
547653 15 EWIMPORT PINEAPPLE CHUNK IN JUICE 29.86$     7E+05 5 Allens Corn Cream Style                    (R) 35.70$     15 EWIMPORT PINEAPPLE CHUNK IN JUICE 29.40$     

2792315 15 EWIMPORT TUNA CHUNK LIGHT IN WATER 64.00$     7E+05 15 Bushbest Hominy White 21.81$     15 EWIMPORT TUNA CHUNK LIGHT IN WATER 54.00$     
566860 15 EWIMPORT FRUIT TROPICAL LT SYRUP 35.79$     7E+05 200 Idahoan Potato Mashed Instant Real          (R) 57.24$     15 EWIMPORT FRUIT TROPICAL LT SYRUP 33.40$     

7996500 20 CMCFOOD OIL FRYING LIQUID CLEAR 55.48$     7E+05 20 Resers Potato Russet Diced Blanched 18.94$     20 CMCFOOD OIL FRYING LIQUID CLEAR
4335632 15 MISSION TOSTADA YELLOW 5.5IN 17.34$     7E+05 5 Princela Potato Sweet Cut Fancy              (R) 38.34$     15 MISSION TOSTADA YELLOW 5.5IN
1803105 5 LAKESIDE VEGETABLE MIXED 34.07$     7E+05 130 Kth/Home Tomato Whole Peeled 20.44$     5 LAKESIDE VEGETABLE MIXED 33.00$     
1591510 55 LAKESIDE BEET SLICED MEDIUM 33.74$     7E+05 20 Hunts Tomato Paste                        (R) 46.98$     55 LAKESIDE BEET SLICED MEDIUM 30.00$     
4356002 30 NEWALLIA BEANS PINTO WHOLE DRIED 41.75$     7E+05 130 Adolphus Rice Long Grain Adolphus 22.48$     30 NEWALLIA BEANS PINTO WHOLE DRIED
No bid 5 GATORADE GATORADE MIX FRUIT PUNCH POUCH No bid 7E+05 5 Producer Rice Pilaf Mix Seasoned             (R) 25.52$     5 GATORADE GATORADE MIX FRUIT PUNCH POUCH
81042 10 MOTTS APPLESAUCE STRAWBERRY IND CUP 31.24$     7E+05 5 Lil Pig Sauce Bbq                           (R) 19.97$     10 MOTTS APPLESAUCE STRAWBERRY IND CUP
81076 5 MOTTS APPLESAUCE NATURAL NO SUGAR 30.42$     7E+05 5 Mipueblo Cheese Sauce Cheddar Aged 39.74$     5 MOTTS APPLESAUCE NATURAL NO SUGAR
81076 20 MUSSELMN APPLESAUCE NATURAL IND CUP 30.42$     7E+05 5 Gehls Cheese Sauce Mild Cheddar 37.60$     20 MUSSELMN APPLESAUCE NATURAL IND CUP
268508 10 RUBYKIST SAUCE CRANBERRY JELLIED 41.66$     7E+05 100 Mipueblo Cheese Sauce Nacho 40.58$     10 RUBYKIST SAUCE CRANBERRY JELLIED
326109 10 KTH/EXCL FRUIT COCKTAIL CHOICE HVY SYR 53.12$     7E+05 15 Kth/Home Mayonnaise Heavy Duty Gf            (R) 54.96$     10 KTH/EXCL FRUIT COCKTAIL CHOICE HVY SYR
566860 5 DOLE FRUIT TROPICAL IN JUICE 35.79$     7E+05 10 Hid Valy Dressing Pc Ranch Original Cup 29.87$     5 DOLE FRUIT TROPICAL IN JUICE
566860 5 DOLE FRUIT TROPICAL SALAD LIGHT SYR 35.79$     7E+05 20 Daisy Sour Cream Pc 10.76$     5 DOLE FRUIT TROPICAL SALAD LIGHT SYR
435685 5 KTH/CHO PEACH HALF 30-35CT LIGHT SYRUP 38.39$     7E+05 5 Ppi Dressing Pc Italian 14.92$     5 KTH/CHO PEACH HALF 30-35CT LIGHT SYRUP
566854 5 HORIZON PINEAPPLE CRUSHED COARSE 25.09$     7E+05 5 Ppi Dressing Pc Ranch Buttermilk 15.62$     5 HORIZON PINEAPPLE CRUSHED COARSE
547653 5 COUSINS PINEAPPLE CHUNK IN SYRUP 29.86$     7E+05 5 Bullseye Sauce Pc Bbq Bullseye 14.78$     5 COUSINS PINEAPPLE CHUNK IN SYRUP
435685 5 CARBOTRL PEACH HALF IN JUICE 38.39$     7E+05 120 Kraft Sauce Pc Tartar Creamy 16.95$     5 CARBOTRL PEACH HALF IN JUICE 37.00$     
949602 80 RUBYKIST JUICE LEMON 100% JUICE 11.88$     7E+05 70 Keith Sweetener Sugar Keith Pc 15.95$     80 RUBYKIST JUICE LEMON 100% JUICE 29.40$     

1131120 20 DASANI WATER DASANI PURIFIED 7.72$       7E+05 85 Swtdlite Sweetener Pink Packet 16.99$     20 DASANI WATER DASANI PURIFIED 38.00$     
1131120 20 DASANI WATER DASANI PURIFIED 7.72$       7E+05 5 Equal Sweetener Equal Packet 29.24$     20 DASANI WATER DASANI PURIFIED
1550007 65 PURELIFE WATER DRINKING PURIFIED 3.60$       7E+05 30 Keith Pepper Pc Pouch 19.75$     65 PURELIFE WATER DRINKING PURIFIED Niagara 4.75$       
1284076 5 CRYSTLGT DRINK MIX IND LEMONADE SF 32.39$     7E+05 40 Keith Salt Pc Pouch 10.81$     5 CRYSTLGT DRINK MIX IND LEMONADE SF
1284099 10 CRYSTLGT DRINK MIX IND FRUIT PUNCH SF 32.39$     7E+05 40 Morton Salt Iodized Table 9.53$       10 CRYSTLGT DRINK MIX IND FRUIT PUNCH SF
1284099 5 CRYSTLGT DRINK MIX FRUIT PUNCH SF 32.39$     7E+05 530 Madeira Syrup Pc Pouch 10.20$     5 CRYSTLGT DRINK MIX FRUIT PUNCH SF
1325125 5 GATORADE GATORADE MIX VARIETY 2.5 GAL 113.40$   7E+05 35 Smuckers Syrup Pc Pancake Cup 13.19$     5 GATORADE GATORADE MIX VARIETY 2.5 GAL
8269710 15 N JOY CREAMER PC NON-DAIRY PACKET 42.69$     7E+05 5 Heinz Pickle Dill Spear Kosher 37.73$     15 N JOY CREAMER PC NON-DAIRY PACKET
8265563 5 NESTLE CREAMER COFFEE MATE SHAKER 44.78$     7E+05 5 Roland Olive Green Queen Pimento Stfd 129.95$   5 NESTLE CREAMER COFFEE MATE SHAKER
8269710 30 CREAMER PC NON DAIRY PACKET 42.69$     7E+05 15 Embasa Pepper Chipotle 19.24$     30 CREAMER PC NON DAIRY PACKET 42.75$     
No bid 30 ELGTNCOF COFFEE 100% COLOMBIAN FP No bid 7E+05 20 Sanmarco Pepper Jalapeno Whole 25.82$     30 ELGTNCOF COFFEE 100% COLOMBIAN FP

8245681 10 FOLGERS COFFEE REG ULTRA ROAST FP 19.54$     7E+05 5 Goldmedl Flour All Purpose Medallion 15.97$     10 FOLGERS COFFEE REG ULTRA ROAST FP
1541457 75 BUSH BEAN PINTO FANCY 23.86$     7E+05 5 Maseca Flour Corn Tortilla Wht #0 21.61$     75 BUSH BEAN PINTO FANCY 25.80$     
1591510 15 KTH/CHO BEET SLICED IRREGULAR 33.74$     7E+05 10 Contmill Cake Mix Yellow 26.84$     15 KTH/CHO BEET SLICED IRREGULAR
1679299 5 ALLENS CORN CREAM STYLE 40.94$     7E+05 5 Contmill Cake Mix White 26.84$     5 ALLENS CORN CREAM STYLE
1716000 15 BUSHS HOMINY WHITE 22.91$     7E+05 5 Coralbay Coconut Snowflake 28.24$     15 BUSHS HOMINY WHITE 21.90$     
1803105 5 KTH/EXCL VEGETABLE MIXED FANCY 34.07$     7E+05 5 Clabgirl Baking Soda 27.13$     5 KTH/EXCL VEGETABLE MIXED FANCY
2106383 200 IDAHOAN POTATO MASHED INSTANT REAL 71.61$     7E+05 5 Argo Starch Corn 19.87$     200 IDAHOAN POTATO MASHED INSTANT REAL 66.00$     
1551240 20 RESERS POTATO RUSSET DICED BLANCHED 27.36$     7E+05 170 Mission Taco Shell 5 In Yellow 19.19$     20 RESERS POTATO RUSSET DICED BLANCHED
2140424 5 PRINCELA POTATO SWEET CUT FANCY 34.60$     7E+05 35 Fritos Chip Frito Corn Original 37.33$     5 PRINCELA POTATO SWEET CUT FANCY
2140424 5 PRINCELA POTATO SWEET CUT FANCY 34.60$     7E+05 35 Lays Chip Potato Reg Single Serve 37.33$     5 PRINCELA POTATO SWEET CUT FANCY
2281001 130 KTH/HOME TOMATO WHOLE PEELED 23.19$     7E+05 35 Cheetos Chip Cheeto Crunchy 37.33$     130 KTH/HOME TOMATO WHOLE PEELED 23.70$     
2272576 20 HUNTS TOMATO PASTE 41.46$     7E+05 15 Doritos Chip Dorito Cooler Ranch 37.33$     20 HUNTS TOMATO PASTE 46.00$     
7780000 20 INDEL TOMATILLO CRUSHED 31.51$     7E+05 30 Doritos Chip Dorito Nacho Cheese 37.33$     20 INDEL TOMATILLO CRUSHED 34.50$     
4356002 25 GRANSABR BEAN PINTO TRIPLE CLEAN DRIED 41.75$     7E+05 10 Sunchips Chip Sunchip Original 37.33$     25 GRANSABR BEAN PINTO TRIPLE CLEAN DRIED

36005 130 ADOLPHUS RICE LONG GRAIN ADOLPHUS 22.49$     7E+05 5 Roldgold Pretzel Tiny Twists Low Fat 31.59$     130 ADOLPHUS RICE LONG GRAIN ADOLPHUS 21.95$     
4234555 5 PRODUCER RICE PILAF MIX SEASONED 30.34$     7E+05 5 Funyuns Chip Funyun Flamin Hot Lss 32.89$     5 PRODUCER RICE PILAF MIX SEASONED
3206117 5 LIL PIG SAUCE BBQ 18.86$     7E+05 10 Chapas Chip Pork Cracklin 49.64$     5 LIL PIG SAUCE BBQ
2722877 5 MIPUEBLO CHEESE SAUCE CHEDDAR AGED 39.02$     7E+05 10 Zerega Pasta Egg Noodle 7/8 In 15.00$     5 MIPUEBLO CHEESE SAUCE CHEDDAR AGED
2722877 5 GEHLS CHEESE SAUCE MILD CHEDDAR 39.02$     7E+05 120 Gldhrvst Cheese American Sliced 160 Ct 70.02$     5 GEHLS CHEESE SAUCE MILD CHEDDAR
2722877 100 MIPUEBLO CHEESE SAUCE NACHO 39.02$     7E+05 5 Landolak Cheese Cheddar Shred Feather        (R) 85.55$     100 MIPUEBLO CHEESE SAUCE NACHO  Ricos 49.50$     

52516 160 CHOLULA SAUCE HOT PC CHOLULA 10.75$     7E+05 5 Gldhrvst Cheese Cheddar Cubed .75 In         (R) 44.34$     160 CHOLULA SAUCE HOT PC CHOLULA
3660004 15 KTH/HOME MAYONNAISE HEAVY DUTY GF 58.59$     7E+05 5 Dominare Cheese Mozz Feather Shred 77.76$     15 KTH/HOME MAYONNAISE HEAVY DUTY GF 46.00$     
3329803 10 HID VALY DRESSING PC RANCH ORIGINAL CUP 23.67$     8E+05 60 Myhmtwn Pudding Vanilla Rts 28.47$     10 HID VALY DRESSING PC RANCH ORIGINAL CUP
3249257 75 RED GOLD KETCHUP INDIVIDUAL 9 GRAM PC 39.82$     8E+05 55 Myhmtwn Pudding Chocolate Rts 28.47$     75 RED GOLD KETCHUP INDIVIDUAL 9 GRAM PC 20.75$     
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Bid 2022-13 Annual Contract for Processed Foods
Contract Term: October 1, 2021 thru September 30, 2022

Annual Contract is not limited to the items listed below.  Please request pricing for additional item from vendor.
RC Food Service & Produce
c/o Alma Cavazos
120 Market St.
Laredo, TX 78040
(956) 796-9999
almacavazos77@yahoo.com

Labatt Food Service
c/o Enrique Alvarado
902 N. Expressway 77
Harlingen, TX 78550
(956) 428-0722
ealvarado@labattfood.com

Ben E. Keith

rmbrown@benekeith.com
mejimenez@benekeith.com

(210) 661-7997
Selma, TX 78154
17635 Ben E. Keith Way
c/o Matt Brown

3372224 90 MUSTARD PC POLY POUCH 12.79$     8E+05 110 Jello Gelatin Strawberry Sugar Free 9.75$       90 MUSTARD PC POLY POUCH 13.00$     
3329893 300 MAYONNAISE PC 18.36$     8E+05 15 Gldhrvst Salad Coleslaw Creamy Gf 47.76$     300 MAYONNAISE PC 9.00$       
3471059 5 PPI DRESSING PC ITALIAN 16.07$     8E+05 15 Resers Salad Pasta Macaroni 41.99$     5 PPI DRESSING PC ITALIAN
3341112 70 SAUCE PC TARTAR 19.89$     8E+05 10 Resers Salad Potato Regular 41.99$     70 SAUCE PC TARTAR
949602 40 JUICE LEMON PC 11.88$     8E+05 5 Gldhrvst Salad Potato Mustard Gf 41.93$     40 JUICE LEMON PC

3471117 5 PPI DRESSING PC RANCH BUTTERMILK 17.20$     8E+05 10 Gldhrvst Salad Tuna Supreme Gf 49.93$     5 PPI DRESSING PC RANCH BUTTERMILK
3372224 5 FRENCHS MUSTARD PC POUCH 200 CT 12.79$     8E+05 10 Resers Salad Chicken White Gourmet 48.97$     5 FRENCHS MUSTARD PC POUCH 200 CT 13.00$     
3341112 15 HEINZ SAUCE PC TARTAR 19.89$     8E+05 25 Resers Salad Chicken Smoked 37.86$     15 HEINZ SAUCE PC TARTAR
3202330 5 BULLSEYE SAUCE PC BBQ BULLSEYE 19.74$     8E+05 20 Nabisco Cracker Saltine 15.53$     5 BULLSEYE SAUCE PC BBQ BULLSEYE
3341112 30 KRAFT SAUCE PC TARTAR CREAMY 19.89$     8E+05 5 Tedygram Cracker Graham Cinnamon Teddy       (R) 40.71$     30 KRAFT SAUCE PC TARTAR CREAMY
8569519 70 SWEETENER SUGAR KEITH PACKET 20.02$     8E+05 10 Ritz Cracker Ritz 28.74$     70 SWEETENER SUGAR KEITH PACKET
7100005 85 SWTDLITE SWEETENER PINK PACKET 16.96$     8E+05 5 Chex Snack Mix Simply Chex Stwbry        (R) 28.84$     85 SWTDLITE SWEETENER PINK PACKET
8568511 5 EQUAL SWEETENER EQUAL PACKET 32.11$     8E+05 25 Barnums Cookie Animal Cracker               (R) 13.35$     5 EQUAL SWEETENER EQUAL PACKET
6331243 30 PEPPER PC POUCH 13.18$     8E+05 30 Nillawaf Cookie Vanilla Wafer Ind            (R) 22.69$     30 PEPPER PC POUCH 12.80$     
6331250 40 SALT PC POUCH 7.67$       8E+05 70 Grandmas Cookie Oatmeal Raisin 21.95$     40 SALT PC POUCH 8.20$       
6313043 40 MORTON SALT IODIZED TABLE 4.88$       8E+05 5 Kelloggs Cereal Bar Strawberry               (R) 28.98$     40 MORTON SALT IODIZED TABLE
4650678 530 PPI SYRUP PC POUCH 10.78$     8E+05 240 Nabisco Cookie Bulk Assortment 27.35$     530 PPI SYRUP PC POUCH 20.75$     
4592622 85 PPI JELLY PC ASSORTED CUP 15.20$     8E+05 15 Kelloggs Snack  Rice Krispie Treat           (R) 48.54$     85 PPI JELLY PC ASSORTED CUP 16.65$     
4592531 25 JELLY PC GRAPE CUP 13.25$     8E+05 30 N Valley Granola Bar Chewy Variety Pack      (R) 48.97$     25 JELLY PC GRAPE CUP 13.75$     
4650678 35 SMUCKERS SYRUP PC PANCAKE CUP 10.78$     8E+05 5 Spicecls Cinnamon Ground 26.22$     35 SMUCKERS SYRUP PC PANCAKE CUP
5162344 10 BAYOU PICKLE DILL SLICE HAMBURGER CC 19.51$     8E+05 5 Mcormick Cumin Comino Ground 10.91$     10 BAYOU PICKLE DILL SLICE HAMBURGER CC
5162352 5 HEINZ PICKLE DILL SPEAR KOSHER 32.41$     8E+05 25 Spicecls Cumin Comino Ground 22.79$     5 HEINZ PICKLE DILL SPEAR KOSHER
3821001 5 ROLAND OLIVE GREEN QUEEN PIMENTO STFD 78.85$     8E+05 75 Mcormick Pepper Lemon Seasoning 12.81$     5 ROLAND OLIVE GREEN QUEEN PIMENTO STFD
9412359 15 EMBASA PEPPER CHIPOTLE 21.39$     8E+05 5 Lawrys Seasoning Salt No Msg 146.80$   15 EMBASA PEPPER CHIPOTLE 33.00$     
1988963 20 SANMARCO PEPPER JALAPENO WHOLE 27.12$     8E+05 50 Mcormick Seasoning Cajun Bayou No Msg 14.59$     20 SANMARCO PEPPER JALAPENO WHOLE 25.80$     
3823372 5 GOLDMEDL FLOUR ALL PURPOSE MEDALLION 13.67$     8E+05 20 Mcormick Parsley Flakes 4.69$       5 GOLDMEDL FLOUR ALL PURPOSE MEDALLION 16.00$     
3826502 5 MASECA FLOUR CORN TORTILLA WHT #0 23.47$     8E+05 5 Txcustom Pepper Black Ground Table 55.00$     5 MASECA FLOUR CORN TORTILLA WHT #0
4071110 10 CONTMILL CAKE MIX YELLOW 28.18$     8E+05 15 Txcustom Garlic Powder 10.29$     10 CONTMILL CAKE MIX YELLOW
4071108 5 CONTMILL CAKE MIX WHITE 28.18$     8E+05 5 Txcustom Seasoning Menudo Mix 10.29$     5 CONTMILL CAKE MIX WHITE
3672011 5 CORALBAY COCONUT SNOWFLAKE 29.65$     8E+05 15 Txcustom Garlic Granulated 160.89$   5 CORALBAY COCONUT SNOWFLAKE
6415681 5 CLABGIRL BAKING SODA 22.26$     8E+05 100 Kth/Home Shortening Clear Fry Liquid 44.96$     5 CLABGIRL BAKING SODA
6453005 5 ARGO STARCH CORN 22.24$     8E+05 50 Imperial Sugar Pure Cane Granulated 18.15$     5 ARGO STARCH CORN
3113355 170 MISSION TACO SHELL 5 IN YELLOW 17.25$     8E+05 5 Imperial Sugar Brown Light In Bag 28.26$     170 MISSION TACO SHELL 5 IN YELLOW
4335632 5 MISSION TOSTADA SHELL 5.5IN YELLOW 17.34$     8E+05 70 Santiago Bean Refried Dehydrated 34.78$     5 MISSION TOSTADA SHELL 5.5IN YELLOW
3778043 35 FRITOLAY CHIP FRITO CORN ORIGINAL 39.59$     8E+05 5 Marcos Nopalito 28.49$     35 FRITOLAY CHIP FRITO CORN ORIGINAL
3778044 35 LAYS CHIP POTATO REG SINGLE SERVE 39.59$     8E+05 5 Chicsea Tuna Chunk Light In Water           (R) 65.42$     35 LAYS CHIP POTATO REG SINGLE SERVE
3778047 35 CHEETOS CHIP CHEETO CRUNCHY 39.59$     8E+05 60 Manwich Sauce Manwich Sloppy Joe 29.78$     35 CHEETOS CHIP CHEETO CRUNCHY
3778049 15 DORITOS CHIP DORITO COOLER RANCH 39.59$     8E+05 20 Smuckers Syrup Cup Diet Pancake 16.85$     15 DORITOS CHIP DORITO COOLER RANCH
3778050 30 DORITOS CHIP DORITO NACHO CHEESE 39.59$     8E+05 20 Morrison Gravy Mix Country Style Pepper      (R) 19.67$     30 DORITOS CHIP DORITO NACHO CHEESE
3778029 10 SUNCHIPS CHIP SUNCHIP ORIGINAL 39.69$     8E+05 60 Morrison Gravy Mix Brown Country Style       (R) 22.68$     10 SUNCHIPS CHIP SUNCHIP ORIGINAL 42.00$     
3778036 10 CHEETOS CHIP CHEETO HOT CRUNCHY 35.24$     8E+05 5 Trio Sauce Mix Alfredo Trio 87.82$     10 CHEETOS CHIP CHEETO HOT CRUNCHY
3778022 5 ROLDGOLD PRETZEL TINY TWISTS LOW FAT 33.59$     8E+05 5 Pioneer Gravy Mix Turkey                    (R) 22.91$     5 ROLDGOLD PRETZEL TINY TWISTS LOW FAT
3778042 45 FRITOLAY CHIP FRITO CORN CHILI CHEESE 39.69$     8E+05 10 Morrison Gravy Mix Peppered                  (R) 18.83$     45 FRITOLAY CHIP FRITO CORN CHILI CHEESE
No bid 5 FUNYUNS CHIP FUNYUN FLAMIN HOT LSS No bid 8E+05 5 Cocopuff Cereal Bowl Cocoa Puffs 48.68$     5 FUNYUNS CHIP FUNYUN FLAMIN HOT LSS

3777611 10 CHAPAS CHIP PORK CRACKLIN 47.14$     8E+05 25 Quaker Cereal Oats Quick 39.39$     10 CHAPAS CHIP PORK CRACKLIN
4179875 45 CORTONA PASTA SHELL MEDIUM 7/8 INCH 23.04$     8E+05 10 M O M Cereal Bowl Cinnamon Toasters 29.79$     45 CORTONA PASTA SHELL MEDIUM 7/8 INCH 19.75$     
4152089 60 CORTONA PASTA ELBOW MACARONI 18.34$     8E+05 10 M O M Cereal Bowl Berry Colossal 29.79$     60 CORTONA PASTA ELBOW MACARONI 18.30$     
4151812 20 CORTONA PASTA EGG NOODLE WIDE 1/2 INCH 12.58$     8E+05 200 M O M Cereal Bowl Apple Zings 29.79$     20 CORTONA PASTA EGG NOODLE WIDE 1/2 INCH 18.30$     
4152106 100 CORTONA PASTA SPAGHETTI LONG 10IN 18.34$     8E+05 120 M O M Cereal Bowl Tootie Fruities 29.79$     100 CORTONA PASTA SPAGHETTI LONG 10IN 18.30$     
4152096 5 CORTONA PASTA FETTUCCINE 10 IN 23.53$     8E+05 140 M O M Cereal Bowl Raisin Bran 29.79$     5 CORTONA PASTA FETTUCCINE 10 IN 27.00$     
4151812 10 ZEREGA PASTA EGG NOODLE 7/8 IN 12.58$     8E+05 150 M O M Cereal Bowl Crispy Rice 29.79$     10 ZEREGA PASTA EGG NOODLE 7/8 IN
4171716 5 CORTONA PASTA SHELL SMALL 23.53$     8E+05 5 Champn Raisin Seedless Select 70.73$     5 CORTONA PASTA SHELL SMALL
4301362 10 CORTONA PASTA VERMICELLI 10 INCH 23.04$     8E+05 5 Jetpufed Marshmallow Jet Puffed 24.95$     10 CORTONA PASTA VERMICELLI 10 INCH
5020003 60 MYHMTWN PUDDING VANILLA RTS 37.47$     8E+05 15 Kth/Home Base Beef Flavor                    (R) 37.96$     60 MYHMTWN PUDDING VANILLA RTS
5020045 55 MYHMTWN PUDDING CHOCOLATE RTS 37.47$     8E+05 15 Kth/Home Base Chicken Flavor Soup 52.87$     55 MYHMTWN PUDDING CHOCOLATE RTS
4860250 110 JELLO GELATIN STRAWBERRY SUGAR FREE 16.60$     8E+05 5 Minors Base Beef No Msg 164.51$   110 JELLO GELATIN STRAWBERRY SUGAR FREE 31.12$     
8778425 15 GLDHRVST SALAD COLESLAW CREAMY GF 25.76$     1E+05 15 Kth/Valy Peach Sliced Choice X Lt Syrup 52.91$     15 GLDHRVST SALAD COLESLAW CREAMY GF
8778961 15 RESERS SALAD PASTA MACARONI 43.28$     1E+05 55 Lakeside Beet Pickled Sliced Fancy 37.96$     15 RESERS SALAD PASTA MACARONI
8770117 10 RESERS SALAD POTATO 43.28$     2E+05 5 Ellingtn Peanut Butter Creamy 49.87$     10 RESERS SALAD POTATO
8770117 10 RESERS SALAD POTATO REGULAR 43.28$     2E+05 200 Krusteaz Pancake 3 In Original 33.02$     10 RESERS SALAD POTATO REGULAR
8778953 5 GLDHRVST SALAD POTATO MUSTARD GF 43.28$     2E+05 5 Gransabr Sauce Enchilada Mild Rtu 15.04$     5 GLDHRVST SALAD POTATO MUSTARD GF
8779072 10 GLDHRVST SALAD TUNA SUPREME GF 49.91$     2E+05 100 Krusteaz Pancake Whole Grain 3.75In 27.96$     10 GLDHRVST SALAD TUNA SUPREME GF
8779098 10 RESERS SALAD CHICKEN WHITE GOURMET 51.76$     2E+05 25 Flavrfrs Jelly Pc Grape Cup 12.99$     10 RESERS SALAD CHICKEN WHITE GOURMET

14132 25 RESERS SALAD CHICKEN SMOKED 42.74$     4E+05 15 Foster Corn Dog Chicken 33.58$     25 RESERS SALAD CHICKEN SMOKED
3770086 20 NABISCO CRACKER SALTINE 13.92$     4E+05 540 Elmontry Burrito Beef & Bean Red Chili 36.94$     20 NABISCO CRACKER SALTINE 12.50$     
No bid 5 LANCE CRACKER CRUSHED SALTINES No bid 5E+05 430 Butterbl Turkey Lunchmeat Combo 34.73$     5 LANCE CRACKER CRUSHED SALTINES

3805512 5 NABISCO CRACKER GRAHAM TEDDY CUB 42.74$     5E+05 50 H Value Bacon Ends & Pieces 24.12$     5 NABISCO CRACKER GRAHAM TEDDY CUB
3757507 10 NABISCO CRACKER RITZ 30.18$     6E+05 40 Realemon Juice Lemon Pc Real Lemon 14.21$     10 NABISCO CRACKER RITZ
9380009 5 GENMILLS SNACK MIX SIMPLY CHEX STWBRY 28.16$     7E+05 20 Del Sol Tomatillo Crushed 34.81$     5 GENMILLS SNACK MIX SIMPLY CHEX STWBRY
3730553 25 NABISCO COOKIE ANIMAL CRACKER 21.00$     7E+05 50 Pace Sauce Salsa Thick & Chunky Med      (R) 55.93$     25 NABISCO COOKIE ANIMAL CRACKER 23.90$     
No bid 30 NABISCO COOKIE VANILLA WAFER IND No bid 7E+05 90 Heinz Mustard Pc Pouch 13.20$     30 NABISCO COOKIE VANILLA WAFER IND

3802550 70 GRANDMAS COOKIE OATMEAL RAISIN 21.65$     7E+05 300 Heinz Mayonnaise Pc Foil Pack 15.87$     70 GRANDMAS COOKIE OATMEAL RAISIN
No bid 5 KELLOGGS CEREAL BAR STWBY YOGURT No bid 7E+05 85 Smuckers Jelly Pc Assorted Plastic Cup 17.50$     5 KELLOGGS CEREAL BAR STWBY YOGURT
No bid 240 NABISCO COOKIE BULK ASSORTMENT No bid 7E+05 10 Bayou Pickle Dill Slice Hamburger Cc 23.89$     240 NABISCO COOKIE BULK ASSORTMENT

9991266 15 KELLOGGS CEREAL BAR RICE KRISPIE TREAT 49.41$     8E+05 15 Chefboy Ravioli Mini Beef Rtu 49.91$     15 KELLOGGS CEREAL BAR RICE KRISPIE TREAT
3761236 30 N VALLEY GRANOLA BAR CHEWY VARIETY PACK 50.05$     30 N VALLEY GRANOLA BAR CHEWY VARIETY PACK
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Bid 2022-13 Annual Contract for Processed Foods
Contract Term: October 1, 2021 thru September 30, 2022

Annual Contract is not limited to the items listed below.  Please request pricing for additional item from vendor.
RC Food Service & Produce
c/o Alma Cavazos
120 Market St.
Laredo, TX 78040
(956) 796-9999
almacavazos77@yahoo.com

Labatt Food Service
c/o Enrique Alvarado
902 N. Expressway 77
Harlingen, TX 78550
(956) 428-0722
ealvarado@labattfood.com

Ben E. Keith

rmbrown@benekeith.com
mejimenez@benekeith.com

(210) 661-7997
Selma, TX 78154
17635 Ben E. Keith Way
c/o Matt Brown

6181176 5 SPICECLS CINNAMON GROUND 5.58$       5 SPICECLS CINNAMON GROUND
4441986 5 MCORMICK CUMIN COMINO GROUND 6.64$       5 MCORMICK CUMIN COMINO GROUND
4441986 25 SPICECLS CUMIN COMINO GROUND 6.64$       25 SPICECLS CUMIN COMINO GROUND
6184303 75 MCORMICK PEPPER LEMON SEASONING 11.11$     75 MCORMICK PEPPER LEMON SEASONING
6185417 5 LAWRYS SEASONING SALT NO MSG 7.62$       5 LAWRYS SEASONING SALT NO MSG
6181069 50 MCORMICK SEASONING CAJUN BAYOU NO MSG 14.19$     50 MCORMICK SEASONING CAJUN BAYOU NO MSG
6174528 20 MCORMICK PARSLEY FLAKES 11.67$     20 MCORMICK PARSLEY FLAKES
4448791 5 TXCUSTOM PEPPER BLACK GROUND TABLE 43.81$     5 TXCUSTOM PEPPER BLACK GROUND TABLE
6184113 15 TXCUSTOM GARLIC POWDER 9.74$       15 TXCUSTOM GARLIC POWDER
9398626 5 TXCUSTOM SEASONING MENUDO MIX 30.58$     5 TXCUSTOM SEASONING MENUDO MIX
6182216 15 TXCUSTOM GARLIC GRANULATED 40.26$     15 TXCUSTOM GARLIC GRANULATED
7996534 100 KTH/HOME SHORTENING CLEAR FRY LIQUID 45.88$     100 KTH/HOME SHORTENING CLEAR FRY LIQUID
8520009 50 IMPERIAL SUGAR PURE CANE GRANULATED 19.19$     50 IMPERIAL SUGAR PURE CANE GRANULATED 28.00$     
8523755 5 IMPERIAL SUGAR BROWN LIGHT IN BAG 29.80$     5 IMPERIAL SUGAR BROWN LIGHT IN BAG
2105556 70 SANTIAGO BEAN REFRIED DEHYDRATED 23.48$     70 SANTIAGO BEAN REFRIED DEHYDRATED
2145500 5 MARCOS NOPALITO 31.93$     5 MARCOS NOPALITO 28.00$     
2200000 5 BUENO MOLE AUTENTICO ROJO 120.94$   5 BUENO MOLE AUTENTICO ROJO 75.50$     
2792315 5 CHICSEA TUNA CHUNK LIGHT IN WATER 64.00$     5 CHICSEA TUNA CHUNK LIGHT IN WATER 54.00$     
2280018 60 HUNTS SAUCE MANWICH SLOPPY JOE 30.99$     60 HUNTS SAUCE MANWICH SLOPPY JOE
3100500 15 CHEFBOY RAVIOLI BEEF RTU 41.00$     15 CHEFBOY RAVIOLI BEEF RTU
5010042 20 SMUCKERS SYRUP CUP DIET PANCAKE 15.94$     20 SMUCKERS SYRUP CUP DIET PANCAKE
3445696 20 MORRISON GRAVY MIX COUNTRY STYLE PEPPER 14.82$     20 MORRISON GRAVY MIX COUNTRY STYLE PEPPER 16.50$     
3445698 60 MORRISON GRAVY MIX BROWN COUNTRY STYLE 15.53$     60 MORRISON GRAVY MIX BROWN COUNTRY STYLE 17.18$     
3576006 5 TRIO SAUCE MIX ALFREDO TRIO 80.11$     5 TRIO SAUCE MIX ALFREDO TRIO
3445695 5 PIONEER GRAVY MIX TURKEY 20.06$     5 PIONEER GRAVY MIX TURKEY
3445696 10 MORRISON GRAVY MIX PEPPERED 14.82$     10 MORRISON GRAVY MIX PEPPERED
6490009 5 GENMILLS CEREAL BOWL COCOA PUFFS 48.78$     5 GENMILLS CEREAL BOWL COCOA PUFFS
6601546 25 QUAKER CEREAL OATS QUICK 42.01$     25 QUAKER CEREAL OATS QUICK
6495113 10 M O M CEREAL BOWL CINNAMON TOASTERS 48.78$     10 M O M CEREAL BOWL CINNAMON TOASTERS
No bid 10 M O M CEREAL BOWL BERRY COLOSSAL No bid 10 M O M CEREAL BOWL BERRY COLOSSAL

3730003 200 M O M CEREAL BOWL APPLE ZINGS 45.34$     200 M O M CEREAL BOWL APPLE ZINGS 30.38$     
3730004 120 M O M CEREAL BOWL TOOTIE FRUITIES 45.34$     120 M O M CEREAL BOWL TOOTIE FRUITIES 30.38$     
6573521 140 M O M CEREAL BOWL RAISIN BRAN 45.34$     140 M O M CEREAL BOWL RAISIN BRAN 30.38$     
3730005 150 M O M CEREAL BOWL CRISPY RICE 45.34$     150 M O M CEREAL BOWL CRISPY RICE 30.38$     
790600 5 CHAMPN RAISIN SEEDLESS SELECT 59.78$     5 CHAMPN RAISIN SEEDLESS SELECT 59.00$     

4741400 5 KRAFT MARSHMALLOW JET PUFFED 25.20$     5 KRAFT MARSHMALLOW JET PUFFED
2602506 10 CAMPBELL SOUP CHICKEN NOODLE 20.75$     10 CAMPBELL SOUP CHICKEN NOODLE
2422335 15 KTH/HOME BASE BEEF FLAVOR 37.22$     15 KTH/HOME BASE BEEF FLAVOR
2422335 5 MINORS BASE BEEF NO MSG 37.22$     5 MINORS BASE BEEF NO MSG
2423120 5 KTH/PREM BASE CHICKEN PASTE REFRIGERATE 7.67$       5 KTH/PREM BASE CHICKEN PASTE REFRIGERATE
8520009 10 CARGILL SUGAR GRANULATED 19.19$     10 CARGILL SUGAR GRANULATED 28.00$     
8660128 5 MASTERS CHEESE CHEDDAR JACK SHRD FANCY 50.04$     5 MASTERS CHEESE CHEDDAR JACK SHRD FANCY 73.00$     
3450925 10 FRSH/KTH COTTAGE CHEESE 4% 31.78$     10 FRSH/KTH COTTAGE CHEESE 4%
8145620 280 ELLINGTN MARGARINE SOLIDS PURE VEG 37.07$     280 ELLINGTN MARGARINE SOLIDS PURE VEG 38.40$     
8660082 10 SCHREIBR CHEESE CHEDDAR SHRD IMITATION 50.04$     10 SCHREIBR CHEESE CHEDDAR SHRD IMITATION
8660018 130 SCHREIBR CHEESE AMERICAN 184 SLICES 75.19$     130 SCHREIBR CHEESE AMERICAN 184 SLICES
8660066 5 SCHREIBR CHEESE SWISS AMERICAN 120 SL 50.61$     5 SCHREIBR CHEESE SWISS AMERICAN 120 SL
8660072 5 GLDHRVST CHEESE SWISS AMERICAN 160 SL 51.96$     5 GLDHRVST CHEESE SWISS AMERICAN 160 SL
8165060 470 ELLINGTN EGG FRESH SHELL XL USDA AA 17.29$     470 ELLINGTN EGG FRESH SHELL XL USDA AA 19.00$     
8165060 300 PACKER EGG FRESH SHELL XL 17.29$     300 PACKER EGG FRESH SHELL XL 19.00$     
8170017 50 YOPLAIT YOGURT TRIX STWBRY/BAN BASH LF 20.14$     50 YOPLAIT YOGURT TRIX STWBRY/BAN BASH LF
No bid 5 LIGHT&FT YOGURT STWBRY/RASP/BLUEBERRY No bid 5 LIGHT&FT YOGURT STWBRY/RASP/BLUEBERRY
No bid 5 LIGHT&FT YOGURT VARIETY PACK No bid 5 LIGHT&FT YOGURT VARIETY PACK

8206020 5 DAISY COTTAGE CHEESE LOW FAT SM CURD 10.66$     5 DAISY COTTAGE CHEESE LOW FAT SM CURD
8856024 30 PAPETTIS EGG WHOLE LIQUID W/CITRIC 52.27$     30 PAPETTIS EGG WHOLE LIQUID W/CITRIC
8859016 5 PAPETTIS EGG OMELETTE W/CHEDDAR CHS 49.34$     5 PAPETTIS EGG OMELETTE W/CHEDDAR CHS
3529923 20 DAISY SOUR CREAM PC 11.09$     20 DAISY SOUR CREAM PC 13.25$     
8660018 120 GLDHRVST CHEESE AMERICAN SLICED 160 CT 75.19$     120 GLDHRVST CHEESE AMERICAN SLICED 160 CT 56.00$     
8660082 5 LANDOLAK CHEESE CHEDDAR SHRED FEATHER 50.04$     5 LANDOLAK CHEESE CHEDDAR SHRED FEATHER 65.00$     

15475 5 GLDHRVST CHEESE CHEDDAR CUBED .75 IN 35.24$     5 GLDHRVST CHEESE CHEDDAR CUBED .75 IN 42.90$     
8662003 5 MASTERS CHEESE MOZZ FEATHER SHRED 54.12$     5 MASTERS CHEESE MOZZ FEATHER SHRED 73.00$     
8656001 15 V&V CHEESE QUESO FRESCO WHEEL 6.04$       15 V&V CHEESE QUESO FRESCO WHEEL 25.00$     
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