
RC Food Service & Produce Inc. Ben E. Keith Foods
c/o Alma Cavazos c/o Matt Brown
120 Market St. 17635 Ben E. Keith Way
Laredo, TX 78040 Selma, TX 78154
(956) 796-9999 (210) 507-6276
almacavazos77@yahoo.com rmbrown@benekeith.com

mejimenez@benekeith.com
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APPLE RED DL XF WSH 64 CT PACKER 1 / 40 LB 5 No Bid APPLE RED DL XF WSH 64 CT PACKER 1 / 40 LB 5 34.00$     170.00$        Apple Red Dl Fcy Wsh 113 Ct Mrkn/Fc 40 Lb 5  $      41.98 209.90$           

APPLE RED DL XF WSH 72 CT PACKER 1 / 72 CT 5 No Bid APPLE RED DL XF WSH 72 CT PACKER 1 / 72 CT 5 34.00$     170.00$        Apple Red Dl Fcy Wsh 138 Ct Mrkn/Fc 40 Lb 70  $      41.98 2,938.60$        

APPLE RED DL XF WSH 88 CT MARKON 1 / 40 LB 70 No Bid APPLE RED DL XF WSH 88 CT MARKON 1 / 40 LB 70 34.00$     2,380.00$    Apple Red Dl Xf Frsh/Kth 5 Lb 5  $      11.38 56.90$             

APPLE RED DL FCY WSH 113 CT MARKON 1 / 40 LB 5 No Bid APPLE RED DL FCY WSH 113 CT MARKON 1 / 40 LB 5 34.00$     170.00$        Apple Granny Smth Fcy 88 Ct Mrkn/Fc 88 Ct 80  $      41.57 3,325.60$        

APPLE RED DL FCY WSH 125 CT MARKON 1 / 40 LB 20 No Bid APPLE RED DL FCY WSH 125 CT MARKON 1 / 40 LB 20 24.75$     495.00$        Apple Granny Smth Fcy 113 Ct Mrkn/Fc 113 Ct 5  $      49.68 248.40$           

APPLE RED DL FCY WSH 138 CT MARKON 1 / 40 LB 80 No Bid APPLE RED DL FCY WSH 138 CT MARKON 1 / 40 LB 80 24.75$     1,980.00$    Apple Sliced Red Usa Mrkn/Rss 2 Oz 500  $      17.18 8,590.00$        

APPLE RED DL FCY 138 CT PACKER 1 / 138 CT 280 34.00$   9,520.00$    APPLE RED DL FCY 138 CT PACKER 1 / 138 CT 280 24.75$     6,930.00$    Banana Green Tip Packer 40 Lb 1000  $      29.69 29,690.00$      

APPLE RED DL XF PACKER 1 / 5 LB 5 No Bid APPLE RED DL XF PACKER 1 / 5 LB 5 7.00$       35.00$          Banana Premium Packer 10 Lb 20  $        9.87 197.40$           

APPLE GOLD DL XF WSH 88 CT MARKON 1 / 40 LB 10 No Bid APPLE GOLD DL XF WSH 88 CT MARKON 1 / 40 LB 10 32.50$     325.00$        Blueberry Driscoll 6 Oz 25  $      33.18 829.50$           

APPLE GRANNY SMITH PACKER 1 / 12 CT 5 No Bid APPLE GRANNY SMITH PACKER 1 / 12 CT 5 10.00$     50.00$          Strawberry Clamshell                (R) Mrkn/Fc 1 Lb 400  $      23.98 9,592.00$        

APPLE GRANNY SMTH FCY 72 CT PACKER 1 / 72 CT 5 No Bid APPLE GRANNY SMTH FCY 72 CT PACKER 1 / 72 CT 5 38.50$     192.50$        Lemon Choice 200 Ct Mrkn/Esn 35 Lb 15  $      46.79 701.85$           

APPLE GRANNY SMTH FCY 88 CT MARKON 1 / 88 CT 10 No Bid APPLE GRANNY SMTH FCY 88 CT MARKON 1 / 88 CT 10 38.50$     385.00$        Juice Lemon Fresh Squeezed Sunorchd Qt 5  $      29.17 145.85$           

APPLE GRANNY SMTH FCY 100 CT PACKER 1 / 40#TR PK 15 No Bid APPLE GRANNY SMTH FCY 100 CT PACKER 1 / 40#TR P 15 38.50$     577.50$        Orange Choice 88 Ct Mrkn/Esn 88 Ct 5  $      34.88 174.40$           

APPLE GRANNY SMTH FCY 125 CT PACKER 1 / 125 CT 35 No Bid APPLE GRANNY SMTH FCY 125 CT PACKER 1 / 125 CT 35 38.50$     1,347.50$    Orange Choice 113 Ct Mrkn/Esn 113 Ct 70  $      38.68 2,707.60$        

APPLE SLICES RED USA SUN RICH 24 / 2 OZ 500 No Bid APPLE SLICES RED USA SUN RICH 24 / 2 OZ 500 12.00$     6,000.00$    Orange Choice 138 Ct Mrkn/Esn 138 Ct 20  $      39.29 785.80$           

APPLE SLICED BAGS PACKER 100 / 2 OZ 20 No Bid APPLE SLICED BAGS PACKER 100 / 2 OZ 20 28.50$     570.00$        Juice Orange Fresh Squeezed Mrkn/Rss 1 Gal 5  $      41.68 208.40$           

BANANA PREMIUM US #1 PACKER 1 / 40 LB 20 21.00$   420.00$        BANANA PREMIUM US #1 PACKER 1 / 40 LB 20 19.50$     390.00$        Cantaloupe Us#1 6 Ct Frsh/Kth 6 Ct 140  $      16.88 2,363.20$        

BANANA GREEN TIP PACKER 1 / 40 LB 1000 21.00$   21,000.00$  BANANA GREEN TIP PACKER 1 / 40 LB 1000 19.50$     19,500.00$  Cantaloupe Us#1 3 Ct Frsh/Kth 3 Ct 5  $      13.18 65.90$             

BANANA PREMIUM PACKER 1 / 10 LB 20 No Bid BANANA PREMIUM PACKER 1 / 10 LB 20 5.50$       110.00$        Honeydew Melons Us #1 3 Ct Frsh/Kth 3 Ct 55  $      16.09 884.95$           

BLUEBERRY FRESH PACKER 6 / 6 OZ 25 No Bid BLUEBERRY FRESH PACKER 6 / 6 OZ 25 16.50$     412.50$        Watermelon Seedless Red Frsh/Kth Each 30  $      12.57 377.10$           

STRAWBERRY CLAMSHELL MARKON 8 / 1 LB 400 21.00$   8,400.00$    STRAWBERRY CLAMSHELL MARKON 8 / 1 LB 400 24.00$     9,600.00$    Grape Green Seedless Frsh/Kth 5 Lb 10  $      24.59 245.90$           

STRAWBERRY WITH STEM PACKER 4 / 16 OZ 5 No Bid STRAWBERRY WITH STEM PACKER 4 / 16 OZ 5 24.00$     120.00$        Grape Red Seedless 5 Lb Frsh/Kth 5 Lb 5  $      16.79 83.95$             

LEMON CHOICE 95 CT PACKER 1 / 95 CCT 5 No Bid LEMON CHOICE 95 CT PACKER 1 / 95 CCT 5 36.50$     182.50$        Plum Red Us #1 4X5 California Packer 28 Lb 30  $      60.68 1,820.40$        

LEMON STANDARD 200 CT PACKER 1 / 200 CT 10 49.00$   490.00$        LEMON STANDARD 200 CT PACKER 1 / 200 CT 10 36.50$     365.00$        Avocado Hass Ripe 48 Ct Packer 48 Ct 5  $      42.19 210.95$           

JUICE LEMON FRESH SQUEEZE MARKON 16 / 1 QT 5 No Bid JUICE LEMON FRESH SQUEEZE MARKON 16 / 1 QT 5 29.50$     147.50$        Kiwi Fruit #1 33/36 Ct Packer 7 1/2 L 5  $      26.98 134.90$           

LIME PERSIAN #1 200 CT PACKER 1 / 200 CT 25 23.00$   575.00$        LIME PERSIAN #1 200 CT PACKER 1 / 200 CT 25 23.00$     575.00$        Mango Us#1 9/12 Ct Packer Ctn 5  $      14.38 71.90$             

ORANGE FANCY 88 CT PACKER 1 / 35 LB 20 No Bid ORANGE FANCY 88 CT PACKER 1 / 35 LB 20 32.00$     640.00$        Broccoli Crown Iceless Mrkn/Fc 20 Lb 15  $      21.88 328.20$           

ORANGE CHO 56 CT PACKER 1 / 35 LB 5 No Bid ORANGE CHO 56 CT PACKER 1 / 35 LB 5 32.00$     160.00$        Cabbage Green Us#1 Packer 50 Lb C 20  $      22.57 451.40$           

ORANGE CHO 88 CT PACKER 1 / 88 CT 70 No Bid ORANGE CHO 88 CT PACKER 1 / 88 CT 70 30.00$     2,100.00$    Cabbage Red Us#1 California Packer 50 Lb 10  $      30.07 300.70$           

ORANGE CHO 113 CT PACKER 1 / 113 CT 20 No Bid ORANGE CHO 113 CT PACKER 1 / 113 CT 20 30.00$     600.00$        Spring Mix Conventional             (R) Mrkn/Rss 1.5 Lb 5  $      11.38 56.90$             

ORANGE CHO 138 CT PACKER 1 / 138 CT 1000 34.00$   34,000.00$  ORANGE CHO 138 CT PACKER 1 / 138 CT 1000 32.00$     32,000.00$  Carrot Jumbo Tx/Mex/Mich Packer 50Lb Ba 30  $      20.98 629.40$           

JUICE ORANGE FRESH SQUEEZED SUN ORCHARD 4 / 1 GAL 5 No Bid JUICE ORANGE FRESH SQUEEZED SUN ORCHARD 4 / 1 GAL 5 -$              Carrot Jumbo Packer 25 Lb 5  $      22.48 112.40$           

ORANGE FANCY 22 CT PACKER 1 / 22 CT 5 No Bid ORANGE FANCY 22 CT PACKER 1 / 22 CT 5 10.00$     50.00$          Carrot Jumbo  Us #1 Mrkn/Fc 10 Lb B 5  $      16.87 84.35$             

TANGERINE CHILEAN PACKER 1 / VOL FILL 10 31.00$   310.00$        TANGERINE CHILEAN PACKER 1 / VOL FILL 10 29.00$     290.00$        Carrot Shred Mrkn/Rss 5 Lb 30  $      13.98 419.40$           

FRUIT SALAD DELUX P'APPL SUN RICH 1 / 8 LB 5 12.00$   60.00$          FRUIT SALAD DELUX P'APPL SUN RICH 1 / 8 LB 5 12.00$     60.00$          Carrot Carroteenie 100 2 Oz Packer 2 Oz 140  $      21.37 2,991.80$        

PINEAPPLE CHUNKS       K SUN RICH 1 / 8 LB TUB 5 12.00$   60.00$          PINEAPPLE CHUNKS       K SUN RICH 1 / 8 LB TUB 5 28.00$     140.00$        Pear D Anjou 110 Ct Mrkn/Fc 110 Ct 50  $      56.29 2,814.50$        

CANTALOUPE US#1 9 CT PACKER 1 / 35 LB 140 No Bid CANTALOUPE US#1 9 CT PACKER 1 / 35 LB 140 23.00$     3,220.00$    Cantaloupe 12 Ct Mrkn/Fc 12 Ct 25  $      25.07 626.75$           

CANTALOUPE US#1 15 CT PACKER 1 / 35 LB 25 No Bid CANTALOUPE US#1 15 CT PACKER 1 / 35 LB 25 23.00$     575.00$        Honeydew Melon 6 Ct Mrkn/Fc 30 Lb 100  $      33.19 3,319.00$        

CANTALOUPE US#1 6 CT PACKER 1 / 6 CT 5 No Bid CANTALOUPE US#1 6 CT PACKER 1 / 6 CT 5 23.00$     115.00$        Fruit Salad Deluxe Presv Free       (R) Mrkn/Rss 8 Lb 5  $      31.37 156.85$           

CANTALOUPE US#1 3 CT PACKER 1 / 3 CT 5 No Bid CANTALOUPE US#1 3 CT PACKER 1 / 3 CT 5 12.00$     60.00$          Lettuce Shred 1/8 In   K            (R) Mrkn/Rss 5 Lb 5  $      17.88 89.40$             

HONEYDEW MELONS US #1 3 CT PACKER 1 / 3 CT 50 No Bid HONEYDEW MELONS US #1 3 CT PACKER 1 / 3 CT 50 8.00$       400.00$        Lettuce Romaine Wash&Trim           (R) Mrkn/Rss 5 Lb Ba 10  $      26.78 267.80$           

HONEYDEW MELONS US #1 3 CT PACKER 1 / 3 CT 5 No Bid HONEYDEW MELONS US #1 3 CT PACKER 1 / 3 CT 5 8.00$       40.00$          Salad Mix Iceberg/Rom 50/50         (R) Mrkn/Rss 5 Lb 5  $      23.68 118.40$           

HONEYDEW MELON US #1 6 CT PACKER 1 / 30 LB 10 No Bid HONEYDEW MELON US #1 6 CT PACKER 1 / 30 LB 10 16.90$     169.00$        Salad Mix W/Bag Mrkn/Rss 5 Lb Ba 5  $      18.57 92.85$             

HONEYDEW MELONS US#1 9 CT PACKER 1 / 30 LB 100 No Bid HONEYDEW MELONS US#1 9 CT PACKER 1 / 30 LB 100 16.50$     1,650.00$    Lime Persian #1 200 Ct Mrkn/Fc 40 Lb 25  $      18.59 464.75$           

WATERMELON PACKER 1 / EACH 100 No Bid WATERMELON PACKER 1 / EACH 100 4.50$       450.00$        Grape Green Seedless Mrkn/Esn 19 Lb 15  $      64.48 967.20$           

WATERMELON SEEDLESS RED PACKER 1 / EACH 25 No Bid WATERMELON SEEDLESS RED PACKER 1 / EACH 25 4.50$       112.50$        Onion White Jumbo Us#1 Packer 50 Lb S 10  $      18.79 187.90$           

WATERMELON SEEDLESS RED PACKER 1 / EACH 5 No Bid WATERMELON SEEDLESS RED PACKER 1 / EACH 5 4.50$       22.50$          Onion White Jumbo Us#1 Frsh/Kth 10Lb Ba 10  $      10.79 107.90$           

GRAPE GREEN SEEDLESS PACKER 1 / 18 LB 10 39.00$   390.00$        GRAPE GREEN SEEDLESS PACKER 1 / 18 LB 10 26.00$     260.00$        Onion Yellow Jumbo Packer 50 Lb 80  $      18.18 1,454.40$        

GRAPE GREEN SEEDLESS PACKER 1 / 5 LB 5 No Bid GRAPE GREEN SEEDLESS PACKER 1 / 5 LB 5 36.00$     180.00$        Onion Yellow Jumbo Frsh/Kth 10Lb Ct 10  $        7.38 73.80$             

GRAPE RED SEEDLESS 5 LB PACKER 1 / 5 LB 5 No Bid GRAPE RED SEEDLESS 5 LB PACKER 1 / 5 LB 5 15.00$     75.00$          Pepper Bell Green Chopper Mrkn/Esn 1 1/9 B 150  $      22.59 3,388.50$        

PEACH RIPE N READY 48/60 PACKER 1 / 20 LB 60 No Bid PEACH RIPE N READY 48/60 PACKER 1 / 20 LB 60 21.50$     1,290.00$    Pepper Bell Green Frsh/Kth 5 Lb Cs 5  $      12.57 62.85$             

PEAR D'ANJOU US #1 PACKER 1 / CS 5 No Bid PEAR D'ANJOU US #1 PACKER 1 / CS 5 39.50$     197.50$        Pepper Bell Red Frsh/Kth 5 Lb Cs 5  $      14.68 73.40$             

PEAR D'ANJOU US #1 PACKER 1 / CS 50 42.00$   2,100.00$    PEAR D'ANJOU US #1 PACKER 1 / CS 50 29.00$     1,450.00$    Pepper Bell Gold Frsh/Kth 5 Lb Ba 5  $      13.29 66.45$             

PEAR D'ANJOU US #1 PACKER 1 / CS 5 No Bid PEAR D'ANJOU US #1 PACKER 1 / CS 5 39.50$     197.50$        Pepper Serrano Frsh/Kth 5 Lb Cs 100  $      12.79 1,279.00$        

PEAR D'ANJOU US #1 PACKER 1 / CS 10 No Bid PEAR D'ANJOU US #1 PACKER 1 / CS 10 39.50$     395.00$        Pepper Serrano Packer Vol Fil 30  $      30.18 905.40$           

PLUM BLACK RIPE N READY PACKER 1 / 20 LB 5 No Bid PLUM BLACK RIPE N READY PACKER 1 / 20 LB 5 30.00$     150.00$        Pepper Bell Red Chopper Mrkn/Esn 1 1/9 B 5  $      31.29 156.45$           

PLUM BLACK RIPE N READY PACKER 1 / 20 LB 30 No Bid PLUM BLACK RIPE N READY PACKER 1 / 20 LB 30 22.00$     660.00$        Pepper Habanero Packer 8 Lb 5  $      36.87 184.35$           

KIWI FRUIT #1 33/36 CT PACKER 1 / FLAT 100 No Bid KIWI FRUIT #1 33/36 CT PACKER 1 / FLAT 100 16.00$     1,600.00$    Pepper Ancho Frsh/Kth 5 Lb 5  $      41.97 209.85$           

MANGO US#1 9/12 CT PACKER 1 / CTN 5 No Bid MANGO US#1 9/12 CT PACKER 1 / CTN 5 10.00$     50.00$          Potato Red B Size Us#1 Frsh/Kth 10Lb Ba 5  $      12.68 63.40$             

FIGS BROWN 35-40CT DRIED PACKER 1 / 5 LB 5 No Bid FIGS BROWN 35-40CT DRIED PACKER 1 / 5 LB 5 -$              Potato Red B Size Us#1 Packer 50 Lb 5  $      31.29 156.45$           

PUREE SAMPLE MORE FRUIT PERFECT PUREE 1 / 14 CT 5 No Bid PUREE SAMPLE MORE FRUIT PERFECT PUREE 1 / 14 CT 5 -$              Potato Russet 40 Ct Ida Mrkn/Fc 50 Lb 5  $      34.09 170.45$           

PUREE SAMPLE TOP FLAVORS PERFECT PUREE 1 / 16 CT 10 No Bid PUREE SAMPLE TOP FLAVORS PERFECT PUREE 1 / 16 CT 10 -$              Potato Russet 50 Ct Ida Mrkn/Fc 50# Ctn 140  $      34.09 4,772.60$        

PAPAYA MEXICAN PACKER 1 / 9-12 CT 20 No Bid PAPAYA MEXICAN PACKER 1 / 9-12 CT 20 18.50$     370.00$        Potato Russet 60 Ct Ida Mrkn/Fc 50Lb Ct 90  $      30.07 2,706.30$        

BROCCOLI FLORETS ICELESS MARKON 4 / 3 LB CTN 5 No Bid BROCCOLI FLORETS ICELESS MARKON 4 / 3 LB CTN 5 20.50$     102.50$        Potato Russet 70 Ct Ida Mrkn/Fc 50Lb Ct 10  $      27.38 273.80$           

BROCCOLI CROWNS ICELESS MARKON 1 / 20 LB 15 No Bid BROCCOLI CROWNS ICELESS MARKON 1 / 20 LB 15 18.00$     270.00$        Potato Russet 90 Ct Ida Mrkn/Fc 50Lb Ct 5  $      20.37 101.85$           

CABBAGE GREEN US#1 PACKER 1 / 50 LB CS 5 16.50$   82.50$          CABBAGE GREEN US#1 PACKER 1 / 50 LB CS 5 14.00$     70.00$          Potato Russet #2 Ida 10 Oz Utl Mrkn/Esn 50 Lb B 5  $      21.88 109.40$           

CABBAGE GREEN JUMBO PACKER 1 / 50LB CTN 20 16.50$   330.00$        CABBAGE GREEN JUMBO PACKER 1 / 50LB CT 20 14.00$     280.00$        Spinach Triple Washed Mrkn/Rss 2.5 Lb 50  $      20.57 1,028.50$        

CABBAGE GREEN PACKER 1 / 10 LB BG 10 No Bid CABBAGE GREEN PACKER 1 / 10 LB BG 10 5.00$       50.00$          Squash Zucchini Fcy Green Frsh/Kth 10Lb Ct 5  $      15.48 77.40$             

CABBAGE RED PACKER 1 / 10 LB SK 5 No Bid CABBAGE RED PACKER 1 / 10 LB SK 5 6.50$       32.50$          Squash Zucchini Med 18-25 Lb Packer Vol Fil 100  $      25.69 2,569.00$        

KIWI FRUIT 118 COUNT PACKER 1 / 118 CT 10 No Bid KIWI FRUIT 118 COUNT PACKER 1 / 118 CT 10 44.00$     440.00$        Tomato 5X5 2 Layer Mrkn/Fc 20 Lb 10  $      30.68 306.80$           

SPRING MIX CONVENTIONAL PACKER 2 / 1.5 LB 5 No Bid SPRING MIX CONVENTIONAL PACKER 2 / 1.5 LB 5 10.50$     52.50$          Tomato 4X5 2 Layer Mrkn/Fc 22 Lb 50  $      31.29 1,564.50$        

CARROT JUMBO TX/MEX/MICH PACKER 1 / 50LB BAG 30 16.50$   495.00$        CARROT JUMBO TX/MEX/MICH PACKER 1 / 50LB BA 30 14.50$     435.00$        Tomato 5X6 Vine Ripe 2 Layer Packer 20 Lb 200  $      26.59 5,318.00$        

CARROT JUMBO PACKER 1 / 25LB CTN 5 No Bid CARROT JUMBO PACKER 1 / 25LB CT 5 8.00$       40.00$          Tomato Bulk Cafe Packer 25Lb Ct 500  $      20.68 10,340.00$      

CARROT JUMBO PACKER 1 / 25 LB 5 No Bid CARROT JUMBO PACKER 1 / 25 LB 5 8.00$       40.00$          Fruit Mixed 100% Juice Dole 4 Oz 867  $      23.09 20,019.03$      

CARROT JUMBO  US #1 PACKER 1 / 10 LB BX 5 No Bid CARROT JUMBO  US #1 PACKER 1 / 10 LB BX 5 4.00$       20.00$          

CARROT SHRED MARKON 2 / 5 LB 30 No Bid CARROT SHRED MARKON 2 / 5 LB 30 15.00$     450.00$        

CARROTEENIES 100 2 OZ PACKER 100 / 2 OZ 140 No Bid CARROTEENIES 100 2 OZ PACKER 100 / 2 OZ 140 34.00$     4,760.00$    

CARROT SNACK WITH RANCH DIP GRIMMWAY FARMS 36 / 4 OZ 5 No Bid CARROT SNACK WITH RANCH DIP GRIMMWAY FARMS 36 / 4 OZ 5 34.00$     170.00$        

CAULIFLOWER FLORETS MARKON 2 / 3 LB PKG 70 No Bid CAULIFLOWER FLORETS MARKON 2 / 3 LB PKG 70 8.00$       560.00$        

CELERY MED FOODSERVICE PACK MARKON 1 / 40 LB 30 22.00$   660.00$        CELERY MED FOODSERVICE PACK MARKON 1 / 40 LB 30 21.00$     630.00$        

CELERY STALK MARKON 1 / 6 CT 40 No Bid CELERY STALK MARKON 1 / 6 CT 40 6.00$       240.00$        

CELERY STALK MARKON 1 / 6 CT 50 No Bid CELERY STALK MARKON 1 / 6 CT 50 6.00$       300.00$        

CELERY STICKS MARKON 4 / 5 LB 10 No Bid CELERY STICKS MARKON 4 / 5 LB 10 24.50$     245.00$        

HERB BASIL FRESH BOX PACKER 1 / 1 LB 5 No Bid HERB BASIL FRESH BOX PACKER 1 / 1 LB 5 -$              

HERB THYME FRESH PACKER 1 / 8 OZ 5 No Bid HERB THYME FRESH PACKER 1 / 8 OZ 5 -$              

CILANTRO 1 LB CELLO WASH & TRI TAYLOR 1 / 1 LB 200 No Bid CILANTRO 1 LB CELLO WASH & TRI TAYLOR 1 / 1 LB 200 0.35$       70.00$          

CILANTRO BUNCHED 10/3 CT MARKON 10 / 3 CT 5 12.00$   60.00$          CILANTRO BUNCHED 10/3 CT MARKON 10 / 3 CT 5 18.50$     92.50$          

CARROT BABY PEELED MARKON 2 / 5 LB 60 No Bid CARROT BABY PEELED MARKON 2 / 5 LB 60 14.00$     840.00$        

LETTUCE ROMAINE RED BABY PACKER 1 / 24 CT 5 No Bid LETTUCE ROMAINE RED BABY PACKER 1 / 24 CT 5 28.50$     142.50$        

Bid 2022-14 Annual Contract for Produce
Contract Term: October 1, 2021 thru September 30, 2022

Annual Contract is not limited to the items listed below.  Please request pricing for additional item from vendor.

pepe_westsideproduce@yahoo.com 

Laredo, TX 78045
(956) 753-8700

Westside Produce
c/o Jose Gamez
PO Box 452289
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RC Food Service & Produce Inc. Ben E. Keith Foods
c/o Alma Cavazos c/o Matt Brown
120 Market St. 17635 Ben E. Keith Way
Laredo, TX 78040 Selma, TX 78154
(956) 796-9999 (210) 507-6276

Annual Contract is not limited to the items listed below.  Please request pricing for additional item from vendor.

Laredo, TX 78045
(956) 753-8700

Westside Produce
c/o Jose Gamez
PO Box 452289

LETTUCE ROMAINE GREEN BABY PACKER 1 / 24 CT 5 No Bid LETTUCE ROMAINE GREEN BABY PACKER 1 / 24 CT 5 32.50$     162.50$        

CUCUMBER SELECT US #1 PACKER 1 / 1 1/9 BU 10 No Bid CUCUMBER SELECT US #1 PACKER 1 / 1 1/9 BU 10 0.50$       5.00$            

CUCUMBER SELECT PACKER 1 / 5 LB BAG 60 18.00$   1,080.00$    CUCUMBER SELECT PACKER 1 / 5 LB BAG 60 18.50$     1,110.00$    

CUCUMBER 24 CT PACKER 1 / 24 CT 5 No Bid CUCUMBER 24 CT PACKER 1 / 24 CT 5 12.00$     60.00$          

GARLIC WHITE PACKER 1 / 5 LB 5 No Bid GARLIC WHITE PACKER 1 / 5 LB 5 10.00$     50.00$          

LETTUCE ICEBERG 24 CT PACKER 1 / CS 40 No Bid LETTUCE ICEBERG 24 CT PACKER 1 / CS 40 24.00$     960.00$        

LETTUCE ICEBERG PREM PALLETIZD MARKON 1 / 24 CT 500 26.00$   13,000.00$  LETTUCE ICEBERG PREM PALLETIZD MARKON 1 / 24 CT 500 24.00$     12,000.00$  

LETTUCE SHRED 1/8 IN   K MARKON 4 / 5 LB 5 No Bid LETTUCE SHRED 1/8 IN   K MARKON 4 / 5 LB 5 21.50$     107.50$        

LETTUCE ROMAINE 24 CT   K MARKON 1 / 24 CT 20 No Bid LETTUCE ROMAINE 24 CT   K MARKON 1 / 24 CT 20 26.00$     520.00$        

LETTUCE ROMAINE WASH&TRIM K MARKON 2 / 5 LB BAG 10 No Bid LETTUCE ROMAINE WASH&TRIM K MARKON 2 / 5 LB BAG 10 12.00$     120.00$        

SALAD MIX ICEBERG/ROM 50/50 MARKON 4 / 5 LB 5 No Bid SALAD MIX ICEBERG/ROM 50/50 MARKON 4 / 5 LB 5 28.50$     142.50$        

SALAD MIX W/BAG MARKON 4 / 5 LB BAG 5 No Bid SALAD MIX W/BAG MARKON 4 / 5 LB BAG 5 28.50$     142.50$        

ONION WHITE JUMBO US#1 PACKER 1 / 50 LB SK 10 No Bid ONION WHITE JUMBO US#1 PACKER 1 / 50 LB SK 10 18.50$     185.00$        

ONION WHITE JUMBO US#1 PACKER 1 / 10LB BAG 10 No Bid ONION WHITE JUMBO US#1 PACKER 1 / 10LB BA 10 5.00$       50.00$          

ONION PEARL PEELED PACKER 1 / 5 LB 5 No Bid ONION PEARL PEELED PACKER 1 / 5 LB 5 18.00$     90.00$          

ONION YELLOW JUMBO PACKER 1 / 50 LB 80 18.50$   1,480.00$    ONION YELLOW JUMBO PACKER 1 / 50 LB 80 18.00$     1,440.00$    

ONION YELLOW JUMBO PACKER 1 / 10LB CTN 5 No Bid ONION YELLOW JUMBO PACKER 1 / 10LB CT 5 5.00$       25.00$          

ONION YELLOW JUMBO PACKER 1 / 10LB CTN 70 No Bid ONION YELLOW JUMBO PACKER 1 / 10LB CT 70 5.00$       350.00$        

PEA SNO GREEN US #1 PACKER 1 / 10 LB 5 No Bid PEA SNO GREEN US #1 PACKER 1 / 10 LB 5 34.50$     172.50$        

PEPPER BELL GREEN LG US#1 PACKER 1 / 1 1/9 BU 100 16.50$   1,650.00$    PEPPER BELL GREEN LG US#1 PACKER 1 / 1 1/9 BU 100 19.00$     1,900.00$    

PEPPER BELL GREEN US#1 CHOPPR PACKER 1 / 1 1/9 BU 50 16.50$   825.00$        PEPPER BELL GREEN US#1 CHOPPR PACKER 1 / 1 1/9 BU 50 19.00$     950.00$        

PEPPER BELL GREEN PACKER 1 / 5 LB CS 180 No Bid PEPPER BELL GREEN PACKER 1 / 5 LB CS 180 10.00$     1,800.00$    

PEPPER BELL RED PACKER 1 / 5 LB CS 10 No Bid PEPPER BELL RED PACKER 1 / 5 LB CS 10 12.00$     120.00$        

PEPPER BELL GOLD PACKER 1 / 5 LB BAG 10 No Bid PEPPER BELL GOLD PACKER 1 / 5 LB BAG 10 12.00$     120.00$        

PEPPER SERRANO PACKER 1 / 5 LB CS 100 No Bid PEPPER SERRANO PACKER 1 / 5 LB CS 100 10.00$     1,000.00$    

PEPPER SERRANO US #1 PACKER 1 / 10 LB CS 5 No Bid PEPPER SERRANO US #1 PACKER 1 / 10 LB CS 5 16.00$     80.00$          

PEPPER SERRANO PACKER 1 / VOL FILL 30 21.00$   630.00$        PEPPER SERRANO PACKER 1 / VOL FILL 30 22.00$     660.00$        

PEPPER BELL RED CHOPPER PACKER 1 / 1 1/9 BU 5 No Bid PEPPER BELL RED CHOPPER PACKER 1 / 1 1/9 BU 5 24.00$     120.00$        

PEPPER HABANERO PACKER 1 / 8 LB 5 No Bid PEPPER HABANERO PACKER 1 / 8 LB 5 5.00$       25.00$          

PEPPER ANCHO PACKER 1 / 5 LB 5 No Bid PEPPER ANCHO PACKER 1 / 5 LB 5 4.00$       20.00$          

POTATO RED "B" SIZE US#1 PACKER 1 / 10LB BAG 5 No Bid POTATO RED "B" SIZE US#1 PACKER 1 / 10LB BA 5 10.00$     50.00$          

POTATO RED "B" SIZE US#1 PACKER 1 / 50 LB SK 5 No Bid POTATO RED "B" SIZE US#1 PACKER 1 / 50 LB SK 5 36.00$     180.00$        

POTATO RUSSET 50 CT US#1 PACKER 1 / 50LB CTN 140 24.50$   3,430.00$    POTATO RUSSET 50 CT US#1 PACKER 1 / 50LB CT 140 18.00$     2,520.00$    

POTATO RUSSET 60CT US#1 PACKER 1 / 50LB CTN 90 No Bid POTATO RUSSET 60CT US#1 PACKER 1 / 50LB CT 90 26.00$     2,340.00$    

POTATO RUSSET 70 CT US#1 PACKER 1 / 50LB CTN 10 No Bid POTATO RUSSET 70 CT US#1 PACKER 1 / 50LB CT 10 24.50$     245.00$        

POTATO RUSSET 90 CT US#1 PACKER 1 / 50LB CTN 5 No Bid POTATO RUSSET 90 CT US#1 PACKER 1 / 50LB CT 5 21.50$     107.50$        

POTATO RUSSET 40 CT US #1 PACKER 1 / 50 LB 5 No Bid POTATO RUSSET 40 CT US #1 PACKER 1 / 50 LB 5 24.50$     122.50$        

POTATO RUSSET #2 IDA 10 OZ UTL PACKER 1 / 50 LB BX 90 24.50$   2,205.00$    POTATO RUSSET #2 IDA 10 OZ UTL PACKER 1 / 50 LB BX 90 18.00$     1,620.00$    

SPINACH WASHED & TRIMMED MARKON 4 / 2.5 LB 50 No Bid SPINACH WASHED & TRIMMED MARKON 4 / 2.5 LB 50 18.50$     925.00$        

SQUASH ZUCCHINI FCY GREEN MARKON/COMBS 1 / 10LB CTN 100 19.00$   1,900.00$    SQUASH ZUCCHINI FCY GREEN MARKON/COMBS 1 / 10LB CT 100 10.00$     1,000.00$    

SQUASH ZUCCHINI MED 18-25 LB PACKER 1 / 20 LB CS 40 No Bid SQUASH ZUCCHINI MED 18-25 LB PACKER 1 / 20 LB CS 40 20.00$     800.00$        

TOMATO 4 X 4 2 LAYER R R GILMORE 1 / 20 LB 10 No Bid TOMATO 4 X 4 2 LAYER R R GILMORE 1 / 20 LB 10 20.50$     205.00$        

TOMATO 4X5 2 LAYER PACKER 1 / 20LB CTN 25 No Bid TOMATO 4X5 2 LAYER PACKER 1 / 20LB CT 25 20.50$     512.50$        

TOMATO 5X6 2 LAYER PACKER 1 / 20 LB 5 No Bid TOMATO 5X6 2 LAYER PACKER 1 / 20 LB 5 20.50$     102.50$        

TOMATO 5X6 1 LAYER PACKER 1 / 10 LB 200 No Bid TOMATO 5X6 1 LAYER PACKER 1 / 10 LB 200 20.50$     4,100.00$    

TOMATO 5X6 VINE RIPE 2 LAYER PACKER 1 / 20 LB 50 No Bid TOMATO 5X6 VINE RIPE 2 LAYER PACKER 1 / 20 LB 50 20.50$     1,025.00$    

TOMATO ROMA #2 PACKER 1 / 25 LB 60 No Bid TOMATO ROMA #2 PACKER 1 / 25 LB 60 20.50$     1,230.00$    

TOMATO ROMA #1 PACKER 1 / 25LB LUG 15 No Bid TOMATO ROMA #1 PACKER 1 / 25LB LU 15 22.50$     337.50$        

TOMATO BULK CAFE PACKER 1 / 25LB CTN 500 23.00$   11,500.00$  TOMATO BULK CAFE PACKER 1 / 25LB CT 500 17.00$     8,500.00$    

TOMATO 6 X 6 LARGE PACKER 1 / 25LB CTN 20 No Bid TOMATO 6 X 6 LARGE PACKER 1 / 25LB CT 20 18.00$     360.00$        

APPLE SLICES RED USA 20/4 OZ UNKNOWN 20 / 4 OZ 100 No Bid APPLE SLICES RED USA 20/4 OZ UNKNOWN 20 / 4 OZ 100 -$              

AVOCADOS ANY CASE 5 No Bid AVOCADOS ANY CASE 5 38.00$     190.00$        

CILANTRO 6 CT PACKER 1 / 1 LB 15 No Bid CILANTRO 6 CT PACKER 1 / 1 LB 15 3.00$       45.00$          

ASSORTED FRESH FRUIT CUPS 4 OZ 31200 0.40$     12,480.00$  ASSORTED FRESH FRUIT CUPS 4 OZ 31200 0.40$       12,480.00$  

FRESH FRENCH FRIES 4/5 LB 900 14.50$   13,050.00$  FRESH FRENCH FRIES 4/5 LB 900 14.00$     12,600.00$  
FRESH SALAD MIX 4/5 LB 800 14.50$   11,600.00$  FRESH SALAD MIX 4/5 LB 800 16.00$     12,800.00$  
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