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Est. Qty per 
MONTH

UOM Chemical Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

48,000 LBS Alum Sulfate ( 1% Copper) per lb  $            0.1509  $             7,243.20 No Bid  $            0.1310  $            6,288.00 
48,000 LBS Alum Sulfate ( 2% Copper) per lb  $            0.1582  $             7,593.60 No Bid  $            0.1385  $            6,648.00 
48,000 LBS Alum Sulfate ( 3% Copper) per lb  $            0.1664  $             7,987.20 No Bid  $            0.1460  $            7,008.00 

4 1 ton Cyl Chlorine No Bid No Bid No Bid
10 100 LB Chlorine HTH (granular) per/lb (will be shipped in 

100LB Containters-Brenntag)
 $            183.00  $             1,830.00  $            149.00  $            1,490.00 No Bid

48 50 LB Bags Copper Sulfate (granular) per bag No Bid  $            112.00  $            5,376.00 No Bid
45,000 LBS Liquid Ammonium Sulfate (Aquamine LAS)  $            0.1330  $             5,985.00 No Bid  $            0.1200  $            5,400.00 

3 465 LB Drum Polymer (Superfloc A-1820) Negative (-) Charge
 $            930.35  $             2,791.05 No Bid No Bid

3 Tons Silica Sand (50# bags Grade 65 sand) No Bid No Bid No Bid
800 Gallons Urea Gas No Bid No Bid No Bid

45,000 LBS Blended Aluminum Sulfate, Polymer, Copper, & 
Iron (2456)

 $            0.2411  $           10,849.50 No Bid No Bid

45,000 LBS Blended Aluminum Sulfate, Polymer, Copper 
(2409)

 $            0.2203  $             9,913.50 No Bid No Bid

80 LBS Calcium Hypochlorite (HTH) 100 LBS No Bid $149.00  $               149.00 No Bid
25 Pails De-Sulph-A-Nator (Odor Control Agent) 5 gal pail

No Bid No Bid No Bid

25 Pails EHC-33 (Degreaser Bacteria) 50 packets-25LB pail
No Bid No Bid No Bid

25 Pails Micro-Solve (Grease de-emulsifier) 5 gal pail
No Bid No Bid No Bid

10 Bottle Permethrin (Insecticide) No Bid No Bid No Bid
*pail must ship with other 
Chlorine HTH - 100 lb pail

Chemrite, Inc.

c/o Aaron Opp

5202 Belle Wood Court, Ste. 104

Brenntag Southwest, Inc

CLAR+ION 91014 for Aluminum 
Sulfate with Copper 1%, 2%, 3%

(770) 271-5576

sales@chemrite.com

Lancaster, TX 75134

Annual Contract for Water Plant Chemicals

Contract Term: 

Bid 2022-16

(713) 330-8570

gtullier@brenntag.comOctober 1, 2021 to September 30, 2022

Additional Notes:

704 E. Wintergreen Rd.

bids@chemtradelogistics.com

Buford, GA 30518

Chemtrade Chemicals US, LLC

c/o Ann Hopler

90 East Halsey Road

Parsippany, NJ 07054

(800) 441-2659

c/o Gale Tullier

mailto:sales@chemrite.com
mailto:gtullier@brenntag.com
mailto:bids@chemtradelogistics.com
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Est. Qty per 
MONTH

UOM Chemical Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

48,000 LBS Alum Sulfate ( 1% Copper) per lb No Bid No Bid No Bid
48,000 LBS Alum Sulfate ( 2% Copper) per lb No Bid No Bid No Bid
48,000 LBS Alum Sulfate ( 3% Copper) per lb No Bid No Bid No Bid

4 1 ton Cyl Chlorine No Bid No Bid No Bid
10 100 LB Chlorine HTH (granular) per/lb (will be shipped in 

100LB Containters-Brenntag)
No Bid No Bid No Bid

48 50 LB Bags Copper Sulfate (granular) per bag $119.00 5,712.00$             No Bid No Bid
45,000 LBS Liquid Ammonium Sulfate (Aquamine LAS) No Bid No Bid $0.193 $8,685.00

3 465 LB Drum Polymer (Superfloc A-1820) Negative (-) Charge
No Bid $742.50 2,227.50$            No Bid

3 Tons Silica Sand (50# bags Grade 65 sand) $1,189.00 3,567.00$             No Bid No Bid
800 Gallons Urea Gas No Bid No Bid No Bid

45,000 LBS Blended Aluminum Sulfate, Polymer, Copper, & 
Iron (2456)

No Bid No Bid No Bid

45,000 LBS Blended Aluminum Sulfate, Polymer, Copper 
(2409)

No Bid No Bid No Bid

80 LBS Calcium Hypochlorite (HTH) 100 LBS No Bid No Bid No Bid
25 Pails De-Sulph-A-Nator (Odor Control Agent) 5 gal pail

$300.00 7,500.00$             No Bid No Bid

25 Pails EHC-33 (Degreaser Bacteria) 50 packets-25LB pail
$325.00 8,125.00$             No Bid No Bid

25 Pails Micro-Solve (Grease de-emulsifier) 5 gal pail
No Bid No Bid 250.00$            6,250.00$            

10 Bottle Permethrin (Insecticide) $125.00 1,250.00$             No Bid No Bid

8201 S.  212th Street

muniteam-west@univarsolutions
(206) 653-5075
Kent, WA 98032

Polydyne, Inc.
c/o Roise Holiday
Univar Solutions

Bid 2022-16
Annual Contract for Water Plant Chemicals

Contract Term: 
October 1, 2021 to September 30, 2022

Additional Notes:

Gasochem International LLC
c/o Charu Jain
9509 Pemberton Crescent Dr.
Houston TX 77025
(713) 837-6116
charu@gasochem.com

 CLARIFLOC A-210P polymer **55 
gal. drums are filled to 450 Lbs. 
$1.65/Lb. x 450 Lbs/Drum= 
$742.50 per drum 

c/o Boyd Stanley
1 Chemical Plant Road
Riceboro, GA 31323
(912) 880-8013
bids@polydyneinc.com
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