Emperor Services, LLC Sierra Dump & Backhoe Service |Vulcan Construction Materials Martin Asphalt Company
Bid 2022-013 c/o Cesar Lombrana c/o Rafael Sierra c/o Carlos Trevino c/o Victoria Espino
Contract for Road Construction Material 107 North Ave. 3302 Salinas Ave. 10101 Reunion Place, Ste. 500 3 Riverway #400
Laredo, TX 78045 Laredo, TX 78040 San Antonio, TX 78279 Houston, TX 77056
(956) 237-5255 (956) 763-4185 (210) 965-0419 (713) 350-6852
Contract Term: cesar@emperorservices.com |rsierra7353@gmail.com farrarj@vmcmail.com victoria.espino@martinmip.com
June 1, 2022 to Sep 30, 2023
ITEM DESCRIPTION Price Price Price Price
Item | - Type E TxDot Approved Flexible Base No Bid No Bid
per cubic yard when weekly Diesel price per gallon is $2.500 - 3.499 $17.95 $52.50
per cubic yard when weekly Diesel price per gallon is $3.500 - 4.499 $18.25 $53.75
per cubic yard when weekly Diesel price per gallon is $4.500 > $19.70 $54.75
Item Il - Type A Grade 1-2 TxDOT Approved No Bid No Bid
per cubic yard when weekly Diesel price per gallon is $2.500 - 3.499 $17.95 $29.10
per cubic yard when weekly Diesel price per gallon is $3.500 - 4.499 $18.25 $32.00
per cubic yard when weekly Diesel price per gallon is $4.500 > $19.70 $33.75
Item 11l - Type F Pit Run Caliche No Bid No Bid
per cubic yard when weekly Diesel price per gallon is $2.500 - 3.499 $16.58 $28.13
per cubic yard when weekly Diesel price per gallon is $3.500 - 4.499 $17.95 $29.37
per cubic yard when weekly Diesel price per gallon is $4.500 > $18.90 $29.75
Item IV - Fill Dirt No Bid No Bid
per cubic yard when weekly Diesel price per gallon is $2.500 - 3.499 $19.75 $20.25
per cubic yard when weekly Diesel price per gallon is $3.500 - 4.499 $20.45 $21.50
per cubic yard when weekly Diesel price per gallon is $4.500 > $21.10 $23.50
Item V - LRA Premix Type D Cold Mix
price per ton delivered to locations No Bid No Bid 7210 E. Saunders $97.45 No Bid
Item VI - MS-2 (5600 gallons per order)
per 5600 gallons when weekly Diesel price per gallon is $2.500 - 3.499 No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.94
per 5600 gallons when weekly Diesel price per gallon is $3.500 - 4.499 No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.94
per 5600 gallons when weekly Diesel price per gallon is $4.500 > No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.04
Item VII - Water 130 BBLS
per 130 BBLS when weekly Diesel price per gallon is $2.500 - 3.499 $450.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
per 130 BBLS when weekly Diesel price per gallon is $3.500 - 4.499 $485.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
per 130 BBLS when weekly Diesel price per gallon is $4.500 > $515.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
5 . Agulla.res, T s G 47 miles to Road and Bridge
Geogrpahic Location: 7.6 Miles
46 miles to Road and Bridge
Name of Ranch El Tahoe Ranch
All TXDOT approved flexible base material must meet testing requirements as per standard specifications under Item 247 in the TxDOT Manual
Vendors are required to provide Webb County lab testing results on all flexible base material (non DOT approved upon request).
\
Vulcan Construction Materials Fuel Surcharge Tabe
SWD Fuel Surcharge Table
Fuel Price
£2.25-52.24 1% $4.75 - $4.84 16%| $6.25 - $6.34 31%)
$3.35- 53.449 2% %4.85-54.94 17%| %6.35-56.44 32%
53.45- 53.54 3% $4.95 - 55.04 18%| 56.45 - 56.54 33%
£3.55 - $3.64 a%|  $5.05- 55,19 19%| %6.55 - $6.64 3%
53.65-53.74 5% $5.15- 55.24 20%| 56.65 - 56.74 35%
$3.75- $3.84 6%| $5.25- 55.34 21%| $6.75- $6.84 36%
$3.85- 63,04 7% $6.35 - §5.44 22%| $6.85 - $6.94 37%
53.95- 54.04 8% $5.45 - §5.54 23%| $6.95 - $7.04 38%
$4.05- 54.14 9%| $5.55-55.64 24%| $7.05-$7.14 39%
$4.15 - $4.24 10% $5.65 - $5.74 25%| $7.15-47.24 40%
5$4.25 - 54.34 11% $5.75 - §5.84 26%) £7.25-57.34 41%
$4.35- 54.44 12%| $5.85 - $5.94 27%| $7.35- 57.94 42%
$4.45- $4.54 13%|  $5.95- $6.04 28%| $7.45-57.54 43%
$4.55 - $4.54 14% $6.05 - $6.14 29%| $7.55- 57.64 44%
$4.65 - $4.74 15%) $6.15- $6.24 30%| $7.65-57.74 %
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