Bid 2023-18

Annual Contract for Refuse Collection

Contract Term:

Trashco Ltd.

c/o Gerardo Resendez
8201 San Lorenzo Dr.
Laredo, TX 78045
(956) 725-9693

October 1, 2022 thru September 30, 2023 diana@trashcoinc.com
. No. of Size of No. of Price per Pick- .
Location Containers | Container (YD) | Pick-Ups Up Total Price
Administration Bldg.
108.42 325.26
1110 Washington St. ! Wcuyd) 3 $ s
Agricultural Bldg.
102.88 205.76
7209 E. Saunders ! 8cuyd 2 s s
CAA Meals On Wheels 1 4cuyd 2 $ 77.88 | $ 155.76
1310 Convent Ave.
Casa Blanca Golf Course
3900 Casa Blanca Road ! 8cuyd 2 s L8 205.76
CSCD /PAL 1 2cuyd 1 $ 55.00 | $ 55.00
3802 S. Zapata Hwy
El Aguila Transportation
55.00 55.00
4801 Daugherty ! Zeuyd ! $ s
El Cenizo Community Center
91.75 275.25
3519 Cecilia Lane ! Bcuyd 3 i i
Jail Division 1 gcuyd| 12 |$ 11250 | $  1,350.00
San Agustin & Washington Y i T
Justice Center
98.92 494.60
1110 Victoria ! Weuyd) 5 $ s
Justice of the Peace Pct. 2
100.00 100.00
901 5. Milmo ! Aouyd 1 i i
Justice of the Peace Pct. 4
100.00 100.00
8501 San Dario ! Aouyd 1 i i
La Presa Community Center
135.75 135.75
1983 Mangana Hein Rd. ! 8cuyd ! $ s
Larga Vista Community Center
52.88 105.76
5401 Cisneros St. ! 2euyd 2 s s
Old Juenile (Drug Court) 1 2 cuyd ) $ 5288 | ¢ 105.76
4101 Juarez
Records Management 1 2 cuyd 2 $ 52.88 | $ 105.76
7117 E. Saunders Hwy 59
Rio Bravo Community Center
102.88 205.76
1607 Orquidia ! Scuydl 2 $ s
Self Help Center
55.00 55.00
8116 Hwy 359 ! Zeuydl 1 $ s
Sheriff's Department
135.75 135.75
902 Victoria ! 8cuyd ! s s
Title Building
100.00 100.00
1620 Santa Ursula Ave. ! Acuyd ! s s
Water Utilities
100.00 100.00
515 Martha Dr. ! Aouyd 1 i i
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Wastewater Treatment Plant 1 2cuyd 1 $ 55.00 | ¢ 55.00
1806 Margarita Ln
Webb Co_unty Youth Village ) 10 cuyd 1 $ 155.95 | ¢ 311.90
111 Camino Nuevo Rd
L.I.F.E Downs 1 10 cu yd 1 S 155.95 | $ 155.95
Head Start Centers
El Cenizo Center
1 4 d 1 100.00 100.00
3549 Cecilia Lane i » »
Finley 1 acuyd| 2 $ 77.88 | $ 155.76
125 Atlanta Dr. v : :
Floyd 1, 1I, Il Center 1 10cuyd| 3 $ 108.42 | § 325.26
4704 Naranjo
Larga Vista Center
2 d 52.88 105.76
5411 Cisneros ! cuy 2 s s
Little Folks Center
10 d 120.30 240.60
1233 Paseo De Danubio ! ey 2 s s
Little Palominos Center
1 4 d 3 68.58 205.74
West End Washington cuy s s
Prada Center 1 4cuyd 2 $ 77.88 | $ 155.76
4908 Zapata Hwy 83
Roosevelt Center 1 4cuyd 1 $ 100.00 | $ 100.00
3301 Sierra Vista
Sierra Vista Center 1 10cuyd| 3 $ 108.42 | § 325.26
102 Sierra
Tatangelos Center
8 d -
2400 5. Jarvis ! i 2 »
Villa Alegre
1 8 d 1 -
3501 Eagle Pass cuy s
Grand Total |$ 6,608.92
Size of Container
2cuyd No Bid
4 cuyd No Bid
8cuyd No Bid
10 cuyd No Bid
15 cuyd No Bid
30 cu yd No Bid
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