Aliza F. Oliveros

From: Antonio Bernal

Sent: Wednesday, August 23, 2023 8:12 AM

To: Aliza F. Oliveros

Subject: RE: The Grant for WEBB, COUNTY OF (06HP000346-05-01) has been awarded.

Good morning Ms. Oliveros,

As of now, not yet. The grant solutions site says the supplement is approved, but the status is still under processing. |
usually receive an email notification when | can download the file for the award. As soon as | do, | will forward to you.
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Antonio Bernal Jr.

Senior Accountant

Webb County Auditor’s Office

1110 Washington St. 2nd Floor Laredo, TX 78040
956-523-4192

From: Aliza F. Oliveros <afoliveros@webbcountytx.gov>
Sent: Tuesday, August 22, 2023 10:17 PM

To: Antonio Bernal <anbernal@webbcountytx.gov>
Subject: Re: The Grant for WEBB, COUNTY OF (06HP000346-05-01) has been awarded.

Would you happen to have the CH supplement




