

ITB 2017-004 Webb County Sheriff's Office Law Enforcement Uniform Contract

Bid Opening: December 14, 2017, 10:00 am

BID TABULATION

		Kirkpatrick Guns & Ammo 6501 Arena Blvd. Ste. 105 Laredo, TX 78041 (956) 723-1911 kfirearms1@gmail.com			Promo Solutions 111014 Windjammer Dr. Frisco, TX 75034 (214) 726-5838 stacy.nwprmo@att.net			
ITEM	STYLE	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	QUANTITY	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL
1	72345	5.11 Tactical Men's Twill PDU Long Sleeve Shirt - Class B	290	\$50.99	\$14,787.10	290	\$54.99	\$15,947.10
2	62065	5.11 Tactical Women's Twill PDU Long Sleeve Shirt - Class B	10	\$50.99	\$509.90	10	\$54.99	\$549.90
3	71177	5.11 Tactical Men's Twill PDU Short Sleeve Shirt - Class B	870	\$50.99	\$44,361.30	870	\$54.99	\$47,841.30
4	61159	5.11 Tactical Women's Twill PDU Short Sleeve Shirt - Class B	30	\$50.99	\$1,529.70	30	\$54.99	\$1,649.70
5	74338	5.11 Tactical Men's Twill PDU Class A Pant	1160	\$50.99	\$59,148.40	1160	\$63.99	\$74,228.40
6	64304, 64308W	5.11 Tactical Women's Twill PDU Class A Pant	40	\$50.99	\$2,039.60	40	\$62.99	\$2,519.60
7	48027	5.11 Tactical 4 in 1 Patrol Jacket	180	\$225.24	\$40,543.20	180	264.99	\$47,698.20
8	48096	5.11 Tactical Double Duty Jacket	120	\$118.99	\$14,278.80	120	129.99	\$15,598.80
9	72071	5.11 Tactical Stryke TDU Long Sleeve Rapid Shirt	60	\$72.24	\$4,334.40	60	79.99	\$4,799.40
10	74369, 74369L, 74369TAA	5.11 Tactical Flex-Tac Stryke Pant	60	\$67.99	\$4,079.40	60	\$74.99	\$4,499.40
11	59569	5.11 Tactical Maverick Assaulters Belt	60	\$93.49	\$5,609.40	60	89.99	\$5,399.40
14	IDPanel1	5.11 Tactical ID Panels Reflective Lettering	300	\$15.00	\$4,500.00	300	\$10.00	\$3,000.00
Sub Total					\$195,721.20			\$223,731.20

12	Stripe1	Green/Gold 3/4" Pant Striping Material and Labor	1200	\$15.00	\$18,000.00	1200	No Bid	No Bid
13	Embroider1	Shoulder Badges, Rockers, Flag Material and Labor	1500	\$12.00	\$18,000.00	1500	No Bid	No Bid
Total					\$231,721.20			