FY 2022 (2021-2022) Annual Bid Contract Between
Webb County and Labatt Food Service
For Processed Foods

WHEREAS, at a Webb County Commissioner’s Court Meeting held on July, 26th, 2021,
the Court approved and awarded Bid No. 2022-13, entitled Processed Foods, to Labatt-Food ﬂeﬁ'
Service (hereinafter “Vendor™).

NOW, THEREFORE, IT IS AGREED between the County of Webb, acting by and
through its Commissioners Court, hereinafter referred to as “County” and Labatt Food Service.
hereinafter referred to as “Vendor™ that Vendor shall provide “County” with the products/goods
as more particularly described and attached herein as Exhibit A Bid Pricing.

Effective Date and Termination Date of Annual Contract:

The effective date of this Agreement is October 1, 2021, and shall terminate September 30. 2022.

1. Vendor

It is hereby covenanted and agreed by the parties that the products/goods to be provided to
County by the Vendor, as awarded under Bid No. 2022-13, entitled Labatt Food Service and listed
in the attached “Exhibit A Bid Pricing”, incorporated herein by reference for all intents and
purposes, shall be new and unused. unless otherwise specified.

2. Price Matching

If the Purchasing Agent is able to identify a significantly lower price of any product/good
provided by Vendor and determines that it’s in the best interest of Webb County; the Purchasing
Agent shall first notify the Vendor either in writing or via email and provide Vendor with the
opportunity to match the lower price of any product/good that County is seeking. In the event
that the Vendor is not able to match the lower price Vendor shall notify the Purchasing Agent
either in writing or via email no later than next working day. Once notification is received
within the required timeline specified in this section the Purchasing Agent is authorized to go
outside of the annual contract to obtain the product/good in accordance with the Webb County
Purchasing manual rules and regulations.

3. Compensation

The County of Webb shall pay the Vendor for products/goods provided which have been
authorized by an Official Purchase Order signed by the Webb County Purchasing Agent. The
County Auditor will only authorize payment for the goods/services described on the Official
Purchase Order unless otherwise permitted by law or the Webb County Purchasing Policy.
Further, compensation for unauthorized change orders will not be paid by Webb County. Only
change orders authorized by the Purchasing Agent through an Official Purchase Order will be
paid once all goods are received and/or services completed. No other County Official,
employee, officer or Elected Official is authorized to approve purchases and/or changes to
purchase orders unless approved by the Webb County Purchasing Agent.
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4. Billing Address
All invoices must be submitted to the Webb County Business Office in electronic format and/or

delivered to the following address:

Webb County

1110 Washington Street, Ste. 203
Laredo, Texas 78040

Attn: Business Office

Or email to: apinvoices@webbcountytx.gov

ALL invoices must reference a Purchase Order Number.

5. Vendor

In supplying products/goods required of the Vendor whether one or more, under this Agreement,
it is mutually understood, and agreed, that Vendor is, at all times, acting and performing as an
independent contractor. Webb County’s sole interest is to assure that the Vendor shall supply
products/goods in a competent, efficient, and satistactory manner. The Vendor hereby agrees to
supply the products/goods in a timely efficient manner and which comply with County’s
expectation, or reasonable commercial expectation, of the product supplied.

6. Ethical Standards

The Bidder warrants that no person or selling agency has been employed or retained to solicit or
secure this contract upon an agreement or understanding for commission, percentage. brokerage,
or contingent fee excepting bona fide employees of bona fide established commercial or selling
agencies maintained by the Bidder for the purpose of securing business. For breach or violation
of this warranty, the County shall have the right in addition to any other right or rights to cancel
this contract without liability and to deduct from the contract price, or otherwise recover the full
amount of such commission, percentage, brokerage or contingent fee.

7. No Conflicts

Vendor represents and warrants that contractor has no actual or potential conflicts of interest in
providing services to County under this contract and the contractor’s provision of services under
this contract would not reasonably create an appearance of impropriety.

8. Additional Services and Expenses

Any and all additional services, parts, costs, fees or expenses, not included in this agreement,
shall require both a written request by the Vendor to the County and prior formal approval by a
quorum of the Webb County Commissioner’s Court at either a regular, special and/or emergency
called meeting of the “County”. The County shall not be responsible for and/or shall not
compensate the Vendor for these costs without both a written request and prior approval by the
County.

9. Terms and Conditions
The Vendor certifies, and affirms, that he/she/company is not legally, or professionally,
disqualified from the performance of the duties under this Agreement. Vendor shall advise the
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County, in writing, of any change in status of the Vendor which may materially affect the ability
of Vendor to legally, or professionally, carry out the duties herein.

10. Access to Criminal History Record and Termination of Contract or Disqualification of
Bid for Cause

Please be advised that Webb County is entitled to obtain the criminal history information of any
person and/or business owner who contracts with the County in accordance with Section
411.1295 of the Texas Government Code. In the event that any criminal history of a person or
business owner who contracts with Webb County is discovered, then it that event, Webb County
at its sole discretion reserves the exclusive right and shall be entitled to immediate termination of
the contract and/or immediate disqualification of bid submittal in the event that such criminal
history is discovered, by providing notice to the person and/or business owner of such
termination and/or disqualification of bid submittal in accordance with the Notice provisions set
forth in Section 13 herein-below.

11. Termination for Convenience

Termination for convenience, also known as a no-fault termination, allows the County to
terminate any contract, in whole or in part, at any time in its sole discretion, if it is determined
that the termination is in the best interest of the County. As notified by the Purchasing Agent
through a 15 day written notice/via email of such intent to terminate contract for convenience.

Purchasing provides the Vendor a written notice specifying the extent of termination and the
effective date, providing as much notice as possible. The Vendor is generally paid for allowable
costs incurred up to the effective date of termination. The County is not liable for payment to the
Vendor related to the terminated portion of the work or any work performed or costs incurred
after the effective date of the termination.

12. Termination for Default

A contract may be terminated for default when (a) the County concludes that the Vendor fails to
perform, make progress, or in any way breaches the contract and continues to do so after
receiving written notice/email notice of such default/issues and fails to cure such default/issues
within 10 working days (b) Termination for default should be used as the last resort. The County
should do everything practicable to assist the Vendor in curing a default. Factors to consider
before making a decision to terminate for default include: (1) The provisions of the contract and
applicable regulations, (2) The specific contractual failure(s) and the explanation provided for
the failures, (3) The urgency of the need for the contracted supplies or services, (4) Actions the
County may have taken that aggravated the problems, (4) The availability of the supplies or
services from other sources and the time required to obtain them, and (5) Availability of funds or
resources to re-purchase if the costs cannot be recovered from the defaulting Vendor.

13. Notices

All notices called for, or contemplated, hereunder shall be in writing, and shall be deemed to
have been duly given, when personally delivered and/or via e-mail, or seventy-two (72) hours
after mailed to each party by certified mail, return receipt requested, postage prepaid.
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Any notices required to be sent hereunder shall be sent as follows:

TO: Vendor TO: Webb County
Enrique Alvarado Jr. Jose Angel Lopez I1I, CTPM
Sales Webb County Purchasing Agent
Labatt Food Service 1110 Washington Street, Ste. 101
4500 Industry Prk. Dr. Laredo, Texas 78040
San Antonio, TX, 78218 (956) 534-4125
(210) 661-4216 E-Mail: joel@webbcountytx.gov

E-Mail: ealvarado(@labattfood.com

14. Severability

Each paragraph, and provision, hereof is severable from the entire Agreement, and if any
provision is declared invalid, the remaining provisions shall nevertheless remain in effect.

15. Prohibitions against Assignment.
No assignment or transfer of this Agreement can be made without written consent of both
parties, hereto.

16. Indemnity and Hold Harmless

The Vendor shall indemnify and hold Webb County harmless from all claims for personal
injury, death and/or property damage resulting directly or indirectly from Vendor’s
performance. Vendor shall procure and maintain. with respect to the subject matter of this
Contract, appropriate insurance coverage including, as a minimum, public liability and property
damage with adequate limits to cover Bidder's liability as may arise directly or indirectly from
work performed and goods or services sold and under the terms of this Contract. Certification of
such coverage must be provided to the County upon request.

17. Venue/Laws of Texas

This Agreement shall be governed by. and construed in accordance with, the laws of the State of
Texas, and the exclusive venue for any and all legal disputes between the parties shall be
enforced and shall lie in the Webb County, Texas.

18. Entire Agreement

This Agreement incorporates all the agreements, covenants, and understandings between the
parties herein concerning the subject matter hereof: and all such covenants, agreements. and
understandings have been merged into this written Agreement. No other prior agreement, or
understandings, verbal or otherwise, of the parties, or their agents, shall be valid, or enforceable,
unless signed by both parties, and attached hereto. and/or embodied herein.

19. Amendment
This Agreement may be modified. only in writing, executed by both parties, and approved by a
majority of'a quorum of the Webb County Commissioner’s Court.
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20. Confidentiality

Any confidential information provided to, or developed by, Vendor in the performance of the
Agreement shall be kept confidential, unless otherwise provided by law, and shall not be made
available to any individual, or organization without the prior approval of COUNTY. All work
products, whether in draft or final form is the sole property of Webb County and may not be used
by VENDOR for any purpose without written consent of COUNTY.

21. Headings
The headings used herein are for convenience only, and shall not constitute a part hereof, or

affect the construction or interpretation hereof.

22. Counterparts
This Agreement may be executed in any number or, and by, the different parties hereto on

separate counterparts, each of which when so executed, shall be deemed to be an original, and
such counterparts shall, together, constitute but one and the same document.

23. Terminology and Definitions
All personal pronouns used herein, whether used in the masculine, feminine, or neutral, shall

include all other genders; the singular shall include the plural, and the plural shall include the
singular,

24. Authority to Sign

As an inducement to the County to execute this Agreement, the undersigned officer of Vendor
represents that he/she is expressly authorized to execute this Agreement and to bind Vendor to
the terms and conditions hereof and acknowledges that the County is relying on this
representation, authorization and execution.

25. Effective Date
This Agreement becomes effective on October 1, 2021.

[Remainder of this page intentionally left blank]
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WEBB COUNTY VENDOR
Labatt Food Service
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Webb County Clerl; c',
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G Nathan Bratton

Webb County Civil Legal Division Director*

“By law, this office mav only advise or approve
contracts or legal docaments on behalf of its clients. It
may not advisc or approve a contract or lcgal document
on behalf of other parties. Our review of this document
was conducted solely trom the legal perspective of our
client. Our approval of this document was offered solely
for the benefit of our client. Other parties should not rely
on this approval, and should seek review and approval of
their own respective attorney(s).
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Exhibit A
To contract with
Labatt Food Service
for
Processed Foods



Bid 2022-13 Annual Contract for Processed Foods
Contract Term: October 1, 2021 thru September 30, 2022

Annual Contract is not limited to the items listed below. Please request pricing for additional item from vendor.

Labatt Faod Service | | | I |
/o Enrique Alarado | — |
1902 N. Expressway 77
Harlingen, TX 78550 I ! R N N R
(956) 428-0722 | | | — L
jealvarado@abatifood com - ! | e . — | i . | - |
aty in)
em |Cases| Label o Case Price | | —— = — i
8968331 15 [FOSTER |CORN DOG ALL MEAT 4 OZ $ 3784 | [ _ . S| B | Il i — -
3020120] 5 |REDSTONE |POTATO WEDGE SKIN ON EX LARGE | §_ 45.07 . i _ ) = | |
3968372] 10 |ELLINGTN |CORN DOG TURKEY MINI $ 34.29 [ | | I
[3408854] 240 [EGGO | WAFFLE EGGO TRADITIONAL 4 IN s 2446 | —— =
[s024589 80 [FARMERS |FRENCH FRIES SC /8 IN $ 3581 | | B | ] l |
[5087776| 450 |MRKN/FC__|BEAN GREEN REGULAR CUT s 2181 | | i
3090383 170 |MRKNFC__|BROCCOLI CUT s 14.46 | ) | I | .
3090383] 120 [MRKNFC _|BROCCOLI CUT s 14se] B I A N | !
3090393 5 |MRKNFC |BROCCOLIFLORET IQF s 2268 | I -
[#547020] 150 [MRKNFC_|CARROT DICED 3/8 X 358 s 17.02 l o
3098824] 30 |MRKNIFC |CARROT CRINKLE CUT s 19.09 ‘
5002231 10 |MRKNFC |CAULIFLOWER 1GF s 2149 | | | [
5002231] 10 |MRKNFC |CAULIFLOWER 1GF s 2149 ] - - 1
3090540 730 |MRKN/FC_|CORN CUT § 2046 N ]
9095622] 90 |MRKNFC |PEA GREEN s 2212 ‘ | i
3091358] 25 |MRKN/FC |SQUASH YELLOW SLICED s 1712 | i 1 ] | |
5091358 20 |MRKNIFC |SQUASH YELLOW SLICED s 17.12 T | | I
9091358 10 |MRKN/FC |SQUASH ZUCCHINI SLICED 1/4IN $ 17.12 L L i § L | —— -, SSENEEE (Camm——
5091358] 10 |MRKN/FC__|SQUASH ZUCCHINI SLICED 1/4IN s 1712] |
[9095655] 190 |MRKN/FC |VEGETABLE MIXED 5 WAY s 21.00 | il
[5062322] 150 |[MRKN/FC |VEGETABLE BLEND PEAS & CARROTS | 5 2019 | 1
3024589| 250 |LMB WSTN |FRENCH FRIES RC 3/8 N s 81| | i | | SRS I—
9024589 90 |OREIDA _ |POTATO TATER TOTS s 3681 i
5024589] 15 |OREIDA _|HASHBROWN GOLDEN PATTY s 3581 - I
39024588| 5 |LAMB SUP |HASHBROWN 2 12 OZ PATTY S 36.81 |
5024589] 170 |LAMB SUP |HASHBROWN SIDE O BROWNS s 35.81
5020108] 10 |LAMB NAT |POTATO WEDGE NATURAL CUT s 4452 I | |
HSPLENDR [POTATO SWEET WEDGE § 3845 i | . 0|
3973066] 5 |LAMBSUP |POTATO MASHED ROASTED GARLIC |5 39.35 ]
2106383] 40 |LAMB SUP |POTATO MASHED TRADITIONAL s 7161 | I D A R |
3884000] 20 |FOSTER _|CORN DOG CHICKEN s 3602 R o N
5315054] 10 |JDEAN _ |SANDWICH SAUS EGG & CHEESE s 2095 | -
3015054] 5 |JDEAN _ |SANDWICH SAUS EGG & CHEESE s 2095 T ) 1 | |
3163165 5 |STOUFFER |LASAGNAMEAT s 8055 1 N ([
8901238] 190 |[TONYS | PIZZA CHEESE 4X6 WHOLE GRAIN s st 1 S [ |
3901265] 25 |TONYS _ |PIZZA PEPPERONI WHOLE GRAIN s ezs0| | B | —
3378115] 540 |sHOMBRES |BURRITO BEEF & BEAN s 4545 | 1] |
3377118] 10 |POSADA _|CHIMICHANGA BEEF SHREDDED s 4068 T | — ) |
979140| 5 |FERNANDO |ENCHILADA BEEF s 298| | | U |
577090] 5 |FERNANDO|ENCHILADA CHICKEN s 2564 | T I |
7040087| 40 |RODRIGUZ | TAMALE BEEF IN HUSK 15 OZ s ao2| | I | ]
3240038] 20 |NYFROZEN |BREADSTICK GARLIC 6 IN BULK s zre8| S | I
3241065 5 |TURANO _|BUN MINI BRIOCHE SLIDER s 3115 | L] |
39236654] 5 |BRIDGFRD |BISCUIT BAKED BUTTERMILK s 2959 1 ] | |
5342658] 15 |KRUSTEAZ |WAFFLE BELGIUM 7 IN ROUND W s 3821 1] o
3342658] 20 |KRUSTEAZ |WAFFLE BELGIAN 4 INCH s 3821 |
9335514] 370 |GRABITZR |FRENCH TOAST STICK s 4800 B B s
9330043] 200 |A JEMIMA_|PANCAKE WG 375 IN s 2840 1 ] [ | — |
§330043] 100 |MBTRWRTH|PANCAKE ORIGINAL s 2840 | | |
4033222] 5 |CHEFP _ |MUFFIN BLUEBERRY s 2648 '
9232323] 5 |CHEFP _ |MUFFIN MINIBLUEBERRY s 2734 [ | ) I R S—(
979061 5 |MEXORIG |TORTILLA WRAP HONEY WHEAT 10N | s 2289 | [ I
39235972] 5 |PILLSBRY |DOUGH BISCUIT BUTTERMILK s 4167 T -
3342808] 30 |SARALEE |CAKE BUTTER POUND W S 1426 | 1
@_SCHEFP PIE PUMPKIN 10 INCH PREBAKED 5 4164 - | i
5855008] 5 |PAPETTIS |FRENCH TOAST PLAINROUND 4 IN s 8540 - | |
B806511] 15 |PACKER | TILAPIA FILLET 5.7 OZ s 3514 - | 1
5460772] 5 |COVERWGNBACON SLAB SLICED RANDGM #2 s 227 ] [
8830215] 15 |GRANSABR |CHICKEN FAJITA MEAT LACOCINA s 4095 1 |
9290014] 35 |BONICI _|VMEATBALL BEEF & CHICKEN s 3502 T
B825045| 20 |INTRSTAT |POLLOCK RECT BRD WG CN 3.6 0Z s aa1|] | [
BB78445] 30 |TYSON  |CHICKEN MEAT DICED 1/2 N s 3478 | B
3153004] 5 |COCINAGR |CHILI NO BEANS s 0359 1 |
B3930215] 25 |GRANSABR |CHICKEN FAJTA STRIP COOKED s 40,95 [ | S | ]
3669914] 5 |TYSON _ |CHICKEN DRUMSTICK BRD COOKED | § 127 60 I I A A i N
Nobid | 5 |TYSON _ |CHICKEN CRUMBLED COOKED No bid I c N N
8568783 120 |MINUTEMN |CHICKEN PATTY BREADED COOKED 5 3101 l =
3568783] 40 |MINUTEMN |CHICKEN PATTY BREADED COOKED s 31.01 [ [ o B i | 1 §
8931247 390 |MINUTEMA |BEEF & CHICKEN PATTY 3 OZ CKD 3 119.85 | - il _
5931247] 150 |MINUTEMA |BEEF & CHICKEN PATTY 3 OZ CKD s 119.85 || i | I B
5474008] 30 |HILSHIRE |TURKEY BREAST SLICED 502 $ 4536 | | N 1 | b
5934020| 10 |HILSHIRE |ROAST BEEF SLICED 5 OZ EA s 7666 T I T
Nobid | 5 |BRIARSTR |HAM SHAVING SMKD BNLS No bid ] | )
7611338 50 |KIOLBASA |BACON ENDS AND PIECES s 2527 i i -
5420135 30 |WOLVERIN |BEEF STEW 1X1 s 520 I ] | | N
8666761] 10 |ADVANCE |CHICKEN NUGGET BREAST MEAT s 2504 1 - a— | 1 |
No bid JDEAN __|BISCUIT BACON EGG & CHEESE W No bid I
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Bid 2022-13 Annual Contract for Processed Foods
Contract Term: October 1, 2021 thru September 30, 2022
Annual Contract is not limited to the items listed below. Please request pricing for additional item from vendor.

Nobid | 15 |[JENNIEQ |TURKEY MEAT PULLED WHITE No bid

Labart Food Service [ T 1 T T T T 7T
|c/o Enrique Alvarado -
1902 N. Expressway 77 | -
Harlingen, TX 78550 | | [ — - I I
(956) 428-0722 | | L Sy —
ealvarado@labattfood.com o B I N 1
Qyin|
item | Cases Label Description (Case Price L -
8915054] 5 |JDEAN  |BISCUIT SAUSAGE EGG & CHEESE $ 2095 - |
8825045] 940 [VIKING POLLOCK RECT BRD COOKED 3 602 $ 3441 | | I R
8668781 40 |ADVANCE |CHICKEN NUGGET BREASTMEATCKD |§ 2504| N ——— 77; =] ]
3666018] 10 |TYSON _ |CHICKEN THIGH IQF RAW s 4275 I B
B666015] 20 |TYSON _ |CHICKEN THIGH IQF RAW s 4275 | = —
5 |TYSON _ |CHICKEN WING DRUMMETTE §_ 5647 ‘
Nobd | 60 |TYSON _ |CHICKEN BREAST FILLET MESQ CKD Nobid | - B 1
8668783 5 |ADVANCE [CHICKEN BREAST PATTY BRD $ 31.01 . ) L i — o
3668783] 30 |ADVANCE |CHICKEN BREAST PATTY BRD s _at01 S [ I I
8861015 80 |PACKER |CHICKEN LEG QUARTER RANDOMFZN |5 24.46 - T | S | | —
8867312 10 |BONICI _ |CHICKEN WING BONELESS COOKED | 5 36.11 | I R
8938276 100 [BUTTERBL |TURKEY FRANKB/16 1N s 28.29 |
3938276] 10 |HORMEL _|TURKEY BREAST OVEN ROASTD s 2] | N |
3338276] 15 |HORMEL |TURKEY SLICED BREAD READY s 2829 | | o
3601061] 140 [ELLNGTN |TURKEY SLICED SMOKED 70 O7 s 5359 [ I
3601061] 15 |ELLNGTN |TURKEY SLICED SMOKED 70 OZ s sasa]| B ¥ ] I
3887741 5 |CAROLINA |TURKEY HAM DICED CURED s 3793 o o ] [ S
3883936 50 |CAROLINA |TURKEY HAM BUFFET DELUXE s 308

858101 5 |HORMEL HAM SLICED SMOKED .5 OZ
B8922571] 100 |SMITHFLD |HAM DICED 1/4 INCH IQF
B927105] 400 |KTH/VALY |SAUSAGE PATTY 1.25 OZ COOKED
8928319

o |65 |60 Lo |on |6 |n | |6 |oa |on [en [en |en [en | len |en [on |0 |en |on [on [on |on |an |on |en

4356002 250 |BLACKHIV [BEAN PINTO TRIPLE CLEAN DRIED
4448791| 30 |GRANSABR |PEPPER BLACK GROUND FINE

3886673] 5 |BUTTERBL |TURKEY LUNCHMEAT COMBO s a7 |
§397021] 10 |KTHVALY |BEEF FAJITA MEAT COOKED T 1 1
3541403] 160 |ADVANCE |BEEF SALISBURY FLAME BROILED s 12133 ) |
3941403| 60 |ADVANCE |BEEF SALISBURY FLAME BROILED 121.33
8942809] 20 | MEATLOAF PATTY DELUXE 123.78 T
8542809 5 | MEATLOAF PATTY DELUXE 123.78 I -
3951361) 75 |ADVANGE |BEEF STEAK FINGER COOKED CN 49.59 I -
951361 15 |ADVANCE |BEEF STEAK FINGER COOKED CN 49.59 | I
3951361) 370 |ADVANGE |BEEF STEAK FRITTER 4/1 COOKED 4959 Bl S
3951361] B0 |ADVANCE |BEEF STEAK FRITTER 4/1 COOKED 2958 I I
9230012| 350 |FONTANIN |MEATBALL ITALAN 5 OZ 37.61 |-
9260012| 115 |FONTANIN |MEATBALL TALAN 5 OZ 3761 N B | i
8941153 15 |APFRED |VEAL PATTY CHICKEN FRIED 76.53 I
1911338] 5 |HVALUE _|BACON ENDS & PIECES 2527 | Il | I
8945554] 10 |QTF PORK PATTY RIB SHAPE COOKED CN 44.15 T - -

54 20 |KINGS PORK RIB PATTY W/BBQ SAUCE 4415 | R
8778645 450 |FARMLAND |FRANK ALL MEAT 8/1 39.26 — |
6778002] 15 |TYSON _ |FRANKALL MEAT 1071 6 INCH 5011 |
534004] 30 |HORMEL _|HAM SLICED WATER ADDED 5222 - I

seel [ ' S R _
aas|] | |
39.45 L

75 |NATCHOIC |SAUSAGE LINK NATURAL COOKED a7
[8S33847] 5 |SMAID | SAUSAGE SMOKED ROPE COOKED 4332 I
|5169827] 85 |ALAMO | SAUSAGE CHORIZO ALL BEEF 260 | i — )
BS33947| 50 |ECKRICH SAUSAGE SMOKED ROPE 4332 - -
3928319| 245 [JDEAN | SAUSAGE LINK COOKED SKINLESS 44,47 | T
3928319] 20 |TENN PRD |SAUSAGE LINK 750Z COOKED MILD rerl e I
3528319 15 |BEKO SAUSAGE LINK MILD 1 OZ COOKED ey 1
8914814] 5 |HORMEL |BREAKFAST BAR HAM EGG CHEESE 5307 - |
3322564] 50 |ARMOUR _|SALAMIHARD SLICED 71.82 1 [
Nobid | 430 |FARMLAND |BOLOGNA SLICED Nobid |
3886673 15 |FARMLAND |LUNGH MEAT COMBO PACK s 3781 | |
Nobid | 5 |FRITOLAY |CHIP VARIETY LSS FIESTA PACK No bid | o 1

6187751] 10 |GRANSABR [CHILI POWDER LIGHT

3

5

3

6182218| 5 |GRANSABR [GARLIC GRANULATED $
3113146 10 |GRANSABR |CHIP TORTILLA YELLOW ROUND § 2248

$

$

$

3

3113146] 5 |GRANSABR |CHIP TORTILLA YELLOW ROUND
3206117] 5 |SMOKEHSE |SAUCE BBQ SWEET & SMOKY
1130045| 20 |GLACER |WATER NATURAL DISTILLED
[1883141) 45 |GRANSABR |PEPPER JALAPENO NACHO SLICED
Nooid | 5 |JHS “|cHoCOLATE ENROBER ZTF No bid

1627504] 5 |LAKESIDE |CARROT SLICED MEDIUM s
3861000 10 |ELLINGTN |STUFFING MIX CORNBREAD s
5 |RICHS ICING BUTTERCREME WHITE ZTF s
2423120] 15 |KTHVALY |BASE CHICKEN FLAVOR SOUP PASTE | §
|5245681] 50 |s&D COFFEE QUALITY GROUND s 1954

s

s

s

36005 | 60 |ELLINGTN [RICE LONG GRAIN 4% BROKEN 22.49 | T +—71— S -
1267545| 115 [ELLINGTN |DRINK MIX FRUIT PUNCH 218 | 1 — — e
1284578] 110 [ELLINGTN [DRINK MIX LEMONADE POWDERED 2018 | — - -

Nobid | 100 [ELLINGTN [DRINK MIX PEACH POWDERED Nobd | ) . ] T — = |
1281100] 140 [ELLINGTN |DRINK MIX ORANGE POWDERED s 2018 : ‘
1284577| 110 |ELLINGTN |DRINK MIX PINK LEMONADE PWD s 1921 [ T e === !

Nobid | 65 |ELLINGTN |DRINK MIX GRAPE POWDERED No bd I T e — !

Nobid | 100 [ELLINGTN [DRINK MIX CHERRY POWDERED No bid 1 ) '
3295516] 50 [ELLINGTN [SAUCE PICANTE MEDIUM HOT S 3884 T — = - -
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Bid 2022-13 Annual Contract for Processed Foods
Contract Term: October 1, 2021 thru September 30, 2022
Annugl Contract is not limited to the items listed below. Please request pricing for additional item from vendor.
Labatt Food Service | _—
|c/o Enrique Alvarado | |
902 N. Expressway 77 il L I
|Harlingen, TX 78550 }
(956) 428-0722 | —
jealvar: la m | L
| | - -
Qty in|
5010060] 5 |ELLINGTN |SAUCE ENCHILADA MILD RTU s 3231
|soeoa11 10 |ELLINGTN |PUDDING BANANA RTS § 3747 |
5020062] 10 |ELLINGTN |PUDDING LEMON RTS 3 1932 [ - e
5034012] 15 |ELLINGTN |PUDDING TAPIOCA RTS s 3062
3132107 100 |[ELLINGTN |CHILI WITH BEANS § 8478
4575023] 5 |KTHWVALY |MUSTARD PREPARED EE] o -
1184003] 5 |ELLINGTN |PEANUT BUTTER CREAMY s 58.73 N
326114| 5 |ORCHARDN|APRICOT HALVES EX LIGHT SYRUP s 51.88
[1690011] 15 |ELLNGTN |APPLESAUCE FANCY UNSWEETENED | § 3459 )
481650| 5 |KTHVALY |PEAR HALF 30-35 CT NW CHOICE $  49.41 I [ | o
326108| 5 |KTHVALY |Fnurr COCKTAIL CHOICE X LT SYR s 5312
[326110] & |KTHVALY |PEACH DICED EXTRA LT SYRUP $ 5435 [ 1 - -
2304004] 110 |[ELLINGTN |TOMATO SAUCE FANCY CALIFORNIA s 3208 -
2280016] 50 |ELLINGTN |SAUCE SPAGHETTIRTU s 3215
1803105] 5 |ELLINGTN |VEGETABLE MIXED FANCY § 3407 .
326108| 15 |EWIMPORT |PEACH SLICED IN LIGHT SYRUP 5 5188 |
22510 5 |EWIMPORT [MANDARIN ORANGE WHOLE SEGMENT |§ 3773 o
22515 | 10 |EWIMPORT |[MANDARIN ORANGE BROKENLTSYR | § 3383 - B
547653 PINEAPPLE CHUNK IN JUICE S 2986 T
2792318 TUNA CHUNK LIGHT IN WATER $ _ 64.00
566860 15 |EWIMPORT |FRUIT TROPICAL LT SYRUP s 3579 | o
7996500] 20 |CMCFOOD |OIL FRYING LIQUID CLEAR s 5548 |
4335632] 15 |MISSION  |TOSTADA YELLOW 55N s 1734 . N
1803105] 5 |LAKESIDE |VEGETABLE MIXED s sor| |
1591510] 55 |LAKESIDE |BEET SLICED MEDIUM § 3374 T
4356002] 30 |NEWALLIA |BEANS PINTO WHOLE DRIED s 4175
Nobd | 5 |GATORADE |GATORADE MIX FRUIT PUNCH POUCH No bid 1
81042 | 10 |[MOTTS APPLESAUCE STRAWBERRY IND CUP $ 3124 i
81076 | 5 |MOTTS _ |APPLESAUCE NATURAL NO SUGAR s 3042 [
81076 | 20 |MUSSELMN |APPLESAUCE NATURAL IND CUP s 3042 - )
268508| 10 |RUBYKIST |SAUCE CRANBERRY JELLIED s 4168
326106 10 |KTH/EXCL lmurr COCKTAIL CHOICE HVY SYR s 5312 - i
566860 5 |DOLE FRUIT TROPICAL IN JUICE § 3579 |
566860 | 5 |DOLE FRUIT TROPICAL SALAD LIGHT SYR $ 3579 | o
435685| 5 |KTHICHO |PEACH HALF 30-35CT LIGHT SYRUP s 3839 1T 1 ) B
566854| 5 |HORIZON |PINEAPPLE CRUSHED COARSE s 2509 -
547653| 5 |COUSINS |PINEAPPLE CHUNK IN SYRUP 3 2986 ) - o
435685| 5 |CARBOTRL |PEACH HALF IN JUICE $ 3839 1
949602 | 80 |RUBYKIST |JUICE LEMON 100% JUICE s 1188
1131120 20 |[DASANI [WATER DASANI PURIFIED § 772 _ .
1131120] 20 |DASANI _ |WATER DASANI PURIFIED 5 772 L
1550007| 65 |PURELIFE |WATER DRINKING PURIFIED S 360 B
1284076] 5 |CRYSTLGT |DRINK MIX IND LEMONADE SF s 3239 S
1284099] 10 |CRYSTLGT |DRINK MIX IND FRUIT PUNCH SF $ 3239 1
1284009] 5 |CRYSTLGT |DRINK MIX FRUIT PUNCH SF s 3239 |
1325125 5 |GATORADE |GATORADE MIX VARIETY 2.5 GAL $ 113.40 | N
8269710] 15 |NJOY CREAMER PC NON-DAIRY PACKET 5 42.69 | B
B265563] 5 |NESTLE |CREAMER COFFEE MATE SHAKER S 4478 o o
8269710] 30 CREAMER PC NON DAIRY PACKET § 4289 ]
Nobid | 30 COFFEE 100% COLOMBIAN FP No bid 1
[s245881 10 COFFEE REG ULTRA ROAST FP 5 1954 | -
1541457 BEAN PINTO FANCY $ 2386
1581510 BEET SLICED IRREGULAR S 3374 |
1679299 CORN CREAM STYLE S 40.94
1716000 HOMINY WHITE s 2201 i o
1803105] 5 VEGETABLE MIXED FANCY 5 34.07 )
2106383 200 POTATO MASHED INSTANT REAL s 7181 .
1551240 20 POTATO RUSSET DICED BLANCHED s 27.36
2140424] 5 POTATO SWEET CUT FANCY $ 3460 -
2140424 5 |PRINCELA |POTATO SWEET CUT FANCY $ 3460 B
2281001] 130 |[KTH/HOME [TOMATO WHOLE PEELED § 2319 o
2272576 20 |HUNTS _ |TOMATO PASTE 5 4146 1
7780000] 20 |INDEL TOMATILLO CRUSHED 5 3151 1 B
4356002] 25 |GRANSABR [BEAN PINTO TRIPLE CLEAN DRIED 5 41.75 |
36005 | 130 |ADOLPHUS |RICE LONG GRAIN ADOLPHUS 5 2249 -
4234555 5 |PRODUCER|RICE PILAF MIX SEASONED $ 3034 -
3206117] 5 |LLPIG SAUCE BBQ 5 18.86 - )
2722877] 5 |MIPUEBLO |CHEESE SAUCE CHEDDAR AGED s 3002 | .
2722877] 5 |GEHLS _ |CHEESE SAUCE MILD CHEDDAR $ 3902 B .
2722877| 100 |MIPUEBLO |CHEESE SAUCE NACHO $ 39.02 . ~
52516 | 160 |CHOLULA |SAUCE HOT PC CHOLULA s 1075 1
3660004] 15 |KTHHOME |MAYONNAISE HEAVY DUTY GF s 5850
3329803| 10 |HID VALY |DRESSING PC RANCH ORIGINALCUP | § 23867 171 -
3249257| 75 |RED GOLD |KETCHUP INDIVIDUAL 9 GRAM PC s 3082
3372224] 90 MUSTARD PC POLY POUCH $ 1279 e
3329893 300 MAYONNAISE PC s 1836
3471058] 5 |PPI DRESSING PC ITALIAN $ 1607
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Bid 2022-13 Annual Contract for Processed Foods
Contract Term: October 1, 2021 thru September 30, 2022

Annual Contract is not limited to the items listed below. Please request pricing for additional item from vendor.

Labatt Food Service | - i
c/o Enrique Alvarado L i
902 N. Expressway 77 | | | | |
Harlingen, TX 78550 | f | | . . ] . |
{956) 428-0722 ! {
v iabatift .com | I
Qtyin
Item |Cases Label Description Case Price il L e —— . —
3341112 70 SAUCE PC TARTAR 5 19.89
549602 | 40 JUICE LEMON PC s 1188 R [
3471117] 5 |PPI DRESSING PC RANCH BUTTERMILK s 1720 1 - - S (] |
3372224] 5 |FRENCHS |MUSTARD PC POUCH 200 CT s 12.79
3341112 15 |HEINZ SAUCE PC TARTAR s 198s| VS |
3202330| 5 |BULLSEYE |SAUCE PC BBQ BULLSEYE s 1974
3341112] 30 |KRAFT _ |SAUCE PC TARTAR CREAMY s 19.89
8569519 70 SWEE TENER SUGAR KEITH PACKET s 20| - ] i
7100005] 85 |SWTDLITE |SWEETENER PINK PACKET s 16.95 T I 1 1 |
[568511] 5 |EQUAL  |SWEETENER EQUAL PACKET s a211
6331243 30 PEPPER PC POUCH s 18] | |
6331250 40 SALT PC POUCH s 767 O I R - I
6313043] 40 |MORTON |SALT IODIZED TABLE s 488 | B o -
4650678| 530 |PPI SYRUP PC POUCH s 1078
45392622 85 |PPI JELLY PC ASSORTED CUP, s 1520 | | |
4502531] 25 JELLY PC GRAPE CUP $ 1325
4650678 35 |SMUCKERS |SYRUP PC PANCAKE CUP s 1078 N I | N
5162344] 10 |BAYOU EICKLE DILL SLICE HAMBURGER CC s 1951 | I | |
5162352] 5 |HENZ PICKLE DILL SPEAR KOSHER § 3241
3821001 5 |ROLAND |OLIVE GREEN QUEEN PIMENTOSTFD | § 78.85 |
9412359] 15 |EMBASA PEPPER CHIPOTLE § 2139
1988963] 20 |SANMARCO|PEPPER JALAPENO WHOLE s 2712 i o
3823372] 5 |GOLDMEDL |FLOUR ALL PURPOSE MEDALLION s 1367
3826502] 5 |MASECA |FLOUR CORN TORTILLA WHT #0 $ 2347 - r | )
4071110] 10 |CONTMILL |CAKE MIX YELLOW s 2818
4071108] 5 |CONTMILL [CAKE MIX WHITE $ 2818 |
3672011 5 |CORALBAY |COCONUT SNOWFLAKE $ 29865
6415681] 5 |CLABGIRL |BAKING SODA s 2226
6453005| 5 |ARGO STARCH CORN $ 224 | 7 — i -
3113355 170 |MISSION | TACO SHELL 5 IN YELLOW $ 1725 | S
4335632] 5 |MISSION |TOSTADA SHELL 55N YELLOW $ 1734 ||
3778043| 35 |FRITOLAY |CHIP FRITO CORN ORIGINAL s 3958
3778044 35 |LAYS CHIP POTATO REG SINGLE SERVE s 3950
3778047| 35 |CHEETOS |CHIP CHEETO CRUNCHY $ 3950 1 |
3778049] 15 |DORITOS |CHIP DORITO COOLER RANCH s 3950 | ) - 1
3778050] 30 |DORITOS |CHIP DORITO NACHO CHEESE s aess| | 1 ] il
3778028] 10 |SUNCHIPS |CHIP SUNCHIP ORIGINAL s sees| | 1 B o
3778036] 10 |CHEETOS |[CHIP CHEETO HOT CRUNCHY $ 3524 |
3778022 5 |ROLDGOLD|PRETZEL TINY TWISTS LOW FAT s 3358 ’
3778042] 45 |FRITOLAY |CHIP FRITO CORN CHILI CHEESE s 3sea) | B - o | |
Nobd | 5 |FUNYUNS |CHIP FUNYUN FLAMIN HOT LSS Nobd | | B |
[3777611] 10 |CHAPAS _|CHIP PORK CRACKLIN $ 4714 | |
4170875| 45 |CORTONA |PASTA SHELL MEDIUM 7/8 INCH s 2304 ] |
4152089] 60 |CORTONA |PASTA ELBOW MACARONI s 1834 T
4151812| 20 |CORTONA |PASTA EGG NOODLE WIDE 1/2 INCH $ 1258 B !
4152106] 100 [CORTONA |PASTA SPAGHETTI LONG 10IN s 1834 [ ) i T
4152006] 5 |CORTONA |PASTA FETTUCCINE 10 1N $ 2353 ]
4151812 10 |ZEREGA  |PASTA EGG NOODLE 7/8 IN s 1258 I ] - ]
4171716] 5 |CORTONA |PASTA SHELL SMALL s ;8| | | |
4301362] 10 |CORTONA |PASTA VERMICELLI 10 INCH s 2304 I B | i
5020003] 60 |MYHMTWN |PUDDING VANILLA RTS § 3747
5020045 55 |MYHMTWN |PUDDING CHOCOLATE RTS 5 _arar | |
110 |JELLO GELATIN STRAWBERRY SUGAR FREE | 5§ 16.60 | 1T 1T 1
|a‘nmsl 15 |GLDHRVST |SALAD COLESLAW CREAMY GF 5 2576 | T
5778961 RESERS | SALAD PASTA MACARONI $ 4328 | o
8770117 RESERS | SALAD POTATO s 4328 B | |
8770117 RESERS _ [SALAD POTATO REGULAR s 4328
8778953] 5 |GLDHRVST [SALAD POTATO MUSTARD GF $ 4328
8779072] 10 |GLDHRVST |SALAD TUNA SUPREME GF 5 49.91 | ]
8779098] 10 |RESERS |SALAD CHICKEN WHITE GOURMET s st T [ T
14132 | 25 |RESERS |SALAD CHICKEN SMOKED $ 42.74 I B -
3770086] 20 |NABISCO |CRACKER SALTINE s 13.92 I
Nobd | 5 |LANCE _ |CRACKER CRUSHED SALTINES No bid 1
3805512] 5 |NABISCO |CRACKER GRAHAM TEDDY CUB s 4274 i S
3757507] 10 |NABISCO |CRACKERRZ s 30.18 S
9380003] 5 |GENMILLS |SNACK MIX SIMPLY CHEX STWBRY s 28.18 i -
3730553] 25 |NABISCO |COOKIE ANIMAL CRACKER s 21.00 -
Nobd | 30 |NABISCO |COOKEE VANILLA WAFER IND No bid |
3802550] 70 |GRANDMAS|COOKIE OATMEAL RAISIN s 2165 I |
Nobd | 5 |KELLOGGS |CEREAL BAR STWBY YOGURT No bid
Nobid | 240 |NABISCO _|COOKIE BULK ASSORTMENT No bid [
0991266] 15 |KELLOGGS |CEREAL BAR RICE KRISPIE TREAT s 4941 I |
3761236] 30 |NVALLEY |GRANOLA BAR CHEWY VARIETY PACK | § 50.05 | N
6181176]| 5 |SPICECLS |CINNAMON GROUND s 6558 I
4441986] 5 |MCORMICK |CUMIN COMINO GROUND s 664 1
44413986 25 |SPICECLS |CUMIN COMINO GROUND S 664 [ - | I
6184303 75 |MCORMICK |PEPPER LEMON SEASONING 5 1111 |
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Bid 2022-13 Annual Contract for Processed Foods
Contract Term. October 1, 2021 thru September 30, 2022
Annual Contract is not limited to the items listed below. Please request pricing for additional item from vendor.

Labatt Food Service
c/a Enrique Alvarado
|902 N. Expressway 77
Harlingen, TX 78550

(956) 428-0722
fvar; I .com
Qtyin|

Item Label Case Price |

6185417] 5 |LAWRYS |SEASONING SALT NO MSG s 762]

§181069] 50 |MCORMICK |SEASONING CAJUN BAYOU NO MSG s 14.19

6174528] 20 |MCORMICK |PARSLEY FLAKES s 1167

4448731] 5 |TXCUSTOM |PEPPER BLACK GROUND TABLE s 4381]

6184113 15 |TXCUSTOM|GARLIC POWDER 5 974

[3398626] 5 |TXCUSTOM|SEASONING MENUDO MIX $ 3058 ] i
6182216] 15 |TXCUSTOM|GARLIC GRANULATED s 4026

7996534| 100 [KTH/HOME [SHORTENING CLEAR FRY LIQUID § 4588 |
8520009] 50 |IMPERIAL |SUGAR PURE CANE GRANULATED s 1919

8523755 5 |IMPERIAL |SUGAR BROWN LIGHT IN BAG s 2080

210 70 |SANTIAGO |BEAN REFRIED DEHYDRATED $ 2348

2145500] 5 |MARCOS |NOPALITO s 3193 I

200000] 5 |BUENO _ |MOLE AUTENTICO ROJO $ 12094
2792315] 5 |CHICSEA |TUNACHUNK LIGHT IN WATER $ 6400
2280018] 60 |HUNTS _ |SAUCE MANWICH SLOPPY JOE s 3099 |
3100500] 15 |CHEFBOY |RAVIOLIBEEF RTU s 41.00
5010042] 20 |SMUCKERS|SYRUP CUP DIET PANCAKE $ 1594
[3425696] 20 |MORRISON |GRAVY MIX COUNTRY STYLE PEPPER | § 1482
3445608] 60 |MORRISON |GRAVY MIX BROWN COUNTRY STYLE | § 1553
3576006] 5 |TRIO SAUCE MIX ALFREDO TRIO S 8011
3445695 5 |PIONEER |GRAVY MIX TURKEY s 2006 |
3445696] 10 |MORRISON |GRAVY MIX PEPPERED s 1482) |

5 |GENMILLS |CEREAL BOWL COCOA PUFFS s 4878
5601546] 25 |QUAKER |CEREAL OATS QUICK s 4201
5495113] 10 |[MOM CEREAL BOWL CINNAMON TOASTERS | $ 4878

Nobid | 10 |[MOM CEREAL BOWL BERRY COLOSSAL No bd —
3730003] 200 [MOM CEREAL BOWL APPLE ZINGS s 4534
3730004] 120 [MOM CEREAL BOWL TOOTIE FRUITIES $ 4534 |
6573521] 140 [MOM CEREAL BOWL RAISIN BRAN $ 4534 [ |
3730005 150 [MO M CEREAL BOWL CRISPY RICE S 4534 [
(790600 5 |CHAMPN |RAISIN SEEDLESS SELECT $ 5078 N
4741400] 5 |KRAFT _ |MARSHMALLOW JET PUFFED s 2520] :

60. 10 |CAMPBELL |SOUP CHICKEN NOODLE s 2075 |
2422335| 15 |KTH/HOME |BASE BEEF FLAVOR $ ar22 [
2422335 & |MINORS  |BASE BEEF NO MSG s 3122 |
2423120] 5 |KTHIPREM |BASE CHICKEN PASTE REFRIGERATE | § 767
8520009] 10 |CARGILL _|SUGAR GRANULATED $_19.19 |
8660128] 5 |MASTERS |CHEESE CHEDDAR JACK SHRDFANCY |§ 50.04
3450925 10 |FRSHKTH |COTTAGE CHEESE 4% $ 3178 1
8145620] 280 |[ELLINGTN |MARGARINE SOLIDS PURE VEG s ar.07
8660082] 10 |SCHREIBR |CHEESE CHEDDAR SHRD MITATION s 5004
B660018| 130 |SCHREIBR |CHEESE AMERICAN 184 SLICES $_ 7519 i
B660066] 5 |SCHREIBR |CHEESE SWISS AMERICAN 120 SL s s061] |
8660072] 5 |GLDHRVST |CHEESE SWISS AMERICAN 160 SL s 5196 |
B165060] 470 |ELLINGTN |EGG FRESH SHELL XL USDA AA s 1729 T
8165060] 300 |PACKER  |EGG FRESH SHELL XL s 1729 [
8170017 50 |YOPLAIT |YOGURT TRIX STWBRYBANBASHLF | § 2014

Nobid | 5 |LIGHT&FT |YOGURT STWBRY/RASP/BLUEBERRY Nobid |

Nobid | 5 |LIGHTAFT |YOGURT VARIETY PACK No bid
8206020) 5 |DAISY COTTAGE CHEESE LOW FATSMCURD |5 1066 T
8856024 30 |PAPETTIS |EGG WHOLE LIQUID WICITRIC s seor| | |
5859016| 5 |PAPETTIS |EGG OMELETTE W/CHEDDAR CHS S 4834
3529923] 20 |DAISY SOUR CREAM PC s 11.08
8660018 120 |GLOHRVST |CHEESE AMERICAN SLICED 160 CT s 7519
8660082] 5 |LANDOLAK |CHEESE CHEDDAR SHRED FEATHER |5 5004

15475 | 5 |GLDHRVST |CHEESE CHEDDAR CUBED 75 IN S 3524 1 T
8662003] 5 |MASTERS |CHEESE MOZZ FEATHER SHRED $ 5412 T
8656001 15 |VAV CHEESE QUESO FRESCO WHEEL 5 604 |

Processed Foods
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